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PREFACE 

The unmet need for legal services by those who cannot afford to hire a lawyer is a 
problem that every bar association and court in the country confronts and attempts to 
solve. We all recognize that we can have the best legal system in the world, which we 
do, but for those who cannot afford a lawyer to help solve their legal problem, it is as if 
there is no legal system at all. Much of the focus on providing legal services to the poor 
naturally involves the person's initial contact with the lower courts, but a somewhat less 
obvious but nevertheless real need is for services at the appellate level. 

Attempting to design a system in the state appellate courts to match lawyers who are 
willing to take pro bono appeals with clients who need their services is sometimes 
viewed as complicated and difficult to implement. However, in a number of states, bar 
associations working with the courts have established successful appellate pro bono 
programs. As lawyers, we look for precedents and forms so that we are relying on what 
has been determined or used before. For those reasons, I thought putting together a 
resource book describing the existing pro bono appellate programs around the country 
would aid bar associations and courts in other states in establishing such programs in 
their jurisdictions. 

I know of no better group to prepare such a resource than the Council of Appellate 
Lawyers of the American Bar Association, and I knew of no better person to chair this 
effort than Cynthia Feathers, an appellate attorney who had been the New York State 
Bar Association director of pro bono affairs and was instrumental in establishing an 
appellate pro bono program in New York. I asked Cynthia to chair the committee; and 
her very able and motivated committee reviewed every existing pro bono appellate 
program in the country and prepared a summary of each program, together with forms 
and contact people in each state, all of which are included in this manual. They did all 
this work in less than a year. 

As chair of the Council of Appellate Lawyers, and on behalf of its members and the 
clients who may be served as a result of their work, I want to express our admiration 
and thanks for their extraordinary efforts. If the manual inspires you or aids you in the 
effort to establish a pro bono appellate program, our mission will be fulfilled. We would 
appreciate any comments or any reports of your successful use of the manual. 

A. Vincent Buzard 
Council of Appellate Lawyers 
American Bar Association Judicial Division 
October 5, 2013 



INTRODUCTION 

Throughout the country, pro bono programs for state court appeals have been created to 
help litigants of modest means who cannot afford quality appellate representation. The 
American Bar Association's Council of Appellate Lawyers (CAL) has designed this 
manual to serve as a practical tool that can make the path easier for the next generation 
of such programs and for the expansion of existing programs. Building on valuable 
surveys previously done by CAL and other groups, this resource seeks to provide a 
detailed examination of each state's programs, advice from program leaders, samples of 
various forms, articles, and contact information for each state. The manual surveys only 
pro bono programs that operate in state courts; it does not cover federal court pro bono 
programs, because the ABA Litigation Section will be creating a resource describing 
such programs. Nor does the manual describe law school clinics, because our focus is 
on representation by appellate attorneys. 

We learned about existing programs via the most recent prior report by CAL and 
current court and state bar websites. In contacting 17 states with a pro bono appeals web 
presence, we learned that only 13 actually have a current program, and one state is on 
the brink of launching a program. We made extensive efforts to contact the other states 
to confirm that they do not have a program. If such states do have such a program now, 
we encourage interested persons to email denise.jimenez@americanbar.org and provide 
relevant information so that we can supplement the online version of this manual. The 
CAL Pro Bono Committee also encourages leaders of the programs detailed here to 
update us on their efforts and thanks them for their generous cooperation and assistance 
in compiling this manual. We also thank all of the persons who provided permission to 
reprint the invaluable program material included in this manual. 

Thanks to A. Vincent Buzard, Esq. (Harris Beach, Rochester, NY), Chair of CAL, for 
his vision in suggesting the development of this manual and to the members of the Pro 
Bono Committee who created this resource, including by interviewing attorneys 
involved with existing programs to gain insights about each state's initiative. 

The Pro Bono Committee members are Cynthia Feathers, Esq. (Chair, Albany, NY), 
Sean Andrussier, Esq. (Duke University School of Law, Durham, NC), Michael J. 
Bentley, Esq. (Bradley Arant Boult Cummings LLP, Jackson, MS), Karin Bohrnholdt, 
Esq. (Greenberg Traurig, LLP, Los Angeles, CA), Kira Klatchko, Esq. (Best Best & 
Krieger, Indian Wells, CA), Linda L. Morkan, Esq. (Robinson & Cole LLP, Hartford, 
CT), Matthew Schettenhelm, Esq. (Best Best & Krieger, Washington, D.C.), and 
Charles G. Wentworth, Esq. (The Law Office of Lofgen & Wentworth, P.C., Glen 
Ellyn, IL). Thanks also to the Rural Law Center of New York (Plattsburgh, NY) for the 
assistance of George J. Hoffman, Jr., Esq. and paralegal Laura Charland. Finally, 
special thanks to Counsel Press for its generosity in printing this manual. Copies of the 
complete manual will be made available on the CAL website. 
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BASIC CONSIDERATIONS 
IN CREATING A PROGRAM 

This manual cannot tell you how to create or expand a pro bono appeals program. 
However, it can help you consider the relevant elements of such a program and identify 
likely obstacles and benefits. Some of the basic questions and issues to consider are set 

"­forth below. 

1. Appellate experience 

Is the goal of your program to find opportunities for experienced appellate attorneys to 
use their skills in order to provide quality representation in addressing an unmet need in 
the community? Or would you like to train attorneys to do appeals? If so, will you use a 
mentoring system, in which seasoned appellate practitioners guide the work of other 
volunteers, and will you limit the kinds of cases less experienced volunteers handle? 

2. Appellate attorney committees and sections 

One theme that emerged in our research was the central role of the organized appellate 
bar in creating programs, screening cases, and representing litigants. Such attorneys 
know how difficult appeals can be and have been a significant force in mobilizing their 
own colleagues to offer free appellate representation. Pro bono appeals are thus a 
distinct genre of pro bono service, which often starts not with a group of attorneys with 
a particular skill set, but with a particular need, and sometimes uses paid pro bono staff 
to train volunteers. The appeals programs are also distinct in often operating on a 
statewide, not a local, level in the recruitment of volunteers and screening of cases. 

3. Role of the appellate courts 

What role will the appellate courts play? There are many possibilities. In some 
instances, the courts themselves were the primary force behind creation of a program. 
More often the program was started by a state bar appellate group. In those situations, a 
question to address is whether the appellate court will be considered a full partner in the 
program. Other questions are whether the court will refer cases to the pro bono program 
and will appoint counsel, as is often done in federal court programs, but less often in 
state programs. 

4. Role of nonprofits and funding 

What role will existing legal services/pro bono programs play? Are there programs in 
your community that can provide administrative assistance, malpractice insurance, and 
other support? Partnerships of state bar appellate groups and pro bono organizations 
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work well where there is a mutual understanding and respect for each other's role. The 
attorneys are grateful for the infrastructure and guidance offered by pro bono 
professionals, who in turn support the vision and expertise of the appellate bar. 

Is the pro bono program local, regional or statewide? Will it handle the income 
qualification of applicants, and what standards will apply? Can it identify possible 
funding sources, prepare grant proposals, and administer funds? If so, how will such 
funds be used? In one state, two members of the state bar appeals committee rec~ive a 
stipend in recognition of their ongoing role in helping to run the program. In other 
states, the appellate attorney administrator is fully voluntary, and the pro bono program 
donates staff time. Funding can also be used for transcripts and printing costs, where the 
volunteers cannot absorb such costs, and for outreach efforts. Several programs have no 
funding, and volunteers must cover their costs. 

5. Appeal topics 

Another threshold consideration is whether a program will cover any and all appeal 
topics or will narrow the subject matters in which appeals will be handled, based on 
perceived high-need areas. 

6. Promoting the program 

Except where the court runs the program and identifies the cases warranting pro bono 
appellate counsel, a basic issue programs face is getting the word out about the program 
to lawyers and litigants. States have found a number of ways to promote their programs: 
placing information on court, pro bono program, and state bar websites; distributing 
materials at Continuing Legal Education (CLE) programs; making brochures and 
posters available via the above entities and in trial and appellate court clerks' offices; 
creating a LawHelp.org presence; and publishing articles in the general circulation or 
legal press about the program generally or an interesting case specifically. 

7. Tenacity 

The road to creating a pro bono appeals program may not be smooth. Once the program 
is launched, getting a steady flow of cases and managing the program to place the cases 
and ensure timely and quality representation can be difficult. Reinvigorating an existing 
program with new leadership or outreach efforts is often required. Innovative 
approaches may be called for. For example, one jurisdiction that initially sought to 
represent primarily litigants who could not obtain assigned counsel has created a 
partnership with providers of mandated representation to expand services to indigent 
persons in family law appeals. 
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8. Defining success 

Even the most vibrant programs do not define success by a high-volume of appeals 
handled each year. For many programs, doing 10 appeals a year is typical. That number 
belies the value of such programs. For one thing, a single appeal involving an enormous 
record and multiple complex issues can be a very labor-intensive undertaking. 

For another thing, the power of appeals in creating binding precedent that will setve 
other similarly situated persons of modest means should not be under-estimated. Indeed, 
many pro bono programs have made important new law in their jurisdictions. Working 
with legal services groups to identify possible impact cases or areas where amicus 
curiae briefs could make a critical difference seems to be a largely untapped frontier. 
Even in appeals not deemed to be "impact" cases, each appeal can have an enormous 
impact on the life of the individual litigant represented. Finally, the number of appeals 
handled is not indicative of the number of applications screened and valuable 
information provided to trial counsel and pro se litigants about the appeal process and 
possible problems with rejected appeals. 

9. A few comparisons 

The most common model involves a collaboration of a state bar appellate section, a 
public interest nonprofit organization, and a court. In some cases, the nonprofit entity 
performs the income qualification of applicants, whereas in others, the appellate 
attorneys do so. Perhaps the state with the greatest court control of a program is 
Montana. In Oregon, the court also chooses the cases, but the state bar plays a major 
role in the program. In Colorado, in some cases that were briefed by pro se litigants, the 
court issues an order inviting the litigant to seek pro bono counsel through the program 
and provides an extension for supplemental briefing. In most programs, referrals flow 
from a variety of sources, which mayor may not include the court. 

As to topics, unique approaches are taken in Minnesota, which handles only 
unemployment insurance appeals, and North Carolina, which involves only guardian ad 
litem representation of children in appeals. Many states apparently do not limit topics. 
A middle ground is taken in Hawaii and New York, where appeals are restricted to 
several enumerated high-need areas. A unique program is Los Angeles County's, which 
emphasizes a brief advice clinic that helps a high volume of pro se litigants, while 
referring a small number of cases for pro bono representation. States with regional 
programs that do not cover the entire state include California and New York. 
In creating or expanding your program, you may find especially useful the extensive 
program literature and forms provided by Colorado, Montana, and New York and an 
article about Minnesota's program. Finally, a number of states offer pro se appeals 
guides, as well as pro bono representation, and links to such guides are provided in this 
manual. 
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CALIFORNIA: 
LOS ANGELES COUNTY 

When was the program created? 

2006. 

How was it started? 

The program started after Justice Laurie Zelon of the Second District Court of Appeal 
decided that her court needed to do something to help the unrepresented civil litigants 
who were having a difficult time navigating the system. She contacted Public Counsel, 
a public interest nonprofit law firm, the Appellate Court Section of the Los Angeles 
County Bar Association, and a few prominent appellate lawyers in L.A. Then a series of 
meetings was held to brainstorm and design a program. In the meantime, Public 
Counsel created an appellate law program and received a five-year grant through the 
State Bar to get the program started. An appellate self-help clinic was established in a 
partnership of the court and Public Counsel. It is now held in a small office at the 
courthouse two days a week. 

How are cases and volunteers chosen? 

Lisa Jaskol of Public Counsel identifies meritorious cases and places them with pro 
bono lawyers. Cases are typically snapped up quickly. The L.A. County Bar 
Association set up a speciallistserv for Public Counsel to use. The volunteer lawyer 
decides if the appeal presents non-frivolous issues and ifhe wants to keep it or give it 
back to Public Counsel to find another lawyer to handle it. When respondents come to 
the clinic, their appeals are immediately placed with pro bono lawyers. 

Do volunteers need to have appellate experience? 

Appellate Court Section members typically possess appellate expertise. If the volunteer 
lacks experience, a mentorship arrangement is created with a more experienced 
appellate lawyer. 

On average, how many appeals are handled each year? 

Several thousand pro se litigants have been helped at the clinic, and in six years, about 
30 appeals have been placed, several of which have resulted in published decisions. 
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How do you promote the program? 

The program is promoted to litigants through the Court of Appeal. The website has a lot 
of information about the program. When an unrepresented litigant files an appeal, he or 
she receives a packet from the court. Flyers are distributed throughout the county. 
Lawyers learn about the program through the Appellate Courts Section or Public 
Counsel. 

What obstacles had to be overcome to establish the program? 

Largely funding. In other districts, there seems to be resistance to establishing similar 
programs. 

Where can I learn more about this program? 

A law journal article offers a detailed discussion ofthe program. See Meehan Rasch, "A 
New Public-Interest Appellate Model: Public Counsel's Court-Based Self-Help Clinic 
and Pro Bono 'Triage' for Indigent Pro Se Civil Litigants on Appeal," 11 J. App. PRAC. 
& PRO. 461 (2010). 

Does California have a pro se appeals guide? 

Yes, go to http://www.courts.ca.gov/8676.htm. 

Who is the contact person for the L.A. program? 

Lisa Jaskol, Esq. 
Public Counsel 
(213) 385-2977, ext. 151 
ljaskol@publiccounsel.org 
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COLORADO 

Program creation 

The state's pro bono program was inspired by two Court of Appeals judges, one of 
whom started his career in Legal Aid. The culture in the state helps to explain the deep 
judiciary support. The state has a "Self-Represented Litigant" program in the trial 
courts, with help available in person for pro se litigants in civil cases. There is a national 
program headquartered at the University of Denver-the Institute for the Advancement 
of the American Legal System, headed by a former Colorado Supreme Court judge­
which seeks to improve accessibility to courts. The Colorado Bar Association formed a 
five-person committee to develop a pro bono program. That committee looked at model 
programs in Austin and Houston, Texas. It took seven or eight months to get going and 
craft language. Before posting information about the program on its website, the Bar 
Association received numerous requests for help. Members of the committee took pro 
bono appeals while the process was being developed. 

Appeal sources 

Information about the program is available from many sources. The Colorado Court of 
Appeals provides an information sheet to appellants and appellees. Litigants also find 
out about the program online, from district court clerks and appellate clerks or other pro 
bono programs. The application may be revised to have applicants indicate who referred 
them in order to gain a better understanding of how litigants are learning about the 
program. Another source of referrals is Metro Volunteer Lawyers (MVL) in the Denver 
area. Volunteer attorneys are covered under MVL's malpractice insurance. 

Types of cases 

Since its launch in summer 2010, the program has received approximately 140 
applications and has agreed to representation in more than 30 appeals. About half are 
domestic relations cases. The cases come from all over the state. The volunteers may 
represent parties on either side of an appeal. The volunteer attorney, not the program, is 
the attorney of record for the appeal. 

Process 

Attorney Jane Ebisch is the voluntary administrator, and applications flow to her after 
they are submitted by applicants to the Colorado Bar Association. She is a member of 
the Appellate Subcommittee of the Litigation Committee ofthe State Bar. A small 
screening committee decides on what cases to accept, usually meeting via conference 
calls. There are mentor-mentee relationships between experienced attorneys and newer 
attorneys. The Litigation Committee has a small war chest to absorb costs. Ms. Ebisch 
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often calls applicants to discuss procedural issues. The program does not require the 
notice of appeal to be done before an application is submitted; and if the case is 
accepted, sometimes the volunteer attorney prepares the notice of appeal for the 
applicant. 

Full information about the process is available on the Colorado Bar Association 
website: http://www.cobar.org/index.cfmlID/20004/dpwfp/For-the-Public/. 

Unique element 

There have been several court orders from the Court of Appeals, with copies to the 
program, giving pro se litigants who filed a brief an extension of time to apply for pro 
bono representation from the program. However, it is up to the litigants to follow up 
and apply to the program, which they do not always do. 

Contact person 

Jane Ebisch, Esq. 
The Ebisch Law Firm 
Lakewood, CO 
(303) 233-1232 
jebisch@ebischlaw.com 
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FLORIDA 

How was the program started? 

The program was created several years ago at the impetus of the Pro Bono Committee 
of the Appellate Practice Section of the Florida Bar (Committee). The Committee's 
website is found at http://www.flabarappeUate.org/about committee PROB.asp." 

What entities are involved with this program? 

The Committee, the Florida Supreme Court, and legal aid organizations. 

On average, how many appeals are handled each year? 

Around 15. 

How does it work? 

Cases generally are referred to the Committee from legal aid organizations or the 
Florida Supreme Court. The Committee maintains a roster of volunteer lawyers who 
have expressed interest in serving as pro bono appellate counsel. When the Committee 
receives word of a potential pro bono appeal, it distributes an email to the roster to ask 
who is interested in handling the appeal. With this inquiry, the Committee will forward 
basic information about the case. The Committee generally forwards any request for pro 
bono assistance in a civil or family law matter. Criminal or post-conviction appeals are 
not handled unless the Florida Supreme Court seeks to appoint counsel in such cases. 

How do referrals from legal aid organizations work? 

A legal aid organization may refer a party to the Committee for pro bono representation 
after the organization ensures that he or she qualifies financially for assistance. If a 
party contacts the Committee directly seeking appellate representation, the Committee 
tries to route the applicant to a legal aid organization for financial screening. Such 
organizations do the financial screening because the Committee lacks the resources to 
do it. Rarely do parties contact the Committee directly seeking pro bono appellate 
counsel. 

After the Committee notifies the roster of volunteer lawyers about a referral from a 
legal aid organization, interested attorneys contact such organization directly. If 
multiple lawyers volunteer, the legal aid program (or the client) may make the selection. 
Typically, the volunteer who expresses interest first is selected. Screening as to the 
merits of an appeal is done by the volunteer attorney after he or she connects with the 
referring organization or client. 

10 



How do court-originated appointments work? 

When the Florida Supreme Court grants review in a case involving a pro se party, the 
court alerts the Committee, which notifies the roster of attorneys to determine who is 
interested. The Committee then forwards to the Supreme Court the names of interested 
persons, along with recommendations about attorney selections. The court then chooses 
appellate counsel. For this type of appointment, it helps if a lawyer is certified in 
appellate practice or is working with a certified attorney, whether from his or her' firm 
or from the Committee. 

The Committee has contacted Florida's intermediate appellate courts to find ways to 
work with those courts in providing pro bono representation. However, for various 
reasons-including the absence of a process to screen cases worthy of appointment 
before the cases are sent to merits panels- those intermediate appellate courts have not 
been a consistent source of pro bono appointments. 

Must volunteers have appellate experience? 

Lack of appellate experience may be a factor when the Florida Supreme Court appoints 
appellate counsel. Otherwise, appellate experience is not required for cases referred 
from legal aid organizations. Members of the Florida Bar's Appellate Practice Section 
may sign up for the roster, but they need not have appellate experience to do so. 

Is there any oversight after cases are assigned? 

If a case is assigned to a lawyer lacking appellate experience, the Committee assigns a 
mentor to that attorney. Mentors are selected from among certified appellate specialists 
in the Appellate Practice Section. A mentor may review a brief before it is filed. 

Are there length-of-engagement guidelines or rules? 

Length of engagement is governed by the arrangements reached between the client and 
volunteer attorney. 

How is the program funded? 

The program has no funding. The referring legal aid organization generally pays any 
costs necessarily incurred in handling the appeal. At the volunteer attorney's option, any 
costs not covered by a legal aid organization may be paid by the volunteer attorney's 
law firm (however, volunteers and their law firms are not required nor expected to incur 
costs). Any costs not paid by a legal aid organization or the volunteer's law firm remain 
the client's responsibility. 
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Does Florida have a pro se appeals guide? 

Yes, go to http://prose.fiabarappellate.org. 

Also, "Ensuring Meaningful Access to Appellate Review in Non-Criminal Cases 
Involving Self-Represented Litigants," a paper by Jacinda Haynes Suhr of the Second 
District Court of Appeal, Florida State Courts System, examines self-representa~on in 
non-criminal cases filed in Florida's intermediate appellate courts. See 
http://www.ncsc.org/~/media/files/pdf/education%20and%20careers/cedp%20papers/20 

09/ suhr accesstoappellatereview.ashx. 

Who is the program contact person? 

Sarah LaWou-Amine, Esq. 
Fowler White Boggs P.A. 
Tampa, FL 
(813) 769-7849 
sarah.amine@fowlerwhite.com 
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HAWAII 

When was the program started? 

Planning began in 2012 and is ongoing. Before it is implemented, the program must be 
approved by the Hawaii Access to Justice Commission (Commission), which may 
happen later in 2013. The program will launch as a pilot project. ' 

What entities are involved with this program? 

The groups involved are the Appellate Section of the Hawaii State Bar Association 
(Appellate Section); Volunteer Legal Services of Hawaii (VLS); and the Commission, 
an organization created by the Hawaii judiciary to expand civil legal services for 
residents with low or moderate incomes. The Commission is involved in the pilot 
project's creation, but will not playa direct role in the program's execution, once it is 
launched. 

What types of cases are covered? 

In Hawaii's Intermediate Court of Appeals, the program will cover foreclosure, 
summary possession, employment discrimination, workers' compensation, tax appeals, 
probate, and divorce- the types of cases in which the court sees numerous pro se 
parties. In the future, if the pilot is successful, the program might expand to include 
other types of cases and matters pending in Hawaii's Supreme Court. 

How will it work? 

Step one: 

Request for services and initial screening. Cases will not originate from any court. 
Rather, an unrepresented party seeking appellate counsel must contact the Appellate 
Section, which will initially screen the case to ensure that it is a type listed above. If it 
is, the process will proceed to step two. 

Step two: 

Financial screening. After confirming that the appeal fits within one of the included 
categories, the Appellate Section will notify the pro se party to contact VLS so that the 
latter organization can confirm that the party meets the income eligibility threshold. The 
party must pay VLS an administrative fee to cover that organization's financial 
screening. The amount is minimal; and all organization clients must pay such a fee. 

13 



Step three: 

Obtaining a volunteer attorney. When financial screening is successfully completed, the 
Appellate Section will send an email to a listserv of volunteer attorneys who have 
expressed an interest in pro bono appellate work. This listserv will not be limited to 
members of the Appellate Section. The email to the listserv will include any 
information the Section has about the pending appeal, including relevant documents. 
The first attorney to volunteer for an appeal will be selected. The volunteer will iend his 
or her own engagement letter to the client. 

The Appellate Section will send a confirmation letter to confirm the match. After that, 
the Section will have no further involvement in the case; and neither will VLS, but it 
will provide volunteer attorneys with legal malpractice coverage. 

Must volunteers have appellate experience? 

No. One of the program's objectives is to provide an opportunity for lawyers to get 
appellate experience. For attorneys lacking such experience, the program will have a 
mentoring component: experienced appellate lawyers can volunteer with the Appellate 
Section to serve as mentors. Mentors will not enter an appearance. 

Are there length-of-engagement guidelines or rules? 

The program imposes no obligation on a volunteer attorney to represent a client beyond 
the disposition of the Intermediate Appellate Court. 

Are there reimbursement programs for attorneys volunteering? 

No. Volunteer lawyers agree to serve without compensation for their service. Costs are 
expected to be minimal. As noted, the party must pay a small fee for financial 
screening. As for filing fees, an unrepresented party will have already filed a notice of 
appeal. Other costs remain the client's responsibility, though parties deemed indigent by 
the trial court do not bear appellate costs. Printing costs are minimal because appellate 
briefs are not filed in hard copy; they are electronically filed. 

How will the program be promoted? 

The Appellate Section will advertise on its website and send marketing materials to 
legal aid organizations. Courts will have informational flyers available for the public, 
and so will the HSBA. The program is described on the HSBA Section website at 
www.hawaiiappellatesection.org 
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Who is the contact person? 
Rebecca A. Copeland, Esq. 
Chair, HSBA Appellate Section 
Honolulu, HI 
(808) 792-3808 
chair@hawaiiappellatesection.org 
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INDIANA 

Program creation 

The Indiana Appellate Pro Bono Project was established in 2007 as a joint project of the 
Indiana Bar Association Appellate Practice Section (Indiana Bar APS) and the Indiana 
Pro Bono Commission (Commission), a state agency within the judicial branch. , 

The program is administered primarily by the Commission, with attorney-placement 
assistance from the Indiana Bar APS. 

Case selection and eligibility 

All civil matters are eligible for the program, so long as the party meets the financial­
eligibility guidelines established by the Commission. Case assignments are made at the 
discretion of the Commission, which also screens applicants for financial eligibility, 
according to its general guidelines for providing representation to low-income 
individuals. 

Program funding 

The program costs are absorbed by the Commission, which promotes access to legal 
services for Indiana's low-income residents. The Commission and the Indiana Bar are 
the primary promoters of the program. 

Pro se appeals guide link 

http://www.in.gov/judiciary/cofcI2332.htm 

Program contact 

Matthew T. Albaugh, Esq. 
Faegre Baker Daniels LLP 
Indianapolis, IN 
(317) 237-1359 
matthew.albaugh@faegrebd.com 
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MINNESOTA 

Program creation 

The Minnesota Appellate Pro Bono Program was established in 2002 by the Minnesota 
Bar Association Appellate Practice Section (Minnesota Bar APS), with encouragement 
and input from the Minnesota Court of Appeals. The program's primary purposes are to 
give Minnesota attorneys an opportunity to gain appellate experience and to serve a 
particular pro bono need that was identified by the appellate court in the area of pro se 
unemployment compensation appeals. 

The program is officially administered by the Minnesota Bar APS, but Thomas Boyd 
serves as the program coordinator from his office at Winthrop & Weinstine and has 
done so since the program's inception. 

Case selection and eligibility 

The program accepts only unemployment compensation appeals by pro se litigants 
whose fees have been waived pursuant to state law. The program focuses on these 
appeals because the court receives a significant number of such cases each year. These 
appeals involve limited legal standards that are manageable and easily grasped by 
volunteer attorneys who do not have previous experience in such matters. There was 
also a concern that a more expansive program could sweep in cases that would 
otherwise have gone to paid attorneys. 

The program's narrow focus benefits volunteer attorneys by limiting cases to a pre­
determined area of the law governed primarily by statute and well-defined legal 
principles. In addition, all appeals are from an administrative agency and are based on 
an easy-to-compile record. Generally, eligible cases are screened by Mr. Boyd and the 
volunteer attorneys, who weed out meritless appeals before a volunteer attorney agrees 
to provide pro bono representation. 

Selection, service, and oversight 

Attorneys volunteer for the program by expressing their interest in an email to Mr. 
Boyd or the Minnesota Bar APS or signing up for the program at various State Bar 
Association events. All licensed attorneys are eligible to volunteer; prior appellate 
experience is not required. Mr. Boyd maintains a list of volunteers and assigns cases to 
attorneys according to their availability. Generally, there is no oversight of the attorney 
after he or she has accepted an eligible case. Mr. Boyd, however, makes himself 
available to answer basic questions about administrative issues and court procedure. 
Attorneys are expected to represent the party for the duration of the appeal. 
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Program funding 

The program has no funding source and thus cannot defray costs associated with the pro 
bono representation, and it is voluntarily administered by Mr. Boyd. The lack of 
independent funding presents an issue for sole practitioners and small law firms. 
Generally, volunteer attorneys come from larger firms in Minnesota that can absorb the 
costs associated with pro bono representation. All court fees are waived, pursuant to 
unemployment compensation laws. ' 

Program statistics 

On average, the program accepts 10 to 15 appeals each year. 

Program contact 

Thomas H. Boyd, Esq. 
Winthrop & Weinstine P.A. 
Minneapolis, MN 
(612) 604-6505 
tboyd@winthrop.com 
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MONTANA 

Program creation 

The Montana Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) was established in May 2012 by 
order of the Montana Supreme Court. Confronted with an increase in pro se litigants 
that nearly overwhelmed its Pro Se Law Clerk, the Court established the APBP, 'illong 
with an Access to Justice Commission, to address the needs oflow-income litigants in 
Montana. 

The APBP is administered by the Supreme Court's Pro Bono Coordinator (Coordinator) 
with assistance from the Court's Pro Se Law Clerk. The Montana Legal Services 
Association (Montana LSA) screens applicants for financial eligibility. 

Case selection and eligibility 

Only pending cases involving a pro se litigant are eligible for placement. The pro se 
litigant must have perfected the appeal (if the appellant) and filed an initial brief before 
the APBP screening process is triggered. Pro se cases are then selected through the 
Court's established supplemental-briefing procedure. 

To be eligible for pro bono assistance, the pro se litigant must meet the financial criteria 
established by the Montana LSA for representation of low-income persons and must 
have a case pending before the Court that requires supplemental briefing or oral 
argument. There are no subject matter limitations. In any pending case, the justices may 
order supplemental briefing-triggering the appointment of pro bono counsel for a pro 
se litigant. If multiple parties are self-represented on appeal, the Court will offer pro 
bono counsel to each party who is appearing pro se. 

Selection, service, and oversight 

Attorneys volunteer for the program by completing an online form. All licensed 
attorneys are eligible to volunteer; prior appellate experience is not required. 

The Coordinator is responsible for placing volunteer attorneys with eligible litigants. 
The pro se litigant must consent to the appointment of the selected attorney. Young 
lawyers or lawyers with no appellate experience may be paired with experienced 
attorneys to provide an attorney-mentoring element to the APBP. 

The Court does not guarantee that a case selected for the APBP (and briefed by a 
volunteer attorney) will have oral argument. While the Coordinator recognizes that oral 
argument experience is a significant draw for volunteer attorneys, she does not believe 
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that this rule has discouraged attorneys from volunteering. After a volunteer attorney is 
assigned, the APBP remains in contact with the attorney and provides answers to 
questions, general information regarding the appeal process and administrative issues, 
and, if needed, information regarding practice resources, in order to ensure that the 
attorney has a positive pro bono experience. Volunteer attorneys receive malpractice 
insurance through the Montana LSA. 

Program funding and promotion 

The costs of the APBP are absorbed by the Montana Supreme Court. Court employees, 
led by the Coordinator and the Pro Se Law Clerk, manage the program. Some program 
costs are defrayed by the Montana LSA' s agreement to screen pro se litigants for 
financial eligibility. 

There are no fee-waivers associated with program eligibility. Though a pro bono 
attorney is appointed, the party is responsible for all costs associated with the appeal, 
unless those costs are waived in accordance with existing court rules (unrelated to the 
pro bono program). The Coordinator may, however, facilitate the volunteer attorney's 
access to an electronic record from the trial court (when available), at no cost to the 
attorney or party. 

The APBP is promoted primarily by the Montana Bar Association, which absorbs any 
costs associated with program promotion. The Montana Supreme Court and the 
Montana LSA also promote the program on their websites. 

Program statistics and notes 

Because the program has only operated for one year, the Court has not published any 
reports and has not yet compiled statistics on the APBP. 

Program contact 

Statewide Pro Bono Coordinator 
Montana Supreme Court - Office of the Court Administrator 
(406) 794-7824 
pfain@mt.gov 
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NEW YORK 

History of the program 

New York State's Pro Bono Appeals Program (PBAP) was established by the State Bar 
Association in 2010 and now covers 50 of the state's 62 counties. The State Bar's 
Committee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction (CCAJ) had reviewed an American Bar 
Association report which revealed that only a handful of states offered programs that 
provided pro bono representation in appeals. The committee decided to create a 
program in which experienced appellate attorneys would offer free, quality 
representation in selected appeals. 

CCAJ focused on state court appeals, because the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Second 
Circuit has its own pro bono appeals program. The committee further determined to 
handle appeals to the four judicial Departments of the state's Appellate Division, the 
mid-level appeals court for most appeals. The Clerks of all four Departments were 
consulted, and all voiced support for a pro bono appeals program, but did not want to 
have responsibility for choosing cases or volunteers. CCAJ realized it could not provide 
statewide coverage from the outset and decided to launch a pilot program in the 
Appellate Division, Third Department, based in Albany, covering appeals from 28 
counties. 

The committee partnered with two nonprofits, the Rural Law Center of New York, 
which provides legal services in the state's 44 rural counties, and the Legal Project, 
which provides legal services in the state's wider capital region. They helped shape the 
program, do outreach and intakes, and provide malpractice insurance. CCAJ met with 
the leaders of the Third Department to obtain the support of the court and its input as to 
the proposed program description. Finally, the Executive Committee of the State Bar 
Association approved the pilot. Since then, the Association- from the President to the 
staff-has provided extraordinary support to the program. 

Family Court and other appeals 

Initially, the program handled only Family Court appeals for persons making 250% or 
less of Federal Poverty Guidelines (FPG). That income cap was chosen based on the 
premise that many persons denied assigned counsel because of income above 150% of 
FPG could not afford to retain counsel. Then the program branched out to also cover 
other "Civil Gideon," topics, that is, education, health, housing, and subsistence 
income-including unemployment insurance and Workers' Compensation cases. 
Program applications and brochures were widely distributed. 

A seven-person working group screens cases, accepts only those that appear 
meritorious, and provides rejected applicants with a manual on how to do an appeal pro 
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se, as well as insights on potential problems presented by the case. Accepted cases are 
described and disseminated on a confidentiallistserv to volunteers from CCAJ and 
other participating appellate attorneys. Appeals are typically assigned on a first-come, 
first-serve basis. The program will only represent one side in a given case. 

Cases of interest and outreach efforts 

" Eventually, the program became firmly established in the Third Department, and CCAJ 
was taking about 10 appeals a year. Cases of interest have included one that changed the 
case law on the modification of out-of-state child support orders and on whether 
ministers of the Universal Life Church can officiate at weddings; one on the violation of 
a claimant's constitutional rights in an unemployment insurance matter; and another one 
regarding whether 9/11 volunteers not affiliated with an organization can receive 
Workers' Compensation benefits. While many topics are covered, the vast majority of 
applications concern family law. 

The committee recently did a renewed outreach effort in the Third Department, 
including by sending brochures and posters to chief clerks at all Supreme Courts (a New 
York trial court) and to Family Courts and by meeting with Administrative Judges in all 
affected Judicial Districts. Program literature was also provided to all local, minority, 
and special bar associations. 

Expansion and funding 

In spring 2013, the PBAP was also expanded to the Appellate Division, Fourth 
Department, based in Rochester, which covers 22 counties in the western part of the 
state. The leadership of the court and the State Bar were instrumental in the launch of 
the program there. In both Departments, the PBAP also offers representation for further 
appeals to the Court of Appeals, New York's highest court. 

At the same time, with the support of the Rural Law Center, the program established an 
office in Albany. The office is staffed by two part-time appellate attorneys from CCAJ 
who do the initial vetting of all applications and provide substantive support to 
volunteers, including compiling records when representing appellants. A paralegal also 
assists with administrative matters. Funding comes from the State Bar's philanthropic 
arm, The New York Bar Foundation; the State Office of Court Administration; Interest 
on Lawyer Account grants; and attorney's fees awards in divorce and family law cases 
where fee-shifting based on a disparity in income is permitted. 

The private bar has enthusiastically embraced the program. Dozens of appellate 
attorneys have volunteered to handle cases. In addition to carrying on its existing 
model---emphasizing merits review for persons who cannot obtain assigned or retained 
counsel-the PBAP has added a new model. Through collaborations between the 
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PBAP. a legal aid office in Onondaga County, and a public defender in Monroe County, 
volunteers will serve as of counsel for several Family Court appeals a year for each of 
those offices. These new initiatives are inspired by a successful model in New York 
City, in which an institutional provider of indigent criminal appellate defense services 
collaborates with major law firms that provide pro bono representation. 

As we go to press, the PBAP is slated to meet in fall 2013 with colleagues at the City 
Bar in New York City to discuss how the CCAJ model could be adapted to creat~ a pro 
bono appeals program to meet the needs of New Yorkers in the First and Second 
Departments, covering the state's remaining 12 counties-its most populated counties. 
When that effort comes to fruition, CCAJ's initial dream will be realized-anywhere in 
the state of New York, a litigant of modest means facing an appeal involving the 
essentials of life will have a place to turn to apply for free appellate assistance. 

Among the program's goals is providing greater recognition of volunteers. Currently, 
attorneys are recognized via certificates of appreciation, a listing on the program's 
website, and occasional articles. The PBAP hopes to do more in the future, including 
creating a special awards program for volunteers. A special housing court appeals 
initiative and pro bono opportunities for law school students are also in planning stages. 

Pro se appeals guide link 

http://www .nys ba.org/pro bonoappeals 

Program contact 

Cynthia Feathers, Esq. 
Co-chair, New York State Bar Association 
Committee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction 
and Chair, Pro Bono Appeals Program 
Albany, NY 
(518) 727-8564 
cfeathers@appealsny.org 
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NORTH CAROLINA 

What is the scope and nature of the program? 

The North Carolina Guardian ad Litem program (GAL) advocates on behalf of 
juveniles. The state legislature created the program in 1983 to provide legal 
representation to children who allegedly have been abused, neglected, or are dependent. 
The program relies heavily on a partnership between volunteer child advocates and 
attorney advocates. Program staff recruit, train, and supervise volunteers. 

When a petition alleging abuse or neglect of a juvenile is filed in the trial court, the 
judge appoints a volunteer guardian ad litem advocate and an attorney advocate to 
provide team representation to the child. Trial court proceedings include custody 
hearings; adjudicatory disposition, permanency planning, and review hearings; and 
proceedings to terminate parental rights. A juvenile has full party status in the trial court 
and appellate proceedings. (The parents have their own legal representation, and the 
Department of Social Services is usually also involved as the petitioner.) The attorney 
advocate's duty is to represent the child at the trial level. 

The program has offices in each county. Staff and contract attorneys employed by the 
state focus on trial-level representation. At the appellate level, the caseload is too large 
for state attorneys to handle alone, so the program relies heavily on volunteer appellate 
attorneys. The greatest need for volunteers is at the appellate level because the program 
has only one state-employed attorney dedicated to appeals; and state-paid attorneys are 
typically consumed with work at the trial-court level. Volunteer attorneys handle more 
than 30% of all guardian ad litem appeals. About 200 appeals are currently open. 

Appeals from the district court go to the state's intermediate appellate court, the North 
Carolina Court of Appeals; are filed under an expedited timeline; and typically do not 
include oral arguments, but instead are decided on the briefs. 

Must volunteer attorneys have appellate experience? 

No. Though appellate experience is preferred, it is not required. Appropriate training or 
experience is mandatory to handle appeals, including a two-hour CLE program. The 
program provides a number of resources for volunteer attorneys. After a volunteer 
enters an appearance, the GAL program's appellate counsel may discuss the specifics of 
the cases with the volunteer. 
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Does the program offer an opportunity for attorneys to gain appellate experience? 

Yes. The program is advertised as providing such an opportunity. 

Is a volunteer attorney supervised after a case is assigned? 

Yes, particularly for attorneys new to the program. A state-employed attorney 
coordinates appellate representation for this program and supervises volunteers. ' 

Does the program provide resources for volunteer attorneys? 

Yes. In addition to CLE training, the program has a number of resources available, 
including an attorney manual, a brief bank containing briefs from past cases, and a 
DVD on appellate advocacy tips. 

How is the program funded? 

The program is funded by the state of North Carolina. The state pays for transcripts. 
Juveniles are considered indigent, so they do not have to pay for records. A volunteer 
attorney may have to cover the cost of printing the brief he or she files, but these costs 
may be recovered. Costs of printing a brief are usually nominal. 

How is the program promoted? 

Through the Internet, social media, and contact with attorneys. 

Are volunteers recognized for their service? 

Yes. Volunteers are recognized periodically and receive small tokens of appreciation. 

Are there length-of-engagement guidelines or rules? 

Attorneys represent juveniles in the North Carolina Court of Appeals and may also 
continue with the case in Supreme Court, but if an attorney is not comfortable doing so, 
the program's counsel will take the case back or sign on as co-counsel. 

Who is the contact person? 

Tawanda Foster 
Appellate Counsel and Pro Bono Program Manager 
Raleigh, NC 
tawanda.n.foster@nccourts.org 
(919) 890-1255 

25 



OREGON 

How was the program started? 

The Oregon Pro Bono Program started with inspiration from the Pro Bono Program in 
the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit. The Oregon Supreme Court and Court 
of Appeals select cases. The Program Committee consists of the program managers, the 
Appellate Commissioner, designees of the Chief Justice and Chief Judge, a member of 
the State Bar Appellate Practice Section's Executive Committee, and other individuals 
that named members invite. They meet yearly to review the program and propose 
changes as deemed necessary. 

How are cases chosen? 

A case may be appropriate for acceptance in the program if the court believes that 
referral of the case to a volunteer counsel would be helpful to the court. Selection of a 
case for the program does not reflect a determination of the merits of a party's position, 
but rather indicates that pro bono counsel is considered to be potentially beneficial to 
the court. 

How are volunteers chosen? 

Program managers distribute information about the program to all active members of 
the Oregon State Bar through a yearly email. Attorneys interested in volunteering for 
the program respond by registering with the program manager. In certain cases, the 
appellate courts may request participation of counsel from the program as "amicus to 
the court," rather than as a representative of a party. 

Do volunteers need to have appellate experience? 

Not necessarily. One of the purposes of the program is to provide less experienced 
attorneys with appellate opportunities. Law school clinical programs may participate, 
but are subject to terms and regulations imposed by the program. 

Do you recognize volunteers for their service, such as by certificates or awards or 
articles in bar association pUblications? 

On an annual basis, the Executive Committee of the Appellate Section will 
acknowledge the pro bono work done by volunteer attorneys. 

Are there reimbursement programs for attorneys volunteering? 

No, neither the court nor bar managers reimburse volunteer attorneys for expenses. 
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Who is the contact person? 

Professor Jeffrey C. Dobbins 
Willamette University College of Law 
Salem, OR 
(503) 370-6652 
jdobbins@willamette.edu 
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TENNESSEE 

When was the program created? 

2011. 

'\ 

How was it started? 

A pilot initiative was established by the Tennessee Bar Association (TBA) and the 
statewide Tennessee Alliance Legal Services. 

How are cases chosen? 

Cases are mainly referred from legal services programs or attorneys who have 
represented clients in the lower courts and are not able to continue with those cases 
upon appeal. 

What criteria are used? 

Of particular interest are cases involving matters of first impression or complex legal 
issues, vindication of substantial constitutional rights, and unsettled questions oflaw. 
Judges may refer cases, but that has not happened yet. 

How are volunteers chosen? 

The TBA keeps a list of volunteer attorneys. Usually the first attorney to respond is 
selected. Currently, TBA has an active appellate group. 

Do volunteers need to have appellate experience? 

No. Both young and experienced appellate attorneys are welcome. The program 
provides an opportunity for senior attorneys with appellate expertise to mentor younger 
attorneys seeking such experience. 

On average, how many appeals are handled each year? 

About five cases. The program is being re-Iaunched and promoted this year and is 
looking to include areas such as administrative appeals and to increase the number of 
referrals and cases handled. 
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Are there reimbursement programs for attorneys volunteering? 

No, however, sometimes TBA is able to find financial assistance for transcripts for the 
attorneys. 

Who is the contact person? 

Elizabeth Todaro, JD 
Access to Justice Coordinator 
Tennessee Bar Association 
Nashville, TN 
(615) 383-7421 
ltodaro@tnbar.org 
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TEXAS 

When was the program created? 

The current version of the program went live beginning in 2007. 

How was it started? 

The appellate courts in Texas have been a driving force behind advancing the mission 
of fair and efficient administration of justice. State and local bar associations have 
assisted in that mission through pro bono appellate programs serving qualified 
applicants throughout the state. The latest iteration of the Texas State Bar Appellate 
Program and excellent stand-alone programs are the embodiment of efforts of both the 
appellate bench and bar. 

What entities are involved in the program? 

The following appellate courts have programs administered through the Texas State Bar 
Appellate Pro Bono Program: the Texas Supreme Court; the Fifth Circuit Court of 
Appeals; and the First, Second, Third, and Fourteenth Courts of Appeals. The Dallas 
Court of Appeals, the state's busiest intermediate appellate court, has its own program, 
administered through the Dallas Volunteer Attorney Program. Through an ad hoc 
program administered by the State Bar Appellate Section, volunteer pro bono appellate 
lawyers can also be placed with any case pending anywhere in the state (whether or not 
an official pro bono program exists for that particular appellate court). 

How are cases chosen? 

When a pro se party initiates a civil appeal, the required docketing statement includes a 
brief description of the pro bono programs and asks whether the party wishes to 
participate. When a party elects to do so, the Clerk of the Court forwards the docketing 
statement to the applicable screening committee working with that court. The 
committee screens referred cases based on a number of discretionary criteria, including 
financial means, with 200% of Federal Poverty Guidelines as a benchmark. Other 
factors include the number of appeals pending, the number of available volunteer 
lawyers, and the issues presented. The committee sends to a database of volunteers an 
email providing a very brief overview of the case. 

When a volunteer indicates an interest in a case, the committee serves as a liaison to 
match the pro se party with the lawyer. In the vast majority of cases, volunteers are 
found. However, there is no guarantee that a match will be found. As a general rule, 
certain committees will presumptively solicit volunteers without substantial screening 
of the merits, recognizing that non-meritorious cases likely will not generate any 
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responses from the volunteer pool. The Dallas Volunteer Attorney Program utilizes a 
similar approach in screening for financial need. 

The Supreme Court of Texas has its own Pro Bono Pilot Program. Review in that court 
proceeds in multiple phases. First, parties file petitions for review, identifying issues to 
be raised. If the court wants additional information, it will request briefing on the merits 
from the parties, and if a pro se party is involved, the court will refer the case to its Pro 
Bono Pilot Program. The program liaison will then seek volunteer lawyers to wo~k with 
the pro se parties. 

How are volunteers chosen? 

Attorneys interested in volunteering must submit an application to be considered for the 
State Bar Appellate Pro Bono Program. The committee then asks volunteer attorneys 
what their particular areas of interest or experience are so that appropriate matches can 
be made. The Dallas Volunteer Attorney Program utilizes a similar approach. Many 
pro bono appellate lawyers are on multiple program lists. 

Do volunteers need to have appellate experience? 

No. Attorneys do not have to have previous appellate experience. As part of the 
recruiting effort, there is a tiered program to attract a wide variety of appellate 
practitioners. One goal is to include as many highly experienced appellate attorneys as 
possible. Another goal is to include new appellate practitioners who can handle a case 
with assistance from more experienced practitioners. Appellate lawyers have the option 
of either taking on a case as lead counselor mentoring less experienced practitioners. 
Junior lawyers can gain valuable experience by taking a lead role in representing pro 
bono clients on appeal, with opportunities to present oral argument. 

How is the program funded? 

The State Bar Appellate Pro Bono Program is funded by the Appellate Section. In 
practice, volunteers and/or their firms also cover some of the costs associated with 
representing pro bono clients. The Dallas Volunteer Attorney Program is a nonprofit 
entity funded via grants. 

On average, how many appeals are handled each year? 

Anywhere from 24 to 36 through all channels. 
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Have there been any particularly noteworthy cases you would like to highlight? 

Pro bono appellate volunteers have won appellate reversals in difficult cases, including 
one case for an indigent civil rights claimant and another for an asylum-seeking 
immigrant. 

How do you promote the program? 

The program is promoted via appellate court web sites, docketing statements of 
participating state appellate courts, brochures, emails, state and local appellate bar 
association meetings, and one-on-one attorney recruiting. 

Do you recognize volunteers for their service, such as by certificates or awards or 
articles in bar association publications? 

Volunteers are recognized in meetings, and pro bono hours count towards the State Bar 
of Texas Pro Bono College, which lauds attorneys who have far exceeded the State 
Bar's aspirational pro bono goal. 

What obstacles had to be overcome to establish the program? 

Qualifying applicants and gathering their paperwork and information can be time­
consuming. The committee has two co-chairs and several city-specific screening teams 
to tackle the load. The Dallas Volunteer Attorney Program uses its in-house screening 
personnel and systems. 

What lessons have been learned in implementing the program? 

(1) The courts of appeals, their judges, lawyers, clerks, and staff know best what will 
work with their systems. (2) They are always willing to help. (3) Applicants need to be 
able to speak with someone on the program committee at the very early stages of 
seeking representation. (4) Forms, pamphlets, and communications need to be 
standardized and available both in hard copy and electronically. (5) The qualification 
phase should be centralized, so that once an applicant is cleared, the request can go to 
volunteers via email. 

What advice do you have for other states that wish to start a program? 

Start a dialogue with the court( s) from the outset and study what has worked in other 
jurisdictions. The Fifth Court of AppealslDallas Volunteer Appellate Program is an 
excellent stand-alone program that could provide a framework for an initial pilot 
program. 

32 



Is there any oversight after cases are assigned? 

Volunteer attorneys report at case conclusion. 

Are there length-of-engagement guidelines or rules? 

Length of engagement is governed by the arrangements reached between the client and 
\ 

volunteer attorney. 

Are there reimbursement programs for attorneys volunteering? 

No, the volunteer lawyers agree to serve without expectation of compensation for their 
servIce or expenses. 

Does Texas have a pro se appeals guide? 

Yes, go to http://www.tex-app.org/sct probono practice guide.pdf 

Who are contact persons? 

Heidi Bloch, Esq. 
Immediate Past Chair 
Texas Bar Association Appellate Section 
Austin, TX 
(512) 703-5733 
heidi. bloch@huschblackwell.com 

David Mizgala, Esq. 
Pro Bono Committee Co-Chair 
Dallas, TX 
(214) 855-7556 
dmizgala@munsch.com 

O. Rey Rodriguez, Esq. 
Pro Bono Committee Co-Chair 
Dallas, TX 
(214) 855-7119 
orodriguez@nortonrosefulbright.com 
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VIRGINIA 

The Virginia Supreme Court has a volunteer appellate attorney program under which 
counsel is assigned by the court for certain cases. Through the program, attorneys fall 
into two groups: experienced appellate advocates and lawyers looking for appellate 
experience. When cases are chosen, the court assigns one attorney from each gro~p, 
thus providing a mentoring relationship. 

This structure has various advantages. The clients benefit because they receive capable 
appellate representation. The less experienced lawyers do not have to take the sole 
responsibility for learning and complying with the nuances of the appellate system, 
while the experienced lawyers participate in an appeal, but do not have to do all the 
heavy lifting themselves. The court benefits because it receives a case with both sides 
professionally briefed, thus making sure that there is not an imbalance in the 
presentation of those cases, which can skew the results and make bad case law. 

Unfortunately, because most civil appeals in Virginia are by petition, most indigent 
litigants do not get counsel at the petition stage. As a result, only three or four pairs of 
attorneys per year are invited by the court to represent indigent clients on appeal. 

Contact person 

Clerk 
Virginia Supreme Court 
Richmond, V A 
(804) 786-2251 
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WISCONSIN 

The Wisconsin State Bar's Appellate Practice Section coordinates a pro bono appeals 
program for cases in the state's Court of Appeals and Supreme Court and, occasionally, 
federal appellate courts. 

The program does not take requests for pro bono counsel directly from potential clients, 
because it lacks the resources to screen for indigence or merit. The courts and various 
public interest firms identify cases involving important legal issues and screen for 
indigence. Then they call the pro bono program coordinator for a volunteer willing to 
represent the indigent party. Sometimes organizations like Legal Action of Wisconsin, 
the Legal Aid Society, and the ACLU seek a volunteer to write an amicus brief. 
Historically, most of the appeals have involved civil or quasi-criminal law matters, such 
as due process rights in prison disciplinary proceedings, family law issues, and 
collateral attacks on criminal convictions. 

Recently, the State Public Defender has begun to refer some direct criminal appeals to 
the program. It also refers cases for which it lacks authority to appoint counsel. For 
example, after losing a search-and-seizure case in the Wisconsin Supreme Court, the 
State Public Defender determined that its client was no longer eligible for 
representation. The pro bono program then provided counsel to prepare a petition for a 
writ of certiorari to the U.S. Supreme Court. 

The program handles about 10 to 15 appeals per year. Since its inception in 1998, it has 
provided counsel in more than 200 appeals. In 2009, the program began tracking the 
hours and expenses donated by volunteer lawyers. From March 2009 through July 2013, 
lawyers donated more than 7,000 hours of time and more than $2 million in fees and 
costs. 

The program coordinator has developed a sense of which issues or types of litigation 
will be attractive to firms. Some large firms seek training opportunities for their 
associates. Smaller firm lawyers may want an opportunity for their first argument 
before the Wisconsin Supreme Court. Some attorneys have a passion for certain kinds 
of issues, such as constitutional law, family law, or ineffective assistance of counsel. 
Others just want to donate their appellate expertise. The coordinator considers such 
factors when contacting a lawyer about a case. 

The program tries to offer volunteers the resources they need to do a good job. It will 
connect the volunteer lawyer with an attorney who is knowledgeable in the area of law 
at issue, provide sample motions or briefs, and organize rehearsal arguments before a 
panel of retired judges and/or practitioners. 
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For Wisconsin's pro se appeals guide, go to: 
http://www . wicourts. gOY /publications/ guides/ docs/proseappealsguide. pdf. 

Contact person 

Colleen D. Ball, Esq. 
Milwaukee, WI 53202 
(414) 227-3110 
ballc@opd.wi.gov 
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Appellate Courts Pro Bono Pilot Project 

The Appel/ate Courts Committee has partnered with Public Counsel's new 
Appellate Law Program to provide pro bono assistance to eligible civil 
litigants in the Second Appel/ate District. The pilot program includes a 
walk-in, self-help clinic staffed by Public Counsel at the Second Appel/ate 
District courthouse in downtown Los Angeles. Committee members can 
volunteer in different ways. 

• Take a Case. Represent an indigent civil litigant in el igible cases as 
posted on our website. 

• Answer Walk-In Questions. Staff the Appellate Law clinic for a 
couple of hours and answer routine questions from walk-ins. 

• Evaluate A Record. Examine, from an appellate perspective, 
whether the case presents potentially meritorious issues and make 
a recommendation to the Appellate Law clinic. 

• Mentor An Attorney .; Guide an attorney who has taken an appeal 
pro bono from the Appellate Law clin ic but has limited appel/ate 
experience. 

We will announce new eligible cases requiring pro bono assistance by way 
of email to members of the Appellate Courts Section. 

If you have any questions about the pilot program, contact Lisa Jaskol, 
Directing Attorney of Public Counsel's Appel/ate Law Program, at (213) 
385-2977 ext. 151 or Ijaskol@publ iccounsel .org, or Tom Charchut, at 
(310) 215-7730 or charchut@hbblaw.com . 
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Court of Appeal, Second Appellate District 
Drop-In Clinic Helps Litigants Navigate the Maze of Court Procedures 

For the typical unrepresented civil litigant, the appel­

late process can be daunting. Filing requirements are 

exacting. The procedure bears no resemblance to the 

more familiar trial court routine. The very language 

can baffle even the sophisticated layperson. Associate 

Justice Laurie Zelon, in 2005, convened a group of 

judges, court staff, and bar leaders to discuss what 

could be done to help these people, an increasingly 

large percentage of litigants in the 5,000 cases that 

the Second Appellate District of the Court of Appeal 

decides each year. 

The chief goal was to make access to the court 

more readily available by demystifying the process, 

says Joseph A. Lane, the court's clerk and executive 

officer. But providing assistance to unrepresented 

litigants could serve the court as well. It could reduce 

the number of administrative delays caused by pro se 

error, and it could improve the quality of the record 

and briefing on appeal. 

The result of that 2005 meeting was the first formal 

program in any state court to provide a drop-in clinic 

for appellate litigants-a place where, in the words of 

one user, "they treat you like a human being." 

Launched in 2007, the Appellate Self-Help Clinic is 

conveniently housed in the court's on-site Settlement 

and Mediation Center. Open three days a week, the 

clinic is staffed by two lawyers from Public Counsel, the 

pUblic-interest law office of the Los Angeles County and 

Beverly Hills bar associations. In the first two years they 

served 398 litigants. 

The self-help clinic is open to anyone, though the vast 

majority of users are indigent, states Lisa Jaskol, the 

chief clinic attorney. Litigants can make appointments, 

but they're also welcome to drop in anytime. Spanish­

language assistance is available with advance notice. 

Both attorneys are trained appellate specialists who 

can assist litigants in meeting the highly technical fil­

ing requirements. Typically, the lawyer will explain the 

difference between trial and appellate proceedings. 

She will also explain the appellate process and proce­

dure, review the litigant's paperwork, and provide and 

help fill out Judicial Council forms. 
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Attorney Lisa Jaskol confers with litigants. 

The clinic's attorneys do not provide representation or 

give legal advice. But for some indigent civil litigants, 

they offer to recruit pro bono legal representation, using 

the listserve of the Los Angeles County Bar Associa­

tion's Appellate Courts Committee. 

In the first two years, 101 attorneys did pro bono work 

for litigants through the clinic. The clinic provides valu­

able opportunities for junior attorneys to work under 

the guidance of experienced appellate practitioners. 

Clinic policy is set by a committee chaired by Justice 

Zelon, with members drawn from the Appellate Courts 

Committee, representatives of Public Counsel, and 

prominent appellate practitioners. 

Startup and upkeep costs to the court have been mini­

mal. The court donates part-time use of a multifunction 

office; a computer, telephone number, and phone 

access for the clinic lawyers; and office supplies. 

A grant from the State Bar's Equal Access Fund 

partially covers Public Counsel's costs for the program. 

Contact: 
Joseph Lane, Clerk/Administrator 
(213) 830-7112 I joseph.lane@jud.ca.gov 

Litigants routinely report that they would have 

been unable to proceed with their appeals, or to 

defend against an opposing party's appeal, without 

the clinic's support. 

"I feel like they are working for me," one litigant said. 

"They don't speak down to you," said another. 

"When you walk in nobody knows anything about your 

case, but they have open arms, they want to help you, 

and that really feels good," said a third. 

Court staff also are enthusiastic. As one staff member 

puts it, "After speaking with [the clinic attorney], litigants 

are more educated about the process, and they're more 

receptive to what we have to say." 

TO REPLICATE THIS PROGRAM: 

• Develop a local working group 
of individuals from the bar and 
community to brainstorm a list 
of resources that can be tapped. 

• Obtain funding to staff the clinic 
with an attorney who is not paid 
by or answerable to the court. 

• Find space in or near the courthouse 
to make the clinic as accessible as 
possible to litigants. 
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Appellate Law - Practice Areas - Public Counsel 

Search 

TI,e Na.tion S La t1/est 
Pro-Bono Law Firm ' 

Practice Areas (http://www.site.org/practice areas) 

Appellate Law 

Page 1 of2 

(http://www.site.org/home) 

Public Counsel's Appellate Law Program helps pro se litigants better represent themselves in their civil matters 

and provides pro bono representation in selected cases. The Program thereby increases access to justice and 

improves efficiency in the courts. The Program operates two clinics, one for civil appeals and one for federal 

district court cases. Both clinics assist pro se litigants with a wide variety of civil cases. 

Self-Help Appellate Clinic 

A pro se civil litigant faces numerous hurdles in the appellate courts. Determining whether a trial court's order is 

appealable, calculating the time to file a notice of appeal, providing an adequate record to the appellate court, 

and drafting briefs that clearly discuss the relevant facts, procedural history, and law are difficult tasks for many 

of these individuals. Public Counsel's Appellate Law Program, in partnership with the Second Appellate District 

of the California Court of Appeals, operates a self-help clinic to help pro se civil litigants in the Second 

Appellate District accomplish these and other tasks. 

The self-help clinic is located at the California Court of Appeal in downtown Los Angeles. A Public Counsel 

attorney with experience in civil appeals staffs the clinic. Among other things, the clinic provides litigants 

Judicial Council and Second District rules and forms, sample briefs, simplified practice guides, and detailed 

explanations of the many rules and procedures involved in the appellate process. The clinic is open Mondays, 

Wednesdays and Fridays. People seek assistance from the clinic in a wide variety of civil appeals. 

Pro Bono Representation on Appeal 

When the Appellate Law Program identifies a pro se indigent civil litigant with an appellate matter that is 

appropriate for pro bono representation, the Program works with the Appellate Courts Committee of the Los 

Angeles County Bar Association to place the appeal with pro bono counsel. Matters are appropriate for 

placement with pro bono counsel when a litigant's position on appeal appears to have arguable merit and the 

litigant and the appellate court would benefit from having a lawyer prepare the litigant's briefs and present oral 

argument. The Appellate Law Program carefully screens appeals before placing them with pro bono counsel 

and is available to provide support to counsel throughout the appellate process. 

Federal Pro Se Clinic 

htlp:llwww.publiccounsel.org/practice_areas?id=0007 10/6/2013 
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Federal court also presents numerous challenges to pro se civil litigants. Public Counsel's Proskauer Federal 

Pro Se Clinic assists these litigants in the U.S. District Court for the Central District of California. Located in the 

downtown Los Angeles federal courthouse, the clinic helps pro se civil litigants in federal cases prepare 

complaints and responsive pleadings, provides written instructions and forms for other common pleadings, 

answers procedural questions, and explains legal concepts such as jurisdiction, venue, and service of 

process. The clinic is open on Mondays, Wednesdays and Fridays. 

The clinic was made possible by a generous grant to Public Counsel from the law firm Proskauer LLP. In 

addition, the clinic enjoys strong support from the court's judges and staff. 

Pro Bono Representation in Federal Court 

When the Federal Pro Se Clinic identifies a case brought by an indigent pro se civil litigant that is appropriate 

for pro bono representation, the clinic places the case with pro bono counsel. In addition, Public Counsel 

works with the District Court to find pro bono counsel for prisoners whose federal civil rights actions have 

survived a dispositive motion such as summary judgment. 

http://www . publiccounsel.org/practice _ areas?id=0007 10/6/2013 
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LA W CEN T ER 

APPELLATE LAW PROGRAM 

Evaluating appeals. 

Public Counsel's Appellate Law Program places appeals 
with pro bono counsel for representation when an indigent 
appellant in a civil matter can present one or more arguably 
meritorious issues to the appellate court. To determine 
whether the appellant can do so, it is necessary to conduct a 
thorough evaluation of the appeal. Attorneys evaluating an 
appeal will review the entire record on appeal -- including trial 
court documents and (where relevant) hearing transcripts -­
conduct appropriate legal research, and inform the Appellate 
Law Program whether, in light of the applicable standard of 
appellate review, the appellant can present one or more 
arguably meritorious issues to the appellate court. 

"Meritorious" does not mean the appellant will 
necessarily prevail but rather that the issue walTants serious 
consideration by the appellate court and may warrant a ruling 
in the appellant's favor. By contrast, an appellant's argument 
lacks merit if it would be frivolous as that term has been 
interpreted under Code of Civil Procedure section 907. 

In evaluating the appeal, an attorney is assisting the 
Appellate Law Program only. The attorney is not forming an 
attorney-client relationship with the appellant whose appeal 
the attorney is evaluating. In fact, the appellant will not know 
the identity or law fIrm of the attorney evaluating the appeal. 

If the attorney evaluating an appeal determines that the 
appellant can present arguably meritorious issues to the 
appellate court, the attOlney is welcome to handle the appeal 
as the appellant's pro bono appellate counsel. Altelnatively, 
the attorney may return the appeal to the Appellate Law 
Program, which will place it with other pro bono counsel. 
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Free Appellate Self-Help Clinic 
for Low-Income Civil litigants 

You may be eligible to attend a free, ~elf-help clinic for low-income civil litigants if your case is on 
appeal or if you want to appeal a ruling or judgment entered ag<unst you. 

Public Counsel, the public interest law office of the Los Angeles County and Beverly Hills Bar 
Associations, provides a free self-help clinic in the Conference Center of the Court of Appeal, located 
on the second floor of the Ronald Reagan State Building at 300 South Spring Street in dovvntown Los 
Angeles. 

The clinic staff can help by providing information about the many procedures, filings and deadlines 
appellants and respondents will encounter throughout the appeals process. However, the staff cannot 
represent you and cannot provide legal advice. 

The clinic sees people on a first-come, first-served basis and addresses issues that might arise at any 
stage of the appeal. 

Appeals topics covered include: 

® Appealability of the Irial court's order ("Is my order appealable?") 
® Record on appeal (what it is) 
® Designation of record on appeal (notifying the superior court which records to prepare for the 

Court of Appeal to review) 
® Civil Case Information Statement 
® Certificate of Interested Entities or Persons 
® Motions and Applications (and the difference between the two) 
® Fee waivers and the costs that are covered when a fee waiver is granted 
® How to overcome minor mistal<.es that place your appeal ill jeopardy ("curing" defaults) 
® General guidance on how to stmcture and write a brief 
® How to use proper legal and factual citations in briefs and motions 
® Proofs of service - when they are required, who gets served, and who may serve documents 

on your behalf 
Y Retaining counsel midway through and the "substitution of attomey" requirement 
® Oral argument (not a "new trial"); responding to a calendar notice informing you about oral 

argument; what it means to choose not to participate in oral argument 

The clinic is normally open from 9:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon and from 1:00 to 3:00 p.m. on 
Wednesdays and Fridays. For more information, and to mal<.e sure the clinic will be open when you 
want to come, call LisaJaskol during clinic hours at (213) 830-7234 or at (213) 385-2977, ext 151 
during non-clinic hours, or email her at Ijaskol@publiccounsel.org. 

Spanish-l;mguage assisk1J1ce available with advance notice. Tellemos ayuda ell eSPaJiol, pero 1l0S dene que lloljjjear con liempo. 
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A NEW PRO BONO FRONTIER: 
CALIFORNIA'S COURT OF APPEAL 

Although there are never enough pro bono lawyers 
to fill the need, there have long been many ways 
for indigent litigants to find legal representation 
in California's trial courts. But not in California's 
vast state appellate system - until now. 

The experiment is happening in California's 
Second District, which covers Los Angeles and 
several other counties. The Court's 32 justices 
issue some 5,000 opinions annually, making it by 
far the state's largest and most active appellate 
district. Fortunately for the subject of this article, 
it is also home both to a Court of Appeal justice 
with a career-long commitment to equal access to 
justice, and to Public Counsel, the country's largest 
pro bono legal services organization. And now it is 
home to what is likely the first appellate pro bono 
program of its kind anywhere. 

It began in May 2005, when the Second District's 
Justice Laurie Zelon convened a small group to 
brainstorm how to deliver pro bono legal services 
to unrepresented appellate litigants. In addition to 
Justice Zelon (who among many other activities 
has been a long-time member and past chair of 
the California Commission on Access to Justice), 
the group included Joseph Lane, the Clerk of the 
Court; Marilyn Alper, immediate past chair of the 
Los Angeles County Bar Association's Appellate 
Courts Committee; Richard Nakamura, the current 
chair; Dan Grunfeld, then President of Public 
Counsel; and me. 

There was no California state-court precedent for 
this program. Nor could we use the Ninth Circuit's 
program as a model, because it involved funding 
and staffing that were not available to the Second 
District, as well as a level of court supervision with 
which the Second District was not comfortable. So 
we assumed the program would have to be operated 
largely, if not entirely, by volunteers. 

The first task was to 
try to imagine what the 
program would look 
like. What kind of clients 
would we take? What 
kind of cases? How would 
we decide - or should 
we even try to decide 
- whether the cases 
had sufficient merit to 
walT ant the effort to find 
a pro bono lawyer? And, 
perhaps most difficult, 

by Fellow Robin Meadow 

how would we connect clients and lawyers? 

The first two questions were fairly easy, at least 
in concept. Public Counsel has well-established 
procedures for determining indigency. We also 
decided very quickly to limit cases to those 
involving only a few subjects - family law, housing, 
benefits, and consumer issues - and involving only 
one self-represented party. 

Merit was a tougher question. Self-represented 
litigants (in propria persona, or pro per in 
California parlance) frequently file meritless 
appeals. It would be hard to generate enthusiasm 
if the pro bono lawyer were to open the file and 
immediately discover that there was no possible 
basis for the appeal. 

We decided to enlist the County Bar's Appellate 
Courts Committee. Once Public Counsel identified 
a potential client and case, a member of the 
Committee would conduct a preliminary review of 
the case to determine whether there were arguably 
meritorious issues. The goal would not be to 
determine the chance of success, but just to screen 
out obviously frivolous appeals. There would be 
no attorney-client relationship at this point; the 
Committee member would work in the background. 

THEApPll1 liE .\IJ\IJ( Illl 21J1J7 1 ~\LE 3 Page 9 
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Then, if the case passed this test, Public Counsel 
would seek a volunteer attorney through its usual 
channels. Since the volunteer would likely be a 
junior lawyer with little or no appellate expertise 
(and probably with little appellate expertise in 
his or her film), a Committee member would be 
available as a mentor. 

In sum, Public Counsel would provide pro bono 
expertise and the Appellate Courts Committee 
would provide appellate expertise. The Appellate 
Courts Committee enthusiastically signed on. But 
where were the clients? This proved to be a more 
difficult problem. 

The initial approach was to have Public Counsel 
staff reach out to potential clients. The Clerk of 
the Court would identify candidates via the Civil 
Case Information Statement that every California 
appellant must file, and forward the names to Public 
Counsel. Public Counsel would then call the parties 
to conduct an indigency screening and to learn 
basic information about the case. 

The effort fell fiat. As perhaps we should have 
realized, potential clients were turned off by getting 
cold calls from someone they didn't know asking 
if they needed a lawyer. We needed a better way 
to connect with them. 

The breakthrough came in 2006, when Public 
Counsel obtained a Partnership Grant from the 
State Bar of California's Equal Access Fund, 
administered by the Bar's Legal Services Trust 
Fund Program. This allowed Public Counsel 
to dedicate a staff member to the project, who 
would run a clinic using space in the State Office 
Building provided by the Court of Appeal. The 
staff member was another breakthrough: Lisa 
J askol, an experienced appellate lawyer who was 
previously a partner at Horvitz & Levy. In addition 
to providing walk-in help, she would screen cases 
and coordinate volunteers. 

The clinic opened in February 2007, with Lisa at 
the helm. Here is how the program works now: 

• When a pro per appellant files a notice of appeal, 
the Clerk's initial mailing to that patty includes 
a notice that describes the program. In addition, 

the court's website includes a comprehensive 
description of the program, with a permanent 
navigation link to it. (The link appears on a special 
page of resources for self-represented appellate 
litigants - see www.courtinjo.ca.gov/courts/ 
courtsojappeaZ12ndDistrict/se!jhelp. htm.) Finally, 
Public Counsel sends letters inviting pro per 
litigants to submit their cases to Public Counsel 
for screening to determine whether they qualify 
for placement in the program. One way or another, 
interested litigants end up at Public Counsel, 
which screens them for financial eligibility. 

• The clinic is open several days a week. As of this 
writing, there have been 93 clinic sessions and 
the clinic has assisted 144 qualifying litigants. 
Most have a pending or potential appeal in the 
Second District, and most are appellants. A few 
have matters in the Los Angeles Superior Court's 
Appellate Division (mostly cases involving less 
than $25,000). The appeals involve a wide variety 
of subjects, without the limitations in the initial 
version of the program. 

• In addition to the litigants who qualified for 
assistance, the clinic has given referrals to or 
turned away some 50-60 others, such as people 
with criminal matters, with incomes over the 
IOLTA (Interest on Lawyers Trust Accounts) 
guidelines, or with trial court matters. 

• Lisa can often determine from her initial informal 
screening that there is no possible merit - where, 
for example, the notice of appeal is late, or the 
litigant wants to challenge a factual determination 
based on disputed evidence. But in about 
30-40 cases, she has needed to request further 
information, which the litigants supply about half 
the time. Lisa either conducts the further screening 
herself or refers it out to members of the Appellate 
Courts Committee. The further screening can 
range from simply reviewing additional record 
materials to substantive legal research. (One of my 
associates recently screened a case that required 
research on a rather exotic question of judgment 
finality/appealability. Unfortunately, though, later 
information made clear that there was no possible 
merit to the appeal.) 
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• So far, Lisa has placed four cases with pro bono 
counsel, all with large firms. In addition, at the 
request of a staff lawyer for another Court of 
Appeal district, she found pro bono representation 
solely for a mediation. The mediation was 
successful, and the experience suggests expanding 
the program to include mediated cases. 

• One reason for Public Counsel's success in 
marshaling pro bono lawyers is that it provides 
training in areas that its pro bono lawyers may 
not be familiar with but want to learn about. That 
certainly describes appellate law, especially for 
junior big-fu·m lawyers who often can't get any 
appellate experience or training at their firms. 
Although pro per appeals don't generally involve 
complex issues of appellate practice, pro bono 
lawyers still need to know the basics. But unlike 
trial court litigation, the potential pool of trainers 
is limited. Here, too, we expect the Appellate 
Courts Committee to provide the trainers. 

I took on the first training with one of my associates. 
We spent about two hours giving a group of big­
fu·m first-years a road map of the appellate process, 
along with a promise to answer questions that might 
arise in their pro bono cases. They were interested 
and eager, and asked good questions. As part of 
the process, we developed a basic outline that can 
serve as a guide for future training. 

The program differs from the Ninth Circuit's in 
almost every detail, as one quickly sees from 
reviewing the Ninth Circuit's handbook (available 
at the Ninth Circuit's website at www.ca9.uscourts. 
gov/ca9/probono.nsf). Among the important 
differences: 

• The Ninth Circuit's program is staffed and funded 
by the Court. 

• The handbook does not identify any indigency 
requirement and there does not appear to be any 
financial screening process. Rather, the program 
focuses on "only cases presenting issues of 
first impression or some complexity, or cases 
otherwise warranting further briefing and oral 
argument." Pro Bono Handbook, at 1. One of the 
reasons the Court looks for cases that involve 

oral argument is to provide an incentive for 
volunteers. In contrast to the Ninth Circuit, in 
which oral argument is at the court's discretion, 
in California's appellate courts oral argument is a 
matter of right, so every volunteer who completes 
briefing has the chance to argue. 

• The Ninth Circuit program generally kicks in 
after briefing, when staff personnel review the 
case to detelmine whether further briefing or oral 
argument would be helpful. 

• Ninth Circuit pro bono counsel are appointed by 
order of the Court and can seek reimbursement 
of out-of-pocket costs from the court. 

Another California program bears watching. Under 
the leadership of Justice Maria P. Rivera and Fellow 
Paul Fogel, the First District, which covers the San 
Francisco Bay Area, launched a program in April 
2007. It differs from the Second District's program 
in two major respects: There is no staffed clinic, 
and cases do not enter the program until after the 
record is filed. Otherwise, the basic sequence of 
events is essentially the same. The pro per litigant 
is contacted and asked whether he or she might 
want counsel. If so, Bay Area Legal Aid screens 
the litigant for financial eligibility, and a volunteer 
lawyer screens the case for potential merit (on 
the basis, as in the Second District, that the case 
need not be a winning one, but must rise above 
frivolous). Then volunteer counsel steps in. 

These are exciting experiments. Beyond serving 
indigent appellate litigants - who so far have had 
nowhere to turn for pro bono counsel - they will 
improve the appellate decision-making process 
through better briefing. And they will provide 
unusual opportunities for young lawyers to get 
a taste of appellate practice while performing an 
important public service .• :. 

Fellow Robin Meadow is a partner in the Los 
Angeles firm of Greines, Martin, Stein & Richland 
LLP. He is a Past President of the California 
Academy of Appellate Lawyers. 
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Appellate Pro Bono Program 

The Appellate Pro Bono Program of the Colorado Bar 

Association (CBA) is a pilot program that provides pro bono 

attorneys to represent indigent pro se litigants in civil cases pending 

before the Colorado Court of Appeals and the Colorado Supreme 

Court. The program was approved by the CBA's Executive Council, 

the CBA's Litigation Council, the Appellate Practice Subcommittee, 

the Governing Board of Metro Volunteer Lawyers (MVL), the 

Colorado Court of Appeals , and the Colorado Supreme Court. 

A five-person task force consisting of Judge Daniel Taubman 

and Judge David Richman of the Colorado Court of Appeals, and 

attorneys Christina Gomez, Jane Ebisch, and Tony Viorst developed 

the program. Judge Gale Miller of the Court of Appeals also 

assisted in developing the program. When creating the program, 

the task force gathered information from similar pro bono programs 

in Austin and Houston, Texas, and worked in close cooperation 

with the Appellate Practice Subcommittee and the MVL. This 

document discusses the contours of the program. 

1 
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1. Substantive Criteria for Case Selection 

Pro se litigants with civil cases pending in the Colorado Court 

of Appeals are eligible for representation through the program; 

however, unemployment compensation and prison inmate 

disciplinary appeals are excluded. 

At the supreme court level, pro bono representation is 

available in civil matters for the filing of petitions for certiorari and 

responses to petitions for certiorari, and if a certiorari petition is 

granted, for review on the merits. With regard to a matter before 

the Colorado Supreme Court, a civil matter for the purposes of this 

program does not include criminal cases or cases involving post 

criminal conviction relief, prison discipline, habeas corpus appeals, 

ballot title appeals or election appeals. 

Pro se litigants are encouraged to submit applications for 

representation, which are reviewed: by the screening committee. 

When reviewing applications, the screening committee considers the 

following substantive criteria to determine whether a particular case 

is appropriate for inclusion within the Appellate Pro Bono Program: 

2 
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A. Indigency (1250
/0 of the federal poverty guidelines, the 

same criterion used by the MVL); 

B. Issues of first impression; 

C. Complex issues; 

D. Potentially meritorious claims; 

E. Recurring issues that may otherwise evade review; 

F. Issues that have already been briefed pro se and for 

which the court requests briefing by a pro bono attorney; 

G. Cases concerning the vindication of significant 

constitutional or statutory rights; 

H. The number of appeals currently in the program; and 

I. The number of available volunteer lawyers. 

Although the factor of indigency is a requirement, the remaining 

factors are discretionary. Also, the program will not accept fee­

generating cases, unless the applicant has unsuccessfully made 

reasonable good faith efforts to obtain contingent fee counsel; but 

this rule does not preclude acceptance of a case where an attorney 

fee may be available pursuant to statute, rule, or contract. 

II. Initial Procedures 
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To inform pro se litigants of the opportunity for pro bono 

representation, the program employs a variety of approaches. The 

Court of Appeals now includes a paragraph in the notice sent to 

litigants after a notice of appeal has been filed, informing them of 

the program. The Supreme Court will send a similar notice to 

potentially eligible pro se litigants after they file petitions for 

certiorari. 

This information will advise pro se litigants that they can 

access the application form via a link on the CBA website. The 

notice will advise pro se litigants that they may obtain a copy of the 

application at the clerk's office of either court. 

Additionally, these notices caution pro se litigants that if they 

apply for pro bono representation, they must still adhere to all 

applicable deadlines for pursuing their appeal, including the filing 

of appellate briefs. 

Finally, the notices strongly recommend that pro se litigants 

request a pro bono attorney within fourteen days of receiving the 

notice from the court. 
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Currently, the Appellate Practice Subcommittee is also 

exploring other methods to advise pro se litigants of the program 

before they file a notice of appeal. The Subcommittee believes that 

the earlier pro se litigants learn of the possibility of obtaining a pro 

bono attorney, the more time the attorney will have to prepare the 

opening brief or answer brief, and perhaps be involved with the 

filing of the notice of appeal or petition for writ of certiorari. 

The program will also disseminate information at the district 

court level. District court chief judges have agreed to post 

information about the program on judicial district websites. In 

addition, judges may verbally advise pro se litigants about the 

program following a trial and attach written information about the 

program to the final judgment sent to pro se litigants. Finally, in 

some districts, clerks may distribute a handout about the program 

to pro se litigants. 

In addition, the Court of Appeals provides notice of the 

program to all pro se litigants to advise them that they may seek to 

obtain a pro bono lawyer for assistance in filing or responding to a 

petition for certiorari. 

5 
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Finally, the program allows judges and justices to refer cases 

to the program which they feel would benefit from pro bono 

representation. Chief Judge Davidson of the Court of Appeals has 

already referred a Court of Appeals case to the program. 

III. Review by the Screening Committee 

When a litigant decides to apply for representation, he or she 

submits an application and affidavit of financial need to the 

program's screening committee. (See exhibit A.) Once an 

application is submitted, the five-person pro bono screening 

committee will review it. Any litigant who seeks a pro bono 

attorney to help with filing a petition for certiorari in the Colorado 

Supreme Court must file a Motion for Continuance (see Exhibit B) 

to obtain automatically an extra 60 days to file the petition. 

The screening committee members are elected annually by a 

meeting of the Subcommittee and may serve multiple terms. Each 

year, one member of the committee serves as chair, and is 

responsible for performing the administrative functions of the 

committee including maintaining a list of volunteers and assigning 

initial review of applications to individual com:r;nittee members. 
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Additionally, the committee chair is responsible for ensuring the 

recusal of any committee members in the event of a conflict of 

interest. 

The committee member assigned to an initial review of an 

application shall review the application form, the court docket, any 

briefs or motions filed to date, and selected pleadings from the trial 

court or the Court of Appeals. The committee member may call the 

applicant and, if applicable, the applicant's prior counsel, to obtain 

additional information about the potential representation. Based 

upon this initial review, the assigned committee member will 

recommend whether to accept or reject a case, or seek further 

information relating to the application. 

When an application is accepted, the committee then reviews 

the list of volunteer attorneys and selects potential volunteers for 

the case based upon attorneys' stated areas of expertise, prior 

selection for other pro bono cases, and conflicts of interest. 

Volunteer attorneys may be members of the Appellate Practice 

Subcommittee, other attorneys with significant appellate 

experience, or attorneys without significant appellate experience 
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who work with an experienced mentor. The Volunteer Attorney 

Sign-up Form is attached as Exhibit c. 

Once a volunteer attorney agrees to accept the representation, 

the committee sends a Notice of Acceptance informing the applicant 

about his or her selection for participation in the program. The 

applicant then has fourteen days to accept or decline the 

representation. For additional information regarding the screening 

committee, see Exhibit D. 

In addition, a voluntary program administrator will be 

responsible for processing cases and transmitting the information 

to the screening committee for review. The administrator will 

manage finances related to the preparation of transcripts, attorney 

fees, and other financial matters. Finally, the administrator will 

maintain statistics about the pro bono cases, including hours spent 

on the cases, the types of cases, results in the cases, and feedback 

from attorneys. 

IV. Alliance with MVL 

The appellate pro bono program will maintain a strong alliance 

with MVL. This alliance results in several advantages, particularly 
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the availability of malpractice insurance for participating attorneys. 

In addition, because MVL is a recognized pro bono program, 

participating attorneys may have their time spent on appellate pro 

bono cases counted toward satisfaction of the Colorado Supreme 

Court's Pro Bono Recognition Program and considered for 

continuing legal education credit pursuant to C.R.C.P. 260.8. 

V. Collaboration with Trial Lawyers and Law Students 

Lawyers with little or no appellate experience, as well as law 

students at the University of Colorado and the University of Denver 

Sturm College of Law, may participate in the program. In 

particular, the University of Colorado has indicated that students 

can participate through the school's externship and public service 

programs, and the Sturm College of Law allows students to 

participate through its required Useful Public Service program. 

In such circumstances, lawyers and law students will work 

under the mentorship of an experienced appellate practitioner, 

thereby gaining valuable practical experience. Mentors may be 

Subcommittee members or other experienced appellate attorneys 

who wish to participate in a mentor capacity. The Subcommittee 
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believes that such collaboration will provide valuable practical 

experience to trial1awyers and law students while facilitating the 

availability of pro bono appellate representation. Experienced 

appellate practitioners may participate in the program directly or as 

mentors even if they do not belong to the Subcommittee. 

VI. Funding and Attorney Fees 

Participating attorneys may seek reimbursement for costs 

incurred during their participation. Funding for reimbursement is 

derived from funding provided by the Litigation Council, as well as 

from other funds received by the program. 

While C.A.R. 10 provides a mechanism for pursuing appeals in 

civil cases without trial transcripts, the Subcommittee believes that 

preparation of appellate briefs may be easier when trial transcripts 

are obtained. This is particularly so because appellate pro bono 

lawyers often will not be familiar with the trial proceedings. 

Regardless, costs incurred by participating attorneys are often 

minimal, since litigants will be able to proceed in forma pauperis in 

the Court of Appeals and the Supreme Court, and thus, do not have 

to pay filing fees. 
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Finally, the Subcommittee recommends that, where available, 

appellate program attorneys seek and obtain attorney fees, and that 

attorneys receiving such fees donate them to the Appellate Pro Bono 

Program. 1 Any attorney fees obtained by the program will be used 

to defray costs incurred by participating attorneys, including costs 

for preparation of transcripts, which are not provided free to 

indigent litigants in civil cases. Similarly, when costs are advanced 

by the program, a successful applicant should seek costs on appeal 

and then reimburse the program. 

1 It is permissible for a pro bono attorney to receive an award of 
attorney fees. See In re Marriage of Swink) 807 P.2d 1245 (Colo. 
App. 1991). 

11 
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APPELLATE PRO BONO PROGRAM 
INFORMATION AND APPLICATION FORM 

AND AFFIDAVIT OF FINANCIAL NEED 

The Colorado Bar Association's (CBA) Appellate Pro Bono Program 
may help you obtain a lawyer to assist with your appeal in the 
Colorado Court of Appeals and the Colorado Supreme Court. If you 
cannot afford a lawyer you may qualify for this program. 

The program applies only to civil cases . In the Court of Appeals, it 
does not apply to unemployment, prison discipline, or criminal 
cases. In the Colorado Supreme Court, a civil matter for the 
purposes of this program does not include criminal cases or cases 
involving post criminal conviction relief, prison discipline, habeas 
corpus appeals, ballot title appeals or election appeals. 

Please complete this application as soon as possible. If you are in 
the Court of Appeals, you must submit this application no later 
than 14 days after the appeal information sheet is sent to you by 
the Court of Appeals (sent after you or the other side has filed a 
Notice of Appeal). If you are in the Supreme Court, you must 
submit this application no later than 14 days after the date the 
Court of Appeals renders its decision. You must also complete and 
file with the Supreme Court a Motion for Extension of Time using 
the attached form, which will automatically give you an additional 
60 days to file a petition for certiorari. Return the completed 
application to: 

Colorado Bar Association 
Appellate Pro Bono Program 
1900 Grant Street, 9th Floor 

Denver, CO 80203 

The program committee may contact you, and any lawyers who may 
have worked on your case. These conversations are confidential 
and will be used only for the selection process. The committee may 
also discuss your case with its volunteer lawyers. 
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The committee chooses cases based on your income and the 
importance of your legal issues. To qualify for the program, your 
income must be below 125% of federal poverty guidelines. 

If the program accepts your case, we will contact you within 45 
days. We will then provide you with the name and telephone 
number of the lawyer who is willing to take your case. 

For more information about the program, please visit the CBA 
website: www.cobar.org. 

NOTE: Your case may not be accepted by the Committee. All 
court deadlines still apply and must be followed. This includes 
the deadlines for filing a Notice of Appeal and submitting 
briefs. If your case involves a petition to the Supreme Court 
for writ of certiorari, you must file a motion for an extension of 
time with the Supreme Court using the attached form. 

APPELLATE PRO BONO PROGRAM APPLICATION 

Applicant information 

Name 

Address 

Phone 
Fax 
E-mail 

Are you listed as an individual in the case? If not, name the 
business or organization that is listed in the case and briefly 
describe your relationship with that business or organization. 
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Did a lawyer represent you in the trial court? If so, provide the 
lawyer's name and contact information. 

Case information 
Case number 
Name of trial court 
Trial court case number 
Are you the party who filed the appeal? 

What party or parties are adverse to you (on the other side) in the 
case? Are those parties represented by an attorney? If so, who is 
their attorney? 

Type of case (domestic matter, employment discrimination, personal 
injury, etc.) 

Briefly describe your case. 

Briefly describe the issues you want to raise in your appeal. Did 
you raise these issues in the trial court or in the administrative 
agency? 
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Please attach a copy of the decision in your case from the district 
court, the Court of Appeals, or from an administrative agency. 

Financial information 
Were you granted in forma pauperis status or had your filing fees 
waived in the trial court? 

Please submit this form, along with a completed copy of the 
attached Affidavit of Financial Need and copies of the Notice of 
Appeal (if available) and the district court's final judgment, to: 

Colorado Bar Association 
Appellate Pro Bono Program 
1900 Grant Street, 9th Floor 

Denver, CO 80203 
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OCounty Court o District Court ODenver Juvenile Court O Denver Probate Court 
County, Colorado 

Court Address: 

Plaintiff/Petitioner: A A v. COURT USE ONLY 

Defendant/Respondent: Case Number: 
Courtroom: 

MOTION TO: DFILE WITHOUT PAYMENT OF FILING FEE D APPOINT AND PAY INTERPRETER COSTS 
AND SUPPORTING FINANCIAL AFFIDAVIT 

.. 
I, respectful ly move the Court for an order to waive the follOWing filing fee(s) : 

Ocomplaint Opetition Oanswer Oresponse Omotion to modify Oother: and/or Oto appoint and pay for 
an interpreter for the following language pursuant to CJD 06-03 and as grounds state that I am 
without funds, have no adequate funds available, and have a meritorious claim. 

All items must be fully completed. Print or type neatly. If an item does not apply, please write "NIA" 
Name of Applicant Other Responsible Party 

(Spouse, Parent, ,Other Persons In Household) 
Last Name I First Name I MI Last Name I First Name I MI 

Street Address (Include Apt. # if applicable) Street Address (Include Apt. # if applicable) 

Cny State ZIP Code City State ZIP Code 

DOwn DRent Home Phone #: DOwn DRent Home Phone #: 
Social Security # I Driver's Lie. # & State I Date of Birth Social Security # I Driver's Lic. # & State I Date of Birth 

Most Recent Employer: Most Recent Employer: 

Work Address: Work Address: 

Work Phone #: ( ) Work Phone #: ( ) 

Dates Employed : Dates Employed: 

HourslWeek: Pay Rate : $ HourslWeek: Pay Rate: $ 

OMonthly OWeekly OBi-weekly Oother: OMonthly OWeekly OBi-weekly Oother: 

Marital Status: OSingle OMarried ODivorced OSeparated OWidowed Number in Household: (including yourself) 
__ Identify Name, Age, and Relationship: 

Gross Monthly Income (Se'e Information on page 2) .' Monthlv Expenses (See Information on Page 2) 
Self (wages, salary, commission) $ Rent or Mortgage $ 
Spouse/Other Household Members $ Groceries $ 
Parents (if same household) $ Utilities $ 
Unemployment Benefits $ Clothing $ 
Social Security/Retirement Funds $ Maintenance/Alimony and/or Child Support $ 
Maintenance/Alimony $ Medical/Dental $ 
Other Income (identify) $ Other Expenses (identify) $ 
Other Income (identify) Other Expenses (identify) $ 
Total Income $ Total Expenses $ 

" 
Cash on Hand (Cash you are carrying or $ Credit Cards: (Show type and balance owed) 
which is stored at home, etc.) 
Checking Account Balance $ Name/Address of Bank 

Savings Account Balance $ Name/Address of Bank: 

Stocks, Bonds, or other Investments $ Type of Investment, Name/Location of Company/Corporation 
Held Balance 
Vehicles Owned (Autos, boats, $ Identify Year ___ Model License Plate 
recreational vehicles, etc.) - Estimate Value Identify Year Model License Plate 

House(s) or other Property - Estimate Value $ Amount owed, Year Purchased 

IF ADDITIONAL SPACE IS NEEDED TO PROVIDE COMPLETE INFORMATION, ATTACH A SEPARATE PAGE. 

I swear under penalty of perjury that all information provided is true and complete. In addition, I authorize the Court to make any 
necessary contacts to verify the information. 

Signature: Date: 

JDF 205 R12/09 MOTION TO: FILE WITHOUT PAYMENT OF FILING FEE/APPOINT AND PAY INTERPRETER AND SUPPORTING FINANCIAL AFFIDAVIT 
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MOTION TO FILE WITHOUT PAYMENT AND SUPPORTING FINANCIAL 
AFFIDAVIT 

General Information 

It is important that you accurately complete all sections of this form as appropriate based on your 
personal circumstances. If a section does not apply, please write N/A. 

A. Gross Monthly Income. Includes income from all members of the household who contribute monetarily 
to the common support of the household. 

• Income categories to include: 
Wages, including tips, salaries, commissions, payments received as an independent contractor for 
labor or services, bonuses, dividends, severance pay, pensions, retirement benefits, royalties, 
interesUinvestment earnings, trust income, annuities, capital gains, unemployment benefits, Social 
Security Disability (SSD), Social Security Supplemental Income (SSI), Workman's Compensation 
Benefits, and alimony. 

Note: Income from roommates should not be considered if such income is not commingled in accounts or 
otherwise combined with the applicant's income in a fashion which would allow the applicant proprietary 
rights to the roommate's income. . 

• Income categories do not include: 
TANF payments, food stamps, subsidized housing assistance, veteran's benefits earned from a 
disability, child support payments, or other public assistance programs. 

B. Liquid Assets. Includes cash on hand or in accounts, stocks bonds, certificates of deposit, equity, and 
personal property or investments which could readily be converted into cash without jeopardizing the 
applicant's ability to maintain home and employment. 

C. Expenses. Nonessential items such as cable television, club memberships, entertainment, dining out, 
alcohol, cigarettes, etc., shall not be included. Allowable expense categories are listed on JDF 205. 

JDF 205 R12/09 MOTION TO: FILE WITHOUT PAYMENT OF FILING FEE/APPOINT AND PAY INTERPRETER AND SUPPORTING FINANCIAL AFFIDAVIT 
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Supreme Court 
101 West Colfax Avenue, Suite 800 
Denver, Colorado 80202 

Colorado Court of Appeals 
Opinion by Judges: 
Case No: 

or 

District Court for County 
Judge: 
Case No: ... COURT USE ONLY ... 
Petitioner(s): 

v. (Substitute appropriate party designations and names) 

Respondent(s): 

Party Without Attorney (Name and Address): Supreme Court Case Number: 

Phone Number: E-mail: 

MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME 

___________________ , the Petitioner herein, respectfully requests this Court to 

grant an extension of time from (due date of Petition for Writ of 

Certiorari) to (date that is 60 days from the due date of the Petition 

for Writ of Certiorari) to file the Petition for Writ of Certiorari. 

As grounds for this Motion, the Petitioner states as follows: 

1. A complete application with the Colorado Appellate Pro Bono Program has been filed requesting a free 
attorney to represent me in my case to the Colorado Supreme Court. 

2. The decision of the Colorado Bar Association (CBA) to obtain a lawyer to assist with my case may not be 
available by the date that the Petition for Writ of Certiorari is otherwise due. 

3. No previous extensions of time for filing the Petition for Writ of Certiorari have been requested. 

WHEREFORE, I respectfully request this Court to grant an extension of time to _________ (date) 
within which to file the Petition for Writ of Certiorari). 

Date:, ____________ _ 
Signature of Petitioner 

Address 

City, State, Zip Code 

11110 MOTION OF EXTENSION OF TIME Page 1 of 2 
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(Area Code) Telephone Number (home) 

(Area Code) Telephone Number (work) 

CERTIFICATE OF MAILING 
(You must complete this Certificate of Mailing as proof that you have mailed a copy of this document to 

counsel for the opposing party or pro se opposing party in the case.) 

I certify that on (date) a true and accurate copy of this Motion for Extension of 
Time was served on the other party(ies) by placing it in the United States mail, postage pre-paid and properly 
addressed to the following: 

To: 

Signature of Petitioner 

11/10 MOTION OF EXTENSION OF TIME Page 20f2 
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CBA APPELLATE PRO BONO PROGRAM 
ATTORNEY SIGN-UP FORM 

If you are an attorney licensed in the State of Colorado and are 
interested in signing up to participate as a pro bono attorney in the 
CBA Appellate Pro Bono Program, please complete this form and 
submit it to: 

Colorado Bar Association 
Appellate Pro Bono Program 
1900 Grant Street, 9th Floor 
Denver, CO 80203 

You can learn more about the Pro Bono Program by reviewing 
the program information on the CBA website at www.cobar.org. 

Name: 
Firm/ Employer: 

Address: 

Phone: 
Fax: 
E -mail: 

List any areas of practice in which you would be willing to take a 
pro bono case: 

Approximate number of appeals you would be willing to accept per 
year: 

1 
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The Pro Bono Committee may in some cases pair 
inexperienced attorneys with experienced appellate practitioners to 
serve as mentors on a pro bono appeal. To help facilitate this 
mentoring program, please check the appropriate box. 

D I am interested in being paired with a mentor on a pro bono 
appeal. 

D I have a mentor who can assist me within my own firm. 

D I am interested in serving as a mentor to less experienced 
attorneys at other firms in handling pro bono appeals. 

D I am not interested in participating in the mentoring program. 
I would prefer to handle pro bono appeals on my own or to 
mentor attorneys within my own firm. 

Briefly describe your previous experience in handling appeals, 
within Colorado and in any other jurisdictions. 

Please provide any additional information you believe may be 
helpful to the Pro Bono Committee in matching you with a pro bono 
appeal and / or men tor. 

2 
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CBA APPELLATE PRO BONO PROGRAM 
SCREENING COMMITTEE PROCEDURES 

Committee make-up 
The Pro Bono Committee is comprised of five persons serving one­
year terms. Members are selected annually by a meeting of the 
Appellate Subcommittee of the Colorado Bar Association (CBA), and 
members can serve multiple terms. 

Each year, one committee member shall serve as the committee 
chair. The chair is responsible for (1) coordinating with the Clerk of 
the Court of Appeals, the CBA, and Metro Volunteer Lawyers to 
receive applications for participation in the program, (2) ensuring 
that each application is assigned to a committee member for an 
initial review, (3) maintaining a list of volunteers, and (4) performing 
other functions as needed to administer the program. 

Creation of volunteer list 
The Pro Bono Committee shall create a form for attorney volunteers, 
including contact information, areas of interest/ expertise, the 
number of cases the attorney is willing to take per year, and any 
other pertinent information. Blank forms will be circulated to all 
members of the Appellate Subcommittee of the CBA. They will also 
be made available on the Court of Appeals and Supreme Court 
websites (along with information about the program) and any other 
outlets the committee deems appropriate. 

Committee procedures 
The committee may assign the review of applications by whatever 
manner it chooses (e.g., rotating for each application, rotating 
weeks, or assigning based on subject matter). However, the Chair 
must ensure that a committee member who has a potential conflict 
of interest on a case (e.g., if the committee member's firm 
represents an adverse party) does not review that application for 
consideration in the program and does not vote on the 
consideration of that application. 

1 

Exhibit D 
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The committee member assigned to an initial review of an 
application shall review the application form, the docket, any briefs 
or motions filed to date, and selected pleadings from the trial court. 
The committee member may call the applicant and, if applicable, 
the applicant's prior counsel, to obtain additional information about 
the potential representation. Based upon this initial review, the 
assigned committee member shall provide to the committee an 
initial recommendation as to whether to accept, reject, or seek 
further information relating to the application. 
The committee members shall meet on a bi-monthly basis (or more 
frequently, if necessary) to discuss all pending applications. 
Meetings may be conducted in person, by telephone, or bye-mail. 
The assigned committee member for each application shall provide 
a summary of the application and his or her initial 
recommendation. The committee members shall then discuss and 
vote on each pending application. Members may vote to (1) accept 
the application (pending the committee's ability to match the 
applicant with a volunteer attorney), (2) decline the application, (3) 
seek guidance from another attorney on the particular subject 
matter and issues involved in the appeal, or (4) seek additional 
information from the applicant or the applicant's prior counsel. A 
majority vote prevails. 

If the committee votes to obtain additional guidance or information, 
the assigned committee member shall follow up · on those items and 
bring the matter to a new vote on or before the next committee 
meeting. 

If the committee elects to reject the application, it will send a letter 
to the applicant notifying the applicant of that determination. 

If the committee accepts an application, the committee shall review 
the list of volunteer attorneys and select potential volunteers for the 
case, based upon attorneys' stated areas of expertise, prior selection 
for another pro bono case, and lack of any obvious conflicts of 
interest. The assigned committee member shall contact such 
potential volunteers in an attempt to match the application with a 
volunteer attorney. The committee member may provide potential 

2 
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volunteers with any information obtained during the member's 
initial review of the matter. Potential volunteer attorneys shall be 
given at least 14 days (unless the matter must be assigned more 
quickly due to impending case deadlines) to review these materials, 
obtain and review any other relevant materials, conduct any further 
interviews or investigation, and decide whether to accept the 
representation. 

Procedures for accepted applications 
If the Pro Bono Committee accepts an application, and a volunteer 
attorney agrees to accept the representation, the committee will 
send a Notice of Acceptance informing the applicant about his, her 
or its selection for participation in the program. The letter will 
include the volunteer attorney's contact information and a notice 
tha t the applicant has 14 days to decline the representation. The 
volunteer attorney will be advised to follow up with a separate letter 
to the client outlining the terms of the representation. If the client 
does not decline the representation within 14 days following 
issuance of the Notice of Acceptance, the volunteer attorney shall 
file an entry of appearance in the Court of Appeals. The Pro Bono 
Committee and the assigned volunteer attorney shall also notify and 
coordinate with Metro Volunteer Lawyers when a case is accepted 
into the program. 

3 
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CBA~ Am 
COLORADO BAR ASSOCIATION 

I;SIJllIls/lp.d In 18Y7 

Via E-mail and u.s. Mail 

Jtme 14,2011 

Appellate Pro Bono Program 
1900 GrantStreetJ 9th Floor 

Denver, CO 80203 

Re: Representation through the eBA Appellate Pro Bono Program 

Dear 

We are pleased to infonn fOU that your application for assistance 'with the CBA Appellate 
Pro Bono Program has been accepted and your case has been matched 'with volunteer attorneys. 

The volunteer attorneys v,rill assist you with the Colorado COlUi of Appeals' proceedings 
in _ Case No ' - . The representation 
through the CBA Appellate Pro Bono Program will end wben the Court of Appeals issues a final 
,decision in this case and does not include any proceedings in the trial court, either during or 
follov ... ing the appeal. However, you may reapply for pro bono assistance 'Nith any later 

, proceedings in the Colorado Supreme Court. In that event" priority will be given to the attorneys 
who have been handling your case, ifboth you and the attorneys. agree. 

You will not be responsible for paying 'attorney's fees for the representation, but you may 
be responsible for costs. Your volunteer attorneys can provide more inf01mation on these issues. 

Your volunteer attorneys should be contacting you shortly, or you may coniact them at 
your convenience. Their contact information is; 
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June 14,2011 
Page 2 

If you do not wish to be represented by these attorneys, you must send a '.Nritten objection 
to the placement within fourteen days of this letter to the folloyying address: 

Appellate Pro Bono Program 
1900 Grant Street, 9th Floor 
Denver, CO 80203 

If you submit such an objection, the pro bono committee will atte-mpt to match you with a 
different attomey, but we cannot guarantee that we will be able to do so. Also, if your volunteer 
attorneys are unable to continue to represent you in this case for any-reason, \ve will try to find a 
replacement but cannot guarantee that we will be able to do so. 

Thank you for your interest in the CBA Appellate Pro Bono Program, and we wish you 
luck as you proceed \\~th your case. 

cc: _,(via email) 
:Cvia email) 

Very truly yours, 

CBAAppellate Pro Bono Program 
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CO]OJ;adb Court of Appeals 'COPIES MA~ED TO ' 
2 ~ast 14th Avenue COUNSEL OF RECOlU) 
Denver, CO 80202 I .. _--

[ AND _~Sf-:iciJA 
ON ~":'8.-:-,' .. 

Plaintiff-Appellant; 
BY ,O~ 

Court of Apl'~als' Cgse 
v. -

. Defendants-Appellees: 

- - -

ORDER',OF COURT 
.. 

The Court, upon its own motion, enters the following ORDER: 

Having reviewed the notice of appeal, the record, and the briefs of the 

parties, the Court authorizes the appellant to apply for pro bono representation 

through the Colorado Bar Association's Appellate Pro Bono Program_ 

The Court recognizes that appellant is self-represented, and that the ass'lstance of 

an attorney may be helpful to appellant to address the issues presented in his 
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appeal. The Court also recognizes that appelIant has requested appointment of 

counsel, but is not entitled to an appointment pursuapt to any statute or cOUli nlle. 

Accordingly, the Court provides to appellant an application for the Colorado Bar 

Association's Appellate Pro Bono Program. If appellant wishes to apply for a pro 

bono attorney, such application shou1d be filed directly with the CBA within 21 

days of the date of this Order~ and a copy of the application sent to this Court. 

Appellant will be required to meet the financial qualifications established by the 

Program. 

If appellant applies for a pro bono attorney and is accepted for the pro bono 

program, this COlll1 will issue an order for supplemental briefs on specific issues in 

a separate order. 

If appellant does not wish to seek pro bono counsel, he should notify the 

court within 21 days ofthis Order. Ifno application is made or the application is 

not accepted for a pro bono lawyer, the Court will issue an opinion in due course 

based on the briefs already submitted. 

BY THE COURT 

Taubman, J. 
Hawthorne, J. 

*Graham, J., dissents and would proceed without authorizing the appellant to apply 
for pro bono representation. 

Encl: 
Copy: 

Application for pro bono program 
Colorado Bar Association 

2 
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284 P.3d 898 (2012) 

Robert D. GANDY, Plaintiff-Appellant, 
v. 

COLORADO DEPARTMENT OF 
CORRECTIONS; and Executive Director 

of the Colorado Department of 
Corrections, Defendants:-Appellees. 

No. 10CA1238. 

Colorado Court of Appeals, Div. A. 

June 21, 2012. 

899*899 Davis Graham & Stubbs LLP, 
Kyle W. Brenton, Denver, Colorado, for 
Plaintiff-Appellant. 

John W. Suthers, Attorney General, James 
X. Quinn, Senior Assistant Attorney 
General, Kathryn A. Starn ella, Assistant 
Attorney General, Denver, Colorado, for 
Defendants-Appellees. 

Opinion by Judge CARP ARELLI. 

~ 1 Plaintiff, Robert D. Gandy, a Canadian 
citizen serving a life sentence, applied to the 
Colorado Department of Corrections (DOC) 
to be transferred to the Canadian penal 
system to serve the remainder of his 
sentence. DOC denied the application and 
Gandy sued, alleging, among other things, 
that the basis of DOC's denial was contrary 
to a federal treaty. The district court ruled 
that Gandy failed to state a claim for which 
relief could be granted, and dismissed the 
suit under c.R.C.P. 12(b)(5). Gandy now 
appeals the district cOUli's dismissal. We 
conclude that DOC impermissibly applied 
its administrative regulation in contravention 
of the applicable federal treaty. 

~ 2 Accordingly, we vacate the district 
court's order granting DOC's motion to 
dismiss and remand the case to the district 

court. On remand, the cOUli must resolve 
any pending matters consistent with our 
ruling that DOC improperly applied the 
Regulation contrary to the Treaty. Upon 
reconsideration of Gandy's application, 
DOC may not deny the application on the 
erroneous basis that the Regulation 
precludes Canadian offenders convicted 
with a life sentence from participating in the 
Treaty. 

I. The Treaty and the Regulation 

A. The Treaty 

~ 3 In 1978, the United States and Canada 
entered into the Transfer of Offenders 
Treaty Between the United States of 
America and Canada on the Execution of 
Penal Sentences, U.S.-Can., Mar. 2, 1977, 
30 U.S.T. 6263 (the Treaty).W The Treaty 
authorizes the transfer of offenders between 
the countries. The preamble of the Treaty 
states that its purpose is "to enable 
Offenders, with their consent, to serve 
sentences of imprisomnent or parole or 
supervision in the country of which they are 
citizens, thereby facilitating their successful 
reintegration into society." 

~ 4 Under the Treaty, the offender must 
request, and receive, a transfer from 
the 900*900country in which he or she is 
incarcerated. Treaty art. III, § 3. If the 
offender is a state prisoner, he or she must 
receive approval from both state and federal 
authorities. Id.ali. III, § 5. If the receiving 
country agrees, the offender is then 
transferred to the receiving country. Id. art. 
III, §§ 4, 10. After a transfer is complete, the 
receiving country is responsible for the cost 
of incarceration and may not challenge, set 
aside, or otherwise modify the terms of the 
offender's sentence. Id. ali. IV, § 4 & art. V. 

~ 5 To be eligible for transfer under the 
Treaty, the offender must meet certain 
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eligibility requirements. The Treaty 
provides: 

7. No Offender shall be transferred unless: 

(a) he is under a sentence of imprisonment 
for life; or 

(b) the sentence he is serving states a 
definite termination date, or the authorities 
authorized to fix such a date have so acted; 
or 

( c) he is subject to confinement, custody or 
supervision under the laws of the Sending 
State respecting juvenile offenders; or 

(d) he is subject to indefinite confinement as 
a dangerous or habitual offender. 

Id. art. III, § 7. 

~ 6 Colorado implements federal treaties 
that provide for offender transfers through 
section 24-60-2301, C.R.S.2011, which 
provides in relevant pati: 

If a treaty in effect between the United 
States and a foreign country provides for the 
transfer or exchange of convicted offenders 
to the country of which they are citizens or 
nationals, the governor may, on behalf of the 
state and subject to the terms of the treaty, 
authorize the executive director of the 
depatiment of corrections to consent to the 
transfer or exchange of offenders and take 
any other action necessary to initiate the 
patiicipation of this state in the treaty. 

~ 7 The governor delegated to DOC the 
authority "to approve the transfer of eligible 
foreign national offenders, pursuant to the 
conditions of current treaties which provide 
for such transfer, and the approval of the 
Department of Justice and the affected 
foreign country." DOC Admin. Reg. 550-
05(IV)(B). 

B. The Regulation 

~ 8 DOC promulgated Administrative 
Regulation 550-05 (the Regulation) to 
facilitate international transfers of offenders. 
The Regulation states that it is the policy of 
DOC "to return convicted foreign national 
offenders to their country of origin 
consistent with the interests of the [S]tate of 
Colorado, the United States Department of 
Justice, and the individual offender." Reg. 
550-05(I). The Regulation also says that its 
purpose is to enable "eligible offenders to 
transfer to their country of citizenship and 
thereby reduce the custody and maintenance 
expenses to the [S]tate of Colorado." Reg. 
550-05(II)(B). 

~ 9 The Regulation lists several criteria 
regarding the determination of transfer 
requests. At issue here is DOC's application 
of the statement that "[a]n offender may not 
be eligible if convicted with a life sentence." 
Reg. 550-05(IV)(C)(7). 

II. Procedural History 

~ 10 When DOC disapproved Gandy's 
requests to be transferred to the Canadian 
penal system, he filed suit under C.R.C.P. 
106(a)(2), first in 2002 and again in 2007, 
alleging, in peliinent pati, that DOC's 
rejection of his transfer requests did not 
comply with the controlling treaties, statute, 
and regulations. 

~ 11 The 2007 complaint asked the court to 
require DOC to fairly evaluate requests for 
transfers under the Treaty, and to stop using 
unauthorized criteria when considering 
requests for transfer. The district court 
dismissed these claims in September 2007. 

A. 2008 Appeal 
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~ 12 On appeal in 2008, Gandy asserted that 
DOC had the authority to consent to transfer 
requests, but did not have authority to deny 
them. A division ofthis court rejected the 
argument as an implausible reading of the 
statute, and ruled that DOC had the authority 
to either grant or deny transfers. Gandy v. 
Colo. Dep't ojCorr.,(Colo.App. 
No. 901 *901 07CA2381, 2008 WL 
5009564, Nov. 26, 2008) (not published 
pursuant to C.A.R. 35(f)) (Gandy 1). 

~ 13 In the alternative, Gandy asserted that, 
having issued Regulation 550-05, "DOC has 
an unlawful practice of denying [transfers 
under the Treaty] without applying any of 
the criteria of the regulation." Gandy I The 
division observed that Gandy was seeking 
mandamus relief and that mandamus cannot 
issue without proof that the respondent has a 
clear duty to perform the 
act. Id. (citing Gramiger v. Crowley. 660 
P.2d 1279, 1281 (Colo.1983)). The division 
also observed that Gandy's complaint said 
he was not seeking an order directing DOC 
to grant his transfer request, but, rather, an 
order directing DOC to consider his request 
under the applicable regulations. Id. 

~ 14 The division concluded that the record 
before it did not contain any documents 
"indicating that DOC considered [Gandy's] 
transfer application under the governing 
regulation, or any evidence setting forth why 
the transfer was denied." It, therefore, 
remanded the case to the district court with 
instructions to direct DOC to consider 
Gandy's transfer application "in light of the 
factors set fOlih in Regulation 550-05, or 
demonstrate to the District Court that it has 
already done so." Id. 

~ 15 The division held that DOC was 
required to consider Gandy's application 
under the applicable regulations, and 
affirmed the district court judgment "insofar 

as it denied a writ of mandamus directing 
[Gandy] to be transferred." Id. 

B. On Remand 

~ 16 On remand, the district court ordered 
briefing regarding whether DOC had 
properly considered Gandy's transfer 
application. Gandy argued that the 
Regulation was not a lawful basis to deny 
his application because the Regulation 
directly conflicts with the Treaty. DOC did 
not respond to Gandy's legal argument. 
Instead, DOC presented evidence that 
Gandy'S transfer request had been evaluated 
and denied because Gandy was serving a life 
sentence, which, it asserted, rendered him 
ineligible for transfer under Regulation 550-
05(IV)(C)(7). DOC's supporting 
documentation shows that it denied Gandy'S 
transfer request solely because he "is serving 
a life sentence from Denver County, case # 
90CR1491" and Regulation 550-
05(1V)(C)(7) "precludes inmates [serving] a 
life sentence from participating in this 
program." 

~ 17 In April 2010, the district court again 
dismissed Gandy's complaint for failure to 
state a claim under C.R.C.P. 12(b)(5). The 
court found that DOC proved that it had 
considered and rejected Gandy's transfer 
request. 

~ 18 The court concluded that DOC had the 
authority under Regulation 550-
05(1V)(C)(7) to deny Gandy's transfer 
request because he is serving a life sentence. 
Reviewing the Treaty, which Gandy 
submitted, the court held that the Treaty did 
not "grant [Gandy] a right to transfer as 
[Gandy] has urged" and that the Treaty 
"grants Colorado (specifically, the DOC as 
the delegee of the governor of Colorado) 
discretion to grant or deny transfer 
requests." The COUlt held that the Regulation 



81

was not unconstitutionally vague and that 
DOC had the authority to promulgate it. The 
court did not address the alleged conflict 
between the Treaty and the Regulation 
regarding whether offenders serving life 
sentences are eligible for transfer. 

C. 2010 Appeal 

~ 19 Gandy appealed and submitted a pro se 
brief in which he argued, among other 
things, that the Regulation abrogates the 
Treaty and violates the Supremacy Clause 
when applied to Canadian nationals. We 
authorized Gandy to apply for appointment 
of pro bono counsel tlu'ough the Colorado 
Bar Association's Pro Bono Appellate 
Program. After Gandy applied for and 
received pro bono counsel, we ordered the 
pmties to file supplemental briefs 
addressing: 

Whether DOC Administrative Regulation 
550-05(IV)(C)(7), 1996-2010, unlawfully 
abrogates a portion of The Transfer of 
Offenders Treaty Between the United States 
of America and Canada on the Execution of 
Penal Sentences, U. S. -Can., Mar. 2, 1977, 
T.I.A.S. 9552 (entered into force 
July 902*902 19, 1978) (the bilateral treaty) 
and the United States Constitution? 
Specifically, does the regulation, which 
states "[a]n offender may not be eligible if 
convicted with a life sentence," abrogate 
Alt. III(7)( a) of the bilateral treaty, which 
states that, as relevant here, "[n]o offender 
shall be transferred unless ... he is under a 
sentence of imprisomnent for life"? 

III. Standard of Review 

A. Dismissal Under C.R.C.P. 12(b)(S) 

~ 20 We review de novo a c.R.C.P. 12(b)(5) 
motion to dismiss for failure to state a claim 
and apply the same standards as the district 
court. Denver Post Corp. v. Rifter, 255 P.3d 

1083,1088 (Colo.2011). Therefore, we 
accept all factual allegations in the 
complaint as true and view them in the light 
most favorable to the plaintiff. ld. However, 
we are not required to accept as true legal 
conclusions that are couched as factual 
allegations. ld. 

~ 21 We view with disfavor C.R.C.P. 
12(b)(5) motions to dismiss. ld. Therefore, 
we will uphold the grant of a C.R.C.P. 
12(b)(5) motion to dismiss only when the 
plaintiffs factual allegations do not, as a 
matter of law, support the claim for 
relief. ld. 

B. Supremacy Clause 

~ 22 We review de novo whether the 
Regulation conflicts with the Treaty and 
thereby violates the Supremacy Clause of 
the United States Constitution. See, e.g., In 
re Marriage orA nderson. 252 P.3d 490, 493 
(Colo.App.2010) (reviewing whether 
dissolution decree provision conflicted with 
the Social Security Act in violation of the 
Supremacy Clause). 

~ 23 The Supremacy Clause of the United 
States Constitution provides that all treaties 
made under the authority of the United 
States shall be the supreme law of the land: 

This Constitution, and the Laws ofthe 
United States which shall be made in 
Pursuance thereof; and all Treaties made, or 
which shall be made, under the Authority of 
the United States, shall be the supreme Law 
of the Land; and the Judges in every State 
shall be bound thereby, any Thing in the 
Constitution or Laws of any State to the 
Contrary notwithstanding. 

U.S. Const. art. VI, cl. 2. 
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~ 24 When a state statute or regulation 
conflicts with a valid federal law, that statute 
or regulation is preempted. Sapp v. El Paso 
COllntv DeD'I o(J-Iuman Services, 181 P.3d 
1179, 1184 (Colo.App.2008); see 
also Sanchez-Llamas v. Oregon, 548 U.S. 
331, 346, 126 S.Ct. 2669,165 L.Ed.2d 557 
(2006) (holding that a treaty binds the states 
under the Supremacy Clause and that the 
states must recognize the force of the treaty 
when adjudicating the rights of litigants). 

~ 25 The underlying rationale of the 
preemption doctrine is that the Supremacy 
Clause invalidates state laws that interfere 
with, or are contrary to, the laws of 
Congress. SapD, 181 P.3d at 1184. One type 
of preemption, conflict preemption, voids a 
state statute or regulation that actually 
conflicts with a valid federal law. Id. A 
conflict exists when compliance with both 
federal and state laws is a physical 
impossibility or when the state law stands as 
an obstacle to the accomplishment and 
execution of the full purposes and objectives 
of Congress. Id. 

IV. Analysis and Conclusions 

~ 26 It would be impossible for DOC to 
comply with the Treaty and to apply the 
Regulation to render an offender ineligible 
for transfer. Under the Treaty, offenders 
serving life sentences are eligible for 
transfer. Treaty mt. III, § 7(a). Thus, 
applying Regulation 550-05(IV)(C)(7) to 
render Canadian offenders serving life 
sentences ineligible for transfer conflicts 
with the Treaty and is an obstacle to the 
accomplishment and execution of its full 
purposes. See Sapo, 181 P.3d at 1184. 

~ 27 Accordingly, we conclude that, under 
the Supremacy Clause, the Treaty preempts 
DOC from applying the Regulation to render 
Canadian offenders serving life sentences 

ineligible for transfer. We also conclude that 
Gandy stated a claim for which relief can be 
granted. Accordingly, the district comt erred 
when it ruled otherwise and dismissed 
Gandy's claim on that basis. 

903*903 A. Application of the Regulation 
Under the Treaty 

~ 28 The Regulation, which is titled 
"Transfer of Foreign National Offenders to 
Treaty Nations," was implemented "to return 
convicted foreign national offenders to their 
country of origin." Reg. 550-05(1). 
Regulation 550-05(III)(C) defines "Treaty 
Nation" as a "country that has entered into a 
treaty with the United States on the 
execution of penal sentences." Fifty-nine 
nations have signed transfer treaties with the 
United States. Immigration Law & Crimes § 
8:25 (2011). 

~ 29 DOC has the authority "to approve the 
transfer of eligible foreign national 
offenders, pursuant to the conditions of 
current treaties which provide for such 
transfer, and the approval of the Department 
of Justice and the affected foreign country." 
Reg. 550-05(IV)(B) (emphasis added); see 
also § 24-60-2301 ("the governor may, on 
behalf of the state and subject to the terms of 
the treaty, authorize" DOC to consent to the 
transfer of offenders). Thus, DOC must 
exercise its authority to approve or deny the 
transfer of eligible foreign national 
offenders in conformity with the conditions 
of applicable treaties. 

~ 30 The issue here is whether DOC can 
apply the Regulation to conclude that a 
Canadian offender is ineligible for transfer 
under the Treaty "if convicted with a life 
sentence." 

~ 31 Regulation 550-05(IV)(C) establishes 
nine "Eligibility Criteria for Transfer 
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Consideration. " Under Regulation 550-
05(IV)(C)(l), the offender "must be a citizen 
of the treaty nation" to which he or she seeks 
to transfer, and "must meet any additional 
qualification criteria which treaty 
nations may require." (Emphasis added.) 
The Regulation also provides that "[a]n 
offender may not be eligible if convicted 
with a life sentence." Reg. 550-05(IV)(C)(7) 
(emphasis added). 

~ 32 According to Webster's Third New 
international Dictionary 1396 (3d ed. 1986), 
the word "may" sometimes expresses 
permission or lack of permission, and 
sometimes indicates possibility or 
probability. When indicating possibility, it is 
sometimes used where "might" could also be 
used. Id. 

~ 33 Giving the phrase "may not be eligible 
for transfer" its plain meaning and 
construing the rule as a whole to give 
harmonious effect to all provisions, we 
conclude that Regulation 550-05(IV)(C)(7) 
advises DOC officials that an offender might 
not be eligible for transfer under the 
applicable treaty if convicted with a life 
sentence. See Int'l Paper Co. , 126 P.3d at 
226. Applied in that manner, the Regulation 
recognizes and alerts decision-makers to the 
possibility that the applicable treaty may 
render an offender ineligible for transfer if 
he or she is serving a life sentence. When 
the applicable treaty makes offenders 
serving life sentences ineligible, DOC 
decision-makers may not transfer such an 
offender. However, when, as here, a treaty 
make offenders serving life sentences 
eligible, DOC decision-makers may transfer 
the offender. 

~ 34 We next turn to Gandy's contention 
that, under the Supremacy Clause, DOC's 
application of the Regulation to him is 
unlawful. 

B. DOC's Application of the Regulation 
Violated the Treaty 

~ 35 We asked both parties to address 
whether the Regulation, which provides an 
offender may not be eligible if convicted 
with a life sentence, abrogates Art. III(7)(a) 
of the Treaty, which states that no offender 
shall be transferred unless he or she is 
serving a life sentence. 

~ 36 Under the Treaty, a life sentence 
explicitly renders a Canadian offender 
eligible to participate in the Treaty. Treaty 
art. III, § 7. However, in response to 
inquiries from federal and Canadian 
authorities, DOC's only stated reason for 
denying Gandy's transfer application was 
that Regulation 550-05 "precludes inmates 
convicted of a life sentence from 
participating in [ the Treaty]." 

~ 37 Thus, although the Treaty explicitly 
renders Gandy eligible to participate in the 
Treaty because he is serving a life sentence, 
DOC applied its Regulation to render Gandy 
ineligible based on that very criterion. These 
two eligibility criteria are antithetical. 

904*904 ~ 38 Under the Supremacy Clause, 
DOC may not apply Regulation 550-
05(IV)(C)(7) in a manner that abrogates the 
agreement of the United States and Canada 
that offenders serving life sentences are 
eligible for transfer under the 
Treaty. SeeSanchez-Llamas. 548 U.S. at 
346, ]26 S.Ct. 2669; Sapo, 181 P.3c1 at 
1184. 

~ 39 Accordingly, we conclude DOC's 
application of the Regulation violates the 
Supremacy Clause. 

C. April 2010 Order 
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~ 40 The district court granted DOC's 
motion to dismiss based solely on DOC's 
evidence that it had considered and rejected 
Gandy's transfer requests under Regulation 
550-05 because he is serving a life sentence. 
The dismissal on this basis cmmot stand. 

~ 41 Accordingly, we vacate the district 
court's order granting DOC's motion to 
dismiss and remand the case to the district 
comi. On remand, the court must resolve 
any pending matters consistent with our 
ruling that DOC improperly applied the 
Regulation contrary to the Treaty. Upon 
reconsideration of Gandy's application, 
DOC may not deny the application on the 
erroneous basis that the Regulation 
precludes Canadian offenders convicted 
with a life sentence from participating in the . 
Treaty. 

~ 42 The order is vacated, and the case is 
remanded for further proceedings as directed 
by this opinion. 

ROMAN and PLANKtJ, JJ., concur. 

ill We reject DOC's argument, raised for 
the first time in its supplemental answer 
brief on appeal, that the Council of Europe: 
Convention on the Transfer of Sentenced 
Persons, Mar. 21 , 1983, T.I.A.S . No. 10,824 
(opened for signature on Mar. 21 , 1983), 
applies to Gandy's transfer request. 

rJ Sitting by assignment of the Chief 
Justice under provisions of Colo. Const. art. 
VI, § 5(3), and § 24-51-1105, C.R.S.201l. 
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in I n re the Parental Responsibilities of L. S. / a significa nt case 
interpret ing the federal Pa rental Kidnapping Prevent ion Act . In re 
L.S. also is nota ble because it is t he f irst Supreme Court case 
handled by an at torney appointed under t he Colo rado Bar 
Association's (CBA) new Appellate Pro Bono Program, which has 
been operating since July 1, 2010. 

Origins of the Appellate Pro Bono Program 
The idea for an Appellate Pro Bono Program initially was brought to 
the CBA Litigation Section's Appellate Practice Subcommittee by 
Colorado Court of Appeals Judges Daniel Taubman and David 
Richman. The Subcommittee formed a task force comprising Judge 
Taubman and Judge Richman, and attorneys Jane Ebisch, Christina 
Gomez, and Tony Viorst. When developing Colorado's Appellate Pro 
Bono Prog ram, t he task force gathered information from similar pro 
bono programs in Austin and Houston, Texas, as well as from t he 
CBA Appellate Practice Subcommittee and the Denver Bar 
Association's Metro Volunteer Lawyers (MVL) pro bono prog ram . 

Selecting Cases for the Program 
Most indigent pro se litigants with civil cases pending in the 
Colorado Court of Appeals or the Colorado Supreme Court are 
eligible for representation through the Program. 2 At the Supreme 

http://www.cobar.org/tc1/tc1_atiic1es.cfm?atiic1eid=7196 10/612013 
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Court level, pro bono representation is available for filing petitions; 
for certiorari for review on the merits if a certiorari petition is 
granted; and for original actions under C.A.R. 21 (to determine 
whether a tria l court exceeded its jurisdiction or serious ly abused 
its discretion) . 

The Program's application form is available on the CBA website. 3 

Applications are reviewed by the Program's screening comm ittee, 
which currently comprises Christina Gomez (Chair), Blain Myhre, 
Brandi Pummell , Shannon Stevenson, and Tony Viorst. Jane Ebisch 
performs the administrative functions of the committee. 

When reviewing applications, the screening committee considers 
the following substantive criteria to determine whether a particular 
case is appropriate for the Program: 

• indigency (125% of the federal poverty guidelines, the same 
criterion used by MVL) 

• issues of first impression 
• complex issues 
• potentially meritorious claims 
• recurring issues that may otherwise evade review 
• issues that already have been briefed pro se and for which 

the court requests briefing by a pro bono attorney 
• cases concerning the vindication of significant constitutional 

or statutory rights 
• the number of appeals currently in the program 
• the number of available volunteer lawyers. 

The only required factor for all cases is applicant indigency; the 
remaining factors are discretionary. Also, though the Program will 
not accept fee-generat ing cases, this does not preclude acceptance 
of a case where an award of attorney fees may be available 
pursuant to statute, ru le, or contract. Attorneys are encouraged to 
donate to the Program any recovered fees. 

As of Ju ly 2011, the Program's screen ing committee had rece ived 
and reviewed twenty-seven applications. Ten were accepted. 

How Appellate Counsel is Chosen 

The Program maintains a list of attorneys who have indicated a 
willingness to serve as pro bono appellate counsel. The screening 
committee attempts to match approved applicants with the 
volunteers based on the attorneys' areas of expertise, prior 
selection for other pro bono cases, and conflicts of interest. There 
are currently more than forty attorneys on the Program's roster of 
volunteers. 

Summary of Selected Cases 
In add ition to In re L.S., which Tony Viorst handled from petition of 
certiorari through its conclusion,4 the Program has successfu lly 
concluded several other appeals. The Colorado Supreme Court 
granted a writ of certiorari in In the Interest of Child B.B. O. 5 The 
Court's deCision in this case will determine whether, pursuant to 
CRS § 14-10-123(1), the consent of both biological parents is 
required for a psychological parent to have standing to maintain a 

http://www.cobar.org/tclitcl_ articles.cfm ?articleid=7196 1016/2013 
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custodial relationship. Katy Ellis, on behalf of her client, argued that 
reading such a requirement into the statute would defeat "the 
purpose of the statutory language that acknowledges the 
importa nce of psychological pa rents to minor children." 

In I n the Matter of the Petit ion ofS.D.H .,6 Glen Goldman and his 
co lleagues argued t hat t he district court erred when it term inated 
the ir clie nt 's parenta l r ights and allowed t he child's stepfather to 
adopt him. They asserted t hat the district court should have 
granted t heir cl ient's C.R.C.P 60(b)(2) motion for re lief, arguing 
that the representations of the mother and stepfather regarding the 
biological father's alleged abandonment of the child and the ir 
concealment of a favorable order from a different court was 
fraudulent. The Colorado Court of Appeals agreed, reversing the 
district court's judgment and remanding the case to determine 
"whether mother and stepfather's affidavits and pertinent 
assertions were accurate and, if not, whether the inaccuracies 
constit uted fraud or misrepresentation warranting re liefs under 
C.R.C.P. 60( b)( 2) ." 

In Boettler v. Nelson/ Jane Ebisch was successfu l, in part, in an 
appea l to t he Colorado Court of Appeals concern ing a parenting 
t ime order issued by a mag istrate in a Fremont County case . The 
appellate court reversed t he lower court, holding t hat t he court 
should have ordered the father to submit to a psychological 
evaluation and should have applied the best interests standard 
when determining parenting time. 

Becoming Involved in the Program 
Any attorney licensed in Colorado may participate in the Appellate 
Pro Bono Program by completing t he Program's attorney sign-up 
form . The form is available online t hrough the CBA and MLV 
websites.8 

Trial lawyers wit h litt le or no appellate experience, as well as law 
students, may participate in t he Program. Students at t he 
Un ivers ity of Colorado Law School can participate through the 
school's externship and public service programs, and students at 
the University of Denver Sturm College of Law can participate 
through its required Useful Public Service Program. Trial lawyers 
and law students will be paired by the committee with experienced 
appellate practitioners who have volunteered to act as mentors for 
pro bono appeals. 

Among the many advantages of the Program 's alliance wi t h MVL is 
t he availab ilit y of malpractice insura nce for participat ing attorneys . 
In addition , because MVL is a recogn ized pro bono prog ram, 
participating attorneys may have the ir t ime spent on appellate pro 
bono cases counted toward satisfaction of the Colorado Supreme 
Court's Pro Bono Recognit ion Program and considered for 
cont inuing lega l education cred it, pursuant to C.R.C.P. 260.8 . 

Spread the Word 

The Appellate Pro Bono Program is a worthy professional 
opportunity for Colorado's lawyers and litigants. Colorado attorneys 

http://www .co bar.org/tcl/tcl_ articles.cfm ?articleid=7196 10/612013 
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are encouraged to become involved in the Program and to spread 
the word of its existence to col leagues and clients. 

Notes 

1. In re the Parental Responsibilities of L.S. (No. 095C989, June 27, 
2011). 

2. Some types of cases are exduded from the Appellate Pro Bono 
Program. The Colorado Court of Appeals excludes unemployment 
compensation and prison inmate disciplinary appeals; the Supreme 
Court excludes post-criminal convict ion relief, prison discipline, 
habeas corpus appea ls, ballot title appeals, and election appea ls. 

3. The application form for the Appellate Pro Bono Program is 
avai lab le at www.cobar.org/repository/Access%20to% 
20J usticej AppelateProBono/CBAAppPro Bo no Prog_Pu bl icI nfoApp. pd f. 
More information about the Program is available at 
www.cobar.orgjindex.cfmjIDj21607. 

4. See Fender, "Poor litigants get legal help before state's highest 
courts," The Denver Post (July 5, 2011), available at 
www.denverpost.comjsearchjci_18408139. 

5. In the Interest of B.B.O.: Olds v. Berry (No. 105C623, April 18, 
2011 ) . 

6. In the Matter of the Petition of S.D. H., for the Adoption of l.C.B., 
and Concerning W. T. T (No. 10CA1332, April 14, 2011 ) . 

7. Boettler v. Nelson, and Concerning Fremont County Department 
of Human Services (No. 09CA2751, Sept. 30, 2011). 

8. See www.cobar.orgjindex.cfmjIDj21607 and 
www.metrovolunteerlawyers.orgjRTF1.cfm? 
pagename=Governance. 

© 2011 The Colorado Lawyer and Colorado Bar Association. All Rights 
Reserved. Material from The Colorado Lawyer provided via th is World Wide 
Web server is protected by the copyright laws of the United States and may 
not be reproduced in any way or medium without permission. This material 
also is subject to the disclaimers at http://www.cobar.org/tcl/disclaimer.cfm? 
year=2011. 
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I .lj , 

INFORMATION FOR ... 

• PUBLIC 
• JUDGES 
• CLERKS 
• EDUCATORS 
• PRESS 
• ATTORNEYS 
• COURT STAFF 
• STUDENTS 

Request Help with an Appeal 

What is the Indiana Appellate Pro Bono Project? 

The Project is a collaboration of the Indiana Pro Bono Commission and the Indiana State Bar 
Association Appellate Practice Section's Pro Bono Subcommittee. The Project helps low-income 
people find a pro bono (free) lawyer to represent them on appeal in civil cases. 

How does the Project work? 

After you apply the Indiana Pro Bono Commission will review your application for income eligibility. 
If you are eligible, the ISBA Appellate Practice Section's pro bono committee will review your 
application and attempt to find a lawyer able to take your case. The Project cannot guarantee that it 
can find a pro bono attorney to take your case, so you should not stop looking for other counsel to 
represent you in this proceeding. There is no right to counsel in civil cases. If you have a criminal 
case, you may contact the public defender's office. 

How do I apply? 

Fill out an application and send it to the Indiana Pro Bono Commission at probono@inbf.orQ or 230 
East Ohio Street, Suite 400, Indianapolis, IN 46204. Applications are available below, by phone at 
317-269-2415, or by mail at the above address. You will need to gather information about your 
court case and your income and assets for the application. 

Application 

App lication 

Are there other resources that could assist me? 

The Indiana Pro Bono Commission website has a directory of pro bono and legal aid providers by 
county on th is website . If you want to proceed "pro se" (without a lawyer), there are forms, rules, 
and other resources online: 

• Appea ls Forms 
• Indiana Self Service Lega l Center 
• Filing Facts 
• How a Case Moves from the Trial Court to the Appellate Court 
• Fil ing an Appea l w ith the Indiana Court of Appea ls 

http://www.in.gov/judiciary/probono/2335.htm 10/6/2013 
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• 

• 
• 

• 

• Indiana Ru les of Court, Ru les of Appellate Procedure 
• Gu ide to Appel late Procedure 

Subscribe to content 
by RSS or Ema il 

Follow us on Twitter 
Indiana Courts 

YouTube Channel 
Get our shared 
photos on Flickr 

Learn about Indiana's Court System 

Page 2 of2 

The Indiana Constitution divides state government into three branches: the Legislative, the Executive 
and the Judicial. The Constitution provides that the Judicial power of the State is vested in a Supreme 

Court, a Court of Appeals, Circuit Courts and such other courts as the General Assembly may establish. 

• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

Read More» 

Business Hours & Holidays 

Appellate Courts and offices are open Monday - Friday, 8:30am to 4:30pm. 

To find out when your local court is open, see Information by County . 

Next Holiday: 
Columbus Day, MON OCT 14, 2013 

Get a complete list of State Holidays. 

Services 

Help 
En Espanol 

FAQs 
Press Releases 

Policies 
Videos 

Calendar 
Text Only 

Jobs 
Contact Us 

Browsealoud 
Text Reader 

Do I qua li fy for pro bono? 
How do I f ind pro bono help? 

What do I do if I have a criminal matter? 
Can a law school help me with my legal needs? 

What is the Indiana Pro Bono Commission? 

http://www.in.gov/judiciary/probonoI2335.htm 10/612013 
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Application for Indiana Appellate Pro Bono Project 

The Indiana Appellate Pro Bono Project is a collaboration between the Indiana Pro Bono 
Commission and the Indiana State Bar Association Appellate Practice Section. The Project 
coordinates free legal representation for low-income people in appeals of their civil cases. The 
Project does not handle criminal cases. If you have a criminal case, you may contact the public 
defender's office. There is no right to counsel in civil cases. The Project cannot guarantee that it 
can find a pro bono attorney to take your case, so you should not stop looking for other counsel 
to represent you in this proceeding. 

If you want to apply for assistance, please fill out this form and submit it by mail, fax, or 
email to: 

Indiana Appellate Pro Bono Project 
Indiana Pro Bono Commission 
230 East Ohio Street, FOUlih Floor 
Indianapolis, IN 46204 
(317)269-7865 
FAX: (317) 269-2420 
probono@inbf.org 

If you were represented by a lawyer at your trial or were refelTed by another organization, 
please ask your trial lawyer or referring organization to help you in filling out this form and 
please list that lawyer or organization's name and contact information here: 

Any information you put on this form is not confidential or privileged . You do not create an 
attorney-client relationship with the Indiana Pro Bono Commission, Indiana State Bar 
Association or any attorney by submitting this form. By submitting this form, you are 
authorizing the Project to contact you and/or your lawyer for more information. 

Your Name: Date: -----------------

Mailing Address: Office Use Only: 

Phone Numbers: 

Email Address: 

Page 1 of2 
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1. Were your filing fees waived in the trial court because of your poveliy? 
___ Yes No 

2. Annual gross income of all members of your household from all sources: 

3. Number of people in your household (including spouse): ________ _ 

4. What comi are you appealing from? ________________ _ 

5. What is the title of the case you are appealing? ____________ _ 

6. What is the docket number of the case you are appealing? ________ _ 

7. Date of final order or judgment: ______ _ 

8. Has any party filed a Motion to Correct Errors with the trial court? If so, please list the 

date filed and date decided, if any ________ _ 

9. Due date of notice of appeal, if known: _______ _ 

Please attach a copy of the order or judgment being appealed and a copy of the notice of 

appeal, if available. 

10. What kind of case is this? 

___ Family Law (Divorce, Custody, Visitation, etc.) 

___ Landlord / Tenant 

___ Government Benefits 

___ Consumer Protection 
___ Other, please describe: _____________________ _ 

11. If you lost your case and are seeking reversal or modification, why do you think the 

outcome of the trial was wrong? If you won your case at trial, why is it important that the 

comi of appeals affirm the trial comi' s decision? If you are filling this form out with your 

lawyer, please describe what you think are the appealable legal issues. You can attach 

additional pages if necessary. 

12. Please provide contact information for the other pmiies in the case and their lawyers, if 

known: 

13 . Any other information you want to provide: 

Page 2 of2 
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MSBA --.. -

Home Jump Starts Forms Resources 

Home Connections MS8A Sections Appellate Pro 80no Program 

Appellate Pro Bono Program 
In 2002, the MSBA Appellate Practice section developed an Appe llate Pro Bono Program in cooperation 
with the Minnesota Court of Appea ls to address the increase in pro se li t igation and develop a way to 
address this trend in the appe ll ate courts. Appeal s from denials of unemployment compensation was 
identified as a category of cases invo lving a significant number of pro se appell ants who could benefit 
from attorney ass istance in the appellate process. Th e program not only ass ists pro se li tigants in need of 
representation, but also provides an opportunity for attorneys to fulfill their pro bono obligation and 
further the ir profess ional development. 

The development and implementation of this important program is detailed in the article by Tom Boyd 
titled "Minnesota's Pro Bono Appellate Program : A Simple Approach that Achieves Important Objectives" 
reproduced here with the permission of the William H. Bowen School of Law, University of Arkansas at 
Little Rock and the author, Tom Boyd . The original article appeared in the Fall 2004 edition of The Journal 
of Appe ll ate Practice and Process (6 J. App. Prac. and Process 295). 

Those who have participated in Appe ll ate Pro Bono Program have found the experience very rewarding, 
both professionally and personally. Trainin9 is provided to interes ted attorneys; please see the sem inar 
material s titled "Pro Bono Representat ion in Unemployment Compensation Appeals." 

Page 1 of 1 

search .. 

Connectio ns Blog About 

Copyright © 2001 - 2012 Minnesota State Bar Associat ion I Site Map I Blog I Term s of Use I Help with Forms I MSBA Home I Log In 
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You're receiving this CLE and Events Notice as a member of the Appellate Practice Section. 
Having trouble viewing this email? View it in your browser. 

from the Minnesota State Bar Association 

The MSBA's Appellate Practice Section Presents 

"Representing Pro Bono Clients in Unemployment 
Insurance Appeals" 

The Appellate Practice Section of the Minnesota State Bar Association is 
holding a CLE for attorneys and law students interested in participating in 
its unemployment insurance pro bono program. The program will include 
an overview of Minnesota's unemployment insurance laws, a session on 
practice tips from experienced Dr attorneys, updates on legislation and 
case law, and a panel session with judges from the Minnesota Court of 
Appeals, followed by a question and answer session. 

The Appellate Practice Session will provide a free pizza lunch. 

Speakers: 

Lee Nelson, MN Department of Employment and Economic 
Development 

Amy Lawler, MN Department of Employment and Economic 
Development 

Tom Boyd, Winthrop & Weinstine, PA 

Paul Banker, Lindquist & Vennnm 

Peter Knapp, William Mitchell College of Law 

Chief Judge Matthew Johnson, MN Court of Appeals 

Judge Natalie Hudson, MN Conrt of Appeals 

Judge Kevin Ross, MN COllrt of Appeals 

Judge Terri Stonebw'Iler, MN COUlt of Appeals 

Details: 

3 how's of Standard CLE credits approved 
(event code: 171671) 

Date: Friday, October 5, 2012 
Time: 8:30 a.m. to 1:00 p.m. 
Location: Briggs & Morgan 
2200 IDS Center, 80 S. 8th Street 
Minneapolis, MN 55402 

Cost: 

All Attendees: Free 

Teleconferencing is not available. 

Contact : Jenni fer Carter' I e·mail I Phone : (612) 278·6309 

Date: 
October 5, 2012 

Deadline to Register: 
October 3, 2012 

Register (Choose 
One): 

Online Now 
MSBA Members On~ 

By Fax or Mail 

MSBA 
Sections 

A 
contlnulng legal educa.tlon 
CUPl'ent I concise I coHegl:).l 

Go to the Appellate Practice 
Section Website 

600 Nicollet Mall· Suite 380 · Minneapolis MN 55402 I Phone: (61 2) 333· 11 83 Toll·Free: (800) 882·MSBA 

http://www.mnbar.org/sections/appellate/10-05-12.html 10/6/2013 
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LawHelpM N .org 

Pro Bono Unemployment Compensation Appeals Program 

Who We Are 

This program provides volunteer attorneys to help people who are appealing a decis ion to deny their 

unemployment benefits. Clients are only eligible if they have already commenced an appeal in the 

Minnesota Court of Appeals. 

General Contact Information 

Address 

Pro Bono Unemployment Compensation Appeals Program 

Winthrop & Weinstein P.A., Suite 3500,224 South 6th St. (map) 

Minneapolis, MN 55402 

Phone 

(612) 604-6505 

Email 

TBoyd@winthrop.com 

Choose a legal issue to learn more about the services provided: 

Unemployment Benefits 

Unemployment Benefits 

http://www .lawhelpmn.orgl organizationlpro-bono-unemployment -compensation-appeals-pr 10/6/2013 
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LawHelpMN.org 

Pro Bono Unemployment Compensation Appeals Program 

Who We Are 

This program provides volunteer attorneys to help people who are appealing a decision to deny their 

unemployment benefits. Clients are only eligible if they have already commenced an appeal in the 

Minnesota Court of Appeals. 

How to Get Help 

You can contact this organization by: 

Contact Type 

Phone 

Phone Number 

(612) 604-6505 

Hours 

Monday 

Normal business hours. 

Tuesday 

Normal business hours. 

Wednesday 

Normal business hours. 

Thursday 

Normal business hours. 

Friday 

Normal business hours. 

Who We Serve 

Area(s) 

Statewide 

Income Guidelines 

http://www .lawhelpmn.orgl organizationlpro-bono-unemployment -compensation-appeals-p... 10/6/2013 
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Clients are only eligible if they have commenced an appeal in the Minnesota Court of Appeals 

Is this organization accessible by wheelchair? 

YES 

Does this organization provide access for the hearing impaired? 

YES 

Type of Help 

This group provides the following types of services based on your legal needs and its resources: 

• Full Legal Representation 

General Contact Information 

Address 

Pro Bono Unemployment Compensation Appeals Program 

Winthrop & Weinstein P.A., Suite 3500, 224 South 6th St. (map) 

Minneapolis, MN 55402 

Phone 

(612) 604-6505 

Email 

TBoyd@winthrop.com 

http://www .lawhelpmn.orgl organizationlpro-bono-unemployment -compensation-appeals-p... 10/6/2013 
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THE JOURNAL OF 
APPELLATE PRACTICE 

AND PROCESS 
DEVELOPMENTS 

AND PRACTICE NOTES 

MINNESOTA'S PRO BONO APPELLATE PROGRAM: A 
SIMPLE APPROACH THAT ACHIEVES IMPORTANT 
OBJECTIVES 

Thomas H. Boyd* 

The proliferation of pro se litigation strains both the 
resources and the operation of the nation's state and federal 
judicial systems. At the same time, the increasing number of 
unrepresented litigants offers a wealth of opportunities for 
lawyers to satisfy their professional and ethical obligations to 
render pro bono legal services. A prime example of this dynamic 
can be found in the development of pro bono appellate programs 
that provide needed legal services to pro se appellants, assist the 
appellate courts, satisfy ethical obligations, and advance 
professional development. 

* Shareholder, Winthrop & Weinstine, P.A., Minneapolis, Minnesota. B.A., M.A., and 
J.D. , University of Iowa. Mr. Boyd is Chair of the Pro Bono Committee of the Appellate 
Practice Section of the Minnesota State Bar Association; Pro Se Coordinator of the 
Minnesota Chapter of the Federal Bar Association; and Co-Chair of the Pro Se-Pro Bono 
Committee of the Council of Appellate Lawyers of the American Bar Association. Mr. 
Boyd thanks Matthew D. Spohn and Professor Coleen M. Barger for their invaluable 
assistance with this article. 

THE JOURNAL OF ApPELLATE PRACTICE AND PROCESS Vol. 6, No.2 (Fall 2004) 
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The Appellate Practice Section of the Minnesota State Bar 
Association ("MSBA") recently developed an appellate pro 
bono program in' cooperation with the Minnesota Court of 
Appeals. The program is aimed at developing, implementing, 
and analyzing procedures and materials utilized in providing pro 
bono appellate legal services to pro se palties in unemployment 
compensation appeals. 1 While neither perfect nor 
comprehensive, the program illustrates a fairly simple yet 
effective method for introducing volunteer lawyers to pro se 
parties who seek legal representation in their appeals. This 
Article describes the development and implementation of this 
appellate pro bono program to provide courts and bar 
associations a prototype for developing or improving their own 
appellate pro bono programs. 

The Article is organized into five sections. First, it outlines 
the dynamics injected by pro se patties in civil litigation and the 
manner in which effective pro bono programs can 
simultaneously assist litigants as well as Improve the 
administration of justice. Second, the Article describes how the 
MSBA's Appellate Practice Section went about developing a 
pro bono appellate program to provide representation in pro se 
appeals filed in the Minnesota Court of Appeals. Third, the 
Article explains how Minnesota's program was actually 
implemented and operated. Fourth, it briefly reports on the cases 
in which pro bono counsel were introduced to, and agreed to 
appear on behalf of, pro se appellants as part of the pilot 
program phase of this program. Finally, the Article addresses the 
future direction and development of this program. 

I. THE DYNAMICS OF PRO SE LITIGATION AND 

POTENTIAL FOR PRO BONO OPPORTUNITIES 

Federal and state courts throughout the country have 
experienced dramatic increases in pro se litigation.2 The 

1. Barbara L. Jones, Pilot Progralll Helps Workers Get UnelllploYlllent Benefits, 7 
Minn. Law. I, 19 (Aug. 11 , 2003). 

2. See generally Final Report of the Joint Task Force on Pro Se Litigation, submitted 
to Conference of Chief Justices and Conference of State Court Administrators (July 29, 
2002) [hereinafter Joint Task Force on Pro Se Litigation) (copy on file with Journal of 
Appellate Practice and Process); A National Conference on Pro Se Litigation: A Report 
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challenge posed by the swelling ranks of self-represented 
litigants is now recognized as one of the highest priorities for the 
courts? The increase in pro se litigants in the American justice 
system shows no signs of subsiding, and appellate courts have 
not been spared from this growing trend.4 

The increase in pro se litigation offers a complementary 
increase in oppOltunities for lawyers to render pro bono legal 
services. The American Bar Association has formally 
encouraged lawyers to provide legal services to those who 
cannot afford it since adopting the original Canons of Ethics 
nearly a century ago,S and it continues to promote pro bono 
work in the provisions of the Rules of Professional Conduct.6 In 
Minnesota, for example, the Supreme Court imposes an 
aspirational goal for each lawyer "to render at least 50 hours of 
pro bono publico legal services per year.,,7 

The substantial increase of pro se litigation, particularly in 
appellate proceedings, presents a prime oppOltunity for attorneys 
to provide significant assistance to patties and courts alike, 
while meeting their professional and ethical obligations, by 
providing much needed pro bono legal services. 

and Update (Am. Judicature Socy. 2001); Conference of State Court Administrators, 
Position Paper on Self-Represented Litigation (Aug. 2000) (copy on file with Journal of 
Appellate Practice and Process); Jona Goldschmidt et aI., Meeting the Challenge of Pro Se 
Litigation: A Report and Guidebook for Judges and Court Managers (Am. Judicature 
Socy. 1998). 

3. Joint Task Force on Pro Se Litigation, supra n. 2, at 3. 
4. See e.g. Courts of Appeals Facilitate Handling of Pro Se Cases, Third Branch (July 

1995) (available at http://www.uscourts .gov/ttb/julttb/prose.htm); 2002 Annual Report of 
Administrative Office of the U.S. Courts 115-118, tbl. 8-9, u.s. Courts of Appeals-Pro 
Se Appeals Commenced and Terminated, by Circuit During the 12-Month Period Ending 
September 30, 2002. 

5. See Patrick R. Burns, Pro Bono: It 's Good and It's Good For You! 
http://www.courts.state.mn.us/lprb/fc041999 (originally published in MiImesota Lawyer, 
Apr. 19, 1999) (accessed Sept. 19, 2003). Canon 12 provided in part: 

A client's ability to pay cannot justify a charge in excess of the value of the 
service, though his poverty may require a less charge, or even none at all. The 
reasonable requests of brother lawyers, and of their widows and orphans without 
ample means, should receive special and kindly consideration .... In fixing fees 
it should never be forgotten that the profession is a branch of the administration 
of justice and not a mere money-getting trade. 

Id. (quoting Canons of Ethics canon 12 (American Bar Assn. 1908)). 
6. Id. 
7. Milm. R. Prof Conduct 6.1. 
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A. Challenges Posed by Pro Se Parties in the Appellate Process 

Parties engage in pro se litigation for a variety of reasons. 
Some individuals simply prefer to represent themselves without 
assistance of counsel. Perhaps they do not like lawyers, or they 
believe they can represent themselves as well as or better than 
an attorney could. However, many parties wish to have an 
attorney but are unable to afford counsel. Regardless of their 
motivation, pro se litigants inject a host of serious issues and 
challenges for both the courts and other parties who are 
represented by counsel. 8 

First, self-represented litigants impose additional burdens 
and demands on court staff and resources compared to attorney­
represented litigants.9 Specifically, they require assistance in 
understanding and following appropriate procedures,lo and they 
need greater assistance in correcting mistakes caused by their 
lack of legal training and experience. I I Moreover, interaction 
and communication between court staff and pro se litigants may 
also raise ethical and legal concerns because "[a]t times their 
requests for assistance [from court staff] may cross the gray line 
between legal information and legal advice.,,12 

8. The Conference of Chief Justices and the Conference of State Court Administrators 
recently addressed the dramatic and serious impact that growing pro se litigation has on the 
justice system: 

A nUlllber of social , economic and political factors--especially the rising cost of 
legal representation relative to inflation, decreases in filllding for legal services 
for low-income people, and increased desire on the part oflitigants to understand 
and to actively participate in their personal legal affairs-are believed to be at 
the root of the increase. Regardless of the underlying causes, however, the trend 
toward se/frepresentation ref/ects a significant deviation ji'om a /lIndamental 
assllmption by the courts- namely, that litigants are represented by licensed 
aflo/'l7eys who are trained in applicable law and cOllrt rilles. The influx of large 
numbers of litigants who lIIay not be infomled about law and court procedures 
poses significant implications /01' the administration 0/ jllstice- especially, 
demands on court staff and resources and ethical dilemmas about how to 
compensate /01' se/frepresented litigants' lack 0/ knowledge without 
jeopardizingjlldicialrequirements o/neutrality and objectivity. 

Joint Task Force on Pro Se Litigation, supra n. 2, at 3 (footnote omitted) (emphasis 
added). 

9. /d at 3-4. 
10. /d at 3. 
II. /d 
12. /d at 3 & n. 5 (noting concems about the unauthorized practice of law and citing 

John M. Greacen, Legal /n/ormation vs. Legal Advice: Developments During the Last Five 
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Second, counsel face challenges when dealing with pro se 
litigants whose interests are adverse to their own clients. Of 
course, express professional rules of conduct set out the manner 
in which an attorney shall deal with unrepresented parties. 13 

However, these rules only curtail the manner in which an 
attorney may communicate with an unrepresented party; they do 
not explicitly address how an attorney should proceed so as not 
to take undue or unfair advantage of a pro se litigant. The Joint 
Task Force on Pro Se Litigation ("Task Force") observes that 

[m]any lawyers dislike palticipating in COUlt proceedings 
when the opposing patty is self-represented, as they often 
find it awkward to represent their client's interests without 
appearing to take unfair advantage of the self-represented 
litigant's relative lack of knowledge and experience and 
risking the animosity of the trial judge. 14 

Third, pro se litigation "challenge[s] the neutral role of 
judges,,,15 given that the judicial canons impose competing and 
sometimes conflicting obligations on courts vis-a-vis pro se 
litigants. On one hand, judges must maintain impartiality toward 
all parties. 16 On the other hand, judges must "accord to every 
person who has a legal interest in a proceeding, or ~erson' s 
lawyer, the right to be heard according to law.,,1 When 
confronted with pro se litigation, says the Task Force, "[m]any 
judges find it difficult to reconcile the requirement to provide 
self-represented litigants with an oppOituni!y for a fair hearing 
with the requirement to remain impartial,,18 due to the need to 
lead pro se patties through the necessary procedures. Thus, "[a]n 
uninformed or unprepared pro se litigant can place an 

Years, 84 Judicature 198 (Jan.-Feb. 2001); John M. Greacen, No Legal Adviceji'om Court 
Personnel! What Does That Mean? 34 Judges' J. 10 (Winter 1995» . 

13. See MimI. R. Prof. Conduct 4.3. 
14. Joint Task Force on Pro Se Litigation, supra n. 2, at 4. 
15. Report of the Minnesota Conference of Chief Judges, Committee on the Treatment 

of Litigants and Pro Se Litigation, at 7 (Apr. 1996) (copy on file with Joumal of Appellate 
Practice and Process). 

16. Minn. Code of Judicial Conduct canon 3(A)(5). 
17. Id. at 3(A)(7). 
18. Joint Task Force on Pro Se Litigation, supra n. 2, at 4 (citing Jona Goldschmidt, 

The Pro Se Litigant 's Struggle for Access to Justice: Meeting the Challenge of Bench and 
Bar ReSistance, 40 Family Ct. Rev. 36,40 (2000». 
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uncomfOliable tension on the judicial search for impartial 
justice." 19 

Finally, the presence of pro se litigants presents practical 
challenges for counsel and judges alike in terms of effective 
communications and other logistical considerations, particularly 
where the self-represented are viewed as annoyances "that clog 
court dockets and consume unnecessary amounts of court time 
and attention.,,2o For example, due to their lack of a legal 
education and experience, pro se litigants may focus on facts 
and issues that, while important to them personally, are not 
relevant or that interfere with or compromise the development of 
the evidentiary record and the resolution of the true factual and 
legal issues. Due to their lack of legal education, training, and 
experience, pro se litigants may have difficulty in effectively 
communicating through written submissions. In those 
circumstances, judges and cOUli staff must expend greater 
resources in researching and deciding pro se cases due to the 
limited assistance that the pro se parties themselves can provide. 

In summary, while individuals have the right to represent 
themselves in legal proceedings, the nation's laws and justice 
system are based on an adversarial system in which all parties 
are assumed to be represented by competent counsel. When 
parties appear pro se, this assumption and the corresponding 
balance of procedures and rules are thrown off, jeopardizing 
fairness and equity in the final result. 

B. Programs Developed in Response to Pro Se Parties 
in Appellate Proceedings 

Among the responses of the bench and bar to the increase 
in self-represented litigants are the developments of self-help 
centers, one-on-one assistance programs, promotion of 
unbundled legal services, technological innovations, and 
collaborative programs.21 While these programs primarily focus 
on pro se litigation at the trial cOUli level, many methods and 
programs have been developed to address the increase of pro se 

19. Report of the Minnesota Conference of Chief Judges, supra 11. 15, at 7. 

20. Joint Task Force on Pro Se Litigation, supra 11. 2, at 4. 
21. /d. at 5-9. 
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litigants in appellate proceedings, varying in terms of their focus 
and their complexity. 

The first point of contact between pro se parties and the 
justice system is the clerk's office. Many appellate courts have 
endeavored to sensitize the clerk of couit's staff to the needs of 
pro se litigants. For example, the Missouri Court of Appeals, 
Western District, provides pro se appellants with detailed 
procedural information.22 The attorneys and administrative 
personnel who staff the clerk's offices for the New York COUIt 
of Appeals also provide extensive assistance to pro se litigants 
and direct those parties to relevant resources, including outlines 
of the COUIt's civil and criminal jurisdiction and information on 
the court's website.23 

While staff personnel endeavor to be helpful to pro se 
appellants, these activities are tempered by concerns that COUIt 
employees should not provide legal advice. For example, while 
the Ohio First District Court of Appeals assists pro se litigants 
by providing them with various forms, many of the pro se 
litigants have problems completing the forms and making other 
submissions, consequently seeking assistance from the clerk's 
office.24 Indeed, as a result of these types of concerns, the 
Council of Chief Justices for the State of Texas has expressly 
barred the clerks' staffs of the Texas COUIt of Appeals from 
advising pro se litigants or providing pro bono representation, 
even if their cases are pending in COUIts outside of their 
jurisdiction?5 

22. E-mail from Terence Lord, Clerk of the Court, to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 15,2002) 
(on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process). 

23. Llr. from Marjorie S. McCoy, Deputy Clerk, N.Y., to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 20, 
2000) (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process). The Clerk's Office for the 
New York Supreme Court, Appellate Divisions, provides similar assistance to pro se 
appellate litigants. See e.g. Itr. from Catherine O'Hagan Wolfe, Clerk of the Court, N.Y. 
App. Div. 1st Dept., to Thomas H. Boyd (Jan. 22, 2003) (on file with Journal of Appellate 
Practice and Process); ltr. from James Edward Pelzer, Clerk of the Court, N.Y. App. Div. 
2d Dept. , to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 19,2002) (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice 
and Process). 

24. E-mail from Tom Rottinghaus, Administrator, Ohio App. 1st Dist., to Thomas H. 
Boyd (Nov. 20, 2002) (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process) ("Dealing 
with the pro se litigant is a major concern since the employees of the Court can no! provide 
legal advice. We try to assist the litigants in any way we can by explaining the rules ; 
however, when it comes to preparing a brief, there is little we can do."). 

25 . Llr. from Linda Rogers , Clerk of the Court, Tex. App. 6th Dist., to Thomas H. 
Boyd (Nov. 13, 2002) (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process). 
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Recognizing the limits on staff time as well as these ethical 
concerns, several COUltS and bar organizations have prepared 
written materials · to assist pro se parties. For example, the 
Supreme COUlt of Delaware, the Wisconsin Supreme COUlt, and 
the Georgia Court of Appeals have developed "Citizen Guides" 
that describe the judicial system and the court's procedures, 
answer frequently asked questions, and provide forms and 
checklists for use by pro se parties.26 Other COUltS place 
responses to frequently asked questions on their websites.27 

Some bar associations and appellate COUltS have developed 
fairly extensive written materials to assist pro se litigants, such 
as the Illinois Appellate Lawyers Association's extensive and 
updated Guide to Civil Appellate Procedure for Pro Se 
Litigant;28 the Missouri Court of Appeals, Eastern District's The 
ABC's of Appellate Practice;29 and, most recently, the Appellate 
Practice Section of the Florida Bar's The Pro Se Appellate 
Handbook. 3D 

The federal judiciary'S traditional practice of appointing 
counsel to represent indigent criminal defendants on appeal has 
resulted in the development of some pro bono programs for civil 
appellants. Specifically, while the federal COUltS of appeal have 
procedures for facilitating representation through the Criminal 
Justice Act ("CJA"), some of these courts have gone a step 
further to develop programs to provide pro bono representation 

26. See e.g. 1Ir. from Cathy L. Howard, Clerk of the Court, Del., to Thomas H. Boyd 
(Nov. 14, 2002) (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process); IIr. from William 
L. Martin, III, Administrator/Clerk, Ga. App. , to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 12,2002) (on file 
with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process); Itr. from Cornelia G. Clark, Clerk of 
Supreme Court, Wis ., to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 15, 2002) (on file with Journal of 
Appellate Practice and Process). 

27. E-mail by Marcia Mangel , Clerk of Court, Ohio, to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 13, 
2002) (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process); Itr. from Kenneth A. 
Richstad, Clerk, S.C. App., to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 13, 2002) (on file with Journal of 
Appellate Practice and Process). 

28. Ur. from Steven M. Ravid, Clerk, III . App. 1st Dis!., to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov, 19, 
2002) (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process); Itr. from Robert 1. Mangan, 
Clerk of the Court, III. App. 2d Dis!., to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 14, 2002) (on file with 
Journal of Appellate Practice and Process). 

29. Ravid, supra n. 28 . 
30. Dorothy F. Easley, The Appella/e Praclice Sec/ion Moves /0 Allevia/e ExploSive 

Appella/e Nigh/mare; Publishing /he Pro Se Appellate Handbook, II Record (newsletter of 
Fla. Bar App. Prac. Sec.) I (Spring 2003) (available at http://www. f1abarappellate. 
org/pdf/app-0403.pdf). 
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to pro se litigants in civil appellate proceedings. The United 
States Court of Appeals for the Seventh Circuit operates an 
appointed counsel program that is coordinated through the 
Counsel to the Circuit Executive.3l While this program focuses 
primarily on the representation of indigent litigants in criminal 
appeals under the CJA, the program is also used when the court 
determines that assistance of pro bono counsel would aid the 
court in prisoner civil rights cases or other civil appeals.32 

The longest standing and most developed approach to pro 
se litigation in federal civil appellate proceedings is the Ninth 
Circuit's Pro Bono Program, established by judicial conference 
resolution in 1993.33 The Ninth Circuit concluded that "complex 
non-frivolous pro se appeals would be greatly assisted in many 
cases by the appointment of pro bono counsel for the litigant" 
and the court therefore undertook to establish "a comprehensive 
Pro Se Project to provide for the appointment of pro bono 
counsel in complex civil appeals while a patty is proceeding pro 
se.,,34 Under this program, pro se appeals are reviewed by the 
court' s pro bono coordinator, under the supervision of a staff 
attorney, to determine whether counsel should be appointed.35 

An attorney in each district of the circuit coordinates and 
maintains panels of private volunteer attorneys for the 
program. 36 The court's pro bono coordinator uses these district 
coordinators to recruit volunteers for the :wogram and locate 
counsel for appointment in eligible cases. 7 Cooperating with 
law school clinics located within the Ninth Circuit, the program 
also facilitates pmticipation by qualified law students.38 

31. Seventh CirclIit COllrt of Appeals' Appointed COllnsel Program, De Novo 
(newsletter of Wis. Bar App. Prac. Sec.) at 3 (Spring 2003) (available at http://www. 
\Yisbar.org/sections/appelprac/news/2003sprapp.pdf). 

32. /d 
33. See 9th Cir., Pro Bono Program I (on file with Joumal of Appellate Practice and 

Process); 1993 9th Cir. Jud. Conf Resolution No.3, Encourage Ninth CirclIit Allol'l1eys to 
Participate in the Pro Se Representation Project (submitted by Ninth Circuit Lawyer 
Representatives Coordinating Committee and Ninth Circuit Senior Advisory Board) (on 
file with Joumal of Appellate Practice and Process). 

34. 1993 9th Cir. Jud. Conf Resolution No.3, supra n. 33. 
35 . 9th Cir. , Pro Bono Program, supra n. 33, at 2. 
36. /d at l. 
37. /d 
38. /d at 6. 
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Some state appellate courts, like the federal appellate 
courts, have also developed formal pro bono programs. The 
New Mexico Court of Appeals has one of the most highly 
developed programs among state appellate courts, one which 
came about as a result of an extensive study focusing on how 
that COUIt was dealing with pro se appellants.39 Staff attorneys 
and judges drafted forms for docketing statements for criminal 
cases, general civil cases, and domestic relations cases; a 
celtiorari petition form for administrative appeals; notice of 
appeal forms; applications for free process and service of 
process; and a pamphlet responding to frequently asked 
questions, available in all of the district court clerks' offices.4o 

The court commissioned an instructional CD to explain how 
appeals proceed in the court of appeals and to provide 
interactive instructions for filling out the forms. 4l In addition, 
the court compiled a list of attorneys agreeable to representing 
pro se litigants for free or for a reduced fee where the court has 
determined those litigants would benefit from and welcome such 
assistance.42 Finally, the court initiated a program where senior 
staff attorneys are "on call" to take questions from pro se 
litigants.43 

In some states, the courts and state bar associations have 
collaborated in very effective pro bono appellate programs 
through which the bar coordinates a pool of volunteer lawyers to 
provide pro bono representation where the court has deemed pro 
se palties need legal counsel. The New Hampshire Supreme 
Court and the New Hampshire Bar Association have two pro 
bono programs, each of which refers income-eligible parties to 
volunteer lawyers.44 The Appellate Practice Section of the 
Wisconsin State Bar enlists volunteer attorneys who regularly 
accept appointments to represent pro se litigants in cases 

39. Ltr. from Bridget Gavahan, N.M. App. Senior Staff Attorney and Chair, N.M. 
Appellate Courts' Pro Se Committee, to Thomas H. Boyd (Nov. 13, 2002) (on file with 
Journal of Appellate Practice and Process). 

40. fd. 
41. fd. at 2. 
42. fd. 
43. fd. 

44. Ltr. from Stephanie A. Bray, Wiggin & Nourie, P.A., to Thomas H. Boyd (Dec. 8, 
2003) (on me with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process). 
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identified by the state's appellate courts as raising significant 
legal issues.lI5 

II. DEVELOPMENT OF MINNESOTA'S 

PRO BONO APPELLATE PROGRAM 

The Minnesota courts have spent considerable time 
examining the challenges posed by the increase in pro se 
litigation and developing constructive methods for addressing 
this emerging trend.4 Recognizing that "[p]ro se litigation is on 
the rise in Minnesota," the court leadership has concluded that 
"[t]he need to deal more effectively with this increase is one of 
the top leadership goals of the Conference of Chief Judges.,,47 
Declaring that "[fJull legal representation for all litigants should 
be encouraged wherever possible," the Minnesota judiciary 
determined that the "Minnesota state court system should join in 
a partnership with bar associations and the legal profession to 
increase the number of attorneys providing pro bono 
representation.,,48 As a result, considerable progress has been 
made in assisting pro se litigants at the trial COUlt level.49 

However, until recently, no formalized approach made pro bono 
legal services available to pro se litigants in state civil appellate 
proceedings. 50 

ShOltly after its formation in 2001, the Appellate Practice 
Section of the Minnesota State Bar Association determined that 
one of its objectives was to promote pro bono appellate legal 
services. As a starting point, the Appellate Practice Section 
developed a list of attorneys willing to provide pro bono legal 

45. Robert R. Henak, "Do Good"; APS Pro Bono Appeals Program, De Novo 
(newsletter of Wis. Bar App. Prac. Sec.) 6 (Summer 2004) (available at http://www.wisbar. 
org/sections/appelprac/news/2004summer.pdt). 

46. See generally Report of the Minnesota Conference of Chief Judges, supra n. 15; 
Report of the Commillee on the Role of Judges in Pro Bono Activity (Dec. 1994). 

47. Report of the Minnesota Conference of Chief Judges, supra n. IS, at 4. 
48 . Hon. John M. Stanoch, Working with Pro Se Litigants; The Minnesota Experience, 

24 Wm. Mitchell L. Rev. 297, 299 (1998) (citations omitted). 
49. See e.g. id. at 307-312. 
50. It should be noted that pro bono assistance has been provided by volunteer 

attorneys through the Appellate Office of the State Public Defender in criminal appeals on 
an ad hoc basis. Interview with Teddie Gaitis and Larry Hammerling (Nov. 6,2003). 
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services in civil appeals.51 The Section then began to identify 
potential sources of pro bono appellate opportunities. 

Upon developing a list of approximately thiliy interested 
attorneys, the Section's representatives met with the Chief Judge 
of the Minnesota Court of Appeals, the Honorable Edward 
Toussaint, Jr. The Minnesota Court of Appeals disposes of more 
than 2,000 cases per year, 52 and it must issue an opinion within 
ninety days of hearing oral argument in a given case.53 

Accordingly, the court moves a lot of cases along at a fairly 
brisk pace and only rarely interrupts the processing of any 
particular case. The Section sought to explore whether 
Minnesota's intermediate appellate court had any interest in 
developing a pro bono program to assist parties who would 
otherwise be proceeding pro se in civil appeals. 

Following a general discussion on the subject and a 
positive reaction from Chief Judge Toussaint, the Section put 
together a "brainstorming" meeting of interested parties that 
included Chief Judge Toussaint, representatives of the Section, 
representatives of the clerk's office, court library, public 
defender's offices, staff attorneys, and other interested 
individuals.54 This meeting was highly productive in identifying 
and addressing several threshold issues (discussed below) as 
well as developing the concept of a pilot program to evaluate 
procedures, develop materials, and otherwise gather information 
regarding the operation of a pro bono appellate program. 

51. The Appellate Practice Section developed the list by seeking volunteers through 
communications with its members on its listserv, as well as through announcements at 
section meetings and programs. Interested attorneys were directed to contact the chair of 
the pro bono subcommittee who, in turn, was responsible for compiling a list of names and 
contact infomlation of the individual volunteers. 

52. Minnesota State Courts 2002-2003 Annual Report at 15 (available at http://www. 
courts.state.mn. usldocuments/CI O/annualreports/2003/mjb _annual_report _2003 . pdf). 

53 . Minn. Stat. § 480A08, subdiv. 3(a) (Westlaw current through 2004 Reg. Sess.). 

54. In addition to Chief Judge Toussaint, the meeting was also attended by Frederick K. 
Grittner, Clerk of Appellate Courts; Anne L. Wyneken, Staff Attorney with the Milmesota 
Court of Appeals; Barbara Golden, with the Minnesota Law Library; Jill Frieders, a family 
law attorney from Rochester; Mary Drummer, Chair of the MSBA's Family Law Section; 
Larry Hanuneriing, of the Minnesota Public Defender's Office; Michael Schechter, Chair 
of the MSBA's Appellate Practice Section ("Section" or "Appellate Practice Section"); 
Patrick Bums, who is on the board of Volunteer Lawyers Network ("VLN"); and Thomas 
H. Boyd, Chair of the Section 's Pro Bono Subcommittee. 



112

BOyoABA.ooc 9/24/2013 2:43 PM 

MINNESOTA'S PRO BONO ApPELLATE PROGRAM 

A. Determining Sponsorship of and Responsibility 
for the Pro Bono Program 

307 

Among the most significant and defining of the threshold 
issues in developing a pro bono appellate program was the 
extent to which the Minnesota Court of Appeals would be 
involved in the program. The court's commitment to the prompt 
processing of all cases, as well as its limitations on staff 
resources, posed practical restrictions on the extent to which it 
could participate in arranging for counsel to represent pro se 
litigants.55 Even if these practical obstacles did not exist, 
administering a program to appoint pro bono counsel would 
require the development of criteria to identify appropriate cases 
and procedures for introducing volunteer lawyers into those 
cases.56 

Given these challenges, it became apparent that, at least 
initially, Minnesota's program would have to be operated by an 
outside sponsor who could identify volunteer lawyers and 
introduce them to pro se litigants. Under such an arrangement, 
the court would be advised and updated as to the activities of the 
sponsoring organization, and it could draw upon the panel of 
volunteer lawyers developed by that organization in the event it 
chose to appoint counsel in any given case. Ultimate 
responsibility for operating the program, however, would reside 
outside the court system. 

The Appellate Practice Section was the obvious choice to 
serve as the sponsoring organization because it had already 
assembled a list of lawyers willing to take on pro bono appellate 
matters and had already put together a subcommittee of 
volunteer attorneys to assist in the development and operation of 
a pro bono appellate program. 

B. Developing a Methodfor Identifying and Screening Cases 

As the sponsoring organization, the Appellate Practice 
Section had to develop appropriate methods and procedures for 

55 . The group's discussions on this and other issues are summarized in a July 2, 2002, 
memorandum by Thomas H. Boyd, "MilUlesota Court of Appeal [sic] Pro Bono Panel/July 
1,2002 Meeting" (on file with Journal of Appellate Practice and Process). 

56. /d. 



113

BOYDABA.DOC 9/2412013 2:43 PM 

308 THE JOURNAL OF ApPELLATE PRACTICE AND PROCESS 

identifying appropriate cases and eligible pro se litigants. While 
one option would have been for the Section to review and screen 
all cases filed with the Minnesota Court of Appeals by pro se 
litigants, requiring the development of screening criteria and 
procedures, such an approach would also require substantial 
time and resources. A less demanding and more realistic 
alternative for the busy volunteer members of the Section, 
however, was a program in which the pro se litigants would 
"self select." After being informed of the availability of pro 
bono assistance, interested pro se litigants could apply to the 
Section for assistance. This approach avoids the need for an 
ongoing review of all pro se appellate matters, and the self­
selection procedure automatically excludes those pro se litigants 
who simply do not wish to have professional legal 
representation. 57 

C. Considerations in Determining Eligibility for 
Pro Bono Appellate Services 

Having opted for the self-selection approach, the Appellate 
Practice Section then had to determine who would be eligible to 
receive information concerning this program. There were 
legitimate concerns that volunteer legal services be made 
available only to pro se litigants of limited financial means who 
could not hire counsel on a traditional pay-as-you-go basis.58 

The Section had to either develop a process for evaluating 
financial need or identify categories of cases where the financial 
need of a party is already established or can reasonably be 
presumed. . 

FUlthermore, the program was not intended to put pro bono 
legal services in competition with the private bar, where 
representation might be available through the private bar on a 
contingent fee basis. Instead, the pro bono program would be 
aimed at making voluntary legal services available to individuals 
who were not able to afford such services and to whom such 
services were not otherwise available.59 At the same time, the 

57. Jd 
58. Id. 
59. Id. 
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Section felt that the pro bono program should not exclude 
individuals who, due to their limited financial means, are 
eligible to receive' representation through existing public law or 
legal services organizations. On the contrary, it was felt that the 
pro bono program could provide supplemental resources for the 
representation of a greater number of underprivileged or 
impoverished litigants. 

An additional concern involved the extent to which the 
subject matter of the case or type of cases might involve highly 
charged social and political issues. There were legitimate 
concerns that providing pro bono legal services to litigants in 
controversial cases might create dissent among the suppOliers 
and members of the bar, the public, or the court. 

Finally, it was important to offer voluntary legal services in 
areas of the law or types of cases where pro se paJiies regularly 
appear and in which representation by counsel would be 
welcomed and prove beneficial to the parties and the court alike. 

D. Selecting Unemployment Compensation Cases 
for the Pilot Program 

Eventually, the Appellate Practice Section developed a plan 
to conduct a pilot program involving appeals from denials of 
unemployment compensation benefits. Unemployment cases had 
been on the rise as a result of the difficult economy.60 In the past 
five years, the Minnesota Court of Appeals has averaged 
approximatel~ 127 unemployment cases per year, or 5.9 percent 
of its docket, I and in all likelihood, the number of appeals from 
unemployment compensation cases will increase as the number 
of unemployment compensation claims increases.62 

The COUli of Appeals had previously identified this 
category of cases as involving a significant number of pro se 

60. Jones, supra n. I, at 19. 
61. /d. 
62. The number of claims filed by Minnesotans has substantially increased during each 

of the past three years. See the statistics at the Minnesota Department of Employment and 
Economic Development's website at http://www.deed.state.mn.us/lmil (accessed Nov. 14, 
2004). See also Marshall H. Tanick & Brian R. Dockendorf, Is There Gold in Those Hills? 
Shifting Contours of Unemployment Compensation Law, 60 Bench & Bar 17, 18 (Nov. 
2003) (discussion of increase in unemployment compensation claims and corresponding 
appeals). 
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appellants63 who could benefit from attorney assistance in the 
appellate process64 and in framing and briefing the relevant 
issues on appea1:65 In fact, the clerk's office had already 
prepared a packet of written materials aimed at assisting pro se 
litigants in conducting arfeals from the denial of unemployment 
compensation benefits. These packets provided a natural 
vehicle for communicating the program to interested pro se 
litigants through the "self-select" approach, and the clerk's 
office was willing to place a written description of the pro bono 
appellate program in the existing packets. 

In addition, this was an area in which the pro se parties 
were assumed to be in financial need, as evidenced by 
M· I .. fil' fi 67 . 68 d mnesota aw waIvmg 1 109 ees, transcnpt costs, an cost 
bonds69 in unemployment compensation appeals. Thus, the 
Section could assume that these pro se litigants were in financial 
need; it would not have to conduct independent evaluations of 
individual situations in order to determine eligibility. 

Nor was this area of law one in which the volunteer 
attorneys would be competing with the private bar. These cases 
involve the payment of relatively modest benefits. While these 
benefits are essential to the welfare of the applicants, they do not 
typically justify the engagement of counsel at a standard hourly 
rate or under a contingent fee arrangement. Further, there is no 
statutory right to recover attorneys' fees under Minnesota's 
unemployment compensation laws. Thus, pro bono legal 
services are the only realistic prospect of securing representation 
for those pro se litigants who have appealed the denial of 
unemployment compensation benefits. 

Moreover, Minnesota ' s unemployment compensation laws 
present a fairly straightforward area of the law that can be 
mastered without a great deal of difficulty. The unemployment 

63. Under Minnesota law, parties who seek appellate review of the final administrative 
denial of unemployment compensation bene fils are actually referred to as " relators ." 
However, they will be referred to as "appellants" for purposes of this Article. 

64. Boyd Memorandum, supra n. 55. 
65. Jones, supra n. I, at 19. 
66. Facsimile transmittal from Frederick K. Grittner to Thomas H. Boyd (Oct. 3, 2002) 

(enclosing pro se packet materials) (on file with Journal of AppeIlate Practice and Process). 

67. MimI. Civ. App. P. R. 103.01 , subdiv. 3(g). 

68. MimI. Stat. § 268.105, subdiv. 7(c) (Westlaw current through 2004 Reg. Sess.). 
69. MimI. Civ. App. P. R. 107.02(g). 
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compensation laws are fully codified in a single chapter of the 
Minnesota Statutes, and the case law focuses on the application 
of a few basic principles. In short, attorneys could pick up and 
handle these types of cases effectively even if they had no ~rior 
experience with unemployment compensation benefits law.7 

It should be noted that the unemployment compensation 
benefit program is administered by the Minnesota Department of 
Employment and Economic Development ("Department"), 
which has its own attorneys who litigate these benefit claims 
through appeal. Early on in the development of the pilot 
program, the Section contacted counsel for the Department to 
make them aware of the program and reassure the Depattment 
that neither MSBA nor the Minnesota Court of Appeals intended 
to "target" the Department or pursue some type of controversial 
agenda by implementing this program. The Depattment's 
counsel were actually quite appreciative to have pro bono 
counsel involved and were extremely helpful with and 
supportive of the program. 71 

. 

Finally, Chief Judge Toussaint indicated that the COUlt of 
Appeals would agree to hear oral argument in these cases where 
a volunteer attorney had agreed to represent the pro se 
appellant.72 Typically, pro se appeals are submitted on the briefs 
without oral argument. Thus, the fact that the court was willing 
to provide oral argument made these cases much more appealing 
from the standpoint of professional development and personal 
satisfaction. 

III. MINNESOTA'S UNEMPLOYMENT COMPENSA nON 

ApPEALS PILOT PROGRAM 

A. Communicating the Program to Pro Se Parties 

The clerk's office agreed to include a written description of 
the pilot program, along with sponsor and contact information, 

70. Boyd Memorandum, supra n. 55 . 
71. The Department' s counsel has included Lee B. Nelson and his colleagues, Philip B. 

Bryne, M. Kate Chaffee, Linda Holmes, and Katrina L Smith. 
72. Boyd Memorandum, supra 11. 55 . 
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in the packets of information that it otherwise made available to 
pro se patties appealing adverse unemployment compensation 
determinations. Communicating the program in this way offered 
a much simpler, more efficient, and less expensive means than if 
the Appellate Practice Section had had to comb through the new 
case filings to identify and then communicate the program to 
eligible pro se parties. 

The Section developed three descriptions of the program, 
each aimed at a different audience in order to achieve specific 
objectives: 

• a master description to clarify for the court and 
the bar this pro~'am's objectives, sponsor, and 
practical details. 3 

• a narrative flow chatt for volunteer lawyers 
describing, step by' step, the program's 
mechanical workings.74 

• a more general description of the program for 
pro se parties, intended to communicate 
information to lay people.75 

The information provided to pro se litigants had to 
accurately summarize the program and procedures, yet be 
understandable to a non-lawyer. It had to provide interested pro 
se patties with contact information in order to obtain 
clarification or further information concerning the program. 

B. Introducing Volunteer Attorneys to Interested Pro Se Parties 

Included with the description of the pilot program in the 
clerk's office packet was an application form. It was then up to 
the individual party, should he or she desire pro bono legal 
representation, to promptly fill out and submit the application 
form to the Program Coordinator.76 Once the appeal had been 
commenced and a request was received, the Appellate Practice 
Section then became responsible for finding a volunteer attorney 
to meet and confer with the pro se appellant. 

73. See inJi'a app. A. 
74. See inJi'a app. B. 
75. See inji'a app. C. 
76. See inJi'a app. D. 
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The Section concluded that, for a number of reasons, 
volunteer attorneys should not be expected to provide pro se 
litigants with meaningful consultation and opinions as to 
whether or not to file an appeal. First, the timeframes for 
initiating an appeal are more compressed in these types of cases. 
In contrast to a sixty-day time period that generally applies to 
most civil appeals under Minnesota law, an appeal from a 
decision by the Representative of the Commissioner must be 
commenced within thirty days. The Section did not want to 
discourage volunteer participation by presenting them with 
short-term deadlines and prospects for tardy filings of petitions 
for writ of certiorari or faulty service of such writs. 

Second, an attorney who was not involved in the 
administrative proceedings would need some time to review the 
record in order to conduct a reasonable analysis and provide 
meaningful opinions and recommendations. In many cases, it is 
essential to review the hearing transcript in order to get a full 
understanding of the recotd. However, in most cases, the 
transcript is not prepared and available for review until after an 
appeal has been commenced. 

Third, the Section did not want to create a situation in 
which the availability of volunteer lawyers would have the 
effect of increasing the number of appeals. The Section did not 
see its role as increasing the Court of Appeals' caseload, but 
instead sought to facilitate the more effective and efficient 
submission of cases that would otherwise be filed. 

Finally, the Section determined that pro se parties who 
receive a meaningful review of their cases after their appeals 
have been filed are no worse off for having filed the appeals in 
order to have been eligible to confer with a volunteer lawyer 
about the merits. There are no out-of-pocket costs, as pro se 
patties are not required to pay a court filing fee or post a cost 
bond. FUlther, if pro se parties ultimately decide to withdraw 
their appeals, they are neither taxed any costs nor otherwise out 
of pocket for any amount, nor are they likely to suffer any other 
type of sanction. 
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C. Form Engagement and Declination Letters 

The Appellate Practice Section was particularly concerned 
about documenting the status and scope of any engagement by 
the volunteer attorneys. Accordingly, the Section developed 
form letters for attorneys to use in either accepting or declining 
pro bono engagements once they had met with the clients and 
reviewed the cases. These letters, like the program description 
included in the pro se packet of materials, were written with the 
aim of communicating with a layperson. 

The engagement letter is intended to confirm that the legal 
services will be provided free of charge.77 It is fUliher intended 
to explicitly limit the scope of the engagement to include only 
the unemployment compensation matter. This limitation is 
important because the client's termination from his or her 
employment may have resulted in other potential claims, such as 
wrongful termination, discrimination, defamation, and, in the 
case of union employees, violation of labor agreements. The 
letter is intended to clarify that, by accepting the representation 
in the unemployment compensation appeal, the volunteer 
attorney has not agreed to take on representation of other matters 
as well. 

The Section also prepared a standard Notice of Appearance 
for use by attorneys who decided to take the case.78 This form 
contains an express request for oral argument. 

In contrast to situations in which the Court screens a case 
and determines that it has merit and would benefit from the 
appointment of counsel, pro se litigants in the pilot program are 
given the opportunity to meet with a volunteer lawyer before 
that lawyer evaluates the merits of the case. The Section 
therefore designed the program's procedures to avoid situations 
in which attorneys might agree to take a case and put in an 
appearance before actually having the opportunity to evaluate 
the merits of that case. 

Toward this end, the Section incorporates a two-step 
process for responding to requests for pro bono assistance. Upon 

77. See inji-a app. E. 
78. See inji'a app. H. 
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receiving a request, the Section identifies a volunteer lawyer 
willing to meet with the pro se party and review the case. After 
this initial meeting and review take place, the volunteer attorney 
and prospective client decide whether it will be appropriate to 
establish a professional engagement and for the attorney to enter 
a formal appearance in the proceedings. 

The Section developed two types of letters for use in 
declining an engagement. Neither letter expresses any opinion 
concerning the merits of a party's particular case. However, they 
offer the volunteer lawyer the option of simply declining to take 
the case79 or, alternatively, recommending that another attorney 
review the case.80 

D. Substantive Legal Aids and Primers on 
Unemployment Compensation Law 

The Appellate Practice Section recognized that many of the 
program's volunteers had little or no prior experience with 
unemployment compensation cases. Accordingly, the Section 
undertook to prepare outlines and assemble written materials on 
this topic to assist lawyers who agreed to take these cases. These 
materials include two outlines: "Unemployment Compensation 
in Minnesota," providing a general overview of the . law; and 
"Unemployment Compensation before the Minnesota Court of 
Appeals," focusing specifically on the Minnesota Court of 
Appeals's review of agency decisions to either grant or deny 
unemployment compensation benefitsY 

By coincidence, the Minnesota Legal Services Coalition 
was planning a continuing legal education program on 
unemployment compensation law at approximately the same 
time the Section was developing the pilot program, and the 
Section palticipated in planning this program. As a result, this 
training was made available free of charge to attorneys who had 
volunteered for the pro bono volunteer list. Likewise, these 
attorneys had access to the written materials developed for this 

79. See inji'a app. F. 
80. See inji'a app. G. 
81. Both outlines were authored by Anton J. Moch of Winthrop & Weinstine, P.A., and 

are on file with the author. 
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program, including several primers on unemployment 
compensation law and appellate practice and procedure. 

IV . RESULTS OF MINNESOTA'S PILOT PROGRAM 

The Appellate Practice Section's pro bono appellate pilot 
program officially commenced in November 2002, when the 
clerk's office included a description of the program in the 
packets of materials distributed to twenty-five consecutive pro 
se litigants. Of the twenty-five individuals who received these 
packets, eight contacted the Program Coordinator to request a 
volunteer attorney. All eight pro se litigants met with volunteer 
attorneys to review and consult on their respective cases. From 
this group, five eventually engaged counsel and were 
represented through the remainder of their appeal by an attorney. 

The court affirmed the Commissioner's Representative in 
one of these cases.82 Another of these initial cases was settled 
and, therefore, required no · decision by the COutt.83 In three 
cases, the court reversed the decision by the Representative of 
the Commissioner and either awarded or reinstated benefits to 
the relator. 84 

In Judeh v. Lexmark International Inc., the former 
employee challenged the administrative finding that he had 
intentionally submitted false claims for commission payments.8S 

With the assistance of counsel, the relator was able to secure a 
reversal of the agency determination by demonstrating that the 
evidence of the record "fail[ed] to show that relator engaged in 
conduct that evinced intent to defraud or to ignore his 
employer's interests.,,86 

In Thompson v. Dolphin Clerical Group, the relator had 
been denied unemployment compensation benefits because she 
had allegedly failed without good cause to accept an offer of 

82. Zivalich v. Unique Concepts Promotions, Inc., 2003 WL 21961391 (Minn. App. 
Aug. 19, 2003). 

83. Bertram v. Sheriffs Youth Program, No. C 1-02-2087. 
84. Hayes v. K-Mart Corp., 665 N.W.2d 5S0 (Minn. App. 2003), review denied (Sept. 

24, 2003); Judeh v. Lexmark Inti. Inc. , 2003 WL 21961379 (MilUl. App. Aug. 19,2003); 
Thompson v. Dolphin Clerical Group, 2003 WL 21500175 (Minn. App. July 1,2003). 

85. JudeIJ, 2003 WL 21961379 at *1-2. 
86. Id. at *3 . 
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suitable employment.87 However, with the assistance of counsel, 
the relator was able to obtain a reversal and reinstatement of her 
right to receive benefits by demonstrating that the offer she 
received, when "[v ]iewed in its totality, ... did not constitute 
suitable employment and, therefore, [her] rejection d[id] not 
disqualify her from benefits.,,88 

In Hayes v. K-Mart Corp., the Minnesota Court of Appeals 
actually addressed what it characterized as "a matter of first 
impression in Minnesota," involving the question of "[w]hether 
a breach of promise to grant a raise gives an employee good 
cause to quit" so as to retain eligibility to receive unemployment 
compensation benefits.89 With the assistance of counsel, the 
relator was able to obtain a reversal and reinstatement of her 
right to receive benefits by establishing that her employer's 
failure to grant a promised pay raise "violated her employment 
agreement and gave her good cause to quit.,,90 

V. FUTURE OF MINNESOTA'S PRO BONO ApPELLATE PROGRAM 

With the commencement of the pilot program, awareness 
of the Appellate Practice Section's pro bono appellate program 
began to spread informally by word-of-mouth. As a result, the 
Program Coordinator has received a steady number of requests 
from other pro se parties seeking pro bono representation in their 
unemployment compensation appeals. Interest in the bar has 
likewise grown steadily, as the panel of volunteers has now 
increased to more than fifty lawyers. To date, the Section has 
succeeded in finding a volunteer attorney for nearly every pro se 
party requesting representation on appeal. 

Based on this success, the Section has decided to continue 
and expand its pro bono program. In doing so, the Section has 
been able to build on the lessons learned through the pilot 
program and focus these pro bono appellate resources in even 
more positive and constructive ways. 

In the future, the Section plans to work to coordinate 
partnerships with local legal services organizations such as 

87. Thompson, 2003 WL 21500175 at * 1. 
88. Id at *2. 
89. Hayes, 665 NW.2d at 553. 
90. Id at 553-54. 
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Southern Minnesota Regional Legal Services ("SMRLS,,)91 and 
Volunteer Lawyers Network ("VLN,,).92 As in most states, these 
legal services organizations have experienced severe funding 
cuts which, in turn, have resulted in the reduction of their staffs 
and other resources. The Section hopes to alleviate some of the 
strain by providing volunteer lawyers to VLN and SMRLS to 
take on unemployment compensation appeals as well as other 
types of civil appeals that these organizations may determine to 
be suitable for pro bono assistance. 

Additionally, the Section is seeking to develop a similar 
relationship with the Appellate Office of the State Public 
Defender for handling criminal appeals. The Public Defender 
has coordinated some pro bono work in the past on an ad hoc 
basis.93 Like VLN and SMRLS, the Public Defender has 
recently suffered substantial decreases in funding. The Section 
proposes to work with the Public Defender to budget a quota of 
cases that can be handled by volunteer lawyers on a pro bono 
basis so as to alleviate at least some of the workload of the staff 
attorneys. 

Finally, the Section will continue to maintain its list of 
volunteer attorneys and its methods for facilitating the 
introduction of those attorneys to pro se appellants so as to 
respond to any particular cases that either the Minnesota Court 
of Appeals or the Minnesota Supreme Court may identify as 

91. Originally founded in 1909 as the Free Legal Aid Bureau of Associated Charities of 
St. Paul, SMRLS is the oldest legal aid program in the state and provides free legal 
representation and advice to low-income residents of thirty-three counties in Southern 
Minnesota and to migrant fannworkers throughout MilUlesota and North Dakota. SMRLS 
has offices in St. Paul, Mankato, Winona, Albert Lea, Worthington, Prior Lake, Rochester 
and Fargo, North Dakota. It also has outreach offices at the American Indian/Eastside 
Office in St. Paul at the United Cambodian Association. SMRLS serves an estimated 
260,000 low-income persons in its service area who experience an estimated 100,000 legal 
problems each year. 

92. VLN was established as the Legal Advice Clinics in 1966 with the mission of 
advising and representing economically disadvantaged people with legal problems, through 
volunteer attorneys and without charge to the clients. Today, VLN is the primary pro bono 
legal service provider in Hennepin County, serving the largest poverty population in 
Minnesota. Over time, VLN has expanded beyond its original core of legal advice clinics 
to provide legal services through a variety of programs, including telephone advice panels, 
outreach programs at homeless shelters, schools and community centers, statewide 
programs such as the bankruptcy screening and federal pro se projects, and Legal Access 
Point-a joint effort with the Hennepin County Bar Association and the District Court to 
provide legal assistance to pro se clients at the court. 

93 . See supra n. 50. 
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suitable for appointment of qualified and experienced appellate 
counsel to represent the pro se appellant. 

CONCLUSION 

The pro bono pilot program, while quite limited in scope, 
has been extremely successful from a number of different 
standpoints. First, the pilot program has allowed the Appellate 
Practice Section and the Minnesota Court of Appeals to develop 
a set of guidelines and procedures to operate a program through 
which pro bono appellate legal services may be offered to needy 
pro se appellants. Second, this pilot program has allowed the 
Section and the court to test these guidelines and procedures so 
as to evaluate how well they operate and identify ways to 
improve this type of program. Finally, the results on the merits 
in the cases where pro bono counsel were involved demonstrate 
the substantive benefit that can be derived from introducing 
volunteer attorneys to pro se appellants. 
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APPENDIX A-DESCRIPTION OF PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 

APPELLATE PRACTICE SECTION 
PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 

Program Sponsor· The Appellate Practice Section of the Minnesota 
State Bar Association is sponsoring a pilot program through which volunteer 

attorneys may provide pro bono assistance to appellants in unemployment 
compensation appeals that are filed with the Minnesota Court of Appeals. 
The pilot program is organized through the MSBA the Appellate Practice 
Section, and is not operated or sponsored by the Minnesota COUli of Appeals 
and does not involve the appointment of counsel by the Court. 

Program Objectives· Toward this end, the pilot program is intended to 
(1) create 0ppoliunities for attorneys to render pro bono appellate legal 
services, (2) gather useful information and data, and (3) develop practices and 
procedures that may eventually be expanded to include pro bono 
0ppoliunities with other types of appeals. Based upon the experiences and 

data collected from these cases, the Appellate Practice Section will develop 
proposals to expand the program into other areas of the law andlor address 

other needs. The ultimate goal of the pilot program is to enhance the Court's 
ability to dispense justice, promote the development of the law, and help 
individuals present their cases effectively for review. 

Scope of Program • The pilot program has been limited to appeals 
relating to unemployment compensation benefits for several reasons. First, 
these types of cases typically involve a high number of pro se appellants. 
Second, there is a critical mass of such appeals sufficient to supply potential 
pro bono 0ppoliunities without overwhelming the currently available 
resources. Third, these cases involve a fairly straight-forward area of the law 
with the application of a statutory framework and developed case law. 

Fourth, these appeals generally involve a single appellant and the 
respondent's interests are represented by an attorney from the Minnesota 
Department of Economic Security. 

Eligibility • All appellants who appeal from the denial of 
unemployment compensation benefits to the Minnesota Court of Appeals are 
eligible to paJiicipate in the pilot program. It is assumed that appellants in 
these types of appeals are of limited financial means. Indeed, the filing fee is 

waived under the appellate rules. Minn. Civ. App. R. 103 .01, subdiv.3(g). 
Accordingly, paJiicipants in this pilot program will not be required to 
establish financial eligibility. However, such eligibility requirements will 
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likely have to be considered and implemented as part of future pro bono 
programs involving other types of appeals. 

Volunteer Panel· The Appellate Practice Section has undertaken to 
develop and maintain a panel of volunteer attorneys who are willing to 

represent parties in appellate proceedings on a pro bono basis. 
Notification of Program • Appellants who initiate appeals from 

decisions by the Commissioner of Economic Security denying their 
unemployment compensation benefits are provided a standardized packet of 
materials by the Clerk of the Appellate COutts. The Clerk will inselt among 
these materials a written description of the pilot program along with an 

application form. If any of these individuals wishes to pmticipate in the 
program, he or she will be advised by the written materials to fill out the form 

and submit both the form and a copy of their petition for writ of certiorari 
within five (5) business days of initiating their appeal to the Program 
Coordinator. 

Program Coordinator· The Program Coordinator will be responsible 
for facilitating and monitoring the assignment of volunteer attorneys to 
interested appellants. 

Assignment Process· Upon receiving an appellant's submission, the 
Program Coordinator will notify the members of the volunteer attorney panel 

of the appellant's case bye-mail and request prompt response by any panel 
members who are interested and able to assist with the applicant's case. The 
information contained in the e-mail will include the identities of appellant 
and respondent to facilitate conflict checks, as well as the appellant's 
descriptions of the Commissioner's decision and the issues in the appeal. The 
case will be assigned to the first panel member who can take the case. 

Initial Review and Consultation· The volunteer attorney assigned to 
the case will contact the appellant and arrange to promptly meet with the 

appellant to review the appellant's case. If possible, this meeting should take 
place within five (5) business days after the attorney receives the assignment. 

The volunteer attorney should request the appellant to bring all of the 
documentation relating to the appeal and any of the underlying proceedings 
to this initial meeting. 

Post-Consultation and Review Procedures· Upon meeting with the 
appellant, the matter may proceed in one of the following three ways: 

(1) If, after consultation, the attorney does not believe the appellant has 

a meritorious appeal, then the attorney should so advise the appellant and 
decline to represent the appellant in the appellate proceedings. The attorney 
should promptly confirm the decision to decline representation by letter to the 
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appellant immediately following the meeting, and this letter should be copied 
to the Program Coordinator. 

(2) If, after consultation, the attorney determines the appeal is 
meritorious and the appellant and the attorney mutually agree on the 
engagement of that attorney, then the attorney will undeliake to represent the 
appellant in the appellate proceedings. The volunteer attorney should 
promptly confirm the engagement by letter to the appellant immediately 
following the meeting, and this letter should be copied to the Program 
Coordinator. Additionally, the attorney should immediately file a Notice of 
Appearance with the Clerk of the Appellate COUlis. 

(3) If, after consultation, the volunteer attorney determines the appeal 
has merit but, for whatever reason, the appellant and the volunteer attorney 

who reviewed the case do not agree on the engagement of that attorney, then 
the attorney shall immediately confirm this by letter to the appellant, and the 
letter should be copied to the Program Coordinator. The Program Coordinator 
will then notify the other members of the volunteer attorneys panel of the 
case bye-mail and request a volunteer to represent the appellant in the 
appellate proceedings. The case will be assigned to the first panel member to 
respond to the e-mail. The attorney who is then assigned to handle the appeal 
will be expected to transmit a formal engagement letter to the appellant with 

a copy to the Program Coordinator, and file a Notice of Appearance with the 
Clerk of Appellate COUlis. 

Oral Argumellt • The Court has agreed to grant oral argument in all 
cases in which pro bono counsel has been engaged. 

Post-Assigllment Feedback • Once the appeal is completed, the 
attorney assigned to the appeal will notify the appellant by letter that the 
engagement has been completed, and a copy of the letter should be sent to the 
Program Coordinator. The Program Coordinator will then request both the 
appellant and the volunteer attorney assigned to the case to complete a 
written questionnaire to obtain their respective feedback concerning the pilot 

program. The Program Coordinator will retain these questionnaires for 
review and future use. 
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ApPENDIX B-PROCEDURES FOR ASSIGNING VOLUNTEER 

ATTORNEYS IN PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 

323 

STEP NO.1: Pro se Appellant files Notice of Appeal to initiate 
appellate proceedings. 

STEP NO.2: Clerk's Office provides Appellant with packet of 
information that includes a description of the pilot program and an 
application form . 

STEP NO. 3a: Appellant decides not to pm1icipate in the pilot 
program. PROCESS ENDS. 

STEP NO. 3b: Appellant decides to pal1icipate in the pilot program 

and transmits a completed application form and the Notice of Appeal to the 
Program Coordinator. 

NOTE: The Appellate Practice Section requests the Clerk' s Office to 
provide the Program Coordinator with a complete list of all the cases in 
which pro se appellants are provided with the materials describing the pilot 
program to compare the number and percent of appellants who opt to 
pal1icipate in the pilot program with the overall number of appellants who are 
provided with the information regarding the pilot program. 

STEP NO.4: Program Coordinator puts information from the 
Appellant's application form in an e-mail that is transmitted via LISTSERY® 

to all panel members. 
STEP NO.5: Interested panel members run conflict checks to 

determine whether they are in a position to volunteer for possible assignment. 
STEP NO.6: All interested attorneys e-mail their response to the 

Program Coordinator. 
STEP NO.7: Program Coordinator assigns the case to the Attorney 

and confirms assignment with that Attorney bye-mail. 
STEP NO.8: Program Coordinator faxes the Appellant's form and 

Notice of Appeal to the Attorney assigned to the case. 
STEP NO.9: Attorney contacts the Appellant within five (5) business 

days and schedules a meeting to review the case with the Appellant. 
STEP NO. 10: Attorney meets with Appellant, reviews the matter, and 

provides Appellant with an assessment of the merits. 
STEP NO. 11a: Attorney declines the engagement and confirms this 

decision in a letter to the Appellant (with a copy to the Program Coordinator). 
PROCESS ENDS. 

STEP NO. lIb: Attorney concludes that the appeal is meritorious, but 
is not in a position to take the case, and therefore transmits a letter advising 
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the Program Coordinator to reassign the case (with a copy to the Appellant). 
REPEAT STEPS 4 THROUGH 11 . 

STEP NO. He: Attorney accepts the case and transmits an 
engagement letter to the Appellant with a copy of the engagement to the 
Program Coordinator. 

STEP NO. 12: Attorney files a Notice of Appearance with a copy to 
Program Coordinator. 

STEP NO. 13: Attorney notifies Program Coordinator by letter when 
the appeal has been concluded. 

STEP NO. 14: Program Coordinator transmits questionnaire to 
Appellant and Attorney to obtain feedback regarding the pro bono 
assignment. 
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ApPENDIX C-NOTICE OF UNEMPLOYMENT COMPENSATION 

APPEAL PROGRAM 

NOTICE OF UNEMPLOYMENT COMPENSATION APPEAL 
PROGRAM SPONSORED BY MSBA'S APPELLATE PRACTICE 

SECTION 
The Appellate Practice Section of the Minnesota State Bar Association 

has stat1ed a program for appellants in unemployment compensation appeals 
filed with the Minnesota Cout1 of Appeals. 

A panel of lawyers is offering free help to individuals without lawyers 
who have appealed from unemployment compensation determinations made 

by the Commissioner of Economic Security. Lawyers from this panel will 
meet with you after you filed your Petition for Writ of Cet1iorari with the 

Minnesota Court of Appeals. At that point, the lawyer will discuss the merits 
of your appeal and the possibility of free legal help. 

If you would like to have your case reviewed, please send a completed 
copy of the attached form along with a copy of your Petition for Writ of 
Cet1iorari to Program Coordinator, Unemployment Compensation Appeal 
Program, 3200 Minnesota World Tmde Center, 30 East Seventh Street, 
St. Palll, Minnesota 55101 no later than three (3) business days from the date 
of filing your Petition for Writ of Cet1iorari. 

Once you send in this form and a copy of your Petition, your case will 
be reviewed by a lawyer who will give you a general opinion on the merits of 

your claim and offer advice on how to proceed. A lawyer may be assigned to 
represent you, but there is no guarantee. If a lawyer does represent you, it 
might not be the same lawyer who reviewed your case. 

You are responsible for serving the conformed Writ of Certiorari issued 
by the Clerk, and the deadlines for getting a transcript, filing briefs and 
appendices, and performing all other obligations will not be suspended or 
changed if you pat1icipate in this program. 

This program is not sponsored by the Cout1. Please do 1I0t contact the 
Minnesota Court of Appeals about this program . Call or e-mail the Program 
Coordinator listed above with any questions at 651-290-8505 or 
tboyd@winthrop.com. 
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ApPENDIX D-ApPLICA TION FORM FOR PRO BONO PILOT 

PROGRAM 

MSBA APPELLATE PRACTICE SECTION 
PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 

Information About Employee Who Has Appealed: 

Employee' s Name: ________ ___ ____ _ 
Employee's Address: _ ______ _______ _ 

Employee' s Telephone Number: ___ _______ _ 
Employee ' s Fax Number: ______ _ ______ _ 

Employee's E-mail Address: _ __________ _ 

Short Description of Commissioner of Economic Security'S Decision: 

Information About Former Employer: 
Employer's Name: _____ ____ _ _____ _ 
Employer's Address : ______________ _ 
Employer's Attorney: ______________ _ 

Short Description of the Claims and Issues Raised in Notice of Appeal: 
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ApPENDIX E-ENGAGEMENT LETTER [FORM] 

[Date] 

[Name] 
[Address] 

[City/State/Zip] 

Re:[Case Name and Docket Number] 

Dear [Name]: 

I have agreed to represent you in your unemployment appeal as pmt of 
the pro bono pilot program organized by the Appellate Practice Section of the 
Minnesota State Bar Association. My help is free, but you will need to pay 

for any other costs in your case, such as the cost of getting a COUlt transcript. 

I may stop representing you · if I decide that your case does not have a 
reasonable chance of success or if you do not cooperate with me in working 
on the case. 

If you agree to these terms, please sign and return a copy of this letter. 
I look forward to working with you in this matter. 

Sincerely, 

[Attorney Name] 



133

BOYDABA.DOC 9/24/2013 2:43 PM 

328 THE JOURNAL OF ApPELLATE PRACTICE AND PROCESS 

ApPENDIX F~DECLINING ENGAGEMENT LETTER [FORM] 

[Date] 

[Name] 

[Address] 

[City/State/Zip] 

Re:[Case Name and Docket Number] 

Dear [Name] : 

I am sorry to say that, for the reasons I discussed in our meeting, I have 
decided not to represent you in your unemployment compensation appeal. 

Please remember that the deadlines and requirements in your appeal 

have not changed and you need to comply with these requirements. 

I wish you the best of luck with your case. 

Sincerely, 

[Attorney Name] 
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ApPENDIX G-REFERRAL LETTER [FORM] 

[Date] 

[Name] 
[Address] 
[City/State/Zip] 

Re:[Case Name and Docket Number] 

Dear [Name]: 

912412013 2:43 PM 

329 

For the reasons I discussed in our meeting, I have decided not to 
represent you in your unemployment compensation appeal. 

Although I and my firm cannot represent you, I think it is still worth 
you trying to get a lawyer. I encourage you to contact the Program 
Coordinator, at 651-290-8505 oi· tboyd@winthrop.com if you are still 
interested in free legal help. 

In the meantime, please remember that the deadlines and requirements 

in your appeal have not changed and you need to comply with these 
requirements. 

I wish you the best of luck with your case. 

Sincerely, 

[Attorney Name] 
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ApPENDIX H-NOTICE OF ApPEARANCE [FORM] 

STATE OF MINNESOTA 
IN COURT OF APPEALS 

Employee/Relator, 

v. 

Employer/Respondent, 

and Depaliment of Employment ) 
and Economic Development, ) 
Respondent. ) 

NOTICE OF APPEARANCE 

Department of Employment and 
Economic Development 

No. 

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that _ _ _______ , Esq. of 

hereby appears as 
attol'l1ey for , Employee/Relator in the above­
captioned matter. This appearance is entered under the MSBA Appellate 
Practice Section's Pro bono Pilot Program. 

Employee/Relator requests Oral Argument at the location provided for 
in Rule 134.09, subd. 2, and fUliher requests to submit formal briefs under 
Rule 128.02. 

Dated: _____ _ 

By: _ ______ _ 

[Attol'l1ey] 

[Address] 
[City/State/Zip] 
Attol'l1ey for Employee/Relator 
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The Montana Appellate Pro Bono Program 

1. Overview. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ... Page 2 

2. Recruiting Volunteer Attorneys .... . .......................... . .......... . ............... Page 2 

3. Placing the Case with Pro Bono Counsel.. .... . ................................ .. ..... Page 3 

a. Case Qualifications for Participation in Program 

b. Case Selection and Referral Process 

I. Referral of individual cases 

ii. Self-represented party acceptance or rejection 

lll. Determination of financial eligibility 

IV. Putting pro bono counsel in place 

4. Post-Placement Procedures ............................................................ Page 6 

a. Notice of Appearance 

b. Obtaining the Record 

c. Extensions of Time 

d. Oral Arguments 

5. Continuing Role of Coordinator and Pro Se Law Clerk ................... . ..... . .. Page 7 

6. Substitution of Pro Bono Counsel ....... . .. .. ...... . ....................... ... .. . ..... Page 7 
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1. Overview 

By Order dated May 22,2012, the Montana Supreme Court established an Appellate Pro 

Bono Program (APBP or Program), which became effective July 1,2012. The APBP is 

coordinated by the Montana Supreme COUlt's Pro Bono Coordinator (Coordinator) and the 

Court's Pro Se Law Clerk (PSLC). 

The Program is designed to offer the assistance of appellate counsel to "qualified 

litigants." A "qualified litigant" is a self-represented litigant: (1) who meets the financial criteria 

established by the Montana Legal Services Association (MLSA) I, and (2) whose case, while 

under review by the Supreme Court, requires supplemental briefing or oral argument. 

Once the Court requests supplemental briefing or oral argument, the PSLC and the 

Coordinator begin the process of matching a qualified pro bono attorney with a participating self-

represented litigant. The parties to the appeal are notified of the Court's request and if the self-

represented patty wishes to participate in the Program, the MLSA determines if he or she meets 

the necessary financial criteria. Upon satisfaction of the financial criteria, the qualified litigant is 

provided a volunteer attorney to assist him or her in continuing the appeal before the Supreme 

COUlt. 

If there are multiple parties to the appeal that are qualified litigants, the Coordinator will 

offer each of them an opportunity to participate in the Program and be assigned pro bono 

counsel. Additionally, except for court fees waived in accordance with existing rules, transcripts 

and other costs associated with the appeal will continue to be the responsibility of the parties. 

2. Recruiting Volunteer Attorneys 

I Montana Legal Services Association or MLSA is a 501(c)(3) nonprofit organization providing 
legal information, advice and other services free of charge to low-income Montanans. 

Montana Supreme Court Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) Overview Page 2 
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The Coordinator will engage in on-going recruitment efforts to enlist pro bono appellate 

lawyers who are willing to take on the cases that have been selected for participation in the 

APBP. When an attorney accepts a case through the Program, the attorney is eligible to receive 

primary or secondary malpractice insurance for the duration and scope of the pro bono appellate 

representation. The Coordinator will make every eff011 to recruit attorneys from varied and 

wide-ranging areas of the law as well as seasoned attomeys to mentor younger lawyers and law 

students to assist the volunteer attomeys who are participating in the Program. 

Recruited volunteer attomeys must complete and submit the APBP Attomey Registration 

Form, attached as Exhibit A. The detailed information derived from the registration and 

application forms allows matching attomey with appropriate cases. 

3. Placing the Case with Pro Bono Counsel 

a. Case Qualifications for Participation in Program 

The criteria for participation in the APBP are: (1) after initial briefing, the Court 

determines there are one or more issues in which the Court could benefit from additional briefing 

and possibly oral argument; and (2) the self-represented litigant is financially eligible. Financial 

eligibility occurs when the MLSA confirms that the self-represented party would qualify, or be 

eligible, for use ofMLSA's services. 

b. Case Selection and Referral Process 

i. Referral of individual cases 

Once the Court has identified a case for pat1icipation in the Program, the Court will direct 

the PSLC to notify the self-represented party in writing, Exhibit B. The following information 

should be provided: 

• The case has been initially selected for participation in the Program. 

Montana Supreme Court Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) Overview Page 3 
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• Participation in the APBP is purely voluntary and is contingent upon financial 
eligibility, which requires the litigant to submit a MLSA application and obtain a 
Certificate of Eligibility. The letter shall include specific instructions for 
submitting and returning the MLSA application. 

• It is possible that placement of the case with a volunteer lawyer will include 
posting minimal, publicly available facts about the case through the Internet, 
exclusively for the purpose of placing the case. 

• The self-represented litigant may decline to participate in the APBP by indicating 
so on the Application and returning the completed Request to Decide the Appeal 
form to the PSLC. 

The PSLC will include with the notification letter: (1) an APBP "Application for 

Appointment of Pro Bono Counsel," Exhibit C, (2) a MLSA Application for Assistance, Exhibit 

D, and (3) a "Request to Decide the Appeal," Exhibit E. As indicated above, the "Request to 

Decide the Appeal" is for the litigant's use when declining participation. 

ii. Self-represented party acceptance or rejection 

If the self-represented litigant is interested in participating in the Program, the litigant 

must complete and return the APBP litigant application and the MLSA Application for 

Assistance within fourteen (14) of the date of the letter. The PSLC will notify them of 

acceptance into the Program. 

The self-represented litigant may decline to pruticipate in the APBP by indicating so on 

the Application and returning the completed Application and Request to Decide the Appeal 

fOlms to the PSLC. 

iii. Determination of financial eligibility 

The self-represented litigant must complete the MLSA Application for Assistance, 

Exhibit D. This form may be completed and submitted electronically. Alternatively, the self-

represented litigant may complete the hard copy of the form included in his or her information 

packet from the PSLC and return it to MLSA by mail. Boxes 3 and 7 of the Application need 

Montana Supreme Court Appellate Pro Bono Program CAPBP) Overview Page 4 
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not be completed by the self-represented litigant. In Box 8, the litigant need only request that 

MLSA determine fmancial eligibility for the APBP. After MLSA determines financial 

eligibility, MLSA will notify the PSLC who will, in turn, notify the self-represented litigant and 

the Coordinator. If the litigant meets the fmancial qualification requirements, the Coordinator 

will begin selection of counsel. 

iv. Putting pro bono counsel in place 

The Coordinator will review the applications and select an attorney for placement of the 

case. A mentor or law student may also be selected. To facilitate efficient case and client 

control, the mentor shall not be included in any formal appointment papers. When a self­

represented party becomes a qualified litigant, the Coordinator will disseminate a "Request for 

APBP Attorney Volunteer," Exhibit F, to the existing pool of volunteer attorneys. Limited case­

specific infOlmation, prepared by the PSLC, including patty names, issues presented, urgency of 

proceedings, and other information the Court determines necessary to appropriately place the 

case will be provided to the attorney pool. 

Attorneys interested in pursuing placement on the case will respond by completing a brief 

online or hard copy form entitled "APBP Volunteer Attorney Notice of Case Interest," Exhibit 

G. The Notice will confirm the lack of conflicts and will indicate the desired role in the appeal, 

i.e., lead attorney, mentor, etc. A law student wishing to participate in the case as well may 

complete the fOlm. 

When a volunteer attorney has been selected, the Coordinator will notify the attorney in 

writing using the Attorney Refenal Letter at Exhibit H, instructing the selected attorney to 

contact the self-represented litigant. The letter to counsel will include contact information for 
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the new client as well as a copy of the client's Application for Appointment of Pro Bono Counsel 

and a sample Engagement Letter, attached as Exhibit I. 

After the selected attorney has had the opportunity to meet with the litigant and/or file a 

notice of appearance in the case, counsel shall return an "Attorney ConfIrmation of Acceptance 

of APBP case," Exhibit J, to the Coordinator. The Coordinator will provide a copy to MLSA, 

which triggers provision of malpractice insurance through MLSA. 

If an objection is made to the selection of a volunteer attorney, if fInancial eligibility 

cannot be confirmed, or if a volunteer match cannot be made for any reason, the Coordinator will 

notify the PSLC, who will in turn notify the Court. The PSLC will also notify the self­

represented litigant by letter that placement of the case was unsuccessful. This allows the case to 

continue from that point forward as a self-represented litigant case. 

4. Post-Placement ProcedUl"es 

a. Notice of Appearance 

After consulting with the client and obtaining necessary documentation relating to the 

representation, the selected attorney should file a Notice of Appearance, Exhibit K, with the 

Court. The Notice should indicate the appointment is under the APBP. 

b. Obtaining the Record 

To expedite access to the District Court record, and avoid costs associated with printing 

and postage, the Coordinator will facilitate volunteer attorney's access to the record directly from 

the District Court, electronically when possible. 

c. Extensions of Time 
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The Court will Issue a Scheduling Order setting forth the dates when supplemental briefs 

are due. Any requests for extension of time must be submitted to the Clerk of the Supreme Court 

via motion in substantial compliance with the Montana Rules of Appellate Procedure. 

d. Oral Arguments 

There is no guarantee that any participating case will be invited to present an oral argument 

to the Court; however, should volunteer counsel request oral argument, the Court will consider 

the preferences of counsel as well as the nature of the case to detelmine whether oral argument is 

necessary or appropriate. If the Court chooses to hear oral argument, it will issue an Order 

scheduling the argument and specifying the time allowed to each party in accordance with its 

Internal Operating Rules. 

5. Continuing Role of Coordinator and Pro Se Law Clerk 

The Coordinator will maintain contact with the volunteer attorneys for administrative 

purposes. The Coordinator will assist in directing the volunteer attorney to practice resources 

and information to facilitate a positive pro bono expelience and serve as the point of contact 

between the volunteer attorneys and the Court. 

The PSLC will serve as contact for the litigant should an issue arise with the volunteer 

attorney. The PSLC will monitor the case progress via C-Track, or other similar Court­

sanctioned program. The PSLC and Coordinator will confer as necessary. 

6. Substitution of Pro Bono Counsel 

Although it is anticipated that an APBP-selected attorney will handle accepted pro bono 

appeal cases until completion, it is recognized there are times when an attorney who accepts 

representation must withdraw due to circumstances beyond the attorney's control. In these 

situations, the Engagement Letter will govern this process and the volunteer attorney shall advise 
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the Coordinator. If the Court deems it appropriate to permit withdrawal, the Coordinator will 

attempt to place the client with a new volunteer attorney. Placement is not guaranteed and the 

circumstances necessitating the withdrawal of previously assigned volunteer counsel may be 

considered by the Coordinator and the PSLC when determining reassignment. 

Montana Supreme Court Appellate Pro Bono Program CAPBP) Overview Page 8 



145

EXHIBIT A 
Montana Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) 

Attorney Registration Form 

Attorney Full Name: ______________________________ _ 

Attorney Montana Bar No.: _________ [OR] I am a __ . year student at the UM School of Law 

Employer: 

Address: __________________________________ ___ 

City: _______________ ----J. MT Zip: _____________ _ 

Phone: ________ _ Fax: _______ _ E-mail: ______________ _ 

Check One: 
D I regularly check and respond to my e-mail 

D I do not regularly check my e-mail and prefer not to receive correspondence or requests by this 
method. 

Indicate your participation preferences by checking all applicable boxes below and listing any 
areas of practice in which you would be willing to take or mentor an appellate pro bono case: 

D I prefer to serve as a mentor only 

D I am willing to take a case or mentor another attorney 

D I prefer only to take a case 

D I am a law student 

D I may be interested in being paired with an experienced mentor or a junior attorney 

D I have a mentor who can assist me within my own firm 

Areas ofPractice: ________________________________ _ 

Briefly describe your previous appeals experience within Montana and any other jurisdictions: 

Please provide any additional information you feel would be helpful in matching you with a pro 

bonoclientandformentor: ____________________________ ___ 
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Montana Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) 

Attorney Participation Information and Form 

By Order dated May 22,2012, the Montana Supreme Court established an Appellate Pro 

Bono Program (APBP). The APBP is designed to provide the assistance of appellate counsel to 

qualified litigants in cases in which the Court has determined that supplemental briefing would be 

beneficial to the Court. The APBP is coordinated by the Montana Supreme Court's Pro Bono 

Coordinator and its Pro Se Law Clerk. The ABPB became effective July I, 2012. 

Only selected self-represented litigants who meet Montana Legal Services Association's 

(MLSA) financial criteria are eligible to receive pro bono legal services from the APBP volunteer 

attorneys. Upon MLSA's acceptance and the attorney's confirmation of representation, the 

volunteer attorney is eligible to receive primary or secondary malpractice insurance for the 

duration and scope of the pro bono appellate representation. The Program offers an opportunity to 

volunteer as the appellate attorney, a mentor to the lead attorney, or as a law student willing to 

assist in the appeal under the supervision of the lead attorney. 

Except for court fees waived in accordance with existing rules, transcripts and other costs 

associated with the appeal will continue to be the responsibility of the parties. 

If you are an attorney licensed in the State of Montana and are interested in 

participating as a volunteer attorney in the Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP), 

please complete the online Attorney Registration Form by following the link below or 

visiting the State Bar of Montana website and downloading, printing and mailing or e­

mailing your Registration Form to the following: 

Patricia Fain 
Statewide Pro Bono Coordinator 

P.O. Box 21304 
Billings, MT 59104-2103 
Email to pfain@mt.gov 

Register for the APBP Online 

For more information about the program, visit the State Bar of Montana website and click 
on the Appellate Pro Bono Program link. 

Registration information Set/plf 
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Date 

Name 
Address 

EXHIBIT B 
Participant/Client Letter 

Re: Montana Supreme Court Cause Number: DA-______ _ 

Dear 

The above appeal was fully briefed and has been submitted to this Court for a 
decision. You have represented yourself in filing the briefs and perhaps 
motions and other documents. Five of the seven justices have reviewed the 
briefs and determined that supplemental briefing would be beneficial to the 
Court in deciding this case. 

The Court has an Appellate Pro Bono Program CAPBP) through which counsel 
may be appointed to represent eligible litigants to prepare and file 
supplemental briefs and if the case is classified for oral argument, to argue the 
case before the Court. Enclosed is an information packet that includes the 
Application for Appointment of Pro Bono Counsel. You must complete the 
application in order to apply for appointment of a pro bono attorney. 

Also enclosed is an Application for Financial Qualification from the Montana 
Legal Services Association CMLSA). It contains instructions for accessing this 
form electronically. You must complete this form and submit it electronically 
or, alternatively, you may complete the enclosed hard copy and return it to 
MLSA by mail. It must be returned within 10 days of the date of this 
letter. MLSA will review the Application for Financial Qualification, and you 
will be advised if you qualify and are eligible for the APBP. By completing and 
signing the Application for Financial Qualification, you agree to the MLSA 
reviewing the application and making a determination whether you are 
eligible to participate in the APBP. 
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Please complete the Application for Appointment of Pro Bono Counsel and 
mail it to the Court's Pro Se Law Clerk within 10 days to the following: 

Sally Johnson 
Pro Se Law Clerk 
Montana Supreme Court 
215 N. Sanders, Room 414 
Helena, Montana 59620 

You may submit the completed Application for Appointment of Pro Bono 
Counsel personally by delivering it to staff in the office of the Clerk of Supreme 
Court, 215 N. Sanders, Room 323 here in Helena, who will ensure their 
delivery. 

The PSLC will inform you if you qualify for the APBP. You will be contacted 
directly by the pro bono counsel who has agreed to represent you in 
preparing and submitting supplemental briefing. 

The attorneys and law students who have generously volunteered to be 
appointed as pro bono counsel receive no compensation, but you will be 
responsible for any costs incurred such as the copying and binding of the 
supplemental briefs. If you qualify for the APBP, the Court will issue an Order 
setting a supplemental briefing schedule. After the supplemental briefs from 
all parties are filed, the case will be reviewed and classified by the Court. Your 
pro bono counsel will be notified whether the case is classified for oral 
argument. If oral argument is ordered, your pro bono counsel will present the 
argument which you may attend at your own expense. 

If you choose not to participate in the APBP program, please sign the Request 
to Decide the Appeal, and the Court will decide this appeal without 
supplemental briefing. This form must be submitted to the Court's Pro se 
Law Clerk at the above address within 10 days of date of this letter. 

If you have questions, you may call or e-mail me, and I will attempt to answer 
them and assist you in participating in this program. 

Sincerely, 

2 
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Sally}ohnson 
Pro Se Law Clerk 
Phone: 406444-1412 
e-mail: sjohnson2@mt.gov 

3 
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EXHIBIT C 
APPLICATION FOR APPOINTMENT OF PRO BONO COUNSEL 

IN A CIVIL APPEAL 

I, ________________ , am representing myself as 

the Oappellant or Oappellee in Cause No. ____________ -' 

[caption a/appeal] 

This case is fully submitted to the Supreme Court and ready for a decision. 

I have been informed by the Supreme Court that I may be eligible for the 
appointment of counsel under the Appellate Pro Bono Program CAPBP). In the 
event that I qualify financially for pro bono appellate representation, counsel 
will be appointed to represent me in this appeal. 

o I DECLINE to participate in the APBP. (Skip to signature and complete and 
sign the enclosed Request to Decide Appeal and return to the address below.) 

o I AGREE to appointment of pro bono counsel through APBP. I have 
provided my contact information and have read and initialized each statement 
below: 

My Full Name: _____________________ ___ 

Street Address: ________________________ _ 

City, State, Zip Code: ____________________ _ 

Telephone: ____________ Cell Phone: _______ _ 

Email: ___________________________ _ 

After reading each of the following provisions, please signify your agreement by 
putting your initials in the blank line at the left. 

__ I understand this representation will consist of filing additional briefs relating 
to the issues the Court identifies and oral argument in the event the Court classifies 
this case for oral argument. 

APBP Participant Application - 1 
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__ 1 understand that my appointed pro bono counsel has agreed to act as a 
volunteer, without any compensation and that the Court has waived its fees. 

__ I understand that 1 am responsible for any additional costs incurred. 

__ 1 agree to provide timely, accurate financial information to determine my 
eligibility under Montana Legal Services Association (MLSA) guidelines. 

__ I agree to communicate and cooperate with my pro bono counsel until the case 
is finally disposed of by the Montana Supreme Court. 

__ I understand that the appointment of pro bono counsel will then be terminated 
and my pro bono counsel shall have no further responsibilities to me or my cause. 

__ 1 understand that once pro bono counsel is appointed to represent me in this 
appeal and has filed a Notice of Appearance, 1 may not file any documents in this 
appeal and only counsel will be allowed to file briefs, other documents, or present 
oral argument, if applicable, in this appeal. 

__ I understand the Clerk of the Supreme Court will return any document 1 might 
attempt to file directly, and the Court will not consider these documents in deciding 
this case. 

__ I understand the brief or briefs I filed prior to the appointment of pro bono 
counsel will be considered in deciding this appeal, together with the supplemental 
briefs. 

__ I agree to complete the Financial Qualification form and submit it to Montana 
Legal Services Association as instructed on the Form. 

__ I agree to sign a letter of engagement provided by my pro bono counsel. 

__ I understand all of these provisions of the APBP. 

DATED this __ day of _______ , 20_. 

[Signature] 

APBP Participant Application - 2 
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Montana Legal Services Association 
Application for Assistance 

HOW TO APPLY FOR HELP: 

1. You can call MLSA's Helpline at: 

I 1-800-666-6899 I 

The Helpline is answered Monday - Friday from 7:30 am to 6:00 pm. Sometimes 
you may have a hard time getting through on the phones. We want to hear from 
you, so please keep trying. The fastest way to apply is by calling the Helpline. 

OR 

2. You can submit an application online. To submit an application online you need to 
go to our website, http://www.mtlsa.org.click on the "Get an Application" link 
located under the "Quick Links" area on the left of the homepage and, on the 
following page, click on the "fill out online and submit online" link to begin the online 
application process. 

OR 

3. You can complete this form to apply for our help. To submit this paper application 
you can: 

Mail or fax this form to the Montana Legal Services Association (MLSA). 

Our mailing address is: 

Montana Legal Services Association 
616 Helena Avenue, Suite 100 
Helena, MT 59601 

Our fax number is: 

(406) 442-9817 

4. We will contact you. Please call MLSA at the number below, if you do not hear from 
us within 3 days. 

5. If you need help filling out this application, or if you want to apply over the phone, 
please call the Montana Legal Services Association's Helpline Number at 1-800-
866-6899. 
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Montana Legal Services Association 
Application for Assistance 

Complete the application to the best of your ability. All the information you provide in 
this application is strictly confidential. 

1. What type of problem do you need help with? 

o Garnishment 
o Collection Lawsuit 
o Collection Harassment 
o Repossession 
o Foreclosure 

o Eviction 
o Housing Subsidy/Voucher 
o Return of Security 

Deposit 
o .Mobile Home Issues 

2. Applicant Information: 

o Custody 
o Divorce 
o Order of 

Protection 
o Other 

o Medicaid 
o TANF 
o Food Stamps 
o Employment 

First name: ________________ __ Middle initial(s): ___ _ 

Lastname: ____________________________ __ 

Othernamesyouhavegoneby: ________________________________________ _ 

SSN: XXX - XX - ____ (last 4 digits only) 

Date of Birth: __________________ _ Age: ___ _ 

Sex: o Male o Female Email Address (optional): __________________ _ 

If case involves domestic violence~ please provide MLSA with safe contact information: 

Street address: __________________________________________________ _ 

City: _________ State: ________ _ ZIP Code: _____ _ 

Best phone number to reach you at (MLSA will try to call you, it is important that you provide 

MLSA with a reliable number to reach you): 

Area code: __ _ Number: ______ Type of phone: __________________ __ 

Another phone number to reach you at: 

Area code: ______ Number: ______ Type of phone: __________________ __ 

Please indicate best time to call you back: __________________________________ _ 

Is it safe to contact you using the phone number(s) / address above? DYes o No 

Do you need an Interpreter? DYes 0 No 

If you answered "Yes", what language? ____________________________________ _ 

Rev.9120 1l MLSA Application for Assistance Page 2 of6 
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Are you a citizen of the United States? 

Attestation: 

I am a citizen of the United States 

Signature 

DYes 

If you are not a citizen, are you a legal resident? 

AIN: __________ _ 

D No 

Date 

DYes D No 

3. Other Party Information: Provide the following information about the other person, 
agency, or business in your case. For example, in a divorce that person would be your spouse. 
For custody, that would be another parent or guardian. For housing, it would be your landlord. 
If you've had funds taken from your bank account, it would be the financial institution and the 
creditor who took your money. 

Full name of person, agency or business: 

City and State: 

Other party SSN: XXX-)()(-___ _ 

Other Party DOB: ---1---1_ 
Other names the other party has gone by: 

4. Your Household: Please answer the following questions about your household. A 

"Household" is all the people that you have a responsibility to support, such as a spouse, a 

child, or a ward. 

How many adults (19 and over) live in your house? __________ _ 

How many children (under age 19) live in your house? ___________ _ 

Rev. 9/2011 MLSA Application for Assistance Page 3 of6 



155

S. Household Income Information: Please list all sources of income where applicable. 

Type of Income You Other Party 

Employment 

Food Stamps (SNAP) 

SS! 

Soc. Sec. Disability 

Soc. Sec. Retirement 

Child Support 

TANF (Welfare) 

Veteran's Benefits 

Unemployment 

Worker's Compensation 

Other: 

Other: 

6. Asset Information: 

If "Yes", please list the item, what it is worth, and how much you owe on it if anything. 

Amount in 

Item Do you have? account? 

Checking DYes D No 

Savings DYes D No 

How much did How much do 

Item Do you have? you pay for it? you owe on it? 

Car 1 DYes D No 

Car 2 DYes D No 

House 1 DYes D No 

House 2 DYes D No 

Stocks, bonds, CDs DYes D No 

Other: DYes D No 

Other: DYes D No 

Other: DYes D No 

Rev. 9/2011 MLSA Application for Assistance Page 4 of6 
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7. Hearings and Deadlines: 

- Have you been served with court documents? 0 Yes 0 No 

If yes, what date were you served with papers? ________________ _ 

- Are there any deadlines that you know of? 0 Yes 0 No 

If yes, what is the deadline? ______________________ _ 

- Is there a hearing scheduled? DYes o No 

If yes, what is the date and time of the hearing? ________________ _ 

Please ATIACH copies of critical documents containing important dates. 

8. Specific Problem: 

Please tell us what problem you need help with: 

What do you want Montana Legal Services Association to do for you? 

: 

Rev. 9/2011 MLSA Appl ication fo r Assistance Page 50f6 
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9: Feedback: 

Is there any feedback you would like to leave regarding this application? Did any terms, words 

or questions not make sense to you? Let us know so we can improve the process in the future. 

Rev. 9/2011 MLSA Application for Assistance Page 6 of 6 



158

EXHIBIT E 
REQUEST TO DECIDE THE APPEAL 

IN THE SUPREME COURT OF THE STATE OF MONTANA 

Plaintiff and Appellee, 

v. 

Defendant and Appellant. 

DA __ _ 

REQUEST TO DECIDE 
THE APPEAL 

I acknowledge that I have been provided with an Appellate Pro Bono CAPBP) 

information packet and informed by Supreme Court staff that I may be eligible for 

appointment of a pro bono counsel to provide supplemental briefing to the Court in 

this appeal. I have reviewed the packet and I choose not to participate in the APBP 

and request that this appeal be decided based upon the record and the briefs on file 

with the Court. 

DATED this __ day of _______ -I. 20 __ . 

[signature] 

Certificate of Service 

I hereby certify that I have filed a true and accurate copy of the foregoing 
Request to Decide the Appeal with the Clerk of the Montana Supreme Court and that 
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I have served true and accurate copies of this Request upon and each attorney of 
record and any other self-represented litigants as follows: 

Counselfor ____________________ __ 
[designation o/party] 

Address and zip code 

OR: 

Self-represented ________________ _ 
[designation o/party] 

Address and zip code 

2 



160

EXHIBIT F 
REQUEST FOR APBP ATTORNEY VOLUNTEER and CASE MEMORANDUM 

You are among a pool of attorneys who registered to volunteer for the 
Montana Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) sponsored by the Montana 
Supreme Court. We are seeking an attorney to assist with the case outlined in 
the attached Memorandum. If you require further information about the case, 
contact information for the Court's Pro Se Law Clerk can be found on the 
Memorandum. 

If after conducting necessary conflict checks you wish to accept the 
appointment of this case, please complete the Attorney Notice of Case Interest 
online by following the link on the State Bar of Montana website at 
www.mtstatebar.org or by completing the attached hard copy and mailing or 
e-mailing NO LATER THAN [DATE] to: 

Patricia Fain 
Statewide Pro Bono Coordinator 
406/794-6693 
Pfain@mt.gov 
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To: 

From: 

Memorandum of Appellate 
Pro Bono Case 

Interested volunteer attorney 

Sally Johnson, Pro Se Law Clerk 
Montana Supreme Court 
Phone: 406444-1412 
e-mail: sjohnson2@mt.gov 

Re: Cause No. 12-______ _ 

------~----------

Date: 

Summary of issues for supplemental briefing (The Court will entertain briefing 
only regarding the issues described below): 

Case summary: 

A copy of judgment/finding~ of fact and conclusions of law from which this 
appeal is taken is attached. 

Copies qf critical Qocuments that are attached: 
D __________ _ 

D __________ _ 

D __________ _ 

D __________ _ 

D __________ _ 
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EXHIBIT G 

APBA Volunteer Attorney Notice of Case Interest 

Today'sDate: ______________________________________________________________ _ 

Attorney Name: 

Case Caption: ______________________________________________________________ __ 

APBP Client Participant: ____________________________________________________ __ 

I have performed the requisite conflict check and I do not believe that a conflict of interest exists 
regarding my possible representation in this matter. If after consultation with the client and/or 
lead attorney I discover a potential or actual conflict of interest, I will notify the Coordinator 
immediately. 

I believe I currently have sufficient time to pursue or assist with this action. 

I have reviewed the information ' provided by the Appellate Pro Bono Program regarding the above 
case and I am willing to provide the following services: 

o Represent the above APBP participant as the lead attorney 

o Serve as a mentor to the lead attorney for the above case 

o Serve as a volunteer attorney to assist the lead attorney for the above case 

o I am a law student and am willing to assist the lead attorney for the above case 

I have read the APBP Overview and am willing to provide my pro bono services according to its 
provisions. 

I understand more than one attorney may indicate interest in this case and selection is on a rotating 
basis and by random selection presuming equal experience and interest in the case type. 

LEAD ATTO RNEY VO LUNTEERS PLEASE MARK ALL THAT APPLY: 

o I would be willing to provide oral arguments if the court requests. 

o I would like to be paired with a mentor 

o I would like the assistance of a junior attorney or a law student 

______________________________________ Today'sDate: ________________________ _ 
Attorney Signature 
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EXHIBIT H - ATTORNEY REFERRAL LETTER 

[STATEWIDE PRO BONO COORDINATOR LETTERHEAD] 

ATTORNEY NAME 

ATTORNEY ADDRESS 

Re: Representation of [CLIENT NAME] 
[CASE/CAUSE NUMBER] 
Client Address: 
Client Phone: 
Client E-mail: 

Dear [ATTORNEY], 

[DATE] 

Thank you for responding to our request for pro bono representation through the Appellate Pro 

Bono Program (APBP). You have been selected to represent participant [PARTICIPANT/CLIENT] 

with [HIS/HER] appeal before the Montana Supreme Court. We ask that you contact the client 

at your earliest convenience. 

The request for your pro bono commitment to this client through the APBP is limited to 

supplemental briefing and possible oral arguments, scheduled at the Court's discretion. 

Enclosed is a sample Engagement Letter you may wish to use or modify for your own purposes. 

You may use your firm's form engagement letter, but consider including language that clearly 

outlines the scope/limitations of your representation in this case if it does not already provide 

for the same. You may find more information about the best practices relating to limitations in 

scope of representation by visiting the Montana State Law Library website 

(www.courts.mt.gov/library) and following the Limited Scope Representation link found on the 

main page. 

Also enclosed is the APBP Opening Form. You should complete the Opening Form and return to 

the address on the form after you have met with the client and confirmed representation. The 

return of the Opening Form ensures coverage of malpractice insurance (primary or secondary) 

through Montana Legal Services Association (MLSA). 
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[OPTION 1} You indicated you wished to be pai red wit h a mentor. [MENTOR NAME] has 

agreed to serve as your mentor on this case. [AlTORNEY NAME] can be reached at [CONTACT 

INFORMATION]. 

[OPTION 2} You indicated you would like the assistance of a junior attorney during your work 

on this case. [JUNIOR AlTORNEY] has agreed to assist you with this case. [JUNIOR AlTORNEY] 

can be reached at [CONTACT INFORMATION]. 

[OPTION 3} You indicated you wished to be paired with a law student during your work on this 

case. [LAW STUDENT] has agreed to assist you with this case. [LAW STUDENT] can be reached 

at [CONTACT INFORMATION]. 

I have requested an electronic copy of the district court file from the Clerk of Court. I can 

provide the file to you electronically or print a copy if you prefer. You will also be 

communicating with Sally Johnson, the Court's Pro Se Law Clerk, regarding this case. Sally can 

be reached at 406/444-1412 or sjohnson2@mt.gov. You should contact Sally if you have 

questions about filings, deadlines or issues directly related to the administration of the case 

with the Court. 

If you encounter Q11:t. problems with client cooperation or financial eligibility, or if I can be of 

any assistance, please do not hesitate to contact me immediately. Thank you [AlTORNEY] for 

offering your invaluable services. For your consideration, I remain 

Very truly yours, 
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EXHIBIT I 
Pro Bono Engagement Letter 

Date: __________ _ 

Client's Name 

Organization/Company (if applicable) 

Address 
City, State, Zip 

Re: Montana Supreme Court Cause No. ____ -' 
______________ v. ____________ _ 

Dear ___________ ___ 

I have been appointed as pro bono counsel under the Montana Supreme Court's Appellate Pro Bono 
Program (APBP) to represent you in the above-referenced appeal. My appointment is limited and 

includes only this appeal before the Montana Supreme Court. This letter confirms the terms of my 

engagement and clarifies the nature and extent of the professional services I will provide. If you find 
the arrangement acceptable, please sign and return one copy of this letter to me at your earliest 

convenience. 

1. Identification of the Parties. This agreement is made between 
_______________ ("Client") 

and _______________ ("Volunteer/Firm"). 

2. General Nature of Assistance. The Client was referred to Volunteer through the Montana Supreme 

Court's Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) . The scope of representation is outlined as follows: 

The projected timetable for completing the appeal is: _______ . Client and Volunteer may 

agree at a later time to extend representation to another matter. Any such extension will be the 
subject of a separate written agreement between the parties. 

3. Fees. Volunteer agrees to undertake this representation on a pro bono basis, which means that the 
Volunteer will not charge professional fees in connection with this matter. However, Client agrees to 
assume responsibility for all agreed upon out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the project. The 
following fees/expenses are, anticipated: ___ _ 

4. Client Responsibilities. The Client agrees to cooperate fully with the Volunteer by: 

a. providing complete information or documents that volunteer deems useful or necessary for the 

representation during the project; 
b. assisting volunteer in obtaining information and documents from any other sources which 

volunteer deems useful or necessary for the representation during the project; 

c. promptly notifying the Volunteer of any changes in address, e-mail address, telephone number, or 

changes in the Client's situation that may impact the project; 
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d. maintaining regular contact with Volunteer as is necessary to complete the project; and 

e. keeping and being on time for all appointments. 

5. Volunteer Responsibilities. Volunteer will rely on the information and documents provided by 

Client. Volunteer agrees to: 

a. keep the Client informed about the status of the project; 
b. keep all sensitive information provided by the Client confidential unless authorized by the Client to 

disclose it; [or insert firm's privacy policy] 
c. consult with the Client before making any significant decisions about the project; 

d. return all original documents that were furnished by Client; and 
e. maintain Client's file for ___ years. 

Volunteer cannot guarantee the success of any given matter, but will strive to represent Client's 

interests professionally and efficiently. For best results, I look forward to a high degree of 
cooperation from you. Although I will endeavor to achieve a satisfactory result and to keep you 

informed of the status of your case, I can make no guarantee of any kind concerning the outcome of 

this appeal. 

6. Uses of Document by Others. Client authorizes the use by Volunteer of the documents drafted during 
the course of the project for use in assisting other clients. However, the Client may direct Volunteer to 

delete information in documents that Client deems confidential. 

7. Discharge of Volunteer. Volunteer understands that Client may end this agreement at any time for 
any reason by notifying the Volunteer in writing. However, if Client is dissatisfied about the way in 

which professional services are being provided by Volunteer, the Client must first take his or her 

complaint or concern to the APBP. Client understands and hereby acknowledges that, in the event 
that Client discharges Volunteer, the APBP cannot and does not promise that Client will be referred to 

another Volunteer. 

8. Withdrawal of Representation by Volunteer. Client understands that Volunteer reserves the right to 

withdraw from representing Client, after taking reasonable steps, including first giving Client notice 
of intention to withdraw. Volunteer may withdraw ifin his or her judgment: 

a. Client does not cooperate with Volunteer or, by Client's conduct, makes it unreasonably difficult for 
Volunteer to carry out the representation effectively or efficiently; or 

b. Client insists that Volunteer engage in conduct that is contrary to the judgment imd advice of 
Volunteer or is contrary to law; or 

c. Continued representation of Client would result in a violation of the rules of ethics and professional 
responsibility; for example, if a conQict of interest develops or is discovered; or 

d. Client is no longer financially eligible for professional services free of charge because of a material 
change in Client's resources or alteration in Client's objectives. Financial eligibility will be determined 

solely by the Montana Legal Services Association. 

9. Dispute Resolution. Occasionally, volunteers and their clients have disputes arising from their 
relationship. If this happens, upon request of either Client or Volunteer, the dispute will be resolved 

by a neutral facilitator, acceptable to both parties, provided by the APBP. 
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10. Disclaimer of Liability. Volunteer will not be liable to Client for any loss or damage whatsoever, 

whether direct or indirect, which arises in contract, tort, by statute or otherwise in connection with 

professional services save only to the extent that fraud or bad faith are applicable. 

11. Complete Agreement. Client has read this agreement in its entirety before signing it. Client 

understands the terms of this agreement and agrees that it will apply throughout the course the 

project. This writing represents the entire agreement between the parties. 

I am pleased to have this opportunity to assist you and look forward to working with you. 

Very truly yours, 

Agreed to and accepted: 

Client 

Date: __________________________________ _ 
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EXHIBITJ 
ATTORNEY CONFIRMATION OF ACCEPTANCE OF APBP CASE 

ATTORNEYNAME: ____________________________________________ __ 

CLIENT NAME: ______________________________________________ _ 

CASE TITLE AND NUMBER: ______________________________________ _ 

o I have interviewed the aforementioned client and confirm I am able to represent 
the client pursuant to the guidelines of the Appellate Pro Bono Program. 

DATE CASE WAS OPENED ____________________ _ 

o I have interviewed the aforementioned client and have determined I am unable to 
represent the client (please provide a brief description of circumstances below). 

OI have been unable to make contact the client within a reasonable amount of time 
(please provide a brief description of circumstances below). 

Please return this completed form by mail or e-mail to: 

Patricia Fain 
Statewide Pro Bono Coordinator 

Montana Supreme Court 
P.O.21304 

Billings, MT 59104-1304 
pfain@mt.gov 
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EXHIBIT K 
IN THE SUPREME COURT OF THE STATE OF MONTANA 

DA __ _ 

Plaintiff and Appellee, 

v. NOTICE OF APPEARANCE 

Defendant and Appellant. 

___________ hereby appears as pro bono counsel through 

the Appellate Pro Bono Program for ________________ _ 

in the above-captioned cause. All pleadings, papers and briefs to be served 

hereafter in this matter shall be mailed to: 

Attorney Name: __________ _ 

Address: ____________ _ 

DATED this __ day of _______ -', 20 

[Signature] 
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Certificate of Service 

I hereby certify that I have filed a true and accurate copy of the foregoing 
Notice of Appearance with the Clerk of the Montana Supreme Court and that I have 
served true and accurate copies upon and each attorney of record and any other 
self-represented litigants as follows: 

Counsel for _________ _ 
[designation ofparty] 

Address and zip code 

OR: 

Self-represented ________ _ 
[designation of party] 

Address and zip code 
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Appellate Pro Bono Program Attomey Registration Survey Page 1 of 1 

Appellate Pro Bono Program Attorney Registration I Exit this Registration Form 

APPELLATE PRO BONO PROGRAM ATTORNEY REGISTRATION 

By Order dated may 22,2012 the Montana Supreme Court established an Appellate Pro Bono Program 

(APBP) designed to offer the assistance of appellate counsel to qualified litigants. The APBP is coordinated 

by the Montana Supreme Court's Pro Bono Coordinator and its Self-Represented Law Clerk. 

Only selected self-represented litigants who meet Montana Legal Services (MLSA) financial criteria are 

eligible to receive pro bono legal services from the APBP volunteer attorneys. Upon MLSA's acceptance 

and attorney's confirmation of representation , the volunteer atttorney is eligible to receive primary or 

secondary malpractice insurance for the duration and scope of the pro bono appellate representation. 

There are opportunities to volunteer as the appellate attorney, a mentor to the lead attorney or as a law 

student willing to assist in the appeal under the supervision of the lead attorney. 

Except for court fees waived in accordance with existing rules, transcripts and other costs associated with 

the appeal will continue to be the responsibilities of the parties. 

If you are an attorney licensed in the State of Montana and are interested in participating as a volunteer in 

the Montana Pro Bono Appellate Program (APBP), please complete this registration form and click submit 

at the end of the application. If you need additional information about the APBP before registering, click 

HERE to read an overview of the Program. 

[ Ne~ l 

https:1 Iwww.surveymonkey.com/s/ APBPRegistration 10/6/2013 
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715113 Appellate Pro Bono Program Attorney Registration SUr\,ey 

Appellate Pro Bono Progralll Attorney Registration Exit thi s Regi stration Form 1 

ATTORNEY REGISTRATION 

* 1. Attorney Full Name 

First Name 

Middle Initial 

Last Name 

* 2. Attorney Montana Bar Number 

3. Contact Information 

Address 

City 

Zip Code 

Telephone 

Fax 

E-Mail 

4. E-mail (Choose One) 

I regularly check and respond to the E-mail account provided above. 

I do not regularly check my e-mail and prefer not to receive correspondence or APBP requests by E-mail. 

5. Please indicate your APBP participation preferences by checking all applicable 
boxes below and listing any areas of praactice in which you would be willing to take 
or mentor an appellate pro bono case. 

I prefer to serve as a mentor only 

I am willing tp take a cas~ or mentor another attorney 
\ 

I prefer only to take a cas,e 

I am a law student 

I may be interested in being paired with an experienced mentor 

https ://w.Nw.sur\e~nkey.comls.aspX?sm=QkAXYz3>66B%2bsjm9Ed7EVaby3qGlb9QHO%2fl..ViIN4QB68%3d 1/3 
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715113 Appellate Pro Bono Prog ram Attorney Reg i strati on Sur'.€y 

I ha\€ a mentor who can assist me within my own firm 

6. Please indicate the areas of practice/case type in which you are willing to accept a 

referral 

Case Type 

Case Type 

Case Type 

Case Type 

Case Type 

Case Type 

Case Type 

7. Briefly describe your previous appeals experience within Montana and any other 
jurisdictions. 

8. Ph:~ase provide any additional information you feel would be helpful in matchina you 
with a pro bono client and/or mentor. 

https:llwmJ.sur'.€yroon'rey.com/s.aspx?sm=QkAXYz3>66B%2bsjm9Ed7EVaby3qGI b9QH O%2fL Viw4QB68%3d 213 
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715113 Appellate Pro Bono Prog ram Attorney Reg i strati on Sun.ey 

[Sub~J 

https:llwNN.surveyrmnl<ey.com/s.aspX?sm=QkAXYz3l66B%2bsjm9Ed7EVabf.3qGlb9QHO%2fLViw4QB68%3d 3/3 
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FILED 
May 22 2012 

'Ea5111 itfi 

IN THE SUPREME COURT OF THE STATE OF MONTANA 
CLERK OF THE SUPREME COURT 

STATE OF t.10NTANA 

No. 12-0028 

IN THE MATTER OF ESTABLISHING AN 
APPELLATE PRO BONO PROGRAM 

M.AY 2 ;~ 201 2 

On January 13, 2012, the Court entered an order calling for public comment on a 

proposal to establish an Appellate Pro Bono Program to further access to justice for civil 

litigants who lack financial means to retain counsel. Having now considered the 

comments submitted, 

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that there is established within this Court an 

Appellate Pro Bono Program (APBP) designed to offer the assistance of appellate 

counsel to qualified litigants in cases in which the Court has determined that 

supplemental briefing would be beneficial to the Court. The APBP will be developed 

and coordinated by the Montana Supreme Court's Pro Bono Coordinator and its Pro Se 

Law Clerk in accordance with the following guidelines: 

I. Volunteer counsel: 
The Montana Supreme Court's Pro Bono Coordinator will develop a volunteer 

database and registry for attorneys and law students who volunteer to assist pro se 
litigants in appeals pending before the Supreme Court. Each volunteer will fill out an on­
line application which will include, among other information, areas of the attorney's or 
student's subject matter expertise and interest. Experienced appellate attorneys may 
volunteer to mentor less experienced volunteer attorneys in supplemental briefing and 
arguing the appeal, should argument be ordered. Law students under supervision of the 
UM Law School also may apply to participate as volunteer counsel in accordance with 
the Court's student practice protocol. 

2. Program Eligibility: 
Cases involving at least one self-represented party may be selected by the Court 

for participation in the program where the Court determines, after briefing has been 
completed, that the Court will benefit from additional briefing on one or more issues. 
The Court's staff and Law Clerks may bring appropriate cases to the Court's attention 
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during the briefing process on appeal or, in original proceedings involving self­
represented litigants, during their review of motions or petitions. 

Once the Supreme Court identifies an appeal where pro bono assistance may be 
beneficial to the Court, the Montana Supreme Court's Pro Se Law Clerk (PSLC) will 
provide the identified self-represented litigant with an application form for participation 
in the program, which explains eligibility requirements and the scope of representation. 
Should the litigant choose not to participate in the program, the case will be submitted on 
the litigant's pro se briefing. 

Financial eligibility for the program will be determined in accordance with the 
criteria used to determine eligibility for services from the Montana Legal Services 
Association (MLSA). Appointment of pro bono counsel will be coordinated with 
MLSA's pro bono referral process to ensure proper financial eligibility screening for 
litigants and provision of malpractice insurance coverage for pro bono counsel who 
otherwise lack such coverage. 

If the litigant applies and is approved for appointment of counsel under the 
Appellate Pro Bono Program, the Pro Bono Coordinator will circulate a case-specific 
confidential memorandum to a pool of volunteer attorneys for determination of conflicts 
of interest. The Pro Bono Coordinator will select an attorney from the qualified pool. 
The Pro Bono Coordinator will notify the volunteer attorney or student and the litigant of 
the attorney or student selected. 

In the event multiple parties to the appeal are appearing pro se, volunteer counsel 
will be offered as described above for each qualified self-represented litigant. 

3. Volunteer counsel/student: 
The volunteer counsel will provide the litigant with an engagement letter and file a 

notice of appearance (noting the appointment is under the Appellate Pro Bono Program). 
The Court will set a briefing schedule and the Montana Rules of Appellate Procedure will 
apply as in all other proceedings. 

4. Supreme Court: 
Volunteer counsel shall advise the Court whether oral argument is requested. The 

Court will consider the preferences of counsel and whether the case is appropriate for oral 
argument in determining whether to classify the case for argument. The Court shall 
schedule the oral argument and determine the time allowed to each party in accordance 
with its Internal Operating Rules. 

5. Pro Bono Coordinator/Pro Se Law Clerk: 
The Pro Bono Coordinator and Pro Se Law Clerk will be cross-trained so that the 

appointment of counsel is not interrupted due to the temporary unavailability of either. 
Back-up staff may be trained as needs are identified. 

The Pro Bono Coordinator will develop the database and access to attorneys and 
law student volunteers. A rotation or randomized system of selecting counsel will be 
established. 

2 



177

The PSLC will prepare the case-specific confidential memorandum for each case 
with review and oversight by the Court. 

The PSLC and Pro Bono Coordinator will develop the forms required to support 
this program. 

6. Appeal Costs 
Except for court fees waived in accordance with existing rules, transcripts and 

other costs associated with the appeal will continue to be the responsibility of the parties. 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Program will take effect July 1,2012. 

A copy of this Order will be posted on the Montana Supreme Court website. In 

addition, the Clerk is directed to provide copies of this order to the Chairs of the Equal 

Justice Task Force, the Commission on Self-Represented Litigants, and the State Bar's 

Access to Justice Committee; the Montana Law Library; the Montana Legal Services 

Association; the State Bar of Montana; and the University of Montana School of Law. 

DATED this .JJ!!!day of May, 2012. 

~~~ 
Chief Justice 

~ 

Justices 

3 
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Justice James C. Nelson, dissenting. 

I dissent from this Court's Order establishing the "Appellate Pro Bono Program" 

CAPBP). While I do not impugn the good intentions of those promoting APBP, I suggest 

that the proposal is ill thought-out and will likely create more work and problems than it 

solves. Indeed, on the scant record presented, I suggest that the proposal is premature at 

best and, more likely, is not needed at all. 

According to the materials circulated to this Court and to the public, APBP is 

envisioned to offer the assistance of pro bono appellate counsel to "qualified litigants." 

The Court's Order does not provide any concrete criteria for identifying which self­

represented litigants will "qualify" to receive the special assistance of APBP and which 

self-represented litigants will not so "qualify." Evidently, the assistance will be provided 

to those self-represented litigants whose cases this Court, subjectively and arbitrarily, 

decides will "benefit" from additional briefing on one or more issues. Attorneys, as well 

as law students, are encouraged to offer their services to the program, and the Court will 

require oral argument in "appropriate" cases. The Court's staff and law clerks may bring 

"appropriate" cases to the Court's attention during the briefing process on appeal or, in 

original proceedings involving self-represented litigants, during their review of motions 

or petitions. Again, no criteria are provided as to what constitutes an "appropriate" case. 

If both parties are self-represented on appeal, both will be offered the benefit of APBP. 

There is a financial eligibility requirement and, apparently, the implicit requirement that 

attorneys and law students taking part in APBP will be referred through the Montana 

Legal Services Association so that such practitioners can take advantage of that 

organization's malpractice insurance coverage-assuming that the volunteer does not 

have his or her own errors-and-omissions insurance. There is, of course, more in the 

circulated materials and in the Court's Order-details that involve, among other things, 

labor and time-intensive coordination, possible mentoring and supervision of law 

students, and additional duties imposed on this Court's Pro Bono Coordinator and this 

Court's Pro Se Law Clerk. However, the above fairly sums up the proposal. 

At the outset, I question the premise upon which this entire program is based­

namely, that this Court is faced with a sufficient number cases involving self-represented 

4 
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litigants where "supplemental briefing" and oral argument would be "beneficial." 

Indeed, I suggest that APBP is a solution in search of a problem. This much can be seen 

from the skeletal nature of the program outlined in the Court's Order and the amorphous 

standards (rather than concrete criteria) articulated by the Court regarding the cases to 

which the program will apply. If there were truly a need for APBP, one would expect the 

Court's Order to identify with some sort of specificity the cases to which it will apply­

rather than just saying, somewhat vaguely, that we're creating an appellate pro bono 

program and will apply it whenever we think it's "appropriate" or "beneficial" to do so. 

Anecdotally-and that is about all there is to rely on here-I can recall one or maybe two 

self-represented cases in the last two years that, in my view, would have "benefited" from 

supplemental briefing. 

And that is the fundamental problem. We are presented with no actual data or 

statistics demonstrating the depth and seriousness of the problem to which APBP is 

presumably directed. The gross numbers and anecdotal evidence reflecting the increase 

in cases involving self-represented litigants, generally, say nothing about the necessity to 

create APBP. Those numbers and conventional wisdom show that more and more people 

cannot afford to hire attorneys-or, at least, attorneys who are interested in representing 

them in their particular case. And, as I expect most of us would agree, self-represented 

cases, as a class, would all benefit from supplemental briefing by pro bono counsel. 

Typically, such cases are not well briefed in the first place, and very often the trial court 

record is equally inadequate for appellate review. 

The Court has decided, however, that a select number of those cases should be 

entitled to the benefit of supplemental briefing by counselor a law student. Resorting to 

my own conventional wisdom and anecdotal experience, I suggest that there are very few 

appellate cases where there is one or more self-represented litigants and where the case 

actually merits supplemental briefing, much less oral argument. In the couple of cases 

where additional briefing might have been helpful, there were other problems that no 

amount of supplemental briefing could have fixed. 

In point of fact, cases involving self-represented litigants-especially those who 

represented themselves in the trial court-typically are burdened with serious procedural 

5 



180

problems including: the failure to make and preserve an adequate record in the trial 

court; the failure to make contemporaneous objections; the failure to raise and argue 

appropriate theories and arguments supporting the objections that were made; the failure 

to produce and to get admitted the necessary testimonial and documentary evidence-the 

list goes on and on. In the face of these problems and shortcomings, our staff, our law 

clerks, and our Pro Se Law Clerk-most of whom already have sufficient other work to 

keep them busy-apparently will now be required to examine all self-represented appeals 

and original proceedings (the latter being even rarer than the former)-all of which 

theoretically could benefit from supplemental briefing-and ferret out those cases which, 

under this Court's non-test, are "appropriate" and "will benefit" from supplemental 

briefing and oral argument. This, I assume, presupposes that in addition to "brief 

checking" (for procedural compliance with the Montana Rules of Appellate Procedure), 

which our law clerks already are required to do, they will also be expected to read the 

briefs, motions, and petitions filed by self-represented litigants and examine the adequacy 

of the district court record-a daunting task-so as to find "appropriate" cases (whatever 

those are) to bring to the COUli's attention. I suggest there are few, if any, clerks who 

have that kind of time. 

Furthermore, by its terms, APBP is not just restricted to appeals. It obviously 

covers those, but also covers "original proceedings," "petitions" (which encompasses a 

vast array of other proceedings including not only true "original proceedings" but also 

petitions for habeas corpus, supervisory control, mandamus, prohibition, and 

postconviction relief, all of which are "civil proceedings"), and the "motions" that self­

represented litigants file. In short, if APBP operates as set out, it will quickly morph into 

one that this Court does not have adequate personnel or resources to administer. 

But more to the point, what is it that supplemental briefing is supposed to 

accomplish? Is pro bono appellate counsel supposed to propose and argue new theories, 

issues, and errors that were not preserved in the trial court? If so, this flies in the face of 

caselaw prohibiting that very sort of practice by attorneys and by those self-represented 
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litigants whose cases apparently do not merit "supplemental briefing." \ Also, as for the 

costs of transcripts and the costs of transmitting the record on appeal to the Clerk of this 

Court, we know from the Court's Order that those will remain the responsibility of the 

self-represented litigant. As we are all aware, however, · self-represented litigants often 

calIDot afford the costs of necessary transcripts, and the case comes to this Court without 

a sufficient record to review for legal error. If that is the sort of case which merits 

supplemental briefing-and this Court may determine that it is, absent the benefit of 

being able to first review the transcripts-then it seems to me that we are creating an 

untenable situation: engage pro-bono counsel who will be forced to argue the case 

without reference to the oral record or will be required to fund the cost of the transcripts 

himself or herself in order to do the briefing and oral argument properly-the latter being 

an unlikely possibility for law students. Moreover, by this Court's assisting "qualified 

litigants" in setting forth their arguments on appeal and then deciding those same 

arguments, we are inviting ethical problems and setting the stage for violations of the 

right to an impartial tribunal. 

For the foregoing reasons, if it is going to work at all, APBP must necessarily 

presume that the self-represented litigants on appeal were represented by counsel in the 

trial court proceedings. This is a necessary assumption if the record-preservation 

problems discussed above are to be avoided. That happens sometimes~trial counsel 

bails out before the appeal because he or she and the client had a falling out or, more 

likely, because the client has run out of money.2 But, for a substantial number of self-

\ The well-established general rule is that this Court will not consider issues not 
raised before the trial court or new legal theories raised on appeal. In re M w., 2012 MT 
44, ~ 14, 364 Mont. 211, 272 PJd 112; State v. Montgomery, 2010 MT 193, ~ 11,357 
Mont. 348,239 P.3d 929; Whitehorn v. Whitehorn Farms, Inc., 2008 MT 361, ~ 21,346 
Mont. 394, 195 P.3d 836; State v. LaFreniere, 2008 MT 99, ~ 11, 342 Mont. 309, 180 
PJd 1161; State v. Courville, 2002 MT 330, ~ 5, 313 Mont. 218, 61 P.3d 749. 

2 It goes without saying that, with some notable exceptions (parental rights 
termination proceedings and commitment proceedings, for example), there is no general 
right to appointed counsel in civil proceedings. There is no "civil Gideon right." There 
should be, but the fact is there is not, and it is highly unlikely that Montana's legislative 
and executive branches will fund a civil Gideon program within the lifetimes of anyone 
currently involved in this matter. 
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represented cases, there will have been no representation in the trial court and the case 

will come to this Court burdened with the aforementioned procedural problems that 

nothing, short of a remand for retrial in the district court, will fix. That is certainly true 

for appeals, and is even more likely when we throw motions, original proceedings, and 

petitions for habeas corpus, supervisory control, mandamus, and prohibition into the mix. 

This brings me to the issue of fairness. On one hand, we pick and choose those 

few cases (although I expect that, since we now have a "program," the number will 

mushroom exponentially) for which supplemental briefing will be beneficial and, at the 

same time, implicitly tell untold numbers of other self-represented litigants that they are 

stuck with their inadequate records, their inadequate briefs, their inadequate arguments, 

and, perhaps, their ineffective trial counsel. Rightly, those people should be heard to say, 

"Why not me? Why not my case?" Furthermore, in those cases where one party has 

counsel and the other does not, we will appear to be punishing the litigant who had the 

ability to hire an attorney: he or she will be required to pay for more briefing and, 

perhaps, a remand or an oral argument. The represented litigant may not be able to take 

advantage of inadequacies and mistakes made by the self-represented client. While this 

observation may strike some as harsh and unfair, it is part and parcel of what litigation is 

all about: making a good case for your client and taking advantage of your opponent's 

mistakes. Assisting those who cannot afford counsel by encouraging, generally, pro bono 

service or by lobbying for legislation that would fund representation for a wider variety 

of cases is one thing. However, targeting certain self-represented litigants with certain 

cases and then offering and providing those individuals with the sorts of services that 

might well help them prevail against the other party is a wholly different matter. Doing 

so removes this Court from its proper position of arbiter and places it into the position of 

advocate instead. 

Finally, besides the aforementioned structural problems, the seminal problem 

remains. We are presented with no actual data or statistics that would enable this Court 

to determine the actual number of cases involving self-represented litigants where an 

adequate record has been preserved for appellate review and where supplemental briefing 

would be beneficial and could be ordered without a remand-versus the number of cases 
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where that is not so. In short, the existence of a problem to which APBP is addressed has 

not been established with anything other than anecdotal evidence. Correspondingly, we 

are provided with no real structure to APBP and how the aforementioned problems 

inherent in the program will be adequately and fairly addressed and resolved. 

Furthermore, unless APBP contemplates that pro bono appellate counsel will simply be 

turned loose to create the proverbial silk purse of a supplemental brief from a sow's ear 

of a trial court record, I suggest that this lack of data, statistical evidence, and structure 

militates in favor of either dropping the idea altogether or, at least, putting it on hold until 

such time as adequate facts, data, statistics, structure, and criteria-as opposed to good 

intentions-are available for review. 

The devil is always in the details; and, in that regard, I suggest that there are many 

important details in this proposal for which no actual data or evidence has been presented 

to this Court. I maintain that what we have before us does not demonstrate that there is 

actually a problem which mandates the solution proposed. Indeed, in my view-and 

assuming that we are still addressing the very few self-represented cases which come 

before this Court for which supplemental briefing might actualIy be beneficial-this 

Court can, as we already have done on occasion, contact the Pro Bono Coordinator and 

request that she attempt to locate an attorney willing to represent the self-represented 

litigant on a pro bono basis. 

For the foregoing reasons, I decline to join this Court's Order. I dissent. 
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_ ~Matter 
NYSBA PRO BONO APPEALS PROGRAM 

BROCHURE APPLICATION PRO SEAPPEALS MANUAL FAQ DECISIONS ARTICLES 

The New York State Bar Association has established a Pro Bono Appeals Program that provides pro bono representation 
for selected appeals to the Appellate Division, Third and Fourth Judicial Departments. This unique program is designed to 
help persons of modest means who are taking, or responding to, appeals regarding fundamental civil legal issues, such 
as family stability, personal safety or subsistence income. Note that the Program does not provide representation for 
crim inal matters, is not adm inistered by the court system, and gives preference to applicants who do not qualifyfor 
assigned counsel and cases that could have a broad impact. 

The Program brochure offers further information about the program territory, financial and subject matter criteria, and the 
three program partners: the NYSBA Com m ittee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction, The Legal Project, and The Rural Law 
Center of New York. We invite trial attorneys and nonprofit agencies to assist clients in com pleting applications and 
identifying meritorious appeal iss ues. Note that applications of persons who are appealing from an order or judgment will 
not be reviewed unless a notice of appeal has already been served and filed. You mayalso want to click on the links to a 
few of the decisions regarding appeals handled by the Program and to articles describing the Program. 

The Pro Bono Appeals Program is made possible by the generous efforts of our manyvolunteers and grants from The 
New York Bar Foundation. We would like to thank these appellate attorneys for their outstanding pro bono contributions to 
the program: 

Andria L. Bentley, Esq. (Albany, NY) 
Elizabeth F. Bernhardt, Esq., Cohen & Gresser LLP (NYC) 
Nomi D. Berenson, Esq., and Valerie A Koffman, Esq., Goodwin Procter LLP (NYC) 
Andrew O. Bunn, Esq., DLA Piper LLP (Florham Park, NJ) 
David M. Cost, Esq., Hiscock & Barclay LLP (Albany, NY) 
Cynthia F. Feathers, Esq. (Glens Falls, NY) 
Steven N. Feinman, Esq., The Feinman Law Firm (White Plains, NY) 
Annette G. Hasapidis, Esq., Law Offices of Annette G. Hasapidis (South Salem, NY) 
George J. Hoffman, Jr., Esq., O'Connor, O'Connor, Bresee & First, P.C. (Albany, NY) 
JeremyE. Hollander, Esq., Skadden, Arps , Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP (NYC) 
TimothyW. Hoover, Esq., Phillips Lytle LLP (Buffalo, NY) 
Linda B. Johnson, Esq., Hinman, Howard & Kattell LLP (West Sand Lake, NY) 
Jos hua N. Koplovitz, Es q., Wapner Koplovitz & Futerfas PLLC (Kings ton, NY) 
E. Barry Lyon, Esq., ABB, Inc. (Norwalk, CT) 
HenryM. Mascia, Esq., U.S. Department of Justice (Dobbs Ferry, NY) 
Malvina Nathanson, Esq. (NYC) 
Alan J. Pierce, Esq., Hancock Estabrook LLP (Syracuse, NY) 
Joshua L. Seifert, Esq., (NYC) 

In addition, the Committee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction thanks our vital program partners, The Rural Law Center of 
NY (Susan Patnode, Esq., Executive Director) and The Legal Project (Lisa Frisch, Executive Director). 

Types of Cases 

Q: What kinds of cases does the Program accept? 

A The Program offers representation in appeals involving education, family stability, health, housing, personal safety, 
public benefits and SUbsistence income. 

Q. I have a divorce appeal involving child support and maintenance. Is that covered by the family stability category? 

A Yes. 

Q. I have an appeal involving the denial of unemployment insurance benefits by the Unemployment Appeal Board. Is 
that covered by public benefits and subsistence income? 
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A Yes. Note that if you won before the Appeal Board, and the employer appealed, you could apply for an assigned 
attorney, paid for by the State. However, if you are the party taking the appeal, no assigned attorney is available to you. 

Q: Does the Program offer representation for criminal appeals? 

A. No, the Program only handles civil appeals in specified categories. 

Geographic Area Covered 

Q: What area of New York does the Program cover? 

A. The Program covers appeals from orders or judgments rendered by trial courts in the 50 counties ofthe Appellate 
Division , Third and Fourth Departments. The counties are listed in our program brochure. The Program also covers certain 
administrative appeals to the Third Department. 

Q: What if my appeal is to the First or Second Department? Can the Program help me? 

A. No. The Program is currently limited to the Third and Fourth Departments. 

Q: Why isn't the Program offered statewide? Isn't the Program a part of the court system? 

A. No, the Pro Bono Appeals Program is not administered by the courts, and it is separate from Assigned Counsel 
programs. It is an independent initiative of the NYSBACommittee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction, in partnership with 
The Legal Project and the Rural Law Center of New York. 

Parties Represented 

Q: I just received a decision that I want to appeal from. Can the Program help me? 

A. Before the Program will review your application, the court must render an order or a judgment, and you or your attorney 
must serve and file a notice of appeal. 

Q: I won, and the other party is appealing. Can the Program help me? 

A. Yes, the Program also represents parties responding to an appeal. 

Process 

Q: How do I apply to the Program? 

A. Fill out the Program application, with the assistance of your trial attorney, and submit it to the Program, by fax, email or 
mail, as described in the Program brochure. 

Q. I don't have an attorney to help me fill out the application. Can I still apply to the Program? 

A Yes, we will consider your application, but if an attorney represented you in the trial court, it would be very helpful to have 
that attorney help identify appeal issues for our consideration. 

Q. Do I have to apply for an assigned attorney and have my application denied before I can apply to your Program? 

A No. However, we will give a preference to applicants who do not qualify for assigned counsel. 

Q. What happens once I submit my application? 

A First we check to make sure that your appeal qualifies based on the topic and the income level -- the Program offers 
representation to applicants who make up to 250% of Federal Poverty Guidelines. The income chart is available in the 
Program's brochure. Then a group of attorneys from the Committee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction discusses which 
cases should be accepted, based on numerous factors, including the merits of the appeal and the potential impact of the 
case on creating important legal precedent. Please remember that applying to the Program does not guarantee 
representation. Therefore, you should continue to seek other counsel while your application is being considered. 

Volunteers 

Q. Who are the attorneys that volunteer to take cases? 

A Cases selected for representation are first offered to the members of the full Committee on Courts of Appellate 
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Jurisdiction, which includes many experienced appellate attorneys from throughout New York State. Some appeals are 
handled by non-Committee members, butthey must have extensive appellate expertise and be supervised by a 
Committee member, since offering high-quality appellate representation is a primary goal and commitment of our 
Program. 

Q: I'm an attorney. How can I volunteer with the Program? 

PI. Experienced appellate attorneys are encouraged to volunteer with the Pro Bono Appeals Program. Please send an e­
mail with your resume to info@probonoappealsny.org . 

SELECTED DECISIONS 

Oswald v Oswald 

Matter of Robert AA v Colleen BB 

Matter of Cranston v Horton 

Matter of Monaco v Armer 

Matter of Bowman v Bowman 

Matter of Rosi v Moon 

Matter of Jennifer G. v Benjamin H. 

Chang v Yu-Jen Chang 

ARTICLES 

State Bar Expands Pro Bono Appeals Program, New York Law Journal, April 15,2013 

Pro Bono Appeals Program Expands to Fourth Department, April 11 ,2013 

State Bar Offers Pro Bono Appeals Program , October 25,2012 

Law Center aids pro bono expansion, Press-Republican, December 17, 2011 

State Bar Expands the Reach of Its Appellate Pro Bono Program, New York Law Journal, December 8,2011 

State Bar Association expands free legal aid program in region, DailyFreeman, December 5,2011 

NY Bar Association to offer free legal service, The Saratogian, Decem ber 4,2011 

New York State Bar Association Expands Program Providing Pro Bono Attorneys for Appeals to the Third Department, 
New York State Bar Association , November 30,2011 

Mother's win in court changes laws, Post Star, July 24,2011 

State Bar committee launches pro bono appeals program, State Bar News, September/October 201 0, p. 13 

Related Files 

NYLJ Article (Adobe PDF File) 
Os wald v Os wald (Adobe PDF File) 
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NEW YORK STATE BAR ASSOCIATION 

CIVIL APPEALS 
PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 

A Collaboration of the New York State Bar Association 
Committee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction, 

The Legal Project, and the Rural Law Center of New York 

Please fax, mail or email this completed form to: 
Civil Appeals Pro Bono Pilot Program 

The Legal Project 
Stuyvesant Plaza 

1475 Western Avenue 
Albany, NY 12203 
Fax (518) 435-1773 

info@legalproject.org 

This form should be filled out jointly by the prospective client and the trial attorney or nonprofit 
program referring this case to the Appeals Program. 

REFERRAL SOURCE INFORMATION 

Name of Referring Trial Attorney or Referring Nonprofit Program 1 

Addressl~ ______________________________________________________________________ ~ 

Telephone 1...1 ____________________ ----1 Email~1 ____________________ ---' 

Date Referred 1'--_______ --' 

APPLICANT INFORMATION 

Namel...l __________________________________________________________________________ ~ 

Address~I====================================================================~ 
Co~~~1 ______ ~====================~--~========================~ 
Telephone (Home/Cell) .... 1 ___________ ----11 (Work) 1 ~ ______________ ~ 

Email 1 1 Monthly Income From All Sources 1 '-____________ --' 

STATUS OF ASSIGNED COUNSEL APPLICATION TO THIRD DEPARTMENT 
o Pending o Denied o Approved o None submitted 

CASE INFORMATION (Please check all that apply.) 
Type of case: 
o Divorce 
o Custody /Visitation 
o Termination of Parental Rights 

o Family Offense 
o Paternity 
DOtherl~----------------------------~ 

Does this case involve domestic violence? 0 Yes 0 No 

Is there a domestic violence advocate involved on your behalf? 0 Yes 0 No 
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If yes, please note name of advocate and program and a phone number: 

To be filled out by the referring attorney or program: 
Describe the legal issue(s) that you believe could be raised on appeal, the grounds for reversal or modification to be 
advanced and why they have merit. If the respondent seeks representation, why is affumance important? Please explain 
why this appeal should be considered for pro bono representation: 

IF THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTS HAVE BEEN COMPLETED, 
PLEASE ATTACH THEM TO THIS APPLICATION: 

-J Pre-calendar Statement 
-J Poor Person Motion 

IF SUCH DOCUMENTS HAVE NOT BEEN COMPLETED, 
PLEASE PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION: 

(1) The title of the underlying action and the date of commencement: 

I 
(2) The full names and addresses of the original parties: 

Appellant: 

Phonel~ ______________ ~IFaxl~ ______________ ~ 

Appellant's Counsel: 

Phone~I ________________ ~IFax~I ________________ ~ 
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Respondent: 

PhoneL� ______________ ~IFaxLI ______________ ~ 

Respondent's Counsel: 

PhoneLI ______________ ~IFaxIL ______________ ~ 

(3) Any change in the parties: 

(4) The court, judge, and county from which the appeal is taken: 

I 

(5) Index number: 1 

~======================~ 
RJI number: 1'-______________________________ --' 

(6) Specific nature of the Lmderlying action or proceeding: 

(7) Whether there is another pending appeal or pending related action or proceeding: 
YesD NoD 
If yes, please describe: 

TO BE FILLED OUT BY THE APPLICANT: 

(8) If you are employed, your employer's name and address and position, and if you are a student, your school and 
who pays your tuition. 

(9) If you are employed, what is your gross weekly salary? LI ___________________ -----' 

(10) If you are married and your spouse is employed, what is his/her gross weekly salary? LI ________ ----' 

(11) List other sources of income 
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(12) List assets, including a home, car, checking and savings accounts, including those jointly held, stocks, and bonds. 

(13) List monthly expenses, including rent or mortgage, food, utilities, car, insurance, and loan repayment 

Applicant's Signature (print name below) 

THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTS MUST BE ATTACHED TO THIS APPLICATION: 

-J NOTICE OF APPEAL 
-J ORDER OR DECISION BEING APPEALED 
.J APPELLANT'S BRIEF IF YOU ARE RESPONDENT AND THE BRIEF HAS BEEN FILED 
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State Bar News September/October 2010 13 

State Bar committee launches pro bono appeals program 
By Cynthia Feathers 

Often, litigants 
of modest means 
cannot obtain 
counsel to pursue 
worthy appeals. 
They may earn 
too much to qual­
ify for assigned 
counsel, but too 

'::--:-:--'-- - '------' little to retain 
appellate counsel. 
As a result, wor­

thy appeals may not be taken, and 
many unjust results may remain 
unchallenged. 

Recognizing this Ulmlet need, the 
State Bar's Committee on Courts of 
Appellate Jurisdiction has launched 
the Civil Appeals Pro Bono Pilot 
Program. The committee's initial effort 
is a pilot venture linlited to appeals in 
which the devastation of erroneous 
decisions is particularly acute: those 
involving the family. 

Program a first 
The pilot program will provide free 

representation, in a wide variety of 
Family Court and matrimonial appeals 
to the Third Department, to selected 
appellants and respondents whose 

income is 250 percent or less of federal 
poverty guidelines. At its June 18 
meeting in Cooperstown, the Executive 
Committee approved the pilot pro­
gram, which is believed to be unique 
in the country. 

Two years ago, Committee Chair 
Hon. Betty Weinberg Ellerin of New 
York (Alston & Bird LLP) made devel­
oping and implementing the ini tiative 
a committee priority. Her tenure as a 
presiding justice of the Appellate 
Divis ion, First Department, gave her 
special insight into the potential value 
of such a project to both the courts and 
litigants. 

In shaping the program, the role of 
another presiding justice was critical. 
Hon. Anthony V. Cardona of the Third 
Department offered invaluable sup­
port and g uidance to the committee. 

The committee is partnering with 
two Third Department-based nonprofit 
organizations dedicated to providing 
legal services to low-income New 
Yorkers: The Legal Project in Albany, 
headed by Executive Director Lisa 
Frisch, and the Rural Law Center of 
New York in Plattsburgh, led by 
Executive Director Susan Patnode. 
Frisch is a chair of the State Bar's Pro 
Bono Coordinators Network; Patnode 
is a past chair. 

The pilot program will provide free representation, in a wide variety 

of Family Court and matrimonial appeals to the Third Departmen t, 

to selected appellants and respondents whose income is 250 per­

cent or less of federal poverty guidelines. 

Applications available 
Brochures and applications for 

represen tation through the pro bono 
appeals program are available at 
www.nysba.org/probono/ccaj . To 
apply, litigants must complete the 
application form with the assistance 
of an a ttorney or nonprofit program 
familiar with the case. 

Following initial intake by The 
Lega l Project and the Rural Law 
Center, the Pro Bono Appeals 
Program Subcommittee does a merits 
review and decides which applicants 
may receive representation, based on 
a variety of discretionary factors . 
Preferences will be given to family 
law and matrimonial cases in which 
assigned counsel is not available or 
there are issues involving domestic 
violence. 

Subcommittee members are Elizabeth 
Bemhardt of New York (Cohen & Gresser 

LLP), Steven Feinman of White Plains 
(Feinman & Grossbard, PC), E. Barry 
Lyon of Norwalk, Connecticut (ABB Jnc .), 
and Malvina Nathanson of New York. 

Members of the full Committee on 
Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction serve 
as volunteer appellate attorneys and 
receive malpractice insurance coverage 
from the nonprofit organization part­
ners. The committee's hope is that the 
pilot project will evo lve into an 
expanded program covering other 
high need areas (such as government 
benefits and housing). The committee 
also hopes to establish similar pro­
grams in each Appellate Division and 
to attract additional volunteer appel­
la te attorneys . • 

FeatiJers of Snmtoga Spril/gs (Law Office 
ofC!Jl/thin Feathers, Attome!J At Law) is 
the slIbcommittee ellair. 

f ' ',~ , '~I ' ••• • '-: -, 'r,.i~ i"WI. , •• I -. •• · •. J.... ~ · • . . K. .,..."..: • ... • ., .~ •• •• ," ,. ~ . , ,\ .,~" .... .. ~ . ~ ,filii· ,'.. · ,.,~. 'j •••• "., ~',.- tJ·.. , 
•• " ., • • ,..... • • \' ., '.,. , , •• '" ., •• ,fII ,. • 
, ., ,. fI , • • • t.. ... ' . t- ... .. · · · .. .' •. ~ , -... .. \ .. \. . . ..... . ....... • '. • A·. ·':~"'·1.'" .. .: .. ;: .•. :.. 
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CAN'T SPOT YOUR WEB SITE ONLINE? 

FindLaw 
• 2010 Th'JInH.n Rcur{ls-pT13!!.!s65lI04-10 
FindL;;,'/, l honw::n Rwt"'~ ;;.nd thl! Ktn~~i~ 10,)0 <Ill' !r ad~m~r~, .. 01 Th~m<;M R~ul"-'~ 

FindLaw is the #1 online legal marketing solutions provider to over 14,000 law firms, 
creating award-winning Web sites that help law firms get found more than any other. 

SEE HOW YOUR CURRENT SITE MEASURES UP 
For a free Web site audit, visit lawyermarketing.com/freeaudit or call 1-888-640-7935 today. 
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THE NEW YORK BAR FOUNDATION 

Lawyers caring. Lawyers sharing. 

Around the Corner and Around the State. 

. .' . 
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The NYSBA Pro Bono Appeals Program 
Family Court and matrimonial appeals deal with some of the most urgent and fundamental 
legal needs litigants face. Assigned counsel is generally not ava ilable to litigants making 
less than l 50 percent of Federal Poverty Guidelines, but such persons often cannot afford 
to reta in counsel. Legal services providers serving the relevant upstate reg ion lack resources 
needed to provide such representation, and few law firms have written pro bono policies or 
commit to do pro bono appeals. Thus, many litigants proceed pro se or abandon appeals 
which may be meritorious. 

The program is offered through the NYSBA Committee on Courts of Appellate Jurisd icti on, 
and the organizational partners are the Rural Law Center of New York and The Legal 
Project. Our applicants are appellate litigants whose income is less than 250% of Federal 
Poverty Guidelines. We provide representation on appea l to the Appellate Division, Third 
Department, w ith a planned expansion to the Fourth Department in January 20l 3. 

The Pro Bono Appeals Program shares a story and photo of how The New York Bar 
Foundation has impacted their program: 

Bar Foundation funding has been instru­
mental to the launch and continued suc­
cess of the Pro Bono Appeals Program. 
We offer pro bono representation to 
appellate litigants of modest means in 
appeals involving issues concerning the 
essentials of life: shelter and housing, 
subsistence income and benefits, health 
and education , personal safety, and fam­
ily stab ility. I<aitlin , the ch ild you see in 
her mother BeCky's arms, suffers from a 
progressive disease. We were able to 
triple the support paid on her behalf; and 
our appea l changed the law in New 
York State to make it easier for custod ial 
parents to bring petitions in their home 
state seeking to modify certa in out-of-state 
support orders (Bowman v. Bowman, 
82 AD3d l44 [3rd Dept 20l l)) . 

8 I The New York Bar Foundation 2012 Annual Report Lawyers Caring. Lawyers Sharing. 
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....... 11111 NEvV YORK STATE BAR ASSOCIATION 
N'YHi'iA }IH: Elk SteeeL, Albilny, New 'l'ork 12207 • 51 ' .4 63,3200 • www, nysb2l , r~ 

News Release 

For Immediate Release 

Contact: lise B8ng~Jensen 

Dire tor, Media Servi -es & Public Affairs 
Ibang-jensen@nysba.org 

518.487.5530 

April 11, 2013 

PRO BONO APPEALS PROGRAM HELPING LOWER-INCOM E NEW YORKERS 
EXPANDS TO FOURTH JUDICIAL DEPARTM ENT 

Attorneys in Western New York are offering lower-income individuals a second chance to have their day in court, by 
volunteering to handle appeals of selected civil cases in the Fourth Judicial Department. 

The Pro Bono Appeals Program, created by the New York State Bar ~sociation, is offering free representation to 
individuals of modest means in civil (non-crim inal) cases involving the essentials of life, such as fam ily stability, 
unemployment insurance, education, housing and health. 

Experienced appellate attorneys will handle the appeals for individuals who lost civil cas es in trial court, as well as 
ind ividuals who won in lower court but must respond to appeals by the opposing party. 

The State Bar's Committee on Courts of Appellate Jurisdiction will select cases based on several factors, including the 
merits of the issues raised and the potential impact of the case. For example, appellate decisions can set precedents, 
having far-reaching impact beyond a single case. 

The new program in the Fourth Department builds upon the experience of the State Bar Pro Bono Appeals Program in the 
Third Judicial Department, which the State Bar ~sociation launched with The Legal Project and the Rural Law Center of 
New York in 2009. Since then, it has handled cases involving child custody, grandparent visitation, abuse and neglect, 
fam ily offenses, unem ploym ent insurance, constitutional issues, divorce and workers com pensation benefits. 

"The New York State Bar ~sociation is proud to offer this innovative program in the Fourth Department as part of our 
long-standing com m itment to increasing access to justice for all New Yorkers ," said President-elect David M. Schraver of 
Rochester (Nixon Peabody). 

Schraver praised Presiding Justice Henry J. Scudder for his invaluable support for the Pro Bono Appeals Program in the 
Fourth Department. . 

"The appellate attorneys handling V"le pro bono appeals in the Fourth Department all practice in Western New York. ~ a 
result, they will be fam iliar with our Court's decisions , judges and procedures," said Scudder. "This in itiative shoulc~ be a 
great success, given the talent an9 generosity of our attorne~ and our public service programs , II 

Litigant§) who would like to learn more about the program and apply for legal assistance should go to 
www,nvsba ,org /probonoappea ls. 

Appellate attorneys interested in volunteering to handle appeals in the Fourth Department can contact the Pro Bono 
Appeals Program at info@probonoappealsny.org . 

The Pro Bono Appeals Program is supported by the New York State Bar ~sociation and with grants from The New York 
Bar Foundation, the state Office of Court Adm inistration and the Interest on Lawyer Accounts Fund. The grants help make 
possible staff support for the program. 

The Fourth Judicial Departm ent covers 22 counties : Allegany, Cattaraugus, Cayuga, Chautauqua, Erie, Genesee, 
Herkimer, Jefferson, Lewis , Livingston, Monroe, Niagara, Oneida , Onondaga, Ontario, Orleans, Oswego, Seneca, 
Steuben, Wayne, Wyoming and Yates. 

The 76,000-mem ber New York State Bar ~sociation is the largest voluntary state bar association in the nation. It was 

WMN.nysba.org/AM/Printer Tempi ate.cfm?Section= N em _ Center&template=ICM/ContentDisplay.cfm&ContentlD= 186847 1/2 
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Pro Bono Appeals Program I New York Page 1 of3 

LawHelpNYorg 

Pro Bono Appeals Program 

http://www.nysba.org/ContentiNavigationMenu31/ProBonoAppealsProgram/default.htm 

Who We Are 

The New York State Bar Associat ion's Pro Bono Appeals Program provides free representation to litigants of modest means in selected appeals 
to the Appellate Division, Third and Fourth Judicial Departments. Litigants must make 250% or less of Federal Poverty Guidelines to be eligible 
for representation. Covered topics are fami ly law, public benefits including unemployment insurance, education, housing, and health. The 
volunteer attorneys who handle appeals all have appellate expertise. Most volunteers are members of the NYSBA Committee on Courts of 
Appellate Jurisdiction, which selects appeals for representation based on several factors , including the merit of the appeal , its potential impact, 
and whether assigned counsel is avai lable. Staff support is provided by the Rural Law Center of New York and The Legal Project. 

Pro se Appeals Manual: A Guide for Self-Represented Litigants Providing Basic Information about Civil Appeals 

This program only offers representation in the appeals process. 

General Contact Information 

Address 

Pro Bono Appeals Program 

90 State Street (map) 

c/o Rural Law Center of NY, Suite 700 

Albany, NY 12207 

Phone 

(518) 591-4638 

Website 

http://www.nysba.org/ContenUNavigationMenu31/ProBonoAppealsProgram/default.htm 

Email 

info@probonoappealsny.org 

Last Review and Update: Mar 04, 2013 

htlp:llwww.lawhelpny.orglorganizationlpro-bono-appeals-program?ref=Hy7rK 10/612013 
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Pro Bono Appeals Program I New York 

Choose a legal issue to learn more about the services provided: 

Adoption 

Child Neglect, Abuse, Foster Care and Termination of Parents' Rights 

Child Support 

Court Forms 

Custody and Visitation 

Divorce and Spousal Support 

Domestic Violence and Orders of Protection 

Elder Abuse 

Eviction 

Fair Hearings 

Family Issues for People with Criminal Records 

Gay and Lesbian Couples and Non-Traditional Families 

Grandparenting Issues 

Guardianship of a Child 

Guardianship of an Adult 

Homeless Families and Individuals 

Housing Discrimination 

Juvenile Delinquency and PINS 

Mental Health 

Mobile Home Park Tenants 

Name Change 

Paternity 

Public Housing and Section 8 

Repairs and Bad Conditions 

Rights of Teenagers and Children 

Rights of Tenants and Landlords 

School Attendance - Rights and Requirements 

htlp:llwww.lawhelpny.org/organizationlpro-bono-appeals-program?ref=Hy7rK 

Page 2 of3 

10/6/2013 
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Pro Bono Appeals Program I New York 

School Discipline, Suspensions & Expulsions 

Special Education (ages 3 - 21) 

Title I and No Child Left Behind Act 

Unemployment Benefits 

Veteran and Military Families 

Workers Compo and Temporary Disability Benefits 

htlp:llwww.lawhelpny.orglorganizationlpro-bono-appeals-program?ref=Hy7rK 

Page 3 of3 

10/6/2013 
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Pro Bono Appeals Program - Family and Juvenile - Grandparenting Issues I New York Page 1 of 4 

LawHelpNYorg 

Pro Bono Appeals Program 

http://www.nysba.org/ContentlNavigationMenu31/ProBonoAppealsProgram/default.htm 

Who We Are 

The New York State Bar Association ' s Pro Bono Appeals Program provides free representation to litigants of modest means ill selected appeals 
to the Appellate Division, Third and Fourth Judicial Departments. Litigants must make 250% or less of Federal Poverty Guidelines to be e lig ible 
for representation. Covered topics are family law, public benefits including unemployment insurance, education, housing. and health. The 
volunteer attorneys who handle appeals all have appellate expertise. Most volunteers are members of the NYSBA Conullittee on Courts of 
Appellate Jurisdiction, which selects appeals for representation based on several factors, including the merit of the appeal, its potential impact. 
and whether assigned counsel is available. Staff support is provided by the Rural Law Center of New York and The Legal Project. 

Pro se Appeals Manual: A Guide for Self-Represented Litigants Providing Basic Information about Civil Appeals 

This program only offers representation in the appeals process. 

How to Get Help 

You can contact this organization by: 

Contact Type 

Mail 

Documents 

Please fax, mail or email this completed form to: 

Third Department applications: 

Pro Bono Appeals Program 

c/o Rural Law Center of New York 

90 State Street, Suite 700 

Albany, NY 12207 

Fax (800) 832-9150 

info@probonoappealsny.org 

Fourth Department Applications: 

Pro Bono Appeals Program 

c/o Worker Justice Center of New York 

1187 Culver Road 

Rochester, NY 14609 

Fax (800) 832-9150 

info@probonoappealsny.org 

Information 

http://www.lawhelpny .orglorganizationlpro-bono-appeals-programlfamily-juvenilelgrandp... 10/6/2013 
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Pro Bono Appeals Program - Family and Juvenile - Grandparenting Issues I New York 

The application for the Pro Bono Appeals Program is available at: 

http://www.nysba.org/AM/Template.cfm? 

Section=Home& T emplate=/CM/ContentDisplay. cfm&ContentFi lei 0=94224 

Who We Serve 

Area(s) 

o Albany County 

o Allegany County 

o Broome County 

o Cattaraugus County 

o Cayuga County 

o Chautauqua County 

o Chemung County 

o Chenango County 

o Clinton County 

o Columbia County 

o Cortland County 

o Delaware County 

o Erie County 

o Essex County 

o Franklin County 

o Fulton County 

o Genesee County 

o Greene County 

o Hamilton County 

o Herkimer County 

o Jefferson County 

o Lewis County 

o Livingston County 

o Madison County 

o Monroe County 

o Montgomery County 

o Niagara County 

o Oneida County 

o Onondaga County 

o Ontario County 

o Orleans County 

o Oswego County 

o Otsego County 

o Rensselaer County 

o Saint Lawrence County 

o Saratoga County 

Page 2 of4 

http://www.lawhelpny .org/organizationlpro-bono-appeals-programlfamily-juvenile/grandp... 10/6/2013 
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Pro Bono Appeals Program - Family and Juvenile - Grandparenting Issues I New York 

o Schenectady County 

o Schoharie County 

o Schuyler County 

o Seneca County 

o Steuben County 

o Sullivan County 

o Tompkins County 

o Ulster County 

o Warren County 

o Washington County 

o Wayne County 

o Wyoming County 

o Yates County 

Your family's income should be at or below the following percentage of the federal poverty level 

250 

Is this organization accessible by wheelchair? 

NO 

Does this organization provide access for the hearing impaired? 

NO 

Eligibility Restrictions 

Page 3 of4 

The Program offers representation only in appeals involving education, family stability, health, housing, 

personal safety, public benefits and subsistence income. 

Type of Help 

This group provides the following types of services based on your legal needs and its resources: 

• Full Legal Representation 

• Brief Advice 

Description of Services 

The Program offers representation only in appeals involving education, family stability, health, housing, 

personal safety, public benefits and subsistence income. 

General Contact Information 

Address 

Pro Bono Appeals Program 

90 State Street (map) 

c/o Rural Law Center of NY, Suite 700 

Albany, NY 12207 

http://www.lawhelpny .org/organizationlpro-bono-appeals-programlfamily-juvenile/grandp.. . 1016/2013 
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Pro Bono Appeals Program - Family and Juvenile - Grandparenting Issues I New York 

Phone 

(518) 591-4638 

Website 

http://www.nysba.org/ContentiNavigationMenu31/ProBonoAppealsProgram/default.htm 

Email 

info@probonoappealsny.org 

Last Review and Update: Mar 04, 2013 

Page 4 of4 

htlp://www.lawhelpny .org/organizationlpro-bono-appeals-programlfamily-juvenile/grandp... 10/6/2013 
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2013 NY Slip Op 02811 

HENRY P. OSWALD, Respondent, 
v. 

VICTORIA A. OSWALD, Appellant. 

515519 

Appellate Division of the Supreme Court 
of New York, Third Department 

Decided April 25, 2013 

Pro Bono Appeals Program, Albany (Joshua 
L. Seifert of counsel), for appellant. 

Bartlett, Pontiff, Stewart & Rhodes, PC, 
Glens Falls (Karla Williams Buettner of 
counsel), for respondent. 

Before: Peters, PJ., Rose, Stein and Egan 
J1'. , J1. 

PETERS, PJ. 

On October 29,2005, plaintiff and 
defendant were married in a ceremony 
performed by a minister of the Universal 
Life Church (hereinafter ULC) in the Town 
of Jackson, Washington County. Three days 
earlier, the parties had executed an 
antenuptial agreement which, by its terms, 
was to take effect "only upon the 
solemnization of [the] marriage." Five years 
after the marriage, plaintiff commenced this 
action seeking a declaration that the 
marriage was void from its inception, and 
that the antenuptial agreement was thus 
unenforceable, because the officiant lacked 
authority under the Domestic Relations Law 
to solemnize the marriage. Alternatively, 
plaintiff sought a divorce as well as 
enforcement of the antenuptial agreement 
and equitable distribution of the parties' 
assets. Defendant answered, denying that the 
marriage was invalid and asselting a 
counterclaim for divorce. Plaintiff then 

moved for summary judgment on his 
declaratory jUdgment claim and defendant 
cross-moved for summary judgment, 
arguing that plaintiff had not carried his 
burden of proving the invalidity of the 
marriage and seeking a declaration that the 
antenuptial agreement was void on different 
grounds. Concluding that it was constrained 
by the holdings in Ranieri v Ranieri (146 
AD2d 34 [1989], Iv dismissed 74 NY2d 792 
[1989]) and Ravenal v Ravenal (72 Misc 2d 
100 [1972]) to find the marriage void as a 
matter of law, Supreme Court granted 
plaintiffs motion and denied defendant's 
cross motion. Defendant appeals. 

Initially, defendant contends that plaintiff 
should be estopped from arguing that the 
marriage was void because such position is 
contrary to representations he made on the 
patties' joint tax returns. As defendant 
correctly notes, a palty to litigation may be 
estopped from asserting a position contrary 
to that taken on his or her tax returns 
(see Mahoney-Buntzman v Buntzman, 12 
NY3d 415, 422 [2009]; Naghavi v New York 
Life Ins. Co. , 260 AD2d 252,252 [1999]). 
However, a marriage that is void "cannot be 
retroactively validated by estoppel, by 
mutual agreement, or by the parties' conduct 
in holding themselves out as husband and 
wife" (Lipschutz v Kiderman, 76 AD3d 178, 
183 [2010]; see Landsman v Landsman, 302 
NY 45, 48 [1950]; see alsoPeople v 
Kay, 141 Misc 574, 578 [1931]). Thus, 
Supreme Court correctly found that plaintiff 
was not estopped from challenging the 
validity of the marriage. 

Addressing the merits, we first note that, 
inasmuch as Ranieri v Ranieri (supra) was 
the only appellate decision in this state 
addressing the question of whether a 
minister of the ULC has authority under 
New York law to solemnize a marriage, 
Supreme Court was bound to follow it 
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(see Mountain View Coach Lines v 
Storms, 102 AD2d 663, 664 [1984]). This 
Court, however, is not so constrained (id. at 
664-665), and we decline to follow the 
Second Department's 
determination. Ranieri was decided a quarter 
century ago, and we simply cannot presume 
that the belief system, structure and inner 
workings of the ULC have remained static 
since that time. With the issue having 
resurfaced, we find it appropriate to address 
it anew. 

Having moved for summary judgment on his 
cause of action to declare the marriage null 
and void, plaintiff had the burden to submit 
competent evidence sufficient to 
demonstrate the absence of all material 
issues of fact (see CPLR 3212 [b]; Vega v 
Restani Constr. Corp., 18 NY3d 499, 503 
[2012]; Winegrad v New York Univ. Med. 
Ctr., 64 NY2d 851, 853 [1985]). Finding 
that plaintiff failed to meet that burden, we 
now reverse the grant of summary judgment 
in his favor. 

Domestic Relations Law § 11 provides that 
"[n]o marriage shall be valid" unless it is 
solemnized by, among others, "a clergy[] 
[member] or minister of any religion" 
(Domestic Relations Law § 11 [1]). Pursuant 
to the Religious Corporations Law, the 
terms clergy member and minister include 
"a person having authority ... from the 
church or synagogue to preside over and 
direct the spiritual affairs of the church or 
synagogue" (Religious Corporations Law § 
2). The statute defines an "unincorporated 
church" as a "congregation, society, or other 
assemblage of persons who are accustomed 
to statedly meet for divine worship or other 
religious observances, without having been 
incorporated for that purpose" (Religious 
Corporations Law § 2). Thus, the inquiry 
here distills to (1) whether the officiant of 
the patties' marriage was authorized by the 

ULC to preside over and direct its spiritual 
affairs, and (2) whether the ULC is a 
"church" within the meaning of the statute. 

With respect to the former, plaintiffs own 
submissions, which included the officiant's 
"Credentials of Ministry," establish that the 
officiant was ordained a minister of the ULC 
in August 2000 and remains in good 
standing. FUlthermore, documents submitted 
from the ULC's website state that those 
ordained as a minister by the ULC are 
authorized to perform weddings, baptisms 
and funerals and to otherwise conduct 
religious services through the ULC. Indeed, 
plaintiff concedes that the officiant is a 
minister of the ULC and has not presented 
any proof assailing her authority to conduct 
the spiritual affairs of the ULC. Plaintiff, 
instead, stresses the unconventional nature 
of the method employed by the ULC in 
selecting its ministers in an ostensible 
attempt to undermine the legitimacy of 
authority bestowed upon its ministers. 
However, judicial involvement is permitted 
only when the issue can be resolved by 
application of neutral principles of law (see 
Matter o/Congregation Yetev Lev D'Satmar, 
Inc. v Kahana, 9 NY3d 282, 286 [2007]) 
and, other than determining whether the 
ULC adhered to its own rules and 
regulations in selecting and ordaining the 
officiant as a minister, it is not the role of 
the cOUltS to question the ULC's 
membership requirements or the method by 
which it selects its ministers (see id. at 287-
288; Matter o/Congregation Yetev Lev 
D'Satmar, Inc. v Kahana, 31 AD3d 541, 542 
[2006], ajJd 9 NY3d 282 [2007]; Park Slope 
Jewish Ctr. v Stern, 128 AD2d 847, 848 
[1987], appeals dismissed 70 NY2d 746 
[1987],72 NY2d 873 [1988]; Matter 
ofKissel v Russian Orthodox Greek Catholic 
Holy Trinity Church o/Yonkers, 103 AD2d 
830,831 [1984]). 
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With respect to the question of whether the 
ULC constitutes a "church" within the 
meaning of the Religious Corporations Law, 
the affidavits from plaintiff and his attorney 
merely aver, "upon information and belief," 
that the ULC does not have an actual church 
or stated place of worship. Such allegations 
are without probative value (see Lockwood v 
Layton, 79 AD3d 1342, 1344 
[2010]; Anderson v Livonia, Avon & 
Lakeville R.R. Corp., 300 AD2d 1134, 1135 
[2002]; Onondaga Soil Testing v Barton, 
Brown, Clyde & Loguidice, 69 AD2d 984, 
984 [1979]). Moreover, the statement from 
the ULC's website that "the communication 
and fellowship of our ministers is equal to 
the once a week sacramonious [ sic] 
fellowship in some of our most segregated 
and elitist churches" is, at best, ambiguous 
as to whether members of the ULC are 
accustomed to meet for divine worship or 
other religious observances (see Religious 
Corporations Law § 2). In any event, even 
had plaintiff sustained his initial burden on 
this point, we would find that defendant's 
submissions in opposition to the motion, 
which included an affidavit from the 
president of the ULC attesting that the ULC 
has numerous places of worship throughout 
New York State as well as a list of such 
congregations, raise genuine factual issues 
precluding an award of summary judgment. 

Plaintiffs asseliion that the ULC professes 
no belief to distinguish its church as a 
religion provides no basis to conclude, as a 
matter of law, that the ULC is not a church 
within the meaning of the Religious 
Corporations Law (see Matter of Holy Spirit 
Assn. for Unification of World Christianity v 
Tax Commn. of City ofN Y, 55 NY2d 512, 
518 [1982] [stating that "the cOUlis may not 
inquire into or classify the content of the 
doctrine, dogmas, and teachings held by [a] 
body to be integral to its religion but must 
accept that body's characterization of its 

own beliefs and activities and those of its 
adherents, so long as that characterization is 
made in good faith and is not sham"]; see 
also Matter of O'Neill, 2008 Pa Dist & Cnty 
Dec LEXIS 135, *12 [Ct Common Pleas, 
Bucks County, PA, Dec. 31, 2008, No. 08-
01620-29-1]). In some respects, the ULC 
conducts itself like more conventional 
churches and encompasses many of the 
same ideas and values that are present in 
traditional religions. The ULC ordains 
ministers and, although ministers are not 
required to preside over a specific 
congregation or work within a physical 
church, the ULC encourages that practice. 
Additionally, since the ULC's formation in 
1959, it has consistently advanced and 
advocated for its beliefs. 

Accordingly, we find that plaintiff failed to 
establish as a matter of law that the officiant 
did not have authority to solemnize the 
patiies' marriage, thus warranting denial of 
his motion. While defendant urges us to 
search the record and grant summary 
judgment in her favor (see CPLR 3212 
[b]; Dunham v HUeD Constr. Co., 89 NY2d 
425,429-430 [1996]; Kropp v Town of 
Shandaken, 91. AD3d 1087,1091 [2012]), 
such relief is not available on the limited 
record before us, as genuine issues of fact 
remain. 

Finally, defendant argues that Supreme 
COUli erred by failing to address her claim 
that she was entitled to equitable distribution 
even if the marriage was void. In light of our 
determination, we need not reach the merits 
of such claim. However, we note that 
Supreme COUli must address the merits 
thereof if it again determines, on remittal, 
that the marriage is void. 

Rose, Stein and Egan Jr., JJ., concur. 
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ORDERED that the order is modified, on 
the law, without costs, by reversing so much 
thereof as granted plaintiffs motion for 
summary judgment; motion denied; and, as 
so modified, affirmed. 
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82 A.D.3d 144 (2011) 
917 N.Y.S.2d 379 

In the Matter of REBECCA L. 
BOWMAN, Appellant, 

v. 
JASON R. BOWMAN, Respondent. 

510386. 

Appellate Division of the Supreme Court 
of New Yori(, Third Department. 

Decided February 17, 2011 . 

145*145 Pro Bono Appeals 
Program, Albany (Cynthia Feathers of 
counsel), for appellant. 

Jason R. Bowman, San Diego, California, 
respondent pro se. 

SPAIN, ROSE, LAHTINEN and 
McCARTHY, JJ., concur. 

OPINION OF THE COURT 

PETERS, J.P. 

Petitioner and respondent were married in 
Washington and are the parents of a 
daughter (born in 2005). Following the 
parties' 146* 146 separation in 2007, 
petitioner and the child relocated to Saratoga 
County and respondent moved to California. 
Pursuant to a judgment of divorce entered in 
Washington which incorporated, but did not 
merge, a custody order and order of child 
suppOli, petitioner was granted custody and 
respondent was awarded visitation and 
ordered to pay child support in the amount 
of $479 per month until the child reached 18 
years of age, as well as a certain percentage 
of extraordinary health care expenses. 

In 2009, petitioner filed a petition in 
Saratoga County to modify respondent's 

visitation. Respondent answered and cross­
petitioned seeking sole custody of the child. 
Both patiies appeared before Family Court 
and, in December 2009, an order was 
entered modifying the visitation provisions 
of the custody order. In the meantime, 
petitioner registered the Washington support 
order in New York and commenced this 
proceeding seeking an upward modification. 
Respondent moved to dismiss the petition on 
the ground that New York did not have 
personal jurisdiction over him or subject 
matter jurisdiction to modify the 
Washington suppOli order. A SuppOli 
Magistrate granted respondent's motion to 
dismiss the petition for lack of subject 
matter jurisdiction. Family Court 
subsequently dismissed petitioner's 
objections regarding jurisdiction and 
confirmed the SuppOli Magistrate's order, 
prompting this appeal. 

Petitioner's contention that Family COUli has 
jurisdiction to modify the Washington child 
support order centers around a perceived 
conflict between the jurisdictional 
requirements contained in the Uniform 
Interstate Family Support Act (hereinafter 
UIFSA; see Family Ct Act ati 5-B) and the 
Federal Full Faith and Credit for Child 
SUPPOli Orders Act (hereinafter 
FFCCSOA; see 28 USC § 1738B). 
"FFCCSOA 'follow[s] the contours of 
UIFSA' ... [and t]he two statutes have 
complementary goals" (Matter of Auclair v 
Balderson, 6 AD3d 892, 893 [2004], Iv 
denied 3 NY3d 610 [2004],quoting LeTellier 
v LeTellier, 40 SW3d 490, 498 [Tenn 
2001]). UIFSA, which Congress required 
each state to adopt in order to receive federal 
funding (see Matter of Spencer v 
Spencer, 10 NY3d 60, 65 [2008]), was 
created "to alleviate the confusion 
engendered by multiple child suppOli orders 
from different jurisdictions ... [and] is 
addressed to the comis' subject matter 
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jurisdiction to entertain support proceedings 
where there is more than one state involved" 
(Ventura v Leong, 68 AD3d 1318,1320 
[2009] [citations omitted]; see Matter 
o/Spencer v Spencer, 10 NY3d at 
66; Matter 0/ Auclair 
v 147*147 Bolderson, 6 AD3d at 893-894). 
FFCCSOA "requires that all child support 
orders be given full faith and credit and 
precludes out-of-[ s ]tate modifications of 
such orders by establishing jurisdictional 
rules whereby [s]tates are to refrain from 
modifying or issuing contrary orders except 
in limited circumstances" (Matter 0/ Reis v 
Zimmer, 263 AD2d 136, 142 
[1999] [internal quotation marks and citation 
omitted], amended 270 AD2d 968 
[2000]; see 28 USC § 1738B [a]; Matter 
o/Spencer v Spencer, 10 NY3d at 
65; Matter 0/ Auclair v Bolderson, 6 AD3d 
at 893). Like UIFSA, FFCCSOA was 
enacted 

"(1) to facilitate the enforcement of child 
support orders among the [s ]tates; (2) to 
discourage continuing interstate 
controversies over child suppOli in the 
interest of greater financial stability and 
secure family relationships for the child; and 
(3) to avoid jurisdictional competition and 
conflict among [s ]tate cOUlis in the 
establishment of child support orders" (Pub 
L 103-383, § 2 [cD. 

Under both UIFSA and FFCCSOA, the state 
issuing a child suppOli order retains 
continuing, exclusive jurisdiction over that 
order so long as an individual contestant 
continues to reside in the issuing state 
(see Family Ct Act § 580-205 [ a], [d]; 28 
USC § 1738B [d], [e] [2] [A]; Matter 
o/Spencer v Spencer, 10 NY3d at 
66; Matter of Auclair v Bolderson, 6 AD3d 
at 894). Here, inasmuch as neither the 
parties nor the child continues to reside in 
Washington, that state ceased to have 

continuing, exclusive jurisdiction 
(see Family Ct Act § 580-205 [a] [1]; 28 
USC § 1738B [dD. This fact alone, however, 
does not confer upon the New York cOUlis 
the power to modify the child suppOli order. 

Where, as here, the issuing state has lost 
continuing jurisdiction, UIFSA confers 
jurisdiction upon the New York cOUlis to 
modify an out-of-state suppOli order only if 
that order is registered in New York 
(see Family Ct Act § 580-611 [aD and "(1) 
none of the patiies or children continues to 
reside in the issuing state; (2) the patiy 
seeking modification is not a resident of the 
modifying state; and (3) the nonmoving 
patiy is subject to personal jurisdiction in 
the modifying state" (Matter 0/ Auclair v 
Bolderson, 6 AD3d at 894; see Family Ct 
Act § 5 80-611 [a] [1 D. Putting aside, for the 
moment, the question of whether respondent 
is subject to the personal jurisdiction of New 
York, it is not disputed that petitioner 
resides in New York. Therefore, under 
UIFSA, Family Court lacks jurisdiction to 
modify the Washington support order. 

148*148 FFCCSOA, on the other hand, 
provides that where the issuing cOUli loses 
its continuing, exclusive jurisdiction, a state 
court may modify a child suppOli order 
issued by another state "if ... the court has 
jurisdiction to make such a child support 
order pursuant to [28 USC § 1738B] 
subsection (i)" (28 USC § 1738B [e] [1 D. 28 
USC § 1738B (i), in turn, provides that "[i]f 
there is no individual contestant or child 
residing in the issuing [s ]tate, the party or 
suppOli enforcement agency seeking to 
modify, or to modify and enforce, a child 
support order issued in another [s ] tate shall 
register that order in a [s ]tate with 
jurisdiction over the nonmovant for the 
purpose of modification" (emphasis added) . 
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The patties' dispute centers on the meaning 
of the phrase "jurisdiction over the 
nonmovant." 

Petitioner argues that the phrase 
"jurisdiction over the nonmovant" in 
FFCCSOA contemplates only a requirement 
of personal jurisdiction, not subject matter 
jurisdiction, and to the extent that UIFSA 
sets f01th the additional requirement that the 
patty seeking modification be a nomesident 
of the modifying state, it is preempted by 
FFCCSOA under the Supremacy Clause of 
the US Constitution. Respondent, on the 
other hand, argues that the term "jurisdiction 
over the nonmovant" in FFCCSOA should 
be interpreted to refer to both personal and 
subject matter jurisdiction, and that 
FFCCSOA should be read as incorporating 
the subject matter jurisdiction requirements 
ofUIFSA-i.e., the nomesidency 
requirement-such that the jurisdictional 
requirements of the two statutes are 
harmonious. Initially, we agree with 
petitioner that the term "jurisdiction over the 
nonmovant" plainly and expressly refers to 
personal jurisdiction alone, and not subject 
matter jurisdiction (see Draper v Burke, 450 
Mass 676, 684-685,881 NE2d 122,128 
[2008]; but see LeTellier v LeTellier, 40 
SW3d 490,498-499 [Tenn 2001], supra). 
Indeed, in Matter of Auclair v Bolderson (6 
AD3d 892 [2004], supra)-a case in which 
we were not confronted with the question of 
whether the provisions of FFCCSOA and 
UIFSA conflict-this COUlt interpreted this 
phrase to mean "personal jurisdiction over 
the nonmoving party" (id. at 894). Moreover, 
inasmuch,as we find the phrase "jurisdiction 
over the nonmovant" to be clear and 
unambiguous, we need not consider the 
legislative history of FFCCSOA to aid in 
our interpretation (see Matter of Amorosi v 
South Colonie Ind. Cent. School Dist., 9 
NY3d 367,373 [2007]; Matter of Raritan 

Dev. Corp. v Silva, 91 NY2d 98, 106-107 
[1997]). 

149* 149 In light of our conclusion that 
FFCCSOA requires only personal 
jurisdiction, and given the absence of 
UIFSA's nomesidency requirement in 
FFCCSOA, we are confronted with the issue 
of whether FFCCSOA preempts this 
inconsistent provision of UIFSA. In 
determining whether state law is preempted 
by federal law under the Supremacy Clause 
(see US Const, art VI, cl2), our "'sole task 
is to asceltain the intent of Congress'" 
(Rosario v Diagonal Realty, LLC, 8 NY3d 
755, 763 [2007], cert denied 552 US 1141 
[2008], quoting California Fed. Sav. & Loan 
Assn. v Guerra, 479 US 272, 280 [1987]) . 

"Congressional preemptive intent may be 
discerned in three ways: (1) expressly in the 
language of the [fJederal statute; (2) 
implicitly, when the [fJederallegislation is 
so comprehensive in scope that it is 
inferable that Congress intended to fully 
occupy the 'field' of its subject matter; or (3) 
implicitly, when [s]tate law actually 
'conflicts' with [fJederallaw" (Drattel v 
Toyota Motor Corp., 92 NY2d 35, 42 
[1998] [citation omitted];accord Rosario v 
Diagonal Realty, LLe, 8 NY3d at 763). 

Here, FFCCSOA does not contain an 
express statement by Congress that it 
intended to preempt UIFSA. On the issue of 
implied preemption, we find both the 
existence of an actual conflict and an intent 
by Congress to occupy the field, thereby 
impliedly preempting the jurisdictional 
requirements of UIFSA. 

As previously noted, FFCCSOA and UIFSA 
both attempt to eliminate judicial 
competition and conflicting orders in 
interstate child support disputes by 
establishing clear, definite rules as to which 
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state has jurisdiction to modify or enforce 
child SUppOlt orders (see 28 USC § 1738B 
[a]; Pub L 103-383, § 2 [c]). And, a review 
of the legislative history ofFFCCSOA 
reveals that Congress determined that there 
was a need for uniformity among the states 
as to the enforcement of child SUppOlt 
orders.[l] As a result of these and other 
related problems, Congress exercised its 
authority, under the Full Faith and Credit 
Clause, 150* 150 the Commerce Clause, the 
Due Process Clause, and the General 
Welfare Clause to enact FFCCSOA (see Pub 
L 103-383, § 2; HR Rep 206; S Rep 361). 
Specifically, FFCCSOA states that each 
state "shall enforce according to its terms a 
child support order ... of another [s ]tate; and 
.. , shall not seek or make a modification of 
such an order except in accordance with [its . 
provisions]" (28 USC § 1738B [a] 
[emphasis added]). In our view, this 
congressional directive, as well as the 
legislative history behind the enactment of 
FFCCSOA, supports a finding that this 
federal jurisdictional statute establishes a 
policy of federal preemption in modification 
and enforcement of out-of-state child 
support. [2] Accordingly, because UIFSA 
conflicts with FFCCSOA in this regard, the 
jurisdictional provisions of UIFSA are 
preempted by those of FFCCSOA by 
operation of the Supremacy Clause. 

Our conclusion here is analogous to the 
impact of the enactment of the Federal 
Parental Kidnaping Prevention Act of 1980 
(28 USC § 1738A [hereinafter PKP A]), 
which requires that full faith and credit be 
given to child custody determinations, upon 
the Uniform Child Custody Jurisdiction Act 
(hereinafter UCCJA), embodied in Domestic 
Relations Law former article 5-A. Like 
UIFSA, UCCJA had been enacted by all 50 
states and was designed to prevent 
jurisdictional competition and conflict 
between state courts in the enforcement and 

modification of custody and visitation orders 
(see Domestic Relations Law former § 75-b 
[1] [a]). The purposes ofUCCJA are to 
"discourage 151 * 151 continuing 
controversies over child custody," to "deter 
abductions and other unilateral removals of 
children" and to "facilitate the enforcement 
of custody decrees of other states" 
(Domestic Relations Law former § 75-b [d], 
[e], [g]). With similar goals in mind, and 
with the need for uniformity, Congress 
enacted PKP A (see Pub L 96-611, § 7 [c] 
[5]). 

Notably, the COUlt of Appeals has held that 
where UCCJA and PKPA conflict, PKPA 
preempts UCCJA by virtue of the 
Supremacy Clause (see Matter of Mott v 
Patricia Ann R., 91 NY2d 856, 859-860 
[1997]; see also Frankel v Siravo, 278 
AD2d 66, 67[lst Dept 2000]; Matter 
of Jackson-Ordia v Ordia, 224 AD2d 529, 
529 [2d Dept 1996]; Matter of Hahn v 
Rychling, 258 AD2d 832, 834 [3d Dept 
1999], Iv dismissed93 NY2d 954 
[1999]; Matter of Reis v Zimmer, 263 AD2d 
136, 143-144 r4th Dept 
1999], supra).!3] Given the similar goals of 
PKP A and FFCCSOA and unanimous 
findings that PKP A preempts inconsistent 
state law, we see no basis to reach a 
different conclusion on the issue of 
preemption with respect to FFCCSOA. 
Moreover, the Court of Appeals all but 
expressly answered the question of 
preemption in Matter of Spencer v 
Spencer (10 NY3d 60 [2008], supra). There, 
apparently foreseeing an issue regarding 
inconsistencies between FFCCSOA and 
UIFSA, the Court of Appeals noted that 
"[t]his is not a case where the two statutes 
conflict. Rather, the relevant provisions are 
consistent. Indeed, where UIFSA is silent, 
the FFCCSOA may help fill any gaps" 
(id. at 66). Moreover, in discussing whether 
a child SUppOlt order made subsequent to an 
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expired support order constituted a 
"modification," the Court stated that "a 
subsequent child support order is a 
'modification' as defined by the federal 
statute. The FFCCSOA defines 
'modification' of a child support order 
and,under the Supremacy Clause of the 
United States Constitution, we are bound to 
follow that definition /I (id. at 67 [emphasis 
added]). Likewise in this case, FFCCSOA 
defines the jurisdictional requirements for 
this state's modification of a sister state's 
child support order and, to the extent that 
UIFSA is inconsistent with those 
requirements, we are compelled to follow 
those contained in FFCCSOA. For all of 
these reasons, we find that 152*152 the 
jurisdictional requirements of FFCCSOA 
preempt those of UIFSA. 

Having found that the jurisdictional 
requirements of FFCCSOA preempt those of 
UIFSA, we now address the remaining 
requirement of FFCCSOA-whether 
personal jurisdiction may be maintained 
over respondent in New York. Due process 
permits a state cOUli to exercise personal 
jurisdiction over a nondomiciliary so long as 
he or she has sufficient "minimum contacts" 
with the forum state such that the 
maintenance of the lawsuit "does not offend 
'traditional notions of fair play and 
substantial justice'" (International Shoe Co. 
v Washington, 326 US 310, 316 
[1945],quoting Milliken v Meyer, 311 US 
457,463 [1940]; accord LaMarca v Pak­
Mol" Mfg. Co., 95 NY2d 210, 216 [2000]). 
These minimum contacts must be the result 
of" some act by which the [nondomiciliary] 
purposefully avails [him ]self [or herself] of 
the privilege of conducting activities within 
the forum [s]tate" (Hanson v Denckla, 357 
US 235, 253 [1958]; accord Kulko v 
Superior Court ofCa!., City & County of 
San Francisco, 436 US 84, 94 

[1978]; see LaMarca v Pak-Mor Mfg. 
Co., 95 NY2d at 216). 

Here, respondent acquiesced in the child's 
relocation to New York, paid child support 
in this state and visited with the child in 
New York. While these acts, standing alone, 
are insufficient to confer personal 
jurisdiction over respondent (see Kulko v 
Superior Court of Cal. , City & County of 
San Francisco, 436 US at 94-96; Matter 
of Hauger v Hauger, 275 AD2d 953, 953-
954 [2000]; Birdsall v Melita, 260 AD2d 
809, 810-811 [1999], Iv denied 93 NY2d 
812 [1999]), respondent also invoked the aid 
of the New York cOUlis and protections of 
our state's laws by filing an action in New 
York to modify the Washington custody and 
visitation order, and thereafter benefitted 
from Family COUli's order modifying 
visitation. "Use of the New York courts is a 
traditional justification for the exercise of 
personal jurisdiction over a nonresident" 
(Matter ofSayeh R., 91 NY2d 306, 319 
[1997] [citation omitted] [concluding that 
the respondent "deliberately and 
affirmatively sought the protection of this 
(s)tate's laws, and thereby rendered herself 
amenable to our general long-arm 
jurisdiction"]; accord Andrew Greenberg, 
Inc. v Sir tech Can., Ltd., 79 AD3 d 1419, 
1423 [2010]; Lynch v Austin, 96 AD2d 196, 
199 [1983]; see Matter of Richardson v 
Richardson, 80 AD3d 32, 35 
[2010] [personal jurisdiction over the 
petitioner found where he affirmatively 
sought the entry of orders of protection 
against the respondents]). 
FUlihermore, 153 * 153 under these 
circumstances, we find that the exercise of 
jurisdiction over respondent will not offend 
notions of fair play and substantial justice 
(see generally Burger King Corp. v 
Rudzewicz, 471 US 462, 477 
[1985]; LaMarca v Pak-Mor Mfg. Co., 95 
NY2d at 217). As such, we find that 
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personal jurisdiction may be exercised over 
respondent in New York. 

Therefore, inasmuch as none of the parties 
continues to reside in Washington, the 
Washington suppoti order was registered in 
New York and New York may exercise 
personal jurisdiction over respondent, the 
jurisdictional requirements of FFCCSOA 
have been satisfied. Thus, Family Court 
possesses jurisdiction to modify the 
Washington child support order. 

Ordered that the order is reversed, on the 
law, without costs, motion denied, and 
matter remitted to the Family COUli of 
Saratoga County for further proceedings not 
inconsistent with this COUli's decision. 

[1] In its report that accompanied the bill 
containing FFCCSOA, the House of 
Representatives noted that hearings held 
before various subcommittees of Congress 
"have demonstrated the inadequacy of 
existing [s ] tate law to protect the interests of 
children and custodial parents in enforcing 
child suppOli orders where the non-custodial 
parent lives in a different [s]tate" (HR Rep 
206, 103rd Cong, 1st Sess, at 4 [1993]). The 
report also pointed out that lithe Full Faith 
and Credit clause of Article IV of the 
Constitution, and implementing legislation 
adopted by the Congress, have generally not 
been construed to apply to orders where the 
matter involves an ongoing obligation and 
the court retains the power to modify its 
decision" (HR Rep 206, 1 03rd Cong, 1 st 
Sess, at 4-5 [1993]). 

Likewise, the Senate found that "a large and 
growing number of child suppOli cases 
involve disputes across state lines, and the 
laws by which courts determine their 
authority to establish and modify child 
suppOli orders are not uniform" (S Rep 361, 
103rd Cong, 2d Sess, at 5, reprinted in 1994 

US Code Cong & Admin. News, at 3261-
3262). The Senate report stated that II [t]his 
lack of uniformity ... has led to a number of 
deficiencies in child suppOli collection [and] 
encourages non-custodial parents to relocate 
outside the [s ]tates where their children and 
custodial parents reside, in order to avoid the 
jurisdiction of the COUlis of such [s]tates" (S 
Rep 361, 103rd Cong, 2d Sess, at 5, 
reprinted in 1994 US Code Cong & Admin 
News, at 3262). 

[2] Although the United States Supreme 
Court has held that 1I'[t]he whole subject of 
the domestic relations of husband and wife, 
parent and child, belongs to the laws of the 
[s]tates and not to the laws of the United 
States'" (Rose v Rose, 481 US 619, 625 
[1987], quoting In re Burrus, 136 US 586, 
593-594 [1890]; accord Hisquierdo v 
Hisquierdo, 439 US 572, 581 [1979]), 
FFCCSOA is a procedural and jurisdictional 
statute which does not impose principles of 
substantive law on the states (cf In re 
Clausen, 442 Mich 648, 670 n 24, 502 
NW2d 649, 658 n 24 [1993]; Arbogast v 
Arbogast, 174 W Va 498,502,327 SE2d 
675,679 [1984]). 

[3] Although New York replaced UCCJA 
with the Uniform Child Custody Jurisdiction 
and Enforcement Act (hereinafter UCCJEA) 
in 2002 (see L 2001, ch 386, § 1), UCCJEA 
is a revised version ofUCCJA that seeks to 
conform to the provisions of PKP A 
(see Sobie, Practice Commentaries, 
McKinney's Cons Laws of NY, Book 14, 
Domestic Relations Law § 75-b, at 323), and 
it has been held that the jurisdictional 
provisions of PKP A preempt those of 
UCCJEA that are inconsistent (see Stocker v 
Sheehan, 13 AD3d 1, 10 [2004]). 
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STATEWIDE APPEALS DATA 
Data for 2012 

Appellate Cases 

188 appeals filed 
156 appeals represented by GAL Program 

82 appeals represented by 

GAL pro bono attorneys 

Appellate Attorneys 

1 Associate Counsel 

1 Appellate Counsel 
8 Contract Appellate Attorneys 

56 Pro Bono Appellate Attorneys 

ATTORNEY QUOTES 

"Knowing that everything possible from the 

legal standpoint is being done for a child in need 

makes being a GAL pro bono appellate attorney 
very rewarding . I would strongly recommend 

other attorneys consider pro bono service with 

the GAL program because it is gratifying work 

that can be done on a flexible schedule. In 

addition, as with most appellate work, you have 

the opportunity to enhance your research and 
legal writing skills." -Jay Butler, Partner 

Parker Poe Adams & Bernstein, UP 

"There is no greater service or use of a 

law degree than advocating on behalf of 

children ." -Ashley Edwards, Associate, 

Parker Poe Adams & Bernstein, UP 

North Carolilla 

GUARDIAN AD LITE M 
A CHILD'S ADVOCATE IN COURT 

GUARDIAN AD LITEM 
PRO BONO PROGRAM 

In 1983, the North Carolina General Assembly established the Office of Guardian ad 
Litem (GAL) Services as a division of the North Carolina Administrative Office of the 
Courts. Pursuant to N.c. Gen. Stat. §7B-601, when a petition alleging abuse or neglect 
of a juvenile is filed in district court, the judge appoints a volunteer Guardian ad Litem 
advocate and an attorney advocate to provide team representation to the child, who 
has full party status in trial and appellate proceedings. Through a collaborative model 
utilizing Guardian ad Litem attorney advocates, volunteers, and staff, the program 
provides a voice and legal advocacy in court to all North Carolina children who are 
alleged by the Department of Social Services to have been abused or neglected. If 
those cases are appealed, the Guardian ad Litem Program continues to represent the 
child on appeal through the use of staff, contract, and pro bono appellate attorneys. 
Contract and pro bono appellate attorneys are trained and supported by the GAL 
Associate Counsel and GAL Appellate Counsel. 

Guardian ad Litem Pro Bono Appellate Attorneys: 

• Review trial transcripts and juvenile records 

• Review and settle the record on appeal 

• Respond to appellate motions and writs 

• Draft and file Guardian ad Litem Appellee Briefs 

• Fulfill statutory mandates to provide and promote the best interests of juveniles in 

appellate proceedings 

• Provide a voice for abused and neglected children in North Carolina 

• Help achieve safety and permanency in a child's life 

GAL APPELLATE PROCEDURE IN A NUTSHELL 

• Filed under NC Rule of Appellate Procedure 3.1, governing expedited filings 
of juvenile appeals 

• Juvenile's identity must be protected 
• Requires work from pro bono appellate attorney within the first 45 days 

• GAL appellee must respond to proposed record on appeal within 10 days 

• GAL Appellee Brief usually filed within 90-120 days from the start of the appeal 
• GAL appeals receive calendaring priority 
• Most GAL appeals resolved without oral arguments 

• Complete GAL appeal resolved within 6-9 months 

To learn more about Guardian ad Litem Pro Bono Attorney Opportunities, contact our Appellate 
Counsel, Tawanda Foster, at 919-890-1255 or tawanda.n.foster@nccourts.org. Find us on the web at 

www.ncgal.org or on Facebook as "NC Guardian ad Litem." 
'-'--:-.:.: ..... ::-:-:-.... : .... 
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Volunteer Attorneys Needed 

You can make a difference in the life of a child ... 

Pro bono attorneys have become a vital part of the North Carolina Guardian ad Litem (GAL) since the inception of the Pro 
Bono Project. With offices in every county of the state, the GAL program offers a variety of opportunities for attorneys who 
want to advocate for the best interests of abused and neglected children. 

We provide free CLE training for our pro bono attorneys in basic abuse and neglect laws, court processes, and appellate 
advocacy. Pro bono attorneys also stay updated on current legal events through our GAL publications. 

Our needs vary from county to county, and include: 

• Filing and defending appeals 
• Serving as the guardian ad litem in abuse and neglect cases 

Our greatest current and ongoing need is for pro bono attorneys to handle appellate cases. In just the last two years our 
program has seen an exponential growth with more than 200 appeals currently open. As you can imagine, it is difficultfor 
many of our program's attorneys to maintain their trial court work while continuing to successfully advocate on num erous 
appeals. Luckily, private sector attorneys can take on an appeal anywhere in the state on behalf of our program and to 
ensure that a child's best interests continue to be heard. 

Do you want to sign up? Questions? 

Send an e-mail to tawanda.n.foster@nccourts.org 
or call 919- 890-1255. 

lNWW.nccourts.org/COITYTlOnlPrint.asp 1/1 
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CITIZENS 

Citizens / Guardian ad Litem / Resources for Attorneys 

Resources for Attorneys 

• GAL Attorney Manual 
• GAL Attorney Forms 
• Special Immigrant Juvenile Status (SIJS) 

GAL Conflict Attorney Representation 

• Policy and Procedures 
• Reguest to Appoint GAL Conflict Attorney - Form 

AOC Vendor Payment Method Verification - Form 
• Request for Payment of GAL Conflict Attorney Services - Form - (Appointed after 

July 1, 2009) 
• Request for Payment of IDS Appointed GAL Conflict Attorney Services - Form -

(Appointed prior to July 1, 2009) 

GAL Legal Newsletters 

• GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 8 February - March 2006 
GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 7 December - Januarv 2006 

• GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 6 October - November 2005 
• GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 5 August - September 2005 
• GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 4 June - July 2005 
• GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 3 April - May 2005 
• GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 2 February - March 2005 
• GAL Legal Newsletter Issue 1 December 2004 - Januarv 2005 

Court Report Newsletters 

• GAL Court Report Issue 6 Januarv 2002 
• GAL Court Report Issue 5 August 2001 

Case Summaries: Abstracts of appellate cases that affect abuse, neglect and 
dependency practice: 

2006 Case Summaries 
• 2005 Case Summaries 

2004 Case Summaries Index Included 
• Case Summaries Jan. 1 2003 - Oct. 1 2003 
• Keyword Index for Case Summaries Jan. 1 2003 - Oct. 1 2003 
• 2002 Case Summaries 
• 2002 Index to Case Summaries 

Questions & Answers 

• Q & A Fall 2002 

CLE Seminarsand Taped Trainings 

• 2004 New GAL Attorney Training - VCR and DVD 
• 2003 Appellate Advocacy - VCR and DVD 
• 2003 Termination of Parental Rights - VCR and DVD 

Legal Links 

• Legal Links 

http://www.nccoUlts.org/Citizens/GALlResAtt.asp 

Page 1 of 1 

10/612013 



219

Print Content Page 1 of 1 

GAL Attorney Manual 

• Chapter 1: The Pre-Adjudication State 
• Chapter 2: Adjudication 
• Chapter 3: Disposition, Review, and Permanency Planning 
• Chapter 4: Termination of Parental Rights 
• Chapter 5: Post-Termination of Parental Rights and Adoption 
• Chapter 6: Motions Appeals and Other Procedural Tools for Gal Representation 
• Chapter 7: Evidence Relation to Abuse Neglect and Dependency Proceedings 
• Chapter 8: Guardian Ad Litem Advocacy: The Program, Roles and Responsibi lities 
• Chapter 9: Overview of the Court Process 
• Chapter 10: The Pre-Petition Stage and the Role of DDS 
• Chapter 11: Relevant Federal Laws and North Carolina Statutes Codifying Federal Laws 
• Chapter 12: Ethics and Policy Issues in Guardian Ad Litem Representation 
• Chapter 13: The Attorney Advocate's Role in Other Proceedings 
• Appendix 

Guardian ad Litem Attorney Practice Manual 2007 -- All Chapters 

http://www.nccourts.org/CommoniPrint.asp 10/612013 
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3. Writ of supersedeas [Rule 23 of the Rules of Appellate Procedure] 

E. Appeals 

a. Which court to petition: Unless initially docketed in the supreme court, application for a 
writ of supersedeas must be made to the court of appeals (unless seeking relief from a lUling of 
the court of appeals). See specific language in Rule 23(a)(2) and (b). 

b. Purpose/circumstances: The purpose for a writ of supersedeas is to stay the execution or 
enforcement of any judgment, order, or other determination of a trial tribunal under the 
following circumstances: 

• when such judgment is not automatically stayed by the taking of appeal or a petition for 
mandamus, prohibition or certiorari has been filed AND 

• a stay order has been sought and denied in the trial court, OR 
• extraordinary circumstances make it impracticable to obtain a stay from the trial 

court. 

c. Temporary stay: Pending a detennination on the writ of supersedeas, an application can be 
made for a temporary stay, and for good cause shown, the court may issue an order for a 
temporary stay ex parte. 

d. Details concerning filing, service, content, response, etc. are explained in Rule 23 of the 
Rules of Appellate Procedure. 

Obviously, an appeal is another avenue for seeking relieffrom a judgment. See Appeals in § 6.8, 
directly following this section. 

§ 6.8 Appeals 10 

* This section on appeals is a summary of participation in a Guardian ad Litem appeal. For a comprehensive 
understanding of Guardian ad Litem appeals, please see Williams and Gruber, The Survivor's Guide to 
Guardian ad Litem Appeals, which is available from the Guardian ad Litem State Office. Attorney advocates 
should be aware that GAL Program Policy requires state office approval for appeals . In addition, the Guardian 
ad Litem Program has an Appellate Coordinator and a Pro Bono Project to help with appeals. Please contact the 
GAL State Office for assistance with appeals. 

A. Expedited Appeals Procedure 

A new expedited appeals process for Guardian ad Litem appeals became effective in May 2006. The new 
Rule 3A of the N.C. Rules of Appellate Procedure explains the changes of which you should be aware. In its 
entirety, Rule 3A provides the following: 

10 This section on Appeals was drafted and edited by Pamela N. Williams, GAL Appellate Coordinator. Some material 
remains from the 2002 edition from materials adapted from Janice Perrin Paul, The Appealing Attorney: The Appellate 
Process in Juvenile Cases, prepared for a conference titled "Collaboration on Behalf of the Child," sponsored by the 
Guardian ad Litem Program, July 1994. 
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Rule 3A. Appeal in qualifying juvenile cases -- How and when taken, special rules. 

(a) Filing the notice of appeal. Any party entitled by law to appeal from a trial court 
judgment or order rendered in a case involving tennination of parental rights and issues of 
juvenile dependency or juvenile abuse andlr neglect, appealable pursuant to G.S. 7B-1001, may 
take appeal by filing notice of appeal with the clerk of superior court and serving copies thereof 
upon all other parties in the time and manner set out in Chapter 7B of the general Statutes of 
North Carolina. Trial counselor an appellant not represented by counsel shall be responsible for 
filing and serving the notice of appeal in the time and manner required. If the appellant is 
represented by counsel, both the trial counsel and appellant must sign the notice of appeal, and 
the appellant shall cooperate with counsel throughout the appeal. All such appeals shall comply 
with the special pro visions set out in subsection (b) of this rule and, except as hereinafter 
provided by this rule, all other existing Rules of Appellate Procedure shall remain applicable. 

(b) Special provisions. For appeals filed pursuant to this rule and for extraordinary 
writs filed incases to which these provisions apply, the name of the juvenile who is the subject 
of the action, and of any siblings or other household members under the age of eighteen, shall 
be referenced only by the use of initials in all filings, documents, exhibits, or arguments 
submitted to the appellate court with the exception of sealed verbatim transcripts submitted 
pursuant to Rule 9(c). In addition, the juvenile's address, social security number, and date of 
birth shall be excluded from all filings, documents, exhibits, or arguments with the exception of 
sealed verbatim transcripts submitted pursuant to subdivision (b)(1) below or Rule 9( c). 

In addition, appeals filed pursuant to these provisions shall adhere strictly to the 
expedited procedures set forth below: 

(1) Transcripts. Within one business day after the notice of appeal has been filed, the 
clerk of superior COUlt shall notify the court repOlting coordinator of the administrative Office 
of the Courts of the date the notice of appeal was filed and the names of the parties to the appeal 
and their respective addresses or addresses of their counsel. Within two business days of receipt 
of such notification, the court reporting coordinator shall assign a transcript to the case. Within 
thirty-five days from the date of the assignment, the transcriptionist shall prepare and deliver a 
transcript of the designated proceedings to the office of the Clerk of the Court of appeals and 
provide copies to the respective parties to the appeal at the addresses provided. Motions for 
extensions of time to prepare and deliver transcripts are disfavored and will not be allowed by 
the Comt of Appeals absent extraordinary circumstances. 

(2) Record on Appeal. Within ten days after receipt of the transcript, the appellant shall 
prepare and serve upon all other parties a proposed record on appeal constituted in accordance 
with Rule 9. Trial counsel for the appealing party shall have a duty to assist appellate counsel, if 
separate counsel is appointed or retained for the appeal, in preparing and serving a proposed 
record on appeal. Within ten days after service of the proposed record on appeal upon an 
appellee, the appellee may serve upon all other parties: 

1. a notice of approval of the proposed record; 
2. specific objections or amendments to the proposed record on appeal, or 
3. a proposed altel11ative record on appeal. 
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If the parties agree to a settled record on appeal within twenty days after receipt of the 
transcript, the appellant shall file three legible copies of the settled record on appeal in the office 
of the Clerk of the Court of Appeals within five business days from the date the record was 
settled. If all appellees fail within the times allowed them either to serve notices of approval or 
to serve objections, amendments, or proposed alternative records on appeal, the appellant's 
proposed record on appeal shall constitute the settled record on appeal, and the appellant shall 
file three legible copies thereof in the office of the Clerk of the Court of Appeals within five 
business days from the last date upon which any appellee could have served such objections, 
amendments, or proposed alternative record on appeal. If an appellee timely serves 
amendments, objections, or a proposed alternative record on appeal and the parties cannot agree 
to the settled record within thirty days after receipt of the transcript, each party shall file three 
legible copies of the following documents in the office of the Clerk of the Court of Appeals 
within five business days after the last day upon which the record can be settled by agreement: 

1. the appellant shall file his or her proposed record on appeal, and 

2. an appellee shall file his or her objections, amendments, or proposed alternative 
record on appeal. 

No counsel who has appeared as trial counsel for any party in the proceeding shall be 
permitted to withdraw, nor shall such counsel be otherwise relieved of any responsibilities 
imposed pursuant to this rule, until the record on appeal has been filed in the office of the Clerk 
of the Court of Appeals as provided herein. 

(3) Briefs. Within thirty days after the record on appeal has been filed with the Court of 
Appeals, the appellant shall file his or her brief in the office of the Clerk of the Court of Appeals 
and serve copies upon all other parties of record. Within thirty days after the appellant's brief 
has been served on an appellee, the appellee shall file his or her brief in the office of the Clerk 
of the Court of Appeals and serve copies upon all other parties of record. Motions for 
extensions of time to file briefs will not be allowed absent extraordinaty circumstances. 

(c) Calendaring priority. Appeals filed pursuant to this rule will be given priority over 
other cases being considered by the Court of Appeals and will be calendared in accordance with 
a schedule promulgated by the Chief Judge. Unless othelwise ordered by the COUlt of Appeals, 
cases subject to the expedited procedures set forth in this rule shall be disposed of on the record 
and briefs and without oral argument. 

N.C. R. App. P. 3A (2007). 

The new Rule 3A shortens the length of GAL appeals by a year or more, marking a major step fOlward 
in expediting pem1anency for the children GAL represents. GAL attorneys should pay patticular 
attention to Rule 3A's two most important timesaving features: Production of the transcript under Rule 
3A(b)( 1) and of the record on appeal under Rule 3A(b )(2). 

Under Rule 3A(b)(1), the AOC Court Reporting Coordinator assigns the transcriptionist to the appeal. 
The transcriptionist must then deliver the transcript within 35 days to both parties and the Court of 
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Appeals. Any motions for extension of time to complete the transcript are now filed in the Court of 
Appeals, rather than in the trial court. Although this requirement is not clearly stated in Rule 3A, it is 
implied in the text of the Rule. The Court of Appeals has, by lUling on such motions to extend even 
though the appeal has not yet been docketed in the Court, acknowledged this requirement. Motions to 
extend the time to produce the transcript are filed by counsel for appellants, not the transcriptionist. 

Rule 3A(b )(2) requires the appellant to serve the proposed record on appeal upon all other parties on 
appeal within 10 days after receiving the transcript. These parties must then submit any objections to the 
proposed record within 10 days of receiving it from the appellant. If the pmties agree to the settled 
record within 20 days after the appellant received the transcript, or ifthe appellee serves neither notice 
of approval nor objection to the proposed record, then the duty falls on the appellant to file three copies 
of the record with the COUlt of Appeals. However, if the patties carulOt agree to a settled record within 
30 days after the appellant's receipt of the transcript, then the appellant must file the proposed record, 
and the appellee must file any objections or amendments or the proposed alternative record on appeal. 

The lUle speeds up the appeals process in two other provisions. First, absent extraordinaty 
circumstances, the court will not grant extensions of time to prepare the transcript, record and briefs. In 
the past, these areas led to huge delays. Also, Rule 3A gives "calendaring priority" to GAL cases. 
Unless otherwise ordered by the COUlt of Appeals, the rule limits cases to being heard only on the 
record and briefs - without oral argument. 

The briefing schedule remains essentially the same as it was under Rule 3, with one important 
exception. Under Rule 3A(b)(3), the appellant's brief is due within 30 days after the settled record has 
been filed with the appellate court. In the past, the date the record was mailed to the parties triggered the 
30-day briefing schedule. Finally, Rule 3A requires that both the appellant and the appellant's attorney 
sign the notice of appeal. The lUle also prohibits trial counsel from withdrawing from the case until the 
record has been filed with the appellate COUlt. 

B. Preserving the Record on Appeal 

1. The appellate court will only review a claim, defense, or theory that is presented in the trial court. 

2. An error by the trial court will not be reviewed in the absence of a timely objection setting f01th 
the specific grounds on which it is based. (See Rule of Appellate Procedure 10.) 

a. Rule 46 of the Rules of Civil Procedure governs the instances in which objections must be 
made in order to preserve an exception on appeal. Objections need to be made regarding the 
admissibility of evidence. It is wise to be VeIY familiar with Rule 46. 

b. With respect to lUlings and orders not directed to the admissibility of evidence, formal 
objections and exceptions are unnecessary. A party need only apprise the court of the objection 
to the court's action or make known the action he/she desires the court to take and the ground 
therefor; however, if a party has no opp01tunity to object or except to a lUling when made, the 
absence of an objection/exception does not prejudice the party. G.S. lA-I, Rule 46(b) 

c. The "plain error doctrine" is not applicable to civil cases. In re Gleisner, 539 S.E.2d 362 
(2000). (A "plain error" is a fundamental error that is so prejudicial as to result in a miscarriage 
of justice or in the denial to appellant of a fair trial, and justifies relief on appeal though not 
objected to in the trial court.) [d. 
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3. See Rule of Appellate Procedure 9 regarding the composition of the record on appeal. 

4. Practical advice on preserving the record 

a. Admit all relevant evidence, both documentary and testimonial. Remember that argument 
is not evidence. 

b. Object and state the grounds for the objection. A specific objection will preserve the 
evidentiary error on appeal to the extent of the particular objection; a general objection raises 
only the objection of relevancy and waives any other ground for exclusion. (See 1 Wigmore, 
Evidence, Sec. 18.) 

c. Move to strike a question or answer when appropriate, especially when the question is asked 
and answered before you have a chance to object. Failure to do so will constitute a waiver on 
appeal. 

d. Avoid producing evidence that you objected to as inadmissible. If you object to 
inadmissible evidence and then produce similar evidence through your own witnesses, you will 
be deemed to have waived your objection. However, you may object to the testimony ofa 
witness and then cross-examine that witness to the extent that your cross is limited to explaining 
or rebutting the improper evidence . . 

e. Make an offer of proof to preserve for review an enor in excluding evidence. When 
making an offer of proof, state for the record the legal basis for the admissibility of the evidence 
offered. This includes stating what the evidence would have tended to show or to what the 
witness would have testified. (See G.S. lA-I, Rule 43.) 

f. Don't use a motion in limine as a substitute for objections. A pretrial motion in limine 
cannot serve as a substitute for making timely trial objections. 

g. Generally insist that everything be on the record. Politely resist "at the bench" or "in 
chambers" conferences - or make sure that such discussions are recorded by the court reporter, 
or have the court or a party sununarize on the record the substance of the off-the-record 
conference. 

h. Request a ruling if the judge fails to rule on a motion or objection, and ask for 
clarification of ambiguous rulings. 

i. Make motions in writing whenever possible. File a supporting brief or memorandum of 
law if necessary. 

j. Make an on-the-record checklist of exhibits admitted into evidence. 

k. State your objection on the record to such things as egregious nonverbal behavior by 
opposing counselor the trial judge. 

I. Review proposed orders carefully. Make sure all relevant facts and conclusions are 
incorporated into the order. 
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m. Ensure that all reports are incorporated into the order and made a part of the record. 
Be'sure that the GAL's recommendations are expressly made a part of the order. Even if the 
court does not order what the GAL reconunended, or does not want to incorporate the report, 
ask that the order recite what the GAL recommended or objected to . 

C. When Not to Appeal 

Practical advice: Do not appeal just because you are angry with the other side. Don't appeal when 
you disagree with the judge's decision but are satisfied there are no grounds for reversible error. Don't 
appeal procedural or technical errors in a final order if the evidence would support the order, or on 
remand the judge would find the omitted facts. Don't appeal when the issue is not important and does 
not advance an ultimate goal in the case; appeal only if you would have a different result if you won the 
appeal. 

D. Appropriate Courtesy to Trial Judge on Appeal 

Practical advice: When possible, it is best to avoid surprising the judge in his or her courtroom at the 
end of the case with your intent to appeal. Filing a written motion for a court reporter or giving the 
judge a memorandum of law prior to hearing that indicates that the issue before the court is impOltant 
might alelt the judge to the possibility of an appeal. Send the judge a copy of the appellate documents 
and materials. 

E. Appeals of Rulings Made Pursuant to Abuse, Neglect and Dependency Proceedings 

1. Proper Parties to Appeal. Under § 7B-I 00 I, those who may appeal a final order under § 7B-I 00 I 
include the juvenile, a county department of social services, a parent, guardian or custodian; and any 
party who sought but failed to obtain a termination of parental rights . 

2. Proper Order to Appeal. Under § 7B-IOOI , only a final order can be appealed. These orders 
include the following: (a) any order finding absence of jurisdiction; (b) any order, including the 
involuntary dismissal of a petition, which in effect detennines the action and prevents a judgment from 
which appeal might be taken; (c) any initial order of disposition and the adjudication order upon which 
it is based; (d) any order, other than a nonsecure custody order, that changes legal custody of a juvenile; 
(e) any order relieving D.S.S. of reunification efforts; and (f) any order terminating parental rights or 
denying a petition/motion for termination of parental rights . 

The order from which the appeal flows must be entered at the trial COUlt, meaning it must be "reduced to 
writing, signed by the judge, and filed with the clerk of court." N.C. Gen. Stat. § lA-I, Rule 58 (2007). 

3. Notice of Appeal. The notice of appeal must be signed by both the attorney (if any) and the 
appealing party. N.C. R. App. P. 3A. The appellant has 30 days to appeal an order. 

F. Appeals from Termination of Parental Rights Orders 

1. Right to Appeal. The following parties may appeal a tennination of parental rights order: the 
juvenile, a county department of social services, a parent, guardian or custodian; and any party who 
sought but failed to obtain a termination of parental rights . 

2. Timing and Notice. The appellant has 30 days to file a notice of appeal and must serve all pmties as 
is customary. 
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G. Other Important Requirements for All Appeals: The Rules of Appellate Procedure 11 

The Rules of Appellate Procedure are mandatory and failure to follow them subjects an appeal to 
dismissal. See State v. Hart, 361 N.C. 309; 644 S.E.2d 201 (2007); Viarv. N.e. Dept. of 
Transportation, 359 N.C. 400, 610 S.E.2d 360 (2005). 

1. Filing the Notice of Appeal. Pursuant to Rule 3A, as noted above, the appellant must also sign the 
notice of appeal, along with counsel, if any. In addition, all documents referring to the juvenile must not 
include his/her name, address, social security number and date of birth. Refer to the juvenile with 
his/her initials or use a pseudonym. 

2. DSS and GAL Joining on Appeal. When GAL and DSS have the same position on appeal, it is 
appropriate and wise for them to join on appeal, which will lessen the time the appellate judge and 
clerks will spend learning that position. It is not uncommon for the two parties to join and share the 
duties in authoring the joint brief. However, if GAL differs at all from the DSS position, the GAL 
attorney advocate should prepare his/her own full-length brief, as GAL is a party to the action. The 
GAL brief is on behalf of the children involved in the case. See N.C. R. App. P. 28 for an explanation 
on what should be in an appellant and appellee brief. 

3. Preparation of the transcript and record on appeal shall be pursuant to Rule 3A, as set out above, 
which provides timelines that are different from other civil appeals. 

4. For pointers on how to write an effective GAL brief and what to do for oral arguments, please see 
Williams and Gmber, The Survivor's Guide to Guardian ad Litem Appeals (2007). 

5. The appendices to the Rules of Appellate Procedure are extremely useful. They provide specific 
charts and examples to assist attorneys in meeting the requirements of the Rules. See also the timetables 
for juvenile appeals in Williams and Gmber, The Survivor's Guide to Guardian ad Litem Appeals 
(2007). 

§ 6.9 Stay of Proceedings Pending Judgment 

A. Stay of Proceedings, Disposition Pending Appeal 
[See statutes for more details.] 

1. Disposition pending appeal 

a. In nontermination proceedings: Pending disposition of an appeal, the judge may enter a 
temporary order affecting the custody or placement of the juvenile for compelling reasons, 
which must be stated in writing, as the judge finds to be in the best interest of the juvenile. 
When the child has suffered physical abuse by one with a history of violent behavior, the court 
shall consider the opinion of the mental health professional who perfonned an evaluation under 
7B-503(b) before returning the juvenile to the custody of that individual. For placement in 
foster care, the provisions of subsections (b), (c), and (d) ofG.S. 7B-905 shall apply to such 
order. [7B-I003] 

II For an in-depth discussion of the Rules of Appellate Procedure and Guardian ad Litem appeals, please consult Williams 
and Gruber, The Survivor's Guide to Guardian ad Litem Appeals (2007). 
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b. In termination proceedings: "Pending disposition of an appeal, the court may enter such 
temporalY order affecting the custody or placement of the child as the court finds to be in the 
best interest of the child or the best interest of the State." [7B-1113] 

2. Automatic stay of proceedings for all judgments until time to appeal has expired [G.S. lA-I, 
Rule 62(a)] 

Judgments shall not be executed nor proceedings be taken for enforcement of judgment until 
expiration of the time provided in the controlling statute or rule of appellate procedure for 
giving notice of appeal from the judgment. 

3. Stay upon appeal, application for relieffrom denial of stay [G.S. lA-I, Rule 62(d), Rule of 
Appellate Procedure 8] 

a. When an appeal is taken, the appellant may obtain a stay of execution. (See G.S. lA-I , Rule 
62(a) and G.S. 7B-I003 .) 

b. Procedure for seeking relief for denial of a stay is set out in Rule 8 of the Rules of Appellate 
Procedure. 
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B. Stay on Motion in the Trial Court for New Trial, Amendment, or Relief from Judgment 
[Rule of Civil Procedure 62(b)] 

The trial court may stay the execution of proceedings in its discretion and on such conditions for the 
security of the adverse party as are proper, pending the disposition of a motion made under the 
following lUles: 

• New trial or to amend a judgment (Rule 59) 
• Motion for relief from a judgment (Rule 60) 
• Motion for judgment (Rule 50) 
• Motion for amendment to the findings (Rule 52(b)) 
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Appellate Pro Bono Program 

After a year of cooperative work between the courts, the Appellate Practice 

Section's executive committee, and other bar members , we are pleased to 

announce the creation of the Oregon Appellate Pro Bono Program . Modeled 

after the pro bono program in the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit, 

the program creates a pool of volunteer attorneys willing to represent pro se 

litigants in appellate cases. The Oregon Supreme Court or Court of Appeals 

selects cases in which the court would benefit from attorney representation. 

Any active member of the bar is eligible to participate. In addition to assisting 

the courts in appropriate cases, the program is also intended to provide 

members of the bar with appellate experience. Members of the bar who are 

interested in receiving e-mail announcements about available cases should 

send an e-mail to orappprobono@gmail.com . The email should include your 

name, bar number, email address, phone number, and mailing address. 

Below is a sample notification of a case referred to the program: 

"Greetings, everyone. 

The Oregon Court of Appeals has referred the below case to the 

program in order to determine whether volunteer counsel is 

available to represent respondent on appeal. This case involves 

a dispute over custody and visitation of a minor child . The 

plaintiff lappellant (represented by counsel below and on appeal) 

appeals from a judgment that grants relief from default and sets 

aside a default judgment relating to visitation rights, denies 

plaintiffs motions for temporary and extended visitation, for sol~ 

custody, and to hold defendant in contempt. Respondent 

proceeded pro se at trial and has, so far, done the same on 

appeal. 

As with all cases referred to the pro bono program, selection of a 

case for the program does not represent a determination by the 

Court of the merits of any side of or theory in the case, but 

simply a belief that representation by counsel may assist the 

Court in its review. 

If, after reviewng the below information carefully, you are 

interested and 'N:Juld be available to handle this matter pro bono, 

please respond to this email as soon as possible. No need to 

respond if you are unavailable. 

Before volunteering, please review the Statement of Program 

Principles for the program, available here, particularly parts III, IV, 
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and V. Note that the program does not have funds available to 

cover costs; issues regarding costs will need to be addressed 

with the prospective client. According to the trial court record, 

this client has previously requested and received waivers or 

deferrals of fees due to indigency. 

Out of those attorneys who respond, we will randomly select 

one, and be in touch with that attorney regarding initial contact 

with the potential client (including contact information, checking 

conflicts, etc.) . (We will likely make the initial assignment no 

later than Friday morning, 4/22.) You would still need to discuss 

representation as you would with any client, though this would be 

on pro bono terms, and (for the moment, at least) limited to the 

appeal. 

If you are not experienced in appellate work, and would like to 

have an experienced appellate counsel as a mentor, let us know 

when you volunteer and we will try to match you up if you are 

selected. 

Please send any inquiries to me and Derek Green at this email 

address . Thanks again for your willingness to participate. 

Jeff Dobbins 

Willamette U. College of Law 

Oregon Appellate Pro Bono Program Case #0005 

Summary The Oregon Court of Appeals has referred to the 

program an appeal in which pro bono representation of 

respondent might be of assistance to the court. As noted above, 

this case involves a dispute over custody and visitation of a 

minor child. Plaintiff / appellant Jaquelin Gardner (represented 

by counsel below and on appeal) appeals from a judgment 

(Lincoln Co. Cir. Ct.) that grants relief from default and sets 

aside a default judgment relating to visitation rights , and also 

denies plaintiffs motions for temporary and extended visitation , 

for sole custody, and to hold defendant / respondent (Marci Rae 

Taylor) in contempt. Defendant / respondent Taylor 

proceeded pro se at trial and has proceeded so far on 

appeal pro se. She has approached the clerk's office seeking 

assistance with the filing of a brief. 

Referral from: Oregon Court of Appeals 

Status: Briefing Pending in Oregon Court of Appeals 

(answering brief due) 

Case Title: Marci Taylor, Jacquelin E Gardner v. Marci Rae 

Taylor, Court of Appeals No. A144895 

Possible Need for Counsel for: Respondent Marci Rae Taylor 

Deadlines: Respondent's Answering Brief due 5/26." 

Reconmend this on Google 

Home 

osbaps .blog spot.com'plappellate-pro-bono-prog ram.html 213 
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Oregon Appellate Court Pro Bono Program 
Statement of Program Principles 

Primary Purpose: To assist the appellate courts of the State of Oregon by connecting 
volunteer appellate attol11eys with pro se clients in cases where pro bono representation 
by counsel would be helpful to the Court. 

Secondary Purpose: To provide attol11eys in the state with experience in appellate 
representation, and provide a further opportunity to meet pro bono goals in the state. 

I. Creation of Program 
The Oregon Appellate Court Pro Bono Program is a volunteer project managed 

with the assistance of the Executive Committee of the Appellate Practice Section of 
the Oregon State Bar, and in cooperation with the Oregon Supreme Court and Court of 
Appeals. 

The Appellate Practice Section Executive Committee shall identify a volunteer 
attol11ey or attorneys to serve as program managers for the Program. 

A Program Committee is established, consisting of the program managers, the 
Appellate Commissioner, designees of the Chief Justice and Chief Judge, and a member 
of the Appellate Practice Section Executive Committee, as well as such other individuals 
that the named members may choose to invite. The Program Committee shall meet 
at least yearly in order to review the program and propose changes to the program as 
appropriate or necessaty. 

II. Identification of Cases 
A) The appellate courts have discretion to identify cases appropriate for inclusion 

in the program. A case may be appropriate for inclusion in the program if the Court 
believes that referral of a case to volunteer counsel would be helpful to the Court. 

B) The program is not intended to supplant established programs for 
representation of criminal defendants or any other pro bono programs established in the 
state. 

C) The appellate courts may identify intel11al processes, procedures, and 
individuals responsible for the identification of appeals appropriate for the program 

D) The Appellate Commissioner and designees of the Chief Justice and Chief 
Judge have responsibility for contacting the program managers in order to request 
assignment of volunteer attol11eys through the program. 

E) The Appellate Commissioner and designees of the Chief Justice and Chief 
Judge should notify the judges of the Comis on a yearly basis of the availability of the 
program. 

G) In appropriate cases, the appellate courts may request patiicipation of counsel 
through the program as "amicus to the court," rather than as a representative of any 
particular party. 

F) Selection of case for the program does not reflect a determination of the merit 
of any party's position or theory, but rather simply indicates that the referral of a case to 
pro bono counsel is considered to be of potential benefit to the court. 
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III. Volunteer Attorney Participation 
A. Participation Requirements for Volunteer Attorneys 
Volunteer participation in the program is open to (1) active members of the 

Oregon State Bar, and (2) law school clinical programs, as addressed below. In addition, 
pmticipation is subject to the following terms and conditions: 

1) Neither the court, bar, nor program managers are able to reimburse the 
volunteer attorney for expenses (e.g., travel for argument, copy costs, etc.) incUlTed 
during the course of representation. 

2) No fees for the attorney's time may be charged to the client. If a relevant 
provision pennits recovery of attorney fees by counsel, the volunteer attomey may 
request and receive such fees as provided by applicable law. Counsel must evaluate the 
costs of the appeal, including the cost for preparation of the record, and address payment 
of those costs in the initial representation letter. 

3) The volunteer attorney is always responsible for ultimate compliance with 
ethics rules, including rules regarding the evaluation of conflicts, personal interest, and 
maintenance of PLF and any other relevant insurance. 

4) The program managers, in cooperation with the Program Committee and State 
Bar, should evaluate whether the program would benefit from being officially sponsored 
as a Bar pro bono program. If so, the program managers may, in cooperation with the 
Executive Conunittee of the Appellate Practice Section, file the necessary application 
with the Bar. 

B. Identifying Volunteer Attorneys 
The program managers shall distribute information about the program to all active 

members of the Oregon State Bar through a yearly email. The email should include 
relevant infonnation about the program, instructions on how to register as a volunteer 
attorney, and contact information. The website for the Bar's Appellate Section should 
also include infOlmation about the program and contact information. Attomeys who are 
interested in volunteering for the program would need to respond by registering with the 
program managers. 

C. Registering Volunteer Attorneys 
To register, an attorney must sign and submit a simple registration form to the 

program managers. In the registration, the volunteer attorney shall provide contact and 
bar membership infOlmation, and sign a statement confirming that she or he (1) meets the 
eligibility requirements, and (2) agrees to abide by the terms and conditions of the 
program. 

The program managers should compile and maintain a list of the registered 
volunteers. Although the volunteer attorneys must continue to affirm that they meet the 
eligibility requirements, the program managers should check bar membership records to 
confirm active bar membership. The program managers should update and purge the list 
of volunteers on a yearly basis. 

D. Law School Clinical Programs 
Law school clinical programs, or faculty members who are active members of 

the bar and willing to supervise student participants, may request assignment of cases 
during the year as appropriate. Faculty or staff advisors of students participating in the 
program through this mechanism must comply with all relevant requirements regarding 
the representation of clients under this program, and are ultimately responsible for the 
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representation. 

IV. Assignment of Cases to Volunteer Attorneys 
A) The court shall notify the parties and the program manager when a case has 

been identified for possible inclusion in the pro bono program. The program managers 
shall then provide the pro se party with a consent form to sign if the party is interested in 
pmticipating in the program, and send an email notice about the case to the list of 
registered volunteers. The email will include general, objective infol111ation about the 
case generated by the court and program managers, and include the names of the parties 
and any counsel, the case's current procedural posture (e.g., whether briefs have been 
filed, any upcoming time deadlines, etc.), and the general issues presented. The goal of 
the email is merely to provide an overview of the case and conflict infOlmation, not to 
provide any legal assessment. The email shall state that any attol11ey interested in 
volunteering to take on the case should email the program manager. 

B) The program managers shall then randomly select an attol11ey to the case from 
those who have volunteered to take on the case, subject to three exceptions: (1) registered 
volunteers who have not had an active case through the program in the last three years 
will be given preference over those who have, (2) registered volunteers who have 
previously requested and not been assigned an active case through the program will be 
given preference over those who are requesting palticipation for the first time, and (3) if 
the court specifically requests referral to an experienced appellate attorney due to the 
complexity of an appeal, the program managers shall select an experienced appellate 
attorney. (However, given that one of the purposes of this program is to provide less­
experienced appellate attorneys with appellate opportunities, this last exception is 
intended to be rare.) 

C) The program managers shall notify the selected volunteer attorney of their 
selection for a particular case once the pro se party has agreed to be included in the 
program. Tfthe selected attorney is interested in proceeding with representation, she or 
he should contact the pro se party and establish representation. Within 14 days, the 
attorney should either establish representation and file a notice of appearance with the 
Court, or notify the program managers regarding progress on the issue of representation. 

D) Counsel is encouraged to review the case prior to agreeing to representation in 
order to clear conflicts and to ensure the issues are appropriately presented for appellate 
review. If counsel believes that their representation is impermissible, or otherwise 
unlikely to aid in the court's review of the case, they may decline representation and so 
infonn the program managers. The program managers may, if appropriate, select another 
attol1ley pursuant to section (B) in order to evaluate representation. 

V. Terms of Representation. 
A. Representation Letter 
The program managers shall draft a model representation letter that volunteer 

attorneys may use for guidance. The model letter shall specify that the volunteer attol1ley 
has agreed to represent the client on a pro bono basis and that the representation is 
limited to the appellate proceedings in which the Court has requested assistance. The 
model letter should address payment of costs on appeal. The model letter shall also state 
that the attol1ley has discussed, and the client has agreed, that the attol11ey may consult 
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with the program coordinators on non-privileged matters, but that the client understands 
that such consultation does not create an attomey-client relationship between the 
coordinators and the client. Willamette Law or other law school programs may volunteer 
to provide moot courts for program participants on terms to be identified later. 

B. Procedural Matters 
Counsel that is participating through the program should anticipate that the Court 

will manage any identified case as it would any other appeal. That said, however, the 
Court may recognize in evaluating requests for extension and other procedural matters 
that counsel is perfonning volunteer service and may need some additional flexibility in 
managing the case. 

If pro bono counsel establishes representation under this program after briefing 
at a particular stage is complete, the Court may request supplemental briefing from the 
patiies. 

C. Further representation 
If the case continues beyond the stage for which representation under the 

program was initially established, appropriate further representation may be established 
between counsel and the client outside of this program. If further representation within 
the auspices of the program is desired by counsel, counsel should contact the program 
managers regarding such representation . . 

D. Recognition 
On an annual basis, the Executive Committee of the Appellate Practice Section of 

the State Bar should acknowledge the work of pro bono counsel who provide their 
services under this program. 
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How to Participate in the Tennessee Appellate Pro Bono Pilot 
Program 

By Lynn Pointer on Mon, 04/23/2012 - 3:28pm 

In January 2011, the Tennessee Bar Association (TBA) and Tennessee Alliance for Legal Ser\1ces (TALS) launched the 

Tennessee Appellate Pro Bono Pilot Program, a pilot initiati~ that prm1des pro bono representation to litigants 

appearing in the Tennessee appellate courts who otherwise could not afford counsel. 

The Tennessee Appellate Pro Bono Pilot Program has three primary goals: 

To impro~ access to justice for low-income litigants in Tennessee's appellate courts by establishing a qualified panel 

of appellate attomeys to prol.ide pro bono representation on appeal; 

To prol.ide increased opportunities for attomeys with appellate practice expertise to use their skills to se~ clients 

who could not otherwise afford representation; and 

To prol.ide an opportunity for senior appellate attomeys to mentor and super\1se young lawyers seeking appellate 

practice experience through pro bono representation. 

The program will also prol.ide pro bono attomeys to assist (or co-counsel with) public interest lawyers who are primary 

counsel in cases on appeal. Criteria for case selection include a significant no~1 or unsettled question of law, error in the 

trial court that may ha~ implications outside of the indil.idual case, a current split of authority, or a possible precedent­

setting decision coupled with the financial need of the party. All applicants to the program must not otherwise be able to 

afford appellate counsel. 

The program will maintain a network of wlunteer attomeys to whom cases may be referred. When a case is selected for 

pro bono representation, the screening committee will immediately send notice to the designated panel of appellate 

attomeys with a request for response within a short time period. When an attomey responds that she is able to accept the 

case, the client and the trial attomey will be notified and representation will begin. 

HOW YOU CAN PARTICIPATE: Do you ha~ experience litigating in the Tennessee Supreme Court or Courts of 

Appeals? Do you want to enhance or de~lop your appellate litigation skills with the mentors hip of experienced appellate 

attomeys? Join us in kicking off the Tennessee Appellate Pro Bono Pilot Program. A wlunteer participation form is 
attached. 

Attachment Size 

TBA Appellate Pro Bono Volunteer Form.doc 33.5 KB 
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TENNESSEE APPELLATE PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 
A joint project of the TBA, TBA Appel/ate Pmctice Section, TBA Access to Justice Committee, 

and the Tennessee Alliance for Legal Services 

In 2011, the Telmessee Bar Association (TBA) and Tennessee Alliance for Legal Services 
(TALS) launched the Tennessee Appellate Pro Bono Pilot Program, a pilot initiative that 
provides pro bono representation to litigants appearing in the Tennessee appellate courts who 
otherwise could not afford counsel. 

The Tennessee Appellate Pro Bono Pilot Program has three primary goals: 
To improve access to justice for low-income litigants in Tennessee's appellate courts by 
establishing a qualified panel of appellate attorneys to provide pro bono representation on 
appeal; 

To provide increased opportunities for attorneys with appellate practice expertise to use their 
skills to serve clients who could not otherwise afford representation; and 

To provide an opportunity for senior appellate attorneys to mentor and supervise young 
lawyers seeking appellate practice experience through pro bono representation. 

Case Referral: In its pilot phase, the Appellate Pro Bono Program will accept cases referred by 
legal services attorneys or attorneys who have represented clients pro bono in the lower courts 
but cannot continue on appeal. Judges and justices may refer cases to the program that they 
believe to be appropriate for pro bono representation. The Program will also consider cases from 
attorneys seeking appellate co-counselor consultation on appellate issues. TALS will provide 
organizational and administrative support to the Program. Cases should be referred to TALS, 
which will conduct the initial screening to establish that the potential client cannot afford private 
counsel on appeal. 

Case Screening: Referred cases will be screened by T ALS staff in consultation with a 
committee of attorneys from the TBA Appellate Practice Section. Cases will be selected for 
representation based upon criteria including the presence of issues of first impression or complex 
legal issues, matters involving vindication of substantial constitutional or statutory rights, 
questions of unsettled authority, potentially meritorious claims and issues that are common but 
may evade review. 

Attorney Appointment: The Program will maintain a network of volunteer attorneys to whom 
cases may be referred. If a case is selected for pro bono representation, the screening committee 
will immediately send notice to the designated panel of appellate attorneys with a request for 
response within a short time period. When an attorney responds that she is able to accept the 
case, the client and the trial attorney will be notified and representation will begin. 

HOW YOU CAN PARTICIPATE: Do you have experience litigating in the Telmessee 
Supreme Court or Courts of Appeals? Do you want to enhance or develop your appellate 

litigation skills with the mentorship of experienced appellate attorneys? Join us by participating 
in the Tennessee Appellate Pro Bono Pilot Program. A volunteer participation form is attached. 
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TENNESSEE APPELLATE PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 

A joint project of the TBA, TBA Appellate Pmctice Section, TBA Access to Justice Committee, 
ami the Tennessee Alliance for Legal Services 

-Structure and Overview 

The Tennessee Alliance for Legal Services and the Tennessee Bar Association plan the launch of 
a pilot program in which attorneys will provide pro bono representation to low-income litigants 
in civil cases appealed to the Tennessee Court of Appeals and the Tennessee Supreme Court. 
The program will also provide case assistance or co-counsel support to public interest lawyers 
who are lead counsel in cases on appeal. The program is devised by the TBA, the TBA 
Appellate Practice Section, the TBA Access to Justice Committee and the Tennessee Alliance for 
Legal Services. 

Program structure: 

1. Coordinating Committee: 

A Coordinating Committee will oversee the project and have decision-making 
authority regarding the appellate project and its administration. The Coordinating 
Committee will be comprised of nine members each serving two year terms. The 
members of the Committee shall be as follows : three appellate lawyers representing 
the TBA Appellate Practice Section, two lawyers representing the T ALS Substantive 
Law Task Forces; two relevant staff members from the TBA; and two relevant staff 
members from T ALS. 

A chair shall be selected annually to lead the Coordinating Committee and will work 
with TALS and TBA staff to ensure that the project is functioning well. The chair will 
be the primmy spokesperson for the project. 

2. Sources of referral: 

a. Public interest lawyers with cases pending on appeal or cases that they believe 
merit appeal; 

b. Pro bono lawyers who handle a case at the trial court level but cannot continue 
to represent the client or would like assistance to handle the case on appeal; 
and, 

c. Members of the Tennessee judicimy. 

3. Administration of Appellate Program: 

TALS will provide staff responsible for processing cases and transmitting case 
information to the Coordinating Committee for review. 

• Applications: For a case to be considered for representation, lawyers or other 
referrers will submit a basic application for assistance to the program. The 
application will include a description of why the case meets the basic criteria 
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for appeal and include any other reasons why the case may be particularly 
appropriate for pro bono representation. For example, a case may present a 
novel or unsettled issue oflaw, the resolution of which would substantially 
assist law development. Additional criteria are set out below. 

• Once the application is received, T ALS staff, with consultation by the Chair 
of the Coordinating Committee, will perf 01111 an initial review of the 
application f01111, the court docket, any briefs or motions filed to date, and 
selected pleadings from the trial court or the Court of Appeals. They may call 
the applicant to request additional information. Based on this initial review, 
staff will recommend to the Coordinating Committee whether to accept or 
reject a case or seek further information on the case. Staff will utilize mutually 
accepted case selection criteria. 

• 

Criteria for case selection include the presence of issues of first impression or 
complex legal issues, matters involving vindication of substantial 
constitutional or statutory rights, questions of unsettled authority, potentially 
meritorious claims, and issues that are common but may evade review. All 
applicants to the program must not otherwise be able to afford appellate 
counsel. 

If a case is accepted by the Coordinating Committee, staff will refer the case 
to an identified pool of appellate pro bono lawyers who will be asked to 
accept or decline the case. 

If a volunteer attomey agrees to accept the representation, staff will then send 
a Notice of Acceptance informing the applicant of his or her selection for 
participation in the program. 

The applicant will notify the Coordinating Committee of the date by which it 
must have a decision on counsel, and if counsel cannot be provided by that 
date, staff will inform the applicant that representation will not be provided. 
This process will take place on an expedited basis to ensure no delay in 
pursuing the appeal. 

This staff person will also manage finances related to the preparation of transcripts, 
attomey fees, and other financial matters. Finally, staff will maintain statistics about 
the pro bono program, including hours spent on the cases, funds donated by lawyers 
or fil111S to cover the cost of litigation expenses, the types of cases referred to the 
program, results in the accepted cases, and feedback from attorneys and clients. 

4. Appellate Pro Bono Lawyers: 

The TBA will maintain a list of volunteer attomeys specifically identified for this 
program. Volunteer attomeys may be members of the TBA Appellate Practice 
Section, other attomeys with significant appellate experience, or attomeys without 
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significant appellate experience who will be paired with an experienced mentor in the 
program. Lawyers will be asked to apply to serve on the panel and to detail their 
relevant appellate experience, particular areas of expertise, and any standing conflicts. 

5. Litigation Fund: 

TALS and the TBA hope that many participating attomeys and their firms will 
provide financial support for an accepted appeal as part of their pro bono 
commitment. TALS and the TBA will also coordinate on raising a pool of funds 
adequate to support the costs of filing fees, transcription services, and other related 
expenses. In the event that an appellate pro bono attomey's fim1 will not cover the 
litigation costs of these items, the litigation fund will be tapped. These funds will be 
maintained by T ALS and paid out as needed in appropriate cases. 

6. Lawyers Professional Liability Insurance: 

Volunteer lawyers participating in the program will be covered by professional 
liability insurance maintained by TALS. TALS has a specific pro bono rider to its 
general organizational policy for this purpose. 
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TENNESSEE APPELLATE PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 
A joint project of the TBA, TBA Appellate Practice Section, TBA Access to Justice Committee, and the 

Tennessee Alliance for Legal Services 

Applicant Information (to be completed by the referring attorney) 

Name: 
Firm/Organization: 
Address: 

Email: 
Phone: 

Case Information 

Case Caption: 
Trial Court & Case No. 
Party Seeking Representation: 
Appellant or Appellee: 
Was the client granted in forma pauperis status at the trial court? ____________ _ 

Adverse Party or Parties: 
Opposing Counsel: 

Type of Case: 

Date by which you must receive notification of pro bono attorney assistance. The Pro Bono Program will 
work on the timeline you give us, so please be sure you allow sufficient time to plan if pro bono counsel is not 
available: 

In a separate document, please respond to the following three inquiries: 

1) Briefly describe the case and the decision to be appealed. You should also attach a copy of any final 
order to be appealed. 

2) Briefly describe the issues to be raised or defended on appeal : 

3) Briefly indicate why this case is appropriate for pro bono representation. For example, counsel may be 
particularly appropriate if the case involves issues of first impression or complex legal issues, 
matters involving vindication of substantial constitutional or statutory rights, questions of 
unsettled authority, potentially meritorious claims, or issues that are common but may evade 
review. 

Please submit this form, along with a completed copy of the attached Affidavit of Financial Need and 
copies of the Notice of Appeal (if available) and the trial court's final judgment, to: 

TN Alliance for Legal Services 
ATTN: Anne Fox 
50 Vantage Way, Suite 250 
Nashville, TN 37228 
afox@tals.org 
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TENNESSEE APPELLATE PRO BONO PILOT PROGRAM 
A joint project of the TBA, TBA Appellate Practice Section, TBA Access to Justice Committee, 

and the Tennessee Alliance for Legal Services 

VOLUNTEER FORM 

Name: 
BPR: 
Firm/Organization: 
Address: 

Email: 
Phone: 

o I have appellate practice experience and would like to volunteer to provide pro-bono 
representation to low-income clients in the Tennessee appellate courts. 

o I would like to work with an appellate practice mentor to provide pro-bono 
representation to low-income clients in the Tennessee appellate courts. 

I have represented clients in: 

o Tennessee Court of Appeals 
o Tennessee Court of Criminal Appeals 
o Tennessee Supreme Court 
o Other appellate courts: 

My areas of practice expertise include: 

I am particularly interested in taking cases in the following areas: 

o Family Law 
o Juvenile Law 
o Civil Rights 
o Housing Law 
o Consumer Protection Law 
o Civil or Appellate Procedure 
o Immigration Law 
o Constitutional Law 

Please return your completed forlll to Liz Todaro via email at ltodaro@tnbar.org orfax to (615) 297-8058. 
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APPELLATE SECTION 
Sign up fO/4 the New and Improved Appellate 

Section Pro Bono Program 
Represent people who really need your help! 

Get more "face time" with the appellate courts! 
The State Bar of Texas AppeIlate Section is increasing our reach with our pro bono program for 

the delivery of appellate legal services to those members of our community who cannot afford counsel. 
We are working closely with the Supreme COUli of Texas, the First, Third, and FOUlieenth Court of 
Appeals through our pilot programs for pro bono representation in those courts. Through these pilots, we 
are offering our volunteers more variety and greater appellate experience in those cOUlis. The Texas 
Supreme COUli refers cases to the Pro Bono Pilot when there is a pro se party and the COUli has requested 
briefs on the merits. The Court of Appeals pilots give priority to cases selected to be in their programs for 
oral argument. We are also looking into program options involving criminal, habeas corpus, and 
immigration appeals in the federal system. You can find out more about all of our programs at 
http://www.tex-app.orglprobono.php. 

As part of our recruiting effort, we are establishing a tiered program to attract a wide variety of 
appellate practitioners. Our goal is to include as many high-quality appellate attorneys as possible, 
allowing each lawyer to contribute to the best of his or her ability and time constraints. More senior 
appellate lawyers have the option of either taking on a case as lead counselor mentoring more junior 
practitioners by brainstorming about the issues, reviewing and editing briefs, and assisting with oral 
argument preparation (e.g., moot courts) without having to undeliake full responsibility for the case. 
More junior appellate lawyers can gain valuable experience by taking a lead role in representing pro bono 
clients on appeal, with 0ppOliunities to present oral argument. Our lawyers can enjoy an enhanced pro 
bono experience as part of a team that furthers the best possible presentation of the issues to the courts. 

The application form on the other side of this sheet requests your basic contact information, as 
well as your areas of interest. It also allows you to indicate whether you are interested in a hands-on or 
mentoring role. From this information, we will compile tailored email groups to circulate infolmation 
regarding cases that have been selected for the program quickly, widely, and equitably. We encourage 
you to fill out and send this form back to us right away so that you can be pali of our exciting pro bono 
team. 
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Appellate Pro Bono Sign Up 

Name: ___________ _ Work Phone #: ________ _ 
Finn/Employer: ______ -- Fax #: 
Address : ________ __ _ Cell Phone: 

0 

0 

0 

0 

0 

Emai l: 

Preferences (check a ll that apply) : 

Lead lawyer 0 Crimina l 

Mentor 0 Habeas Corpus 

Appellate courts only 0 Immi gration 

Appellate and trial supp0l1 

Preference for particu lar areas of law: 

Please mail or fax or email to: 

MiI{e Truesdale, Co-Chai!' 
Law Office of Michael S. Tl'Uesdalc, PLLC 

801 West Avenue, Suite 201 
Austin, TX 78701 

512-482-8671 866-847-8719 (fax) 
Email: mike(aitruesdalelaw.com 
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ProBono Projects 

Get Involved! 

After much dedicated work in Pro Bono Pilot Programs in the Supreme Court of Texas and the Third COUlt of Appeals, the Section 
now has Pro Bono Programs established or on the way in several state Appellate Courts, including the Supreme Court, and the First, 
Second, Third and FOUlteenth COUlts of Appeals. If you would like to become involved in our pro bono programs, please fill out this 
Sign-Up Sheet and send to the address indicated. Doing so will place you on our listserv of talented volunteers who receive email 
summaries of potential cases. You are under no obligation to take a case simply by signing up, but we hope that you will do so when 
you receive the electronic call for help. 

Our goal is to match clients who cannot afford legal representation with volunteer Texas lawyers who agree to selve without 
expectation of compensation. We may take other select cases, on a discretionary basis. In our programs, the clients obtain qualified 
coUllsel to help them navigate the often complicated appeals process, while the attorneys gain valuable experience and exposure to the 
appellate courts. We have pooled our volunteers into a databaseflistselv so that we can disseminate information about pro bono cases . 
more quickly and expedite the matching process. Our volunteers can sign up as lead lawyers or as mentors- i.e., pro\~ding oversight 
and input into the client's case and thereby enhancing the representation. So far, we have over 120 volunteers and have placed 
numerous cases. 

To sign up for the programs, please fill out this fo r m. 

For more information on, and useful forms for participating in, the Pro Bono Programs before the various appellate courts, please 
click on the links to the Programs in those various courts, set out below. Many thanks for your interest in the Program, and we look 
forward to working with you. 

Supreme Com1: of Texas 

First COUl·t of Appeals in Houston 

Second Com·t of Appeals in Ft. Worth 

Third Court of Appeals in Aus tin 

Fourteenth Court of Appeals in Houston 

Accessibility I Site Policies I © :::! OI3 Appellate Section, Stale Bar of Te'(as. All lights re.se ..... ,cd. Site design by "el> designs of hOlls ton 

http://tex-app.org/probono.php 

Upcoming Events 

2 0 13 

The Advocate 

The Section 

10/612013 



250

State Bar of Texas Appellate Section Page 1 of 1 

I Home .. / M.mb, r Olr lc tory I The Soctlon \ 1 Apptllalt Ad vDC. " , ( RU,,'ch \I Pro Bono .... r Annu al lAti lI ngl r link. 

Texas Supreme Court Pro Bono Program 

The Supreme COUlt refers cases to the Program when it requests full briefing on the merits and there is at least one party who is 
proceeding pro se because of his or her financial circumstances. Parties represented by counsel at the petition stage may also request 
the Appellate Section's Pro Bono Committee to be included in the Program if Court requests merits briefing as well. A full explanation 
of the proposed Program is available in the attached Proposal that was adopted by the Supreme Court. 

Practice Guide 

The Guide to Practice Before the Supreme Court of Texas may help you navigate through the appellate process in the Supreme 
Court of Texas. Of course, you should always consult the Texas Rules of Appellate Procedure, and we have a number of appellate 
resource links in left side menu bar under 'Appellate Research Links'. 

FOl'ms 

The Appellate Section has also prepared Instructions and Templates for Preparing a Petition for Review in the Supreme 
COUl1: of Texas. These instructions may be used to help you complete an elech'onic template fOl' a petition for review that 
can be filled out using Microsoft Word or an elect.'onie template that can be filled out using Adobe Acrobat, Or you 
can p.int the handw"itten template and use it as a guide for completing a petition for re\~ew." 

The following forms may also assist you in taking a case to the Texas Supreme Court: 

Motion for Extension of Time to File Petition for Review 

Sample Waiver Letter for Respondent 

Motion fo.' Extension of Time to File Brief 

Request fo.' Inclusion in Pro Bono Program 

AC('1'ssibility I Site Policies I «r-0 13 Appt~J1a le Se-c lion. Slate Ba r of Texas. All righls It>s(>n"e<t. Sill' cirsigll by \\cb des igns of hOllston 

http://tex -app.org/probono-sct. php 
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First Cow1: of Appeals in Houston Pro Bono Program Upcoming Events 

The program finds volunteer lawyers to screen and represent pro bono clients in the First Court of Appeals. Through this Program, 20'3 
volunteer lawyers obtain greater appellate experience in, and exposure to, the First Court of Appeals. The Court has indicated that it 
will give special consideration to hearing oral argument in cases accepted through the Program. A description of this Program is found 
in the Pro Bono Pl'ogram Pamphlet. 

The Advocate 
Practice Guide 

The Civil Appeals Pamphlet fOl' the Pro Bono Project may help you navigate through the appellate process in the First Court of 
Appeals. Of course, you should always consult the Texas Rules of Appellate Procedure, and we have a number of appellate resource The Section 
links in left side menu bar under 'Appellate Research Links'. 

Forms 

111e following forms may assist you in handling a case in the First Court of Appeals: 

Notice of Appeal 

Motion fot, E,,'!ension of Time to File Notice of Appeal 

Docketing Statement 

• Affidavit of Indigence 

• Motion for E,,'!ension of Time to File Affidavit of Indigence 

Designation of Items to Be Included in Clel'k's Record 

Supplemental Designation Lettel' as to Items for Clerk's Record 

Request for Repol'ter's Record 

Motion for Extension of Time to File Bricf 

Accessibility I Site Policies I (920 13 Appel1:1le St"'Clion. Slate BilrofTexas. All rights rcsen--e..-t Site dt>sign by \\eb des igns of houston 

~, 

http://tex-app,org/probono-lstcoUli,php 1016/2013 
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Second Court of Appeals in Ft. Worth Pro Bono Program 
The program finds volunteer lawyers to screen and represent pro bono clients in the Second Court of Appeals. Through this Program, 
volwlteer lawyers obtain greater appellate experience in, and exposure to, the Second Court of Appeals. A description of this Program 
is found in the Pro Bono P rogrmn Pamphlet. 

Practice Guide 

The Civil Appeals Pamphle t for the Pro Bono Pr oj ect may help you ask for an attorney in the Second Court of Appeals. Of 
course, you should always consult the Texas Rules of Appellate Procedure, and we have a numher of appellate resource links in left 
side menu bar under 'Appellate Research Links'. 

Forms 

The following forms may assist you in handling a case in the Second COlllt of Appeals: 

• Docketing St at em cnt 

• Affidavit ofIndigencc 

Acct'ssiiJility I Sit e Policies I ©:W I3 ,\ ppdla le SectiOIl , Stair Bnr of Textls. All lights n 'SerH'(1. Site design by n eb designs of hons ton 

http://tex -app.org/pro bono-2ndcourt. php 
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Third Court of Appeals in Austm Pro Bono Program 
A special committee screens and selects potential cases, and finds volunteer lawyers to represent pro bono clients in the Tbird Comt of 
Appeals Program. Through this Program, our section's volunteer lawyers obtain greater appellate experience in, and exposure to, the 
Austin Comt of Appeals. The COUlt bas indicated that it will give special consideration to hearing oral argument in cases accepted 
through the Program. A description of this Program is found in the Pro Bono Pamphlet. 

Practice Guide 

The Pro Bono Program Pamphlet may help you na\~gate through the appellate process in the Third Court of Appeals. Of course, 
you should always consult the Texas Rules of Appellate Procedure, and we have a number of appellate resource links in left side menu 
bar under 'Appellate Research Links'. 

Forms 

Notice of Appeal 

Docketing Statcmcnt (Third Court of Appeals) 

• Affida\~t ofIndigence 

Designation of items to Be Included in Clerk's Record 

Supplemental Designation Letter as to items for Clerk's (0.· RepOl·ter's) Record 

Request for Reporter's Record 

Motion for Extension of Time to File Brief 

A('('essibili ty I Site Policies I (£)20 13 ,\ppe llal€' Section. Slate Bar ofTex3S. All rights resen ed. Site des ign by \\eb designs of hO\lston 

http ://tex -app.org/pro bono-3rdcOUli. php 
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Fourteenth Court of Appeals in Houston Pro Bono Program 
The program finds volunteer lawyers to screen and represent pro bono clients in the Fourteenth Court of Appeals. Through this 
Program, volunteer lawyers obtain greater appellate experience in, and exposure to, the Fourteenth Court of Appeals. The Court has 
indicated that it will give special consideration to hearing oral argument in cases accepted through the Program. A description of this 
Program is found in the Pro Bono Program Pampldet. 

Practice Guide 

The Civil Appeals Pamphlet for the Pro Bono Project may help you navigate through the appellate process in the FOUl1eenth 
Court of Appeals. Of course, you should always consult the Texas Rules of Appellate ProcedUl'e, and we have a number of appellate 
resource links in left side menu bar under 'Appellate Research Links'. 

Forms 

The following forms may assist you in handling a case in the Fourteenth Court of Appeals: 

Notice of Appeal 

Motion fOl' E>.1:ens ion of Time to File Notice of Appeal 

Docketing Statement 

Affidavit of Indigence 

Mediation Statement 

Motion fOl' E>.1:ens ion of Time to File Affidavit of Indigence 

Designation of Items to Be Included in Clerk's Record 

Supplemental Designation Letter as to Items for Clerk's Record 

Reques t for Repol'tel"s Record 

Motion for E>.1:ens ion of Time to File Brief 

t\ ('ce.·~5ibi lity I Site Policies I © 20 13 .-\ppell .:l le Seclion. Sla l(> Bar o f Tex<ls. AlIlighls I"('sen ro . Sill' design by \\-eb designs or hOllston 
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Michael S. Truesdale 
Program Liaison 

[date] 

Supreme Court Pro Bono Pilot Program 
Law Office of Michael S. Truesdale, PLLC 
801 West Avenue, Suite 201 
Austin, TX 78701 
Re: No. [Supreme Court docket number], [name of case] 

Dear Ms. Greer: 

Petitioner requests that the State Bar of Texas Appellate Section's Pro Bono 

Committee consider this request for inclusion in the Supreme Court of Texas' Pro Bono 

Pilot Program. 

[Include all that apply:] 

[Currently, Petitioner is proceeding pro se and will file/has filed a petition for 

review in this matter.] 

[Currently, Petitioner is being represented by the undersigned counsel and will 

file/has filed a petition for review. If the Court deems it advisable that further briefing 

and/or argument be provided, Petitioner requests that his/her case be considered for the 

appointment of pro bono counsel.] 

[Petitioner is proceeding as an indigent in this proceeding and/or meets the 

financial eligibility requirements for the Program.] 

[Petitioner is submitting the attached affidavit of indigence for the Committee' s 

consideration. ] 

[The Supreme Court of Texas requested that the parties submit briefs on the merits 
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by letter dated ____ , 200 _.J 

Very truly yours, 

Name of person filing motion 
State bar number, if any 
Address 
Phone number 
Telecopy 
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PRO BONO PROGRAM 

FOR CIVIL ApPEALS 

SPONSORED AND ADMINISTERED BY 

THE PRO BONO COMMITTEES FOR 

THE STATE BAR OF TEXAS ApPELLATE SECTION 

AND 

THE HOUSTON BAR ASSOCIATION ApPELLATE SECTION 

IN THE 

COURT OF ApPEALS FOR THE FIRST DISTRICT OF TEXAS 

DECEMBER 2009 
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I. PRO BONO PROGRAM 

The State Bar of Texas Appellate 

Section Pro Bono Committee and the 

Houston Bar Association's Appellate 

Practice Section Pro Bono Committee ("Pro 

Bono Committee") are conducting a Pro 

Bono Program to place a limited number of 

civil appeals with appellate counsel who will 

represent the appellant before the First 

Court. The goal of the program is to match 

clients who are financially unable to obtain 

legal representation with volunteer lawyers 

who agree to serve without expectation of 

compensation for their service. 

The Pro Bono Program is 

administered completely by the Pro Bono 

Program Committee. The First Court of 

Appeals has no direct role in screening or 

selecting cases for inclusion in the Program. 

If you lack the financial means to 

pay for an appellate attorney and indicate 

your desire to be included in the Pro Bono 

Program, as explained in this Pamphlet, you 

may be considered for participation in the 

program. Even if you had paid counsel in 

the trial court, you can indicate your interest 

in seeking a pro bono attomey through this 

Program if you can no longer afford an 

attorney to represent you on appeal. 

PLEASE NOTE: There is no guarantee 

that the Pro Bono Committee will select 

your case for inclusion in the Program and 

that pro bono counsel can be found to 

represent you. Accordingly, you should not 

forego seeking other counsel to represent 

you in this proceeding. 

A. The Selection Process 

The Docketing Statement is one of 

the first documents that you file when you 

stmi an appeal. If you would like for your 

case to be considered for inclusion in the Pro 

Bono Program, Section X of the First Court 

of Appeals' Docketing Statement includes a 

brief description of the Program along with 

a list of questions for you to answer. After 

you complete the Docketing Statement and 

indicate interest in your case being 

considered for possible inclusion in the 
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Program, a copy of your Docketing 

Statement will be fOlwarded to the Pro Bono 

Committee for screening. To assist the 

screening process, it is very impOliant that 

you fill out the Docketing Statement 

carefully and completely so that the Pro 

Bono Committee will have as much 

information as possible when considering 

your appeal. 

By filling out the request for 

consideration, you are agreeing that 

members of the Pro Bono Committee can 

contact the counsel of record in the trial 

court to ask for clarification of questions or 

issues as to your case. These conversations 

will be kept confidential to the extent 

permitted by law and used solely for 

purposes of the committee's selection 

process . You are also authorizing the Pro 

Bono Committee to transmit basic, publicly 

available, facts about your case via the 

Intemet to its pool of volunteer lawyers in 

2 

an attempt to find an appellate lawyer to 

take your case. 

The Pro Bono Committee screens 

and selects civil cases for inclusion in the 

Program based upon a number of 

discretionary criteria, including the financial 

means of the appellant. The committee uses 

200% of U.S. Poveliy Guidelines as a 

benchmark for determining whether an 

appellant qualifies for free legal services. 

These guidelines are published by the U.S. 

Department of Health and Human Services, I 

and the following chart sets forth the 

relevant numbers: 

Persons in 200% .of 
Family or Federal Poverty 
Household Guidelines 

1 $19,600.00 
2 $26,400.00 
3 $33,200.00 
4 $40,000.00 
5 $46,800.00 
6 $53,600.00 
7 $60,400.00 
8 $67,200.00 

I Federal Register, Vol. 71, No. 15, January 
24, 2006, pp. 3848-3849, available at 
http:// aspe.hhs. gov/p overty/06poverty. shtml. 
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If you have not already submitted an 

affidavit of indigence in the trial court, you 

may be asked to submit financial 

information as a condition of your 

pmiicipation in the Pro Bono Program. 

Although your ability to pay for legal 

counsel is not the only factor the Pro Bono 

Committee evaluates for participation in the 

Pro Bono Program, it is nonetheless a 

significant factor 111 the committee's 

decision-making process. 

There are a number of other factors 

that the Pro Bono Committee considers in 

deciding whether to place an appeal in the 

Program, including the number of appeals 

cunently in the program, the number of 

available volunteer lawyers, and the issues 

presented. Based upon a review of these 

and other factors, the Pro Bono Committee 

makes a recommendation for each case. If 

the Committee recommends that a case be 

included in the Program and a volunteer 

lawyer agrees to take the case, you will 

3 

receive a letter from the Committee within 

approximately 30-40 days of submitting 

your Docketing Statement notifying you of 

the match. 

B. The Attorneys 

The Pro Bono Committee has 

undertaken a substantial recruiting effort to 

enlist pro bono appellate lawyers willing to 

volunteer their time to take on cases selected 

for inclusion in the Program, as well as other 

specialty pro bono programs that the 

committee is sponsoring. We have inquired 

to find out the particular areas of interest and 

expertise of our volunteers so that we can be 

in a position to make appropriate matches 

between cases and volunteer attorneys 

according to their areas of interest, 

experience, and availability. 

C. Placement of Cases in the 
Program 

When an appeal is identified by the 

Pro Bono Committee as a candidate for the 

Program, the committee provides limited 

information regarding the case, such as the 
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nature of the case, issues on appeal, the 

status of appellate proceedings, and any 

impending deadlines, and solicits volunteers 

to take the case. Based upon the responses, 

the Pro Bono Committee will make an 

appropriate match. 

If your case is chosen and counsel is 

located, the Committee will send you a letter 

advising you of the match, providing contact 

information for your pro bono attorney and . 

advising you that you have 14 days to object 

if you do not want this attorney to represent 

you. If you do object, you need simply 

notify the Committee in writing. You need 

not indicate your reasons for objecting, but 

there is, of course, no guarantee that the 

Committee will be able to find replacement 

counsel. 

Assuming you do not object to the 

volunteer attorney within 14 days of 

receiving the Committee's letter, that 

attorney will undertake further 

4 

representation of you in the appeal without 

charging legal fees. 

D. Representation in the 
Appeal 

If a volunteer lawyer is matched with 

your case through the Program, that lawyer 

will be your lawyer in handling the appeal 

on your behalf in the First Comi of Appeals 

from that point forward. He or she will 

prepare the briefs and any necessary motions 

and present oral argument to the Court of 

Appeals if argument is ordered. 

The scope of the representation is 

limited to the appeal in the First Court of 

Appeals and terminates once those 

proceedings are concluded-typically after 

the opinion issues, OT the Court rules on any 

timely filed motions for rehearing. If you 

are unsuccessful in the First Court of 

Appeals, but desire to go forward to the 

Texas Supreme Court, you will need to 

make other anangements for representation 

in that court, unless your Pro Bono counsel 

agrees in writing to undertake the further 
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representation. Please be advised that the 

Pro Bono Committee has a program with the 

Texas Supreme Comi, although the 

procedures and requirements for that 

program necessarily differ from this one. 

II. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION 

Additional information about the pro 

bono appellate programs is available at the 

State Bar of Texas Appellate Pro Bono 

website, http://www. tex- . 

app.org/probono.php and the Houston Bar 

Association Appellate Section website, 

http://www .hba.org/folder-sections/sec­

apellate.htm. 

5 
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SUPREME COURT APPROVES PRO BONO CIVIL PANEL 

[Posted February 18, 2007] The Supreme Court of Virginia has approved the creation of a 
panel of attorneys willing to accept assignments in civil appeals where one party is indigent 
and unrepresented. Effective immediately, the program will ensure that both sides of an 
appeal are professionally briefed and argued. 

The program, which is outlined in detail below, calls for the creation of two lists, one 
comprising experienced appellate lawyers, and one with those who are looking for an 
opportunity to gain such experience. One attorney from each list will be assigned to each 
case, thus giving those in the second group an opportunity to learn on-the-job from 
someone who knows the appellate ropes. 

The program only addresses purely civil cases; the Commonwealth already funds 
programs to pay for attorneys in criminal and habeas corpus cases. 

I have volunteered to work with the Clerk of the Supreme Court to populate the lists, and 
respectfully solicit your help with that. If you're licensed in Virginia and you'd like to be on 
either list, please contact me (please give me your name, phone number, e-mail address, 
and which list you'd occupy), and I'll ensure that you're included in the program. 

If you need any further impetus to consider the value of this fine work, I encourage you to 
take a look at Rule 6.1 (a) of the Rules of Professional Conduct. Thanks in advance for your 
help. 

PRO BONO CIVIL APPEALS PANEL OF ATTORNEYS TO PROVIDE 
REPRESENTATION FOR INDIGENT PARTIES 

Objectives 

1. To ensure that each side of all civil appeals in the Supreme Court, where one of the 
parties is an indigent proceeding pro se, receives professionally prepared briefing and oral 
argument at the merits stage. 

2. To enable appellate attorneys to fulfill the requirements of Rule 6.1 of the Rules of 
Professional Conduct (2% of time devoted to pro bono work) . 

3. To enable attorneys to gain experience in the handling of appellate cases, with the 
secondary goal of improving the quality of appellate advocacy overall, through the use of a 
mentoring model, which pairs two attorneys in each case. 

Scope of Anticipated Need 

The Clerk estimates that counsel will be needed three to four times per year, based on 
historical experience. 

Approach 

Create a panel of attorneys willing to appear in such cases on a pro bono basis. The core 
group will comprise at least twelve experienced appellate practitioners (so no one of them 
will be called upon more often than once every three to four years) . A second group will be 

http://www.virginia-appeals.comlessay .aspx?id=30 10/612013 
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open to less experienced attorneys (including seasoned trial lawyers without significant 
appellate experience), without limitation in number. 

When the Court awards an appeal in which one side is an indigent party unrepresented by 
counsel , and the Court determines it would be beneficial to provide representation for that 
party, the Clerk will contact the party to determine if he/she is willing to have pro bono 
counsel to provide representation . If the party consents, the Clerk will then contact one 
attorney from the core group and one from the second group to ascertain if they are willing 
to accept the case. Upon confirmation from counsel of their willingness to accept the case, 
the Clerk then will enter the order granting the appeal and forward a copy of the order to 
counsel assigned to that side of the case. This arrangement fosters learning through 
mentoring; enables the attorneys to share the workload in the case; and permits two 
different perspectives in shaping the course of the representation . 

Nature of the Assignment 

The two attorneys from the Panel will serve as counsel of record for the prose party. The 
entry of the grant order, upon confirmation of the assignment of the Panel attorneys to the 
appeal, will begin the period for filing of the brief of appellant under Rule 5:26(b)(1) , in the 
event the panel attorneys represent the appellant. The Court may extend the due date for 
the brief of appellant upon application by the assigned attorneys. 

Administration 

The panel will be administered by the Clerk of the Supreme Court, with the assistance of 
the chair of the State Bar's Appellate Practice Subcommittee. The Clerk will assign 
attorneys to cases and transmit to them copies of briefs and other papers necessary to 
effectuate the representation of the party or the filing of the amicus brief. 

i Virginia Appella le News & Analysis © 2005 - 2013 Home I Video Inlroduclion I Refer Our Si le I Index I Disclaimer I Adminislration 

htlp:llwww.virginia-appeals.comlessay.aspx?id=30 101612013 
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Read/Post Comments 

For the Good: Appellate 

Practice Section Pro Bono Volunteers 

Help Indigent Clients Pursue Civil 

Appeals at Courts' Request 

What is the lure of pro bono work? Giving back to the community? Getting the 

chance to work on novel and important legal issues that establish precedent or 

help shape the law? Tackling unique cases that sharpen legal ski lls? How about 

an opportunity to do all three but at the request of the Wisconsin Supreme Court or 

the 7th Circuit Court of Appeals? For the past 10 years, volunteers with the Pro 

Bono Program of the State Bar of Wisconsin Appellate Practice Section have been 

providing pro bono services for all these reasons. 

NILESH P. PATEL 

What is the lure of pro bono work? Giving back to the community? Getting the chance to work on novel 

and important legal issues that establish precedent or help shape the law? Tackling unique cases that 

sharpen legal skills? How about an opportunity to do all three but at the request of the Wisconsin 

Supreme Court or the 7th Circuit Court of Appeals? For the past 10 years, volunteers with the Pro 

Bono Program of the State Bar of Wisconsin Appellate Practice Section have been providing pro bono 

services for all these reasons. 

http://www.wisbar.orglNewsPublications/WisconsinLawyerlPages/Atiicle.aspx?Volume=... 1016/2013 
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Each year the section's Pro Bono Program provides counsel for indigent clients in about 10 to 12 civil 

appeals at the request of the appellate courts. According to attorney Colleen Ball, who administers the 

program along with attorney Robert Henak, although the Wisconsin State Public Defender provides 

appellate counsel to indigent clients in criminal cases, there is no comparable resource for indigent 

clients pursuing civil appeals. Without counsel, these appellants typically cannot properly research the 

legal issues or present effective arguments to advance their cases, making it difficult for courts to 

evaluate the merits of a case. 

The program does not take representation requests from individual clients, because there are not 

enough resources for volunteer attorneys to review the merits of cases and evaluate indigent status. 

Instead, the program relies on court employees to spot significant cases or appellate attorneys at public 

interest organizations like the ACLU or the Legal Aid Society who request amicus briefs to develop an 

area of the law. Most of the case referrals come from the Wisconsin Supreme Court, possibly because 

the most novel and complex legal issues tend to be raised at that level. If the appellant does not 

sufficiently develop the legal issues, the court may ask for a supplement to the petition before deciding 

whether to review the case. Thus, the program's work can directly affect the viability of an appeal and 

enable the court to determine whether a case raises an issue that will clarify the law or establish legal 

precedent. 

About 30 lawyers volunteer their time for the program. Any attorney can be on the referral list and can 

decline a representation request. Volunteer attorneys can consult with other attorneys on cases and 

receive assistance with preparing oral arguments. The amount of time required depends on who the 

lawyer is appointed to represent (a party or an amicus) and the complexity of the case and issues. 

The program has provided direct or amicus representation on appeals involving prisoners' rights, family 

law, fee shifting in public interest litigation, civil procedure, and criminal law. 

Some recent and pending representations include the following : 

• Attorney Brent Nisteler represented an inmate in Jackson v. U.S. ; 541 F.3d 688 

(7th Cir. 2008) , involving an injured prisoner denied medical assistance, in which 

the court ruled that the relation-back doctrine applies to Federal Tort Claims Act 

suits against the United States. 

• Attorney Dan LaFave filed an amicus brief for Disability Rights Wisconsin, NAACP, 

and the Benedict Center in Christensen v. Sullivan, Appeal No. 2006AP803, which 

addresses the circuit court's authority to impose monetary sanctions for contempt 

after the underlying conduct (violations of a consent decree concerning conditions 

at the Milwaukee County Jail) had ceased. 

• Attorney John Rhode represents the ex-husband in Gaffney v. Gaffney, Appeal 

No. 2008AP2297, in which the husband, who has a disability, argues that in 

applying the statutory test for a maintenance award in a divorce action, the circuit 

court failed to address his "needs." 

• Attorney Rob Henak was appointed to file a supplemental petition for review in 

State v. Allen, Appeal No. 2007 AP795, which addresses whether a criminal 

defendant waives any legal challenges to his or her conviction or sentence that 

were overlooked by the appointed counsel's no-merit report and the court of 

appeals' ruling on that report. 

Henak 

http://www. wisbar.orglN ewsPublications/WisconsinLawyerlPagesl Articie.aspx?Volume=... 1016/2013 
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• Attorney Colleen Ball represented the petitioner in State ex reI. Hipp v. Murray, 

2008 WI 67, 310 Wis. 2d 342, 750 N.W.2d 873, in which the Wisconsin Supreme 

Court established the procedure for subpoenaing and examining witnesses for John 

Doe proceedings. 

For more information about the Pro Bono Program, or to volunteer and be placed on the referral list, 

contact Colleen Bali at cbali@applaw.com or Robert Henak at henaklaw@sbcglobal.net. For more 

information about the Appellate Practice Section, please visit www.wisbar.org/sections/app. 

Nilesh P. Patel, U.W. 2002, is an advisor with the U.W. Law School's Career Services office. He 
also is the principal of the Mahadev Law Group LLC, Madison, and a member of the Wisconsin 
Lawyer editorial advisory board. 

• Back to article 

Bali 

http://www.wisbar.org/N ewsPublications/WisconsinLawyerlPagesl Article.aspx?Volume=... 1016/2013 
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